City of Corpus Christi Bid Tabulation

Contracts and Procurement Department RFB No. 2664
Buyer: Lois Hinojosa Medical Supplies for CCFD
MEDCO Quadmed, Life-Assist, | Henry Schein, [ NAO Global BoundTree Performance Medline ZOLL
Inc. Inc. Inc. Health, LLC Medical, LLC Safety Group Industries, Medical
Inc. Group **
Item Description UNIT |QTY Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Totals:
#14 or #18 Fr.
1|Catheter EA 150( No Bid $ 237 (% 019 | $ 019 $ 031 $%$ 0.10 | No Bid $ 0.26 | ** $ 15.00
#5 or #6 Fr.
2|Catheter EA 150| No Bid $ 0211 $%$ 019 | $ 019 $ 0311 $ 0.10 | No Bid $ 0.25 | ** $ 15.00
#6 or #8 Fr.
3|Catheter EA 90| No Bid $ 019 | $ 0.19 | $ 019 $ 031 $%$ 0.10 | No Bid $ 0.25 [ ** $ 9.00
4[1” Transpore Tape |ROLL 1,100| ** $ 079 | $ 093 | % 114 | $ 131 | $ 0.58 | No Bid $ 0.43 | ** $ 473.00
1000ml N/S Bag -
5|per bag EA 6,600| No Bid No Bid $ 285($ 260 ($ 311 | $ 2.96 | No Bid $ 3.35 [ ** $ 17,160.00

100ml N/S Bag -
6|per bag EA 600| No Bid No Bid $ 222 % 2421 % 791| % 1.78 | No Bid $ 259 | ** $ 1,068.00

15gtt Drip Set
(maxi) (B. Braun or

7|similar) EA 11,700( No Bid $ 403 (% 124 | $ 1.00 | No Bid $ 0.86 | No Bid $ 2.20 | ** $ 10,062.00

169 Jelco,
ProtectlV Plus I.V.
catheter, part

8|#3062 EA 3,000| No Bid $ 144 | $ 139 | $ 133 $% 210 | $ 1.16 | No Bid $ 2.75 | ** $ 3,480.00
9|18g Draw Needle [EA 4,500| No Bid $ 024 $ 0.04|$ 0.03 | % 037 % 0.04 | No Bid $ 0.03 | ** $ 115.65
189 Jelco,

ProtectlV Plus |.V.
catheter, part

10(#3065 EA 27,000( No Bid $ 144 | $ 139 | $ 133 $ 210 | $ 1.16 | No Bid $ 3.03 | * $ 31,320.00
2” Cloth Tape

11|(sterile) ROLL 600| ** $ 115 | $ 136 | $ 1.61 | No Bid $ 1.22 | No Bid $ 1.01 | ** $ 606.00

12|2” Kling (sterile) EA 900( No Bid $ 0.10 | $ 019 $ 151 % 148 | $ 0.32 | No Bid $ 0.11 | ** $ 90.00
20g Jelco,
ProtectlV Plus I.V.

13|catheter EA 30,000( No Bid $ 144 | $ 139 [ $ 133 $ 210 | $ 1.16 | No Bid $ 2.75 | ** $ 34,800.00
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UNIT

QrY
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Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Totals:

14

21g or 22g Hypo
Needles (IM)

EA

1,200

No Bid

$ 0.25

$ 0.04

$ 0.03

$ 0.05

$ 0.20

No Bid

0.05

*%

31.20

15

22g Jelco,
ProtectlV Plus I.V.
catheter, part
#3060

EA

2,100

No Bid

$ 1.44

$ 1.39

$ 1.33

$ 2.10

$ 1.16

No Bid

2.89

**

2,436.00

16

249 Jelco,
ProtectlV Plus |.V.
catheter, part
#3063

EA

900

No Bid

$ 1.44

$ 1.39

$ 1.33

$ 2.10

$ 1.16

No Bid

3.07

*%

1,044.00

17

2x2 Singles - 2 pk
at 50 per box (8-
PLY)

BX

450

No Bid

$ 1.12

$ 2.19

$ 1.21

$ 1.75

$ 2.48

No Bid

0.70

**

315.00

18

4x4 Singles — 2 pk
at 50 per box (12-
PLY)

BX

1,200

No Bid

$ 1.24

$ 5.26

$ 1.82

$ 2.56

$ 4.60

No Bid

2.21

*%

1,488.00

19

4x4 Trays (10 per
tray)

EA

8,400

No Bid

$ 0.48

$ 0.85

$ 0.06

$ 0.74

$ 0.05

No Bid

0.05

**

420.00

20

500ml N/S Bag —
per bag

1,650

No Bid

No Bid

$ 2.89

$ 2.60

$ 3.51

$ 4.95

No Bid

3.31

*%

4,290.00

21

6’ Backboard w/
pins, reusable, and
three straps per
board

EA

50

No Bid

$ 98.65

$ 130.00

**

No Bid

$ 127.78

No Bid

91.88

**

4,594.00

22

60gtt Drip Set
(mini) — sterile

EA

350

No Bid

$ 0.97

$ 1.21

$ 1.00

$ 9.54

$ 1.08

No Bid

3.46

**

339.50

23

Abdominal Sterile
Dressing

300

No Bid

$ 0.09

$ 0.15

$ 0.11

$ 0.14

$ 0.08

No Bid

0.07

K%

21.00

24

Adult Traction
Splint, Ferno SP444
(reusable)

EA

25

$ 465.85

$ 403.35

$ 355.95

$ 415.15

$ 515.17

$ 349.50

No Bid

461.81

**

8,737.50

25

Air Splint
(ankle/foot) -
disposable

EA

210

No Bid

$ 8.50

$ 9.38

$ 9.76

$ 12.12

$ 8.90

No Bid

12.85

*%

1,785.00

26

Air Splint (full arm) -
disposable

EA

60

No Bid

$ 9.90

$ 10.93

$ 11.38

$ 14.13

$ 10.50

No Bid

24.84

**

594.00
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MEDCO Quadmed, Life-Assist, | Henry Schein, [ NAO Global BoundTree Performance Medline ZOLL
Inc. Inc. Inc. Health, LLC Medical, LLC Safety Group Industries, Medical
Inc. Group **
Item Description UNIT |QTY Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Totals:
Air Splint (full leg) —
27|disposable EA 90| No Bid $ 1136 | $ 1253 | $ 13.05 | $ 16.20 | $ 11.90 | No Bid $ 28.12 | ** 1,022.40
Alcohol Bottle, 16
28|0z. EA 120( ** $ 143 | $ 128 | $ 124 | $ 144 | $ 1.11 | No Bid $ 2.37 [ ** 133.20
Alcohol Preps -
29|200 per box BX 350( $ 171 | $ 134 | $ 158 | $ 105 | $ 126 ($ 1.59 | No Bid $ 2.60 | ** 367.50
Ammonia
Capsules — 10 per
30|box BX 300( $ 286 | $ 1.79 [ $ 186 $ 212 | $ 270 ( $ 2.07 | No Bid $ 3.06 [ ** 537.00
Antiseptic Wipes —
12 tubs per case,
Sani-cloth, 160 per
31|tube CA 720| ** $ 7043 | $ 71.16 | $ 66.00 | $ 7778 | $ 72.60 | No Bid $ 96.00 | ** 47,520.00
B/P Cuff, Adult
32|(complete unit) EA 40| $ 2795 | $ 516 [ $ 798 | $ 545 | $ 1593 | $ 4.28 | No Bid $ 8.05 | ** 171.20
B/P Cuff, Infant
33|(complete unit)  [EA 25| No Bid $ 516 | $ 6.88 | $ 545 | $ 1593 | $ 4.28 | No Bid $ 7.56 | ** 107.00
B/P Cuff, Pedi
34|(complete unit)  [EA 25| No Bid $ 516 [ $ 6.88 | $ 545 | $ 1593 | $ 4.28 | No Bid $ 7.65 | ** 107.00
B/P Cuff, Adult
Large (complete
35(unit) EA 50| $ 5294 | $ 516 | $ 6.88 (% 562 $ 2048 | $ 4.28 | No Bid $ 8.47 | ** 214.00
B/P Cuff, Thigh
36|(complete unit)  [EA 25| No Bid $ 516 | $ 6.88 | $ 6.00 | $ 2388 | $ 4.28 | No Bid $ 9.06 | ** 107.00
Band aids-Adult -
1 box (100 per
37(box) BX 300( $ 263 $ 122 ($ 132 ($ 089 $ 172 ( $ 1.25 | No Bid $ 1.44 | ** 267.00
Band aids-
Pediatric — 1 box
38|(50 per box) BX 90| No Bid $ 101 $ 135 $ 150 | $ 357 (% 0.53 | No Bid $ 0.61 | ** 47.70
Biohazard Bag-
39|Small - 24”x30” EA 220| No Bid $ 4724 | $ 0.14 | $ 010 $ 027 | $ 0.10 | No Bid $ 0.04 | ** 8.80
Bio-hoop bags
(emesis) — 12 per
40(pack PK 2,250| No Bid $ 1339 | $ 1842 | $ 3384 | $ 28.06 | $ 18.90 | No Bid $ 4.37 | ** 9,832.50
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Totals:

41

Blankets (cold
weather) —
disposable -
66x90”

EA

540

No Bid

$ 4.45

$ 3.48

$ 7.88

$ 5.33

$ 2.94

No Bid

$ 3.16

**

1,587.60

42

Child Bougie
Tracheal Tube (not
coiled) - 10FR,
Dynarex

EA

45

No Bid

$ 2.79

$ 6.50

$ 3.00

No Bid

$ 4.22

No Bid

$ 5.55

*%

125.55

43

Bulb Syringe, 20z.

EA

90

No Bid

$ 0.70

$ 0.64

$ 0.71

$ 1.32

$ 0.64

No Bid

$ 0.46

**

41.40

44

Burn Sheets
(sterile)

120

No Bid

$ 1.41

$ 1.92

$ 1.13

$ 1.90

$ 2.70

No Bid

$ 2.34

*%

135.60

45

BVM-adult, w/ O2
reservoir, no peep
or manometer

EA

1,350

No Bid

$ 8.05

$ 8.40

$ 8.25

$ 11.28

$ 11.25

No Bid

$ 8.61

*%

10,867.50

46

BVM-Infant, w/ O2
reservoir, peep
needed,
manometer not
required

EA

90

No Bid

$ 7.28

$ 8.40

$ 9.64

No Bid

$ 13.25

No Bid

$ 10.17

**

655.20

47

BVM-Pedi, w/ O2
reservoir, peep
needed,
manometer not
required

EA

120

No Bid

$ 8.24

$ 8.40

$ 8.25

$ 26.61

$ 13.00

No Bid

$ 10.79

*%

988.80

48

Capnography
(zoll) (etco2
filterline), Oridion
Microstream

EA

375

No Bid

$ 6.59

$ 9.44

$ 14.31

$ 17.76

$ 13.00

No Bid

No Bid

*%

2,471.25

49

C-Collar
adjustable, Adult,
Laerdal

EA

5,400

No Bid

$ 5.64

$ 4.68

$ 7.78

$ 7.29

$ 10.40

No Bid

$ 6.55

**

25,272.00

50

C-Collar
adjustable,
Pediatric, Laerdal

EA

360

No Bid

$ 6.57

$ 4.68

$ 7.78

$ 7.00

$ 3.59

No Bid

$ 6.55

*%

1,292.40
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51

Chest
Decompression Kit,
14 gauge by 5.25”,
2.1x133mm

EA

90

No Bid

$ 75.57

$ 83.94

$ 12.45

No Bid

$ 13.19

No Bid

36.92

*%

1,120.50

52

Coban (4”x5yd)

1,500

*%

$ 0.68

$ 2.17

$ 1.18

$ 3.07

$ 14.50

No Bid

1.08

*%

1,020.00

53

Cold Packs (6”x9”)

4,500

*%

$ 7.93

$ 0.44

$ 0.50

$ 0.58

$ 0.24

No Bid

1.27

*%

1,080.00

54

CPAP Mask, Large
(blue), whole
CPAP device,
disposable, O-Two
CPAP system,
“open circuit”,
part # 01CV0211-
cs

EA

360

No Bid

$ 31.07

$ 30.54

$ 35.13

$ 448.00

No Bid

No Bid

23.59

*%

8,492.40

55

CPAP Mask,
Medium (red),
whole CPAP
device,
disposable, O-Two
CPAP system,
“open circuit”,
part # 01cv0212-cs

EA

300

No Bid

$ 31.07

$ 30.54

$ 35.13

$ 448.00

No Bid

No Bid

23.59

*%

7,077.00

56

CPAP Mask, Small
(green), Whole
CPAP device,
disposable, O-Two
CPAP system,
“open circuit”,
part # 01cv0213-cs

EA

90

No Bid

$ 31.07

$ 30.54

$ 35.13

$ 448.00

No Bid

No Bid

23.59

*%

2,123.10

57

Distilled Water —
gallon

EA

150

No Bid

No Bid

$ 2.23

$ 4.44

$ 4.82

No Bid

No Bid

2.57

*%

334.50

58

ECG Paper Roll
(Zoll) 6 rolls per box

BX

125

No Bid

$ 12.48

$ 22.69

$ 33.83

$ 40.10

$ 40.32

No Bid

28.59

*%

1,560.00

59

Electrodes (Zoll)
Adult - 6 pk

PK

360

*%

$ 1.13

$ 1.12

$ 20.20

$ 150.35

$ 1.55

No Bid

92.40

*%

403.20
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60

Electrodes (Zoll)
Pedi - 3 per pouch

POUCH

1,050

No Bid

$ 61.18

$ 0.56

$ 0.50

$ 82.35

$ 35.46

No Bid

$ 56.12

**

525.00

61

Electrodes
(Zoll)Adult - 4 pk

PK

900

*%

$ 6.16

$ 0.75

$ 0.81

$ 120.27

$ 1.02

No Bid

No Bid

**k

675.00

62

ET Tube Holder,
Adult, Laerdal,
Thomas Tube
Holder, part # 600-
10000 (or
comparable)

EA

600

No Bid

$ 3.13

$ 2.64

$ 2.66

$ 3.81

$ 3.45

No Bid

$ 5.76

**

1,584.00

63

ET Tube Holder,
Pedi, Thomas Tube
Holder, part # 600-
20000 (or
comparable)

EA

75

No Bid

$ 3.68

$ 2.64

$ 2.66

$ 3.81

$ 2.75

No Bid

$ 3.80

*%

198.00

64

ET Tube, 3.0
(Uncuffed, with

stylet)

EA

120

No Bid

$ 1.14

$ 1.76

$ 1.50

$ 5.74

$ 0.45

No Bid

$ 1.23

**

54.00

65

ET Tube, 3.5
(Uncuffed, with
stylet)

EA

90

No Bid

$ 1.14

$ 1.76

$ 1.50

$ 5.73

$ 0.45

No Bid

$ 1.23

*%

40.50

66

ET Tube, 4.0
(Uncuffed, with

stylet)

EA

120

No Bid

$ 1.14

$ 1.76

$ 1.50

$ 5.73

$ 0.45

No Bid

$ 1.25

**

54.00

67

ET Tube, 6.0
(Cuffed, without
stylet)

EA

120

No Bid

$ 0.83

$ 0.79

$ 0.77

No Bid

$ 0.45

No Bid

$ 1.45

*%

54.00

68

ET Tube, 7.0
(Cuffed, without

stylet)

EA

390

No Bid

$ 0.83

$ 0.79

$ 0.77

No Bid

$ 0.67

No Bid

$ 1.45

**

261.30

69

ET Tube, 7.5
(Cuffed, without
stylet)

EA

390

No Bid

$ 0.83

$ 0.79

$ 0.77

No Bid

$ 0.67

No Bid

$ 1.45

*%

261.30
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Totals:

70

ET Tube, 8.0
(Cuffed, without

stylet)

EA

90

No Bid

$ 0.83

$ 0.79

$ 0.77

No Bid

$ 0.67

No Bid

$ 1.45

**

60.30

71

ET Tube, 8.5
(Cuffed, without
stylet)

EA

120

No Bid

$ 0.83

$ 0.79

$ 0.77

No Bid

$ 0.67

No Bid

$ 1.76

*%

80.40

72

ET Tube, 9.0
(Cuffed, without

stylet)

EA

120

No Bid

$ 0.83

$ 0.79

$ 0.77

No Bid

$ 0.67

No Bid

$ 1.25

**

80.40

73

ETCO2 Detector,
Adult, Covidien
Nellcor, easy cap
Il >15kg, part #
191680003 (or
comparable)

EA

600

No Bid

$ 6.90

$ 9.01

$ 10.19

$ 12.64

$ 8.59

No Bid

$ 16.37

**

4,140.00

74

ETCO2 Detector,
Pedi, Covidien
Nellcor, pedicap -
1kg — 15kg, part #
183300009 (or
comparable)

EA

210

No Bid

$ 6.90

$ 9.01

$ 41.24

$ 12.80

$ 10.30

No Bid

$ 16.44

**

1,449.00

75

Eye Wash, 40z.

EA

200

$ 1.99

$ 2.60

$ 2.49

$ 1.96

$ 2.44

$ 2.55

No Bid

$ 4.85

**

392.00

76

Fitted EMS Sheets 1
cs=50 per case,
30” width by 72~
length, 4” poly-film

CS

1,200

No Bid

$ 37.80

$ 39.00

$ 37.50

$ 63.48

$ 21.98

No Bid

$ 85.68

**

26,376.00

77

Flat EMS Sheets 1
cs=50 per case

CS

210

No Bid

$ 54.57

$ 27.00

$ 33.08

$ 68.82

$ 29.30

No Bid

$ 23.71

*%

4,979.10

78

GTOvVeS 1ong curr,
Large - 100 per
box

BX

900

**

*kk

**

**

79

Gloves long cuff,
Medium - 100 per
box

BX

600

*%

*kk

*%

*%
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MEDCO Quadmed, Life-Assist, | Henry Schein, [ NAO Global BoundTree Performance Medline ZOLL
Inc. Inc. Inc. Health, LLC Medical, LLC | Safety Group [ Industries, Medical
Inc. Group **
Item Description UNIT |QTY Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Totals:

Gloves long cuft,
Small — 100 per

80 bOX BX 150 *% *kk *kk *kk *kk *kk *% *kk *% -
Gloves Tong cuff, X
Large - 100 per

81 bOX BX 90 *% *kk *kk *kk *kk *kk *% *kk *% -
Glucometer
Lancets (23

82|gauge) EA 27,000( ** $ 0.06 | $ 0.10 | $ 0.05($ 021 $%$ 0.07 | No Bid $ 0.10 | ** 1,323.00
Glucometer Strips
- 50 per box,

83[Microdot BX 1,500 ** $ 1641 | $ 1719 | $ 1661 | $ 2379 | $ 20.49 | No Bid $ 8.00 | ** 12,000.00
Glucometer Test

84(Solutions, Microdot|EA 120( No Bid $ 1071 |$ 1150 | $ 1111 | $ 1590 | $ 11.99 | No Bid $ 7.29 | ** 874.80
Hand Sanitizer, 4

85(0z. EA 540( ** $ 0.59 | $ 131 % 076 | $ 182 | % 0.95 | No Bid $ 1.92 | ** 318.60
Hand Suction Refill
for Ambu Res-Cue

86|Pump EA 150( No Bid No Bid $ 770 [ $ 813 $ 1110 | $ 6.98 | No Bid No Bid ok 1,047.00
Hands Free CPR
Pads (Zoll) - Adult

87|- 12 per case CS 900| No Bid $ 45628 | $ 757.80 | $ 848.04 | $ 701.60 | $ 204.00 | No Bid No Bid ** 183,600.00
Hands Free CPR

8g|Pads (Zoll) - Pedi [EA 150| $ 99.75 | $ 90.80 [$ 86.04|$ 9735 | $ 12081 | $ 120.00 | No Bid No Bid ** 12,906.00
Head Block Tape

89|(Duct tape) EA 360| No Bid $ 935 | $ 6.62 | $ 7.18 | No Bid $ 5.92 | No Bid No Bid *x 2,131.20

90(Head Blocks EA 2,700| No Bid $ 329 | $ 416 | $ 362 (3% 1337 | $ 2.69 | No Bid No Bid ok 7,263.00

91|Hot Packs (5"x9”) [EA 1,200| ** $ 1159 | $ 050 | $ 061|$% 058 | $ 0.21 | No Bid $ 0.60 | ** 252.00
Hydrogen
Peroxide Bottle,

92|80z - 320z EA 150( ** $ 143 ( $ 057 | $ 048 | $ 055 | % 0.89 | No Bid $ 0.84 | ** 72.00

93|Infant O2 Mask EA 300| No Bid $ 074 | $ 087 $ 071 | $ 290 [ $ 0.75 | No Bid $ 1.18 | ** 213.00
|-Pads “Needle-

94|free valves” EA 58,500| No Bid $ 084 (3% 1.78 | $ 0.67 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid ** 39,195.00
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UNIT

QrY
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Unit Price
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Unit Price

Unit Price

Totals:

95

Isolair Masks

EA

90

No Bid

$ 1.36

$ 1.00

$ 0.90

$ 1.31

$ 0.05

No Bid

$ 0.92

**

4.50

96

Isolation Kits to
include gown,
shoe covers, mask
w/eye protection,
surgical cap
(head cover) - per
kit

EA

60

No Bid

$ 3.23

$ 5.85

$ 3.40

$ 4.77

$ 5.32

No Bid

$ 195.00

**

193.80

97

IV Start Packs — per
pack, tie off
(rubber band)
tape that is 2x2
gauge

PK

50,500

No Bid

$ 0.79

$ 1.01

$ 0.85

No Bid

$ 1.52

No Bid

$ 0.67

**

33,835.00

98

KED Ferno SW101

EA

25

$ 151.06

$ 127.68

*%

$ 134.69

$ 167.15

$ 109.70

No Bid

$ 558.95

*%

2,742.50

99

Kerlix — 100 per
case, sterile,
4.5"x4.1yd (11.4
cm X 3.7 m)

EA

2,700

$ 17298

$ 0.47

$ 0.58

$ 0.62

$ 95.42

$ 0.40

No Bid

$ 0.68

**

1,080.00

100

King Tube LTS-D
Ambu 3

EA

150

No Bid

$ 26.97

$ 27.36

$ 27.77

$ 42.52

$ 28.49

No Bid

$ 46.80

**

4,045.50

101

King Tube LTS-D
Ambu 4

EA

525

No Bid

$ 26.97

$ 27.36

$ 27.77

$ 41.37

$ 28.49

No Bid

$ 46.80

**%

14,159.25

102

King Tube LTS-D
Ambu 5

EA

225

No Bid

$ 26.97

$ 27.36

$ 27.77

$ 41.37

$ 28.49

No Bid

$ 46.80

*%

6,068.25

103

Laryngoscope
Handle, Medium
(reusable)

EA

30

No Bid

$ 22.09

$ 1251

$ 7.77

$ 45.47

$ 43.79

No Bid

No Bid

*%

233.10

104

Laryngoscope
Handle, Small
(reusable)

EA

30

No Bid

$ 22.09

$ 1251

$ 7.77

$ 45.47

$ 43.79

No Bid

No Bid

*%

233.10

105

Laryngoscope
Handle, Standard
(reusable)

EA

30

No Bid

$ 9.88

$ 1251

$ 7.77

$ 58.13

No Bid Sheet

No Bid

No Bid

*%

233.10

106

MAD, nasal use

EA

900

No Bid

$ 3.49

$ 6.10

$ 8.56

$ 10.63

No Bid Sheet

No Bid

$ 8.86

*%

3,141.00
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MEDCO Quadmed, Life-Assist, | Henry Schein, [ NAO Global BoundTree Performance Medline ZOLL
Inc. Inc. Inc. Health, LLC Medical, LLC | Safety Group [ Industries, Medical
Inc. Group **
Item Description UNIT |QTY Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Totals:

Magill Forceps,

107|Large EA 60| No Bid $ 348 | $ 347 | $ 395 (% 14.25 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 1555 | ** 208.20
Magill Forceps,

108|Small EA 60| No Bid $ 352 | $ 347 | $ 385 $ 4.77 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 13.39 | ** 208.20
Mask w/eye
protection — 25 per

109|box BX 30| No Bid $ 2311 | $ 28.05 | $ 9.60 | $ 27.40 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 16.14 | ** 288.00
Meconium

110|Aspirator EA 90( No Bid $ 3.65 | $ 427 | $ 6.42 | $ 7.66 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 5.44 | ** 328.50
Medication
Labels, red,
permanent, 2 ¥2” x
14", (pack of

1111,000 per roll) ROLL 9| No Bid No Bid $ 3000 $ 29.14 | $ 35.74 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid No Bid ** 262.26
Multi-Trauma

112|Dressing EA 600( $ 081 $ 065 | % 078 | $ 0.80 | $ 1.53 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.55 [ ** 330.00
N-95 Masks,

113|molded EA 300| No Bid No Bid $ 095 | % 0.07 | $ 3.17 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.79 [ ** 22.20
Nasal Cannula

114|(non-flared) EA 14,000| No Bid ** $ 0.26 | $ 027 | $ 0.35 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.29 | ** 3,640.00
Nasopharyngeal
Airways-Sz 28fr box

115|of 10 BX 5[ No Bid $ 2299 | $ 16.70 | $ 1690 | $ 21.70 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 21.97 | ** 83.50
Nasopharyngeal
Airways-Sz 20fr box

116|of 10 BX 5[ No Bid $ 2299 | $ 16.70 | $ 16.90 | $ 38.22 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 21.97 | ** 83.50
Nasopharyngeal
Airways-Sz 24fr box

117|of 10 BX 5[ No Bid $ 2299 | $ 16.70 | $ 16.90 | $ 21.70 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 21.97 | ** 83.50
Nasopharyngeal
Airways-Sz 32fr Box

118|of 10 BX 5[ No Bid $ 2299 | $ 16.70 | $ 16.90 | $ 21.70 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 21.97 | ** 83.50
Nasopharyngeal
Airways-Sz 36fr Box

119|of 10 BX 5[ No Bid $ 2299 | $ 16.70 | $ 16.90 | $ 39.84 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 25.11 | ** 83.50
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MEDCO

Quadmed,
Inc.

Life-Assist,
Inc.

Henry Schein,
Inc.

NAO Global
Health, LLC

BoundTree
Medical, LLC

Performance
Safety Group

Medline
Industries,
Inc.

ZOLL
Medical
Group **

Item

Description

UNIT

QrY

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Unit Price

Totals:

120

Nebulizer Mask,
Adult

EA

650

$ 1.64

$ 0.81

$ 1.01

$ 0.65

$ 1.37

No Bid Sheet

No Bid

0.83

**

$ 422.50

121

Nebulizer Mask,
Pedi

EA

300

No Bid

$ 0.81

$ 1.07

$ 0.47

$ 1.42

No Bid Sheet

No Bid

1.30

*%

$ 141.00

122

Nebulizer, Micro
Mist w/ tee, 7ft.
star lumen tubing,
mouthpiece and
reservoir including
a universal oxygen
connector

EA

3,200

No Bid

$ 0.76

$ 0.70

$ 0.72

$ 1.37

No Bid Sheet

No Bid

0.78

**

$ 2,240.00

123

NRB Mask

EA

10,800

No Bid

$ 0.58

$ 0.67

$ 0.67

$ 1.06

No Bid Sheet

No Bid

0.68

*%

$ 6,264.00

124

O2 Regulator “D”
cylinder

EA

150

No Bid

$ 26.69

$ 42.00

$ 30.60

No Bid

No Bid Sheet

No Bid

23.94

*%

$ 3,591.00

125

O2 Regulator “K”
cylinder

EA

30

No Bid

$ 58.08

$ 83.85

$ 25.26

No Bid

No Bid Sheet

No Bid

25.29

*k

$ 757.80

126

O2 Wrench (D-
Cylinder) - metal

EA

90

No Bid

$ 1.89

$ 1.53

$ 3.35

$ 5.50

No Bid Sheet

No Bid

0.79

*%

$ 71.10

127

OB Kit, including:
(2) OB towelettes,
(2) umbilical
clamps, (2)
alcohol prep
pades, (2) twist ties,
(1) under pad
measuring, 23 X
36”, (1) drape
sheet measuring
40X607, (1)
placenta bag, (1)
set of gloves, (1)
bulb syringe, (1)
OB pad, (1)
scalpel #11, (3) 2-
pack sponges
measuring 4X4, (4)
3ply towels

EA

180

No Bid

$ 4.51

$ 8.00

$ 4.71

$ 6.75

No Bid Sheet

No Bid

8.13

*%

$ 811.80
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MEDCO Quadmed, | Life-Assist, | Henry Schein,| NAO Global BoundTree Performance Medline ZOLL
Inc. Inc. Inc. Health, LLC Medical, LLC Safety Group Industries, Medical
Inc. Group **
Item Description UNIT |QTY Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Totals:
Oral Airway
128/100mm EA 420| No Bid $ 0.15 | $ 018 | $ 017 | $ 0.27 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid No Bid *x 63.00
129(Oral Airvay 40mm |EA 75| No Bid $ 016 | $ 018 | $ 013 | $ 0.24 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.50 | ** 9.75
130|Oral Airwvay 50mm |EA 90| No Bid $ 021]$ 018 | $ 013 | $ 0.48 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid No Bid * 11.70
131|Oral Airvay 60mm |EA 45| No Bid $ 016 | $ 018 | $ 013 | $ 0.24 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.29 | ** 5.85
132|Oral Airway 80mm |EA 150| No Bid $ 0.15 | $ 018 | $ 016 | $ 0.24 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.27 | ** 22.50
133|Oral Airway 90mm (EA 210| No Bid $ 0.15 | $ 018 | $ 016 | $ 0.25 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.23 | ** 31.50
Padded Splint -
134|Medium, wood EA 60| No Bid $ 311 $ 351($%$ 289 | $ 5.05 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 2.07 | * 124.20
Padded Splint -
135|Small, wood EA 120| No Bid $ 226 | $ 342 (% 150 | $ 3.99 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 1.65 | ** 180.00
Padded Splint
long - Large,
136|wood EA 30| No Bid $ 354 ($ 7923 361($% 5.53 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 2.54 | ** 76.20
137|Pedi O2 Mask EA 400| No Bid $ 074 $ 075|$ 072 1% 2.90 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.70 | ** 280.00
Pediatric
Backboard Ferno
138|SW78 EA 25|$ 72570 |$ 316.96 | $ 347.93|$ 391.28 | $ 485.55 [ No Bid Sheet | No Bid bl ok 7,924.00
Pediatric IV Board
139((9”) EA 30| No Bid $ 032($% 042 (% 071 $ 0.92 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.29 | ** 8.70
Pediatric Traction
140|Splint, Ferno SP443 |EA 25| $ 465.85|$ 403.35 | ** $ 41515 $ 515.17 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $  461.81 | ** 10,083.75
141 [Pen Light EA 300 $ 444 | $ 0.63 | $ 070 | $ 072 % 1.72 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.98 | ** 189.00
Pre-filled Saline
142|Flushes, 10ml EA 57,000| No Bid No Bid $ 040 | $ 031($ 0.90 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.29 | ** 16,530.00
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MEDCO Quadmed, | Life-Assist, | Henry Schein,| NAO Global BoundTree Performance Medline ZOLL
Inc. Inc. Inc. Health, LLC Medical, LLC Safety Group Industries, Medical
Inc. Group **
Item Description UNIT |QTY Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Totals:
Probe Covers, B.
Braun Thermoscan
143|PC20 - 200 per box|(Bx 150| No Bid $ 1627 |$ 1524 ($ 1460 | $ 18.14 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid 17.11 | ** 2,190.00
Pulse Oximeter,
(reusable), part
144|#7088 EA 300( $ 2831 (% 17.80 | $ 29.00 | $ 26.88 | No Bid No Bid Sheet | No Bid 28.05 | ** 5,340.00
Pulse Oximeter,
Pediatric,
(reusable), part
145|#7090 EA 240( No Bid $ 3512 | $ 3245 $ 36.88 | No Bid No Bid Sheet | No Bid 43.49 | ** 7,788.00
146(Ring Cutter EA Q0| $ 597 $ 452 | $ 589 ($ 4251 % 38.18 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid 56.50 | ** 382.50
SAM Splint, Sensi-
147|Wrap, 367, 2x5yd  |EA 900( $ 8.68 | $ 418 | $ 414 | $ 738 (% 9.85 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid 10.12 | ** 3,726.00
Scoop Stretcher
148|Ferno SW065MB EA 25| $ 47166 | $ 503.00 | $ 468.52 ($ 560.97 | No Bid No Bid Sheet | No Bid 540.44 | ** 11,713.00
Sharps Container,
Large, 5.4qt, (5.1L),
149|part # 305551 900( $ 6.96 | $ 701 (% 7.00 [ $ 544 $ 7.81 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid 2.82 | ** 2,538.00
Sharps Container,
Small, 160z, part
150|#8900SA EA 300( $ 215 $ 179 ( $ 225 (% 211 $ 2.63 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid 1.13 | ** 339.00
151 [Silver Swaddler EA 210| No Bid $ 2.06 | $ 486 | $ 218 | $ 7.62 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid 0.62 [ ** 130.20
Soft Stretchers
Graham
Megamovers,
152(large EA 40( No Bid $ 2411 | $ 17.70 | $ 1839 | $ 24.01 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid 17.77 | ** 708.00
Sterile Wound
153|Cleanser, 7.40z. EA 990( $ 6.67 | $ 590 ($ 767 ($ 574 | $ 6.87 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid 4.88 | ** 4,831.20
154|Stethoscope EA 180| $ 597 $ 404 | $ 3104 | $ 226 | $ 13.73 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid 4.00 [ ** 406.80
Stylet, Adult,
155(14fr/ch 4.7mm EA 390| No Bid $ 0.99 | $ 200 |$ 150 | $ 2.06 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid 1.53 | ** 386.10
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MEDCO Quadmed, | Life-Assist, | Henry Schein,| NAO Global BoundTree Performance Medline ZOLL
Inc. Inc. Inc. Health, LLC Medical, LLC Safety Group Industries, Medical
Inc. Group **
Item Description UNIT |QTY Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Totals:

156 Stylet, Pedi, 6fr EA 150| No Bid $ 0.99 | $ 310 | $ 150 | $ 2.06 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 1.57 | ** 148.50
Suction Canister,

157|Green, 1,200CC  |EA 330( No Bid $ 263 |$ 276 | $ 284 | $ 3.61 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 2.23 | ** 735.90
Suction Canister,

158|Red, 800 CC EA 390| No Bid $ 222 | $ 325|$% 246 | $ 3.14 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 2.58 | ** 865.80

159|Suction Tubing EA 750| No Bid $ 093 | $ 061 |$%$ 065 $ 4.25 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.62 [ ** 457.50
Syringe, 10ml, Luer

160|Lock EA 2,400( No Bid $ 0.07 | $ 0.07 | $ 061 (3% 0.13 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.09 [ ** 168.00
Syringe, 1ml, Luer

161|Lock EA 1,500( No Bid $ 012 | $ 012 | $ 0.07 | $ 0.10 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.05 | ** 75.00
Syringe, 3ml, Luer

162|Lock EA 4,500 No Bid $ 0.05 | $ 0.06 | $ 0.05($%$ 0.06 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.05 [ ** 225.00
Syringe, 60ml, Luer

163|Lock EA 420( No Bid $ 041 1| $ 050 | $ 037($%$ 0.51 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.35 | ** 147.00
Thermometer
Cover - 200 per
box (for Braun —

164 |tympanic) BX 1,200( No Bid $ 16.27 | $ 2500 | $ 6.10 | $ 18.14 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid No Bid ol 7,320.00
Tongue Depressors

165|(sterile) EA 210 $ 314 | $ 0.03($ 0.03 | $ 005 |$ 0.06 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid No Bid i 6.30
Tourniquet (CAT

166(type) EA 150| No Bid $ 2227 | $ 2139 | $ 0.07 | $ 29.81 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.36 | ** 9.75

167|Trauma Shears EA 375 $ 071 % 0.67 | $ 081 $% 070 | $ 1.76 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 1.14 | ** 251.25
Triangular
Bandages - 240
per box, 36 x 36 x
51 inches or (91.4 x

168|91.4 x 129.5cm) BX 1,500( ** $ 79.07 | $ 7370 | $ 43.20 | $ 94.08 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 66.23 | ** 64,800.00
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MEDCO Quadmed, Life-Assist, | Henry Schein, [ NAO Global BoundTree Performance Medline ZOLL
Inc. Inc. Inc. Health, LLC Medical, LLC Safety Group Industries, Medical
Inc. Group **
Item Description UNIT |QTY Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Totals:
Vaseline Gauze -
16950 per box, 3"x9”  [BX 600| ** $ 21.80 | $ 33.00 | $ 3090 | $ 48.41 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 36.35 | ** $ 13,080.00
Virex Spray Bottle,
170(1 quart EA 120| No Bid No Bid $ 1245 | $ 6.03 | $ 7.20 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 2.69 | ** $ 322.80
171|Wype-All EA 1,050( No Bid No Bid $ 0.08 | $ 004 ($ 0.21 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid $ 0.13 | ** $ 42.00
172|Yankaur Tip EA 600| No Bid $ 0371 % 039 | % 035 (% 0.70 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid No Bid ** $ 210.00
Adult Bougie
Tracheal Tube (not
coiled) - 15 FR, Sun
173|Med EA 45| No Bid $ 6.56 | $ 6.50 | $ 522 ($ 7.67 | No Bid Sheet | No Bid No Bid ** $ 234.90
* Observed tiebreaking coin tossing used to determine firm being awarded
** Firm Deemed Non-Responsive
*** Due to COVID-19 emergency items not available - will be rebid at a later time
Exact Rounded
Supplier Est. Totals Overall % Contract Values Contract Values
Bound Tree $ 323,626.00 40.16% $ 414,484.66 | $ 414,500.00
Henry Schein $ 191,123.76 23.71% $ 244,729.21 | $ 244,800.00
Life-Assist $ 72,485.40 8.99% $ 92,815.75 | $ ©2,800.00
Medline $ 115,403.40 14.32% $ 147,771.18 | $ 147,700.00
Quadmed $ 103,242.30 12.81% $ 132,199.19 | $ 132,200.00
Bid Total: Budget
(Quantity Est.) S 805,950.86 100.00% Totals:] S 1,032,000.00 | $ 1,032,000.00
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