
City of Corpus Christi Bid Tabulation
Sr. Buyer:  Minerva Alvarado RFB 6846 Backfill Materials for CCW Water Line Repairs
Date Opened:  12/23/2025

Group One

Item Description Unit Qty Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

Unit 
Price

Extended 
Price

1 Cement Stabilizing Sand Ton 6,000      $44.85 $269,100.00 $45.25 $271,500.00
2 Cushion Sand Ton 7,500      $15.75 $118,125.00 $19.00 $142,500.00
3 Sandy Loam Ton 2,500      $29.00 $72,500.00 $28.25 $70,625.00
4 Concrete Sand Ton 1,000      $35.00 $35,000.00 $41.45 $41,450.00
5 3/8" Pea Gravel Ton 1,000      $40.50 $40,500.00 $53.45 $53,450.00
6 Portland Cement Ton 1,000      $220.75 $220,750.00 $210.00 $210,000.00

$755,975.00 $789,525.00

Group Two
1 1" - 1 1/2" River Rock Ton 750         $39.00 $29,250.00 No Bid No Bid
2 5/8" River Rock Ton 1,100      $52.50 $57,750.00 No Bid No Bid

$87,000.00Total

G.P. Transport, Inc.

Gregory, TX

Fox Tree & 
Landscape Nursery 

Inc. dba Mother 
Earth Materials

Corpus Christi, TX

Total 
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