
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI BID TABULATION

PURCHASING DIVISION BID INVITATION NO. BI-0117-14

BUYER: GERALD GOODWIN CNG VEHICLES

 

Grapevine DCJ, LLC Autonation Ford Silsbee Ford PERCENT

Grapevine, TX Corpus Christi, TX Silsbee, TX LOCAL BID

UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL IS ABOVE

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE LOW BID 

1 PU-2, 1/2 Ton Extended Cab Pickup, 6.5' Bed, 

3.7 Liter V-6 Engine w/CNG Prep Package 

(68G), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel Westport Wing 

CNG System (18.4 GGE), Towing Package with 

2" Ball Hitch, Spray-in Bedliner, Cab Guard 

Coated with Bedliner, 6-Way Elect. Conn., 

Electric Brake Controller, 2-High Intensity LED 

Strobe Lights Mounted on Cab Guard. LEASE 

PURCHASE - SOLID WASTE OPERATIONS

8 each NO BID NO BID $29,680 $237,440 $28,535 $228,280 4.01%

2 PU-2, 1/2 Ton Crew Cab Pickup, 6.5' Bed, 5.0 

Liter V-8 Engine, Towing Package with 2" Ball 

Hitch, Spray-in Bedliner, Liftgate, Cab Guard 

Coated with Bedliner, 6-Way Elect. Conn., 

Electric Brake Controller, 2- Strobe Lights 

Mounted on Cab Guard. (No CNG - CNG is not 

available on 5.0 liter engine.) LEASE 

PURCHASE - SOLID WASTE OPERATIONS

1 each NO BID NO BID $36,265 $36,265 $26,995 $26,995 34.34%

3 PU-3HD, 3/4 Ton Standard Cab Pickup, 8.0' 

Bed, 6.2 Liter V-8 Engine w/CNG Prep Package 

(98F), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel Westport Wing 

CNG System (18.4 GGE), H. D. Towing 

Package, w/ Hitch Bar and 2-5/16" Ball Hitch, 

Spray-in Bedliner, Cab Guard Coated with 

Bedliner, 6-Way Elect. Conn., Electric Brake 

Controller, Tool Box Behind Cab, 24" Light Bar 

Mounted on Cab Guard. LEASE PURCHASE - 

SOLID WASTE OPERATIONS

1 each NO BID NO BID $30,485 $30,485 NO BID NO BID  

4 PU-3HD, 3/4 Ton Extended Cab Pickup, 6.5' 

Bed, 6.2 Liter V-8 Engine w/CNG Prep Package 

(98F), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel Westport Wing 

CNG System (18.4 GGE), H. D. Towing 

Package, w/ Hitch Bar and 2-5/16" Ball Hitch, 

Spray-in Bedliner, Cab Guard Coated with 

Bedliner, 6-Way Elect. Conn., Liftgate, Electric 

Brake Controller, 24" Light Bar Mounted on Cab 

Guard. LEASE PURCHASE - SOLID WASTE 

OPERATIONS

1 each NO BID NO BID $33,680 $33,680 $31,323 $31,323 7.52%

5 PU-3HD, 3/4 Ton, 4x4, Standard Cab Pickup, 

8.0' Bed, 6.2 Liter V-8 Engine w/CNG Prep 

Package (98F), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel 

Westport Wing CNG System (18.4 GGE), H. D. 

Towing Package, w/ Hitch Bar and 2-5/16" Ball 

Hitch, Spray-in Bedliner, Cab Guard Coated with 

Bedliner, 6-Way Elect. Conn., Electric Brake 

Controller, 110 Gal Diesel Fuel Tank with Tool 

Box, 24" Light Bar Mounted on Cab Guard. 

LEASE PURCHASE - SOLID WASTE 

OPERATIONS

1 each NO BID NO BID $33,785.00 $33,785 NO BID NO BID  

6 PU-3HD, 3/4 Ton, Extended Cab Pickup, 8.0' 

Bed, 6.2 Liter V-8 Engine w/CNG Prep Package 

(98F), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel Westport Wing 

CNG System (18.4 GGE), H. D. Towing 

Package, w/ Hitch Bar and 2" Ball Hitch, Spray-

in Bedliner, Cab Guard Coated with Bedliner, 6-

Way Elect. Conn., Electric Brake Controller,  2- 

Strobe Lights Mounted on Cab Guard. LEASE 

PURCHASE - SOLID WASTE OPERATIONS

1 each NO BID NO BID $31,895 $31,895 NO BID NO BID  



7 Series (HT-1) 12,500 lbs. GVWR, Standard Cab 

and Chassis, 84 inch Cab-to-Axle, 6.2 Liter V-8 

Engine w/CNG Prep Package (98F), Factory 

Approved Bi-Fuel Westport CNG Tank Pack 

System, Two Tanks (42.0 GGE),with HD Crane 

Service Body (RKI), Electric Crane, Dual Rear 

Wheel, Auto. Trans. (PTO Ready), Spray-in Bed 

Liner including top of body, Cab Guard Coated 

with Bedliner on front of Service Body,  H. D. 

Towing Package, w/ Hitch Bar and 2-5/16" Ball 

Hitch, 6-Way Electrical Conn., Electric Brake 

Controller, 2-High Intensity LED Strobe lights 

mounted on Cab Guard. LEASE PURCHASE - 

SOLID WASTE OPERATIONS

1 each NO BID NO BID $63,095 $63,095 NO BID NO BID  

8 PU-2, 1/2 Ton, Standard Cab, Long (8.0') Bed 

Pickup, 3.7 Liter V-6 Engine w/CNG Prep 

Package (68G), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel 

Westport Wing CNG System (18.4 GGE), Spray-

in Bedliner, Tool Box (Black). PURCHASE - 

UTILITIES DEPT.

11 each NO BID NO BID $27,295 $300,245 $27,294 $300,234 0.004%

9 PU-2, 1/2 Ton, 4x4, Extended Cab, Short (6.5') 

Bed Pickup, 5.0 Liter V-8 Engine, w/Spray-in 

Bedliner, Tool Box (Black), Cab Guard Coated 

with Bedliner, High Intensity LED Strobe Lights, 

Grille Guard (Black), Nerf Bars (Black), 

Electronic Shift on the Fly for 4-Wheel Drive, 

Automatic Transmission, Limited Slip Rear Axle - 

(3.55 Ratio), Cruise Control, Front Tow Hooks, 

Skid Plates, Towing Pkg. w/Hitch Bar and 

Combination Pintle and 2" Ball Hitch, 6-Way 

ElectricalConn., Electric Brake Controller, Tires -  

Minimum LT265/70/17 All Terrain. (No CNG - 

this vehicle operates at the Wesley Seale 

Dam and will not have access to CNG Fuel.) 

PURCHASE - UTILITIES DEPT.

1 each NO BID NO BID $26,465 $26,465 $24,254 $24,254 9.12%

10  PU-3HD, 3/4 Ton, 4x4, Crew Cab, XLT Trim, 

Long (8.0’) Bed Pickup, 6.2 Liter Engine, 

w/Spray-in Bed Liner, Cab Guard Coated with 

BedLiner, Tool Boxes (2-Weather Guard Model 

174-5-01, Color - Black or Approved Equal) (1-

Weather Guard Model 117-5-01, Color - Black or 

Approved Equal).  All Tool Boxes Keyed alike.  

Front Brush Guard (Ranch Hand or Approved 

Equal), Running Boards, Heavy Duty Towing 

Pkg. w/Hitch Bar and 2" Ball, 6-Way Elect. 

Conn., Elect. Brake Cont,  Heavy Duty 6-Speed 

Auto. Trans., FX4 Off Road Package, Cruise 

Control, Power Locks-Windows-Mirrors, 

40/20/40 Cloth FrontSeats, AM/FM/CD Radio, 

Electric shift on the Fly for 4 wheel drive, Skid 

Plates, Electronic Locking Rear Axle-(3.73 

Ratio). (No CNG - this vehicle is for 

maintenance on Lake Texana Pipeline and 

will not have access to CNG fuel.) 

PURCHASE - UTILITIES DEPT.

1 each NO BID NO BID $32,995 $32,995 $32,500 $32,500 1.52%

11 PU-2HD, 1/2 Ton, Extended Cab, Short (6.5') 

Bed Pickup, 5.0 Liter V-8 Engine , Heavy 

DutyTowing Package w/Hitch Bar and 2" Ball, 

Spray-in Bedliner, Cab Guard Coated with 

Bedliner, 6-Way Elect. Conn., Electric Brake 

Controller, Cruise Control, LT245/75R17E BSW 

A/T Tires.  (No CNG - this vehicle is for 

maintenance at Choke Canyon Dam and will 

not have access to CNG fuel.) PURCHASE - 

UTILITIES DEPT.

2 each NO BID NO BID $21,250 $42,500 $20,503 $41,006 3.64%

12 SUV-1, Compact Sport Utility Vehicle.  Ford 

Escape or Equal. (No CNG - CNG is not 

currently available on this type of vehicle.) 

PURCHASE - UTILITIES DEPT.

1 each NO BID NO BID $19,975 $19,975 $19,367.51 $19,367.51 3.14%



13 PU-2, 1/2 Ton, 4x4, Crew Cab, 6.5' Bed Pickup, 

5.0 Liter V-8 Engine , Heavy DutyTowing 

Package w/Combination Pintle and 2" Ball, 

Spray-in Bedliner, 6-Way Elect. Conn., Electric 

Brake Controller. (No CNG - CNG is not 

available on 5.0 liter engine.) PURCHASE - 

UTILITIES DEPT.

1 each $23,350 $23,350 $27,075 $27,075 $26,122 $26,122 15.95%

14 PU-3HD, 3/4 Ton Standard Cab Pickup, Delete 

Bed, Low Profile Service Body (RKI), 6.2 Liter V-

8 Engine w/CNG Prep Package (98F), Factory 

Installed Westport Wing CNG System (18.4 

GGE), Liftgate (Tommylift with Toggle Switch 

Controls), Spray-in Bed Liner to include top of 

Service Body, Cab Guard Coated with Bedliner, 

H. D. Towing Package, w/ Hitch Bar and 

Combination Pintle Hitch and 2” Ball, 6-Way 

Electrical Conn., Electric Brake Controller, 

Strobe Lights on Cab Guard, Strobe Lights Front 

and Rear, 4" Vise mounted on Step Bumper. 

PURCHASE - UTILITIES DEPT.

3 each NO BID NO BID $46,075 $138,225 NO BID NO BID  

15 PU-2, 1/2 Ton Extended Cab Pickup, 6.5' Bed, 

3.7 Liter V-6 Engine w/CNG Prep Package 

(68G), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel Westport Wing 

CNG System (18.4 GGE), Towing Package, w/ 

Hitch Bar and Combination Pintle Hitch and 1 

7/8” Ball, Spray-in Bedliner, 6-Way Elect. Conn., 

Electric Brake Controller. PURCHASE - 

UTILITIES DEPT.

3 each NO BID NO BID $28,785 $86,355 $28,091 $84,273 2.47%

16 PU-2, 1/2 Ton Extended Cab Pickup, 6.5' Bed, 

3.7 Liter V-6 Engine w/CNG Prep Package 

(68G), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel Westport Wing 

CNG System (18.4 GGE), Towing Package, w/ 

Hitch Bar and Combination Pintle Hitch and 1 

7/8” Ball, Spray-in Bedliner, Cab Guard Coated 

with Bedliner, 6-Way Elect. Conn., Electric Brake 

Controller. PURCHASE - UTILITIES DEPT.

2 each NO BID NO BID $29,325 $58,650 $28,485.08 $56,970.16 2.95%

17 Series (HT-1.5) 16,000 lbs. GVWR, Crew Cab 

and Chassis, 84 inch Cab-to-Axle, 6.8 Liter V-10 

Engine w/CNG Prep Package (98G), Factory 

Installed Bi-Fuel Westport CNG System with 

Tank Pack System, Two Tanks (42.0 GGE), 

Mounted between Cab and Flatbed Body, Dual 

Rear Wheel, Auto. Trans., Tool Boxes on both 

sides, Pintle Hitch, 6-Way Electrical Conn., 

Electric Brake Controller. PURCHASE - 

UTILITIES DEPT.

1 each NO BID NO BID $57,195 $57,195 NO BID NO BID

18 Series (HT-1.5) 16,000 lbs. GVWR, Crew Cab 

and Chassis, 84 inch Cab-to-Axle, 6.8 Liter V-10 

Engine w/CNG Prep Package (98G), Factory 

Installed Bi-Fuel Westport CNG System with 

Tank Pack System, Two Tanks (42.0 GGE),  

Mounted between Cab and Dump Body, Dual 

Rear Wheel, Auto. Trans., Tool Boxes on both 

sides, Pintle Hitch, 6-Way Electrical Conn., 

Electric Brake Controller. PURCHASE - 

UTILITIES DEPT.

1 each NO BID NO BID $57,490 $57,490 NO BID NO BID

19 Series (HT-1.5) 16,000 lbs. GVWR, Crew Cab 

and Chassis, 84 inch Cab-to-Axle, 6.8 Liter V-10 

Engine w/CNG Prep Package (98G), Factory 

Installed Bi-Fuel Westport CNG System with 

Tank Pack System, Two Tanks (42.0 GGE), 

Mounted Between Cab and Dutec Caged 

Flatbed Dump Body, Dual Rear Wheel, Auto. 

Trans., 2 - Position Pintle Hitch, 6-Way Electrical 

Conn., Electric Brake Controller. PURCHASE - 

UTILITIES DEPT.

2 each NO BID NO BID $69,715 $139,430 NO BID NO BID



20 PU-2, 1/2 Ton, Standard Cab, Long (8.0') Bed 

Pickup, 3.7 Liter V-6 Engine w/CNG Prep 

Package (68G), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel 

Westport Wing CNG System (18.4 GGE), Spray-

in Bedliner, Cab Guard Coated with Bedliner, 

Tool Box (Black), 2-Strobe Lights on Cab Guard. 

PURCHASE - UTILITIES DEPT.

2 each NO BID NO BID $28,175 $56,350 $27,146.08 $54,292.16 3.79%

21 Series (HT-1.5) 16,000 lbs. GVWR, Crew Cab 

and Chassis, 84 inch Cab-to-Axle, 6.8 Liter V-10 

Engine w/CNG Prep Package (98G), Factory 

Installed Bi-Fuel Westport CNG System and 

Tank Pack System, Two Tanks (42.0 GGE), 

Mounted Between Cab and HD Service Body, 

Dual Rear Wheel, Auto. Trans., Spray-in Bed 

Liner including top of body, Cab Guard Coated 

with Bedliner, High Intensity LED Strobe lights, 

Led Directional Light Bar mounted on Cab 

Guard, H. D. Towing Package, w/ Hitch Bar and 

Pintlel Hitch, 6-Way Electrical Conn., Electric 

Brake Controller. PURCHASE - UTILITIES 

DEPT.

1 each NO BID NO BID $58,175 $58,175 NO BID NO BID  

22 PU-2, 1/2 Ton Extended Cab Pickup, Short (6.5') 

Bed, 3.7 Liter V-6 Engine w/CNG Prep Package 

(68G), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel Westport Wing 

CNG System (18.4 GGE), Towing Package w/ 

Hitch Bar and Combination Pintle Hitch and 2” 

Ball, Strobe Lights Front and Rear, Spray-in 

Bedliner, 6-Way Elect. Conn., Electric Brake 

Controller. LEASE PURCHASE - GAS DEPT.

10 each NO BID NO BID $29,175 $291,750 $28,504.08 $285,040.80 2.35%

23 Series (HT-1.5) 16,000 lbs. GVWR Crew Cab 

and Chassis, 84 inch cab-to-axle, 6.8 Liter V-10 

Engine w/CNG Prep Package (98F), Factory 

Installed Bi-Fuel Westport CNG System and 

Tank Pack System, Two Tanks (42.0 GGE), 

Mounted Between Cab and Service Body with 

Canopy Top, Dual rear Wheels, Auto Trans. 

(PTO Ready), Spray-in Bed Liner, High Intensity 

LED Strobe Lights mounted front and rear close 

to roof of Canopy Top, 14" rear Step Bumper. 

LEASE PURCHASE - GAS DEPT.

3 each NO BID NO BID $67,245 $201,735 NO BID NO BID  

24 PU-3HD, 3/4 Ton Extended Cab Pickup, Delete 

Bed, Low Profile Service Body (RKI), 6.2 Liter V-

8 Engine w/CNG Prep Package (98F), Factory 

Installed Westport Wing CNG System (18.4 

GGE), Spray-in Bed Liner, H. D. Towing 

Package, w/ Hitch Bar and Combination Pintle 

Hitch and 2” Ball, Cab Guard Coated with Bed 

Liner, 6-Way Electrical Conn., Electric Brake 

Controller, Strobe Lights Front and Rear. LEASE 

PURCHASE - GAS DEPT.

10 each NO BID NO BID $43,650 $436,500 NO BID NO BID  

25 PU-3HD, 3/4 Ton, Extended Cab Pickup, 8.0' 

Bed, 6.2 Liter V-8 Engine w/CNG Prep Package 

(98F), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel Westport Wing 

CNG System (18.4 GGE), H. D. Towing 

Package, w/ Hitch Bar and 2" Ball Hitch, Spray-

in Bedliner, Cab Guard Coated with Bedliner, 6-

Way Elect. Conn., Electric Brake Controller, 

Strobe Lights Front and Rear. LEASE 

PURCHASE - GAS DEPT.

1 each NO BID NO BID $31,645 $31,645 $31,152.62 $31,152.62 1.58%

26 PU-2, 1/2 Ton, 4x4, Extended Cab, Short (6.5') 

Bed Pickup, 5.0 Liter V-8 Engine, w/Spray-in 

Bedliner, Tool Box - Black. (No CNG - CNG is 

not available on 1/2 ton 4x4.) LEASE 

PURCHASE - ENGINEERING DEPT.

1 each $22,292.60 $22,292.60 $23,625 $23,625 NO BID NO BID 5.98%

27 PU-2, 1/2 Ton Extended Cab Pickup, 6.5' Bed, 

3.7 Liter V-6 Engine w/CNG Prep Package 

(68G), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel Westport Wing 

CNG System (18.4 GGE), w/Spray-in Bedliner, 

Tool Box (Black). LEASE PURCHASE - 

ENGINEERING DEPT.

7 each NO BID NO BID $28,945 $202,615 $28,124.08 $196,868.56 2.92%



28 PU-2, 1/2 Ton Extended Cab Pickup, 6.5' Bed, 

3.7 Liter V-6 Engine w/CNG Prep Package 

(68G), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel Westport Wing 

CNG System (18.4 GGE), w/Spray-in Bedliner. 

PURCHASE - MIS

1 each NO BID NO BID $28,350.00 $28,350 $27,619 $27,619 2.65%

29 Series (HT-1.5) 16,000 lbs. GVWR, Standard 

Cab and Chassis, 108 inch cab-to-axle,  6.8 Liter 

V-10 Engine w/CNG Prep Package (98G), 

Factory Installed Bi-Fuel Westport CNG Tank 

Pack System, Two Tanks (42.0 GGE) with 

Crane Service Body, Dual Rear Wheels, Auto 

Trans. (PTO Ready), 12" rear Step Bumper, 

Liftgate (Tommylift with Toggle Switch Controls), 

H.D. Gas Powered Air Compressor Mounted in 

Front of Service Body Bed, Electric Crane, Spray-

in Bed Liner to include top of Service Body, Cab 

Guard Coated with Bedliner, Pintle Hitch, 6-Way 

Electrical Conn., Electric Brake Controller, 

Strobe Lights on Cab Guard, Strobe Lights Front 

and Rear, 4" Vise mounted on Step Bumper. 

LEASE PURCHASE - FLEET MAINTENANCE

1 each NO BID NO BID $77,840.00 $77,840 NO BID NO BID  

30 PU-2, 1/2 Ton Extended Cab Pickup, 8.0' Bed, 

3.7 Liter V-6 Engine w/CNG Prep Package 

(68G), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel Westport Wing 

CNG System (18.4 GGE), Liftgate (Tommylift 

with Toggle Switch Controls),  Towing Package 

w/ Hitch Bar and Combination Pintle Hitch and 2” 

Ball, Spray-in Bedliner, Cab Guard Coated with 

Bedliner, 6-Way Elect. Conn., Electric Brake 

Controller, 2-High Intensity LED Strobe Lights 

Mounted on Cab Guard. LEASE PURCHASE - 

FACILITY MAINTENANCE

1 each NO BID NO BID $23,645.00 $23,645 NO BID NO BID  

31 PU-2, 1/2 Ton Extended Cab Pickup, 8.0' Bed, 

3.7 Liter V-6 Engine w/CNG Prep Package 

(68G), Factory Installed Bi-Fuel Westport Wing 

CNG System (18.4 GGE),   Towing Package w/ 

Hitch Bar and Combination Pintle Hitch and 2” 

Ball, Spray-in Bedliner, Cab Guard Coated with 

Bedliner, 6-Way Elect. Conn., Electric Brake 

Controller, 2-High Intensity LED Strobe Lights 

Mounted on Cab Guard. LEASE PURCHASE - 

FACILITY MAINTENANCE

1 each NO BID NO BID $29,684.00 $29,684 NO BID NO BID  

Total Award: $45,642.60 $2,768,049.00 $82,572.00  

Grand Total: $2,896,263.60

 NOTE: Grapevine DCJ, LLC provided alternate non-CNG pricing for items 17, 29, & 30. Silsbee Ford provided alternate non-CNG pricing for item 3. 


