
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI BID TABULATION

PURCHASING DIVISION BID INVITATION NO. BI-0259-14

BUYER:  GERALD GOODWIN WHITE PVC PIPE

HD Supply Co. Morrison Supply Co. Ferguson Enterprises CC Distributors

Corpus Christi, Texas Helotes, Texas Corpus Christi, Texas Corpus Christi, Texas

UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1 1/2" PVC PIPE, SCH 40, B.E. 50 Each $5.00 $250.00 $4.40 $220.00 $6.40 $320.00 $3.75 $187.50

2 3/4" PVC PIPE, SCH 40, B.E. 150 Each 6.00 900.00       5.44 816.00      8.00 1,200.00    4.75 712.50      

3 1" PVC PIPE, SCH 40, B.E. 200 Each 8.00 1,600.00    7.52 1,504.00   11.00 2,200.00    6.98 1,396.00   

4 1-1/4" PVC PIPE, SCH 40, B.E. 50 Each 10.00 500.00       9.84 492.00      14.40 720.00       9.35 467.50      

5 1-1/2" PVC PIPE, SCH 40, B.E. 50 Each 11.60 580.00       11.46 573.00      14.20 710.00       10.28 514.00      

6 2" PVC PIPE, SCH 40, B.E. 150 Each 15.60 2,340.00    15.40 2,310.00   18.00 2,700.00    13.74 2,061.00   

7 2-1/2" PVC PIPE, SCH 40, B.E. 30 Each 27.00 810.00       24.90 747.00      30.80 924.00       32.13 963.90      

8 3" PVC PIPE, SCH 40, B.E. 50 Each 31.60 1,580.00    31.50 1,575.00   36.20 1,810.00    28.23 1,411.50   

9 4" PVC PIPE, SCH 40, B.E. 500 Each 42.00 21,000.00  44.02 22,010.00 52.40 26,200.00  38.95 19,475.00 

10 6" PVC PIPE, SCH 40, B.E. 50 Each 75.00 3,750.00    80.64 4,032.00   96.00 4,800.00    76.50 3,825.00   

11 8" PVC PIPE, SCH 40, B.E. 75 Each 114.00 8,550.00    120.50 9,037.50   146.40 10,980.00  NO BID NO BID

12 10" PVC PIPE, SCH 40, B.E. 25 Each 164.00 4,100.00    169.40 4,235.00   210.20 5,255.00    NO BID NO BID

13 12" PVC PIPE, SCH 40, B.E. 25 Each 216.00 5,400.00    223.40 5,585.00   278.00 6,950.00    NO BID NO BID

Total: $51,360.00 $53,136.50 $64,769.00  


