TABULATION OF BIDS

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT

BID DATE: Wed., October 6, 2021

RESIDENTIAL STREET REBUILD PROGRAM (RSRP) YEAR 2
PROJECT NO. 18164A

BAY LTD.

401 CORN PRODUCTS RD.

JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES
7505 UP RIVER RD.

A. ORTIZ CONSTRUCTION & PAVING INC.
102 AIRPORT RD.

GRACE PAVING & CONSTRUCTION, INC.

4237 BALDWIN BLVD.

HAAS-ANDERSON CONSTRUCTION, LTD

1402 HOLLY RD.

RFB # 3861 CC, TX 78409 CC, TEXAS 78409 CC, TX 78405 CC, TX 78405 CC, TX 78417
ITEM | DESCRIPTION [uniT] Qry UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID F

Part A - General (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

F-Al  |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART A) LS 1.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 11,390.93 | $ 11,390.93
F-A2 |BONDS AND INSURANCE (MAX 2%) AL 1.00 | $ 35,115.00 | $ 35,115.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 145,429.88 | $ 145,429.88

STORMWATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN (SWPPP) (PER STREET SEGMENT EXCLUDING
F-A3  |SILT FENCE AND INLET PROTECTION) EA 13.00 | § 1,800.00 | $ 23,400.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 19,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 32,500.00
F-A4  |SILT FENCE (FOR SWPPP) LF 100.00 | $ 6.10 | $ 610.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 350 ($ 350.00
F-A5  |INLET PROTECTION (FOR SWPPP) EA 64.00 [ 170.00 | $ 10,880.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 9,600.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 11,200.00
F-A6 |OZONE ACTION DAYS DAY 12.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 144.00 | S 1.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 12.00
F-A7  |TRAFFIC CONTROL (PLAN PREPARATION) EA 13.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 23,400.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 36,400.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 32,500.00
F-A8  |TRAFFIC CONTROL (MOBILIZATION, IMPLEMENTATION, AND ADJUSTMENTS) MO 31.00 [ $ 5,300.00 | $ 164,300.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 93,000.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 15,500.00
F-A9 |DOOR HANGERS, PRINTED AND DELIVERED (2 PER RESIDENCE) EA 752.00 [ 6.40 | $ 4,812.80 | $ 4.00 | $ 3,008.00 | $ 7.50 | $ 5,640.00
F-A10 |ALLOWANCES FOR UNANTICIPATED GENERAL ACTIVITIES AL 1.00 [ ¢ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (Items F - A1 thru F - A10)| S 282,661.80 S 227,620.00 S 264,522.81 NO BID NO BID

Part B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)

F-B1 |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART B) LS 1.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 116,200.00 | $ 116,200.00 | $ 207,249.04 | $ 207,249.04
F-B2  |REHABILITATION - MILLING OF EXISTING TOP LAYER OF PAVEMENT ASPHALT AND BASE SY-IN | 47,310.00 | $ 195 $ 92,254.50 | $ 2.00|$ 94,620.00 | $ 1.85|$ 87,523.50
F-B3 REHABILITATION - SURFACE PREPARATION sy 6,474.00 | S 5.00|$ 32,370.00 | $ 9.00 | $ 58,266.00 | S 375 |$ 24,277.50
F-B4 |1.5INCH HMAC (TYPE D) sy 2,287.00 | $ 15.00 | S 34,305.00 | $ 16.50 | S 37,73550 | $ 17.00 | $ 38,879.00
F-B5 |2 INCH HMAC (TYPE D) sy 45,466.00 | 16.00 | S 727,456.00 | $ 18.00 | S 818,388.00 | $ 19.00 | $ 863,854.00
F-B6 |3 INCH HMAC (TYPE D) sy 4,187.00| $ 23.00 | $ 96,301.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 104,675.00 | S 22.00 | $ 92,114.00
F-B7 |SINGLE COURSE SURFACE TREATMENT sy 51,940.00 | $ 5.00|$ 259,700.00 | $ 480 (S 249,312.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 259,700.00
F-B8 |PRIME COAT, MC-30 (0.20 GAL/SY) GAL 9,551.00 | $ 630 | S 60,171.30 | $ 6.00 | $ 57,306.00 | $ 6.50 | $ 62,081.50
F-B9 |CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE (TYPE A, GRADE 1-2) SY-IN [ 195,354.00 | $ 240 | S 468,849.60 | $ 370 | $ 722,809.80 | $ 450 (S 879,093.00
F-B10 |TENSAR GEOGRID (TX5) sy 2,000.00 | $ 370 | $ 7,400.00 | S 580 | S 11,600.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 10,000.00
F-B11 |8 INCH LIME STABILIZED SUBGRADE (6%) sy 17,199.00 | $ 11.00 | S 189,189.00 | S 12.00 | S 206,388.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 292,383.00
F-B12 |8 INCH LIME STABILIZED SUBGRADE (8%) sy 11,875.00 | $ 16.00 | S 190,000.00 | $ 14.00 | S 166,250.00 | S 22.00 | $ 261,250.00
F-B13 |12 INCH MOISTURE CONDITIONED COMPACTED SUBGRADE sy 28,285.00 | $ 260 |S 73,541.00 | $ 360 |S 101,826.00 | S 350 | $ 98,997.50
F-B14 |REHABILITATION - 8 INCH LIME TREATED BASE AND SUBGRADE (6%) SY 11,123.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 122,353.00 | $ 11.75 | $ 130,695.25 | $ 17.00 | $ 189,091.00
F-B15 |REHABILITATION - 8 INCH LIME TREATED BASE AND SUBGRADE (8%) SY 6,058.00 | $ 1550 | $ 93,899.00 | $ 13.75 | S 83,297.50 | $ 22.00 | $ 133,276.00
F-B16 |REHABILITATION - CEMENT TREATED BASE AND SUBGRADE (MIN 4") SY-IN [ 13,722.00 | $ 290 |$ 39,793.80 | $ 3.50 | $ 48,027.00 | $ 3.50 [ $ 48,027.00
F-B17 |RECONSTRUCTION - STREET EXCAVATION (ASPHALT, BASE AND SUBGRADE) cyY 9,430.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 226,320.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 330,050.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 282,900.00
F-B18 |REHABILITATION - FULL DEPTH REPAIR sy 822.00 S 50.00 | $ 41,100.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 32,058.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 24,660.00
F-B19 |PAVEMENT REPAIR SF 170.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 5,950.00 | S 34.00 | $ 5,780.00 | S 50.00 | $ 8,500.00
F-B20 |RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS (TYPE II-B-B) (FIRE HYDRANT MARKING) EA 16.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 288.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 256.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 160.00
F-B21 |CONCRETE DRIVEWAY DEMOLITION SF 33,077.00 | $ 240 | S 79,384.80 | $ 400 (S 132,308.00 | S 7.00 | $ 231,539.00
F-B22 |6-INCH CONCRETE DRIVEWAY SF 34,305.00 | $ 12.00 | S 411,660.00 | $ 12.00 | S 411,660.00 | $ 10.25 | $ 351,626.25
F-B23 |ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING MANHOLE RING\COVER IN ROADWAY (SEWER, STORM) EA 12.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 14,400.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 15,000.00

ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING MANHOLE RING\COVER AND INSTALL NEW RING\COVER IN

F-B24 |ROADWAY (SEWER,STORM) EA 12.00 [ $ 1,800.00 | $ 21,600.00 | $ 2,500.00 | S 30,000.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 15,000.00
F-B25 |ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING VALVE BOX (WATER, GAS) EA 11.00 [ $ 910.00 | $ 10,010.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 15,400.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 8,250.00
F-B26 |ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING VALVE BOX AND INSTALL NEW VALVE BOX (WATER, GAS) EA 8.00 | S 1,400.00 | $ 11,200.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 6,000.00
F-B27 |SPEED TABLE/SPEED HUMP EA 200 (S 3,700.00 | S 7,400.00 | S 8,000.00 | S 16,000.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 9,000.00
F-B28 |REMOVE EXISTING CHAIN LINK FENCE AND REPLACE WITH NEW LF 84.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 3,024.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 3,360.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 3,192.00
F-B29 |REMOVE EXISTING WOODEN FENCE AND REPLACE WITH NEW LF 50.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 2,000.00
F-B30 |NEW SIGNAGE EA 68.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 8,840.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 10,200.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 13,600.00
F-B31 |NEW STREET BLADE NAME SIGNS EA 96.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 19,200.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 21,600.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 24,000.00
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BID DATE: Wed., October 6, 2021

RESIDENTIAL STREET REBUILD PROGRAM (RSRP) YEAR 2
PROJECT NO. 18164A

BAY LTD.

401 CORN PRODUCTS RD.

JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES
7505 UP RIVER RD.

A. ORTIZ CONSTRUCTION & PAVING INC.
102 AIRPORT RD.

GRACE PAVING & CONSTRUCTION, INC.

4237 BALDWIN BLVD.

HAAS-ANDERSON CONSTRUCTION, LTD
1402 HOLLY RD.

RFB # 3861 CC, TX 78409 CC, TEXAS 78409 CC, TX 78405 CC, TX 78405 CC, TX 78417
ITEM DESCRIPTION | UN|T| QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID F
F-B32 |RELOCATION OF EXISTING SIGNAGE EA 10.00 | $ 360.00 | $ 3,600.00 | S 400.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 3,750.00
F-B33 |REMOVAL OF EXISTING SIGNAGE EA 68.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 6,120.00 | S 100.00 | $ 6,800.00 | S 100.00 | $ 6,800.00
F-B34 |SIGN SUPPORT ASSEMBLY (WEDGE ANCHOR STEEL SYSTEM) EA 64.00 | $ 240.00 | $ 15,360.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 17,600.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 16,000.00
F-B35 |SIGN SUPPORT ASSEMBLY (TRIANGULAR SLIPBASE SYSTEM) EA 5.00 [ $ 420.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 475.00 [ $ 2,375.00 | S 400.00 | $ 2,000.00
F-B36 |REMOVE AND REPLACE EXISTING MAILBOX EA 10.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 3,300.00 | S 180.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 2,000.00
F-B37 |SODDING, CLEARING AND GRADING sy 10,084.00 | $ 9.80 | $ 98,823.20 | $ 15.00 | S 151,260.00 | S 15.00 | $ 151,260.00
F-B38 |WATER SERVICE LINE ADJUSTMENTS LF 2,000.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 80,000.00 | $ 46.00 | $ 92,000.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 60,000.00
F-B39 |TYPE 'C' PREFABRICATED STOP BAR STRIPING (24-INCH) LF 50.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 22.00 | S 1,100.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 1,250.00
F-B40 |TYPE 1 REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKING (YELLOW) (SOLID) (4-INCH) LF 800.00 | $ 3.00 [ $ 2,400.00 | $ 170 [ $ 1,360.00 | $ 175 | $ 1,400.00
F-B41 |RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS (TYPE II-A-A) EA 10.00 | 18.00 | S 180.00 | S 14.00 | S 140.00 | S 10.00 | $ 100.00
F-B42 |ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED STREET IMPROVEMENTS AL 1.00 [ § 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (Items F-B1 thru F-B42) S 3,648,443.20 S 4,357,503.05 S 4,812,783.29 NO BID NO BID
Part C - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
F-C1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART C) LS 1.00|$ 6,000.00 | S 6,000.00 | S 24,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 49,067.87 | $ 49,067.87
F-C2  |4-INCH CONCRETE SIDEWALK SF 66,874.00 | 9.00 | $ 601,866.00 | $ 9.00 | $ 601,866.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 534,992.00
F-C3 |SIDEWALK DEMOLITION SF 65,953.00 | $ 400 (S 263,812.00 | S 400 (S 263,812.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 329,765.00
F-C4 |CONCRETE CURB RAMP SF 8,573.00 | $ 3250 | $ 278,622.50 | S 25.00 | $ 214,325.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 214,325.00
F-C5 |CURBRAMP DEMOLITION SF 500.00 | $ 410 (S 2,050.00 | $ 400 (S 2,000.00 | S 575|$ 2,875.00
F-C6 |TYPE'C' PREFABRICATED CROSSWALK STRIPING (12-INCH) LF 100.00 | $ 12.00 | S 1,200.00 | $ 550 | $ 550.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 2,500.00
F-C7  |TYPE'C' PREFABRICATED CROSSWALK STRIPING (24-INCH) LF 198.00 | § 24.00 [ $ 4,752.00 | $ 2200($ 4,356.00 | $ 30.00 [ $ 5,940.00
SUBTOTAL PART C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (Items F-C1 thru F-C7)| S 1,158,302.50 S 1,110,909.00 S 1,139,464.87 NO BID NO BID
Part D - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
F-D1  |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART D) LS 1.00|$ 8,000.00 | S 8,000.00 | S 19,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 61,261.23 | $ 61,261.23
F-D2 |DEMOLITION OF EXISTING INLET (O - 5 FEET DEEP) EA 4.00| S 1,300.00 | $ 5,200.00 | S 2,000.00 | S 8,000.00 | S 1,500.00 | $ 6,000.00
F-D3  |EXISTING CURB INLET TOP ADJUSTMENT (REMOVE AND REPLACE, 5' THROAT TYP.) EA 10.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 45,000.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 38,000.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 15,000.00
F-D4 |NEW CURB INLET (5' THROAT OPENING) (I.D. 3.5' X 5') 0 -5 FEET DEEP EA 12.00 [ $ 8,000.00 | S 96,000.00 | $ 5,300.00 | S 63,600.00 | S 4,500.00 | $ 54,000.00
F-D5 |NEW CURB INLET (5' THROAT OPENING) (I.D. 4.5' X 5') 5 - 10 FEET DEEP EA 200 (S 10,800.00 | $ 21,600.00 | $ 8,500.00 | S 17,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 16,000.00
F-D6 |NEW CURB INLET EXTENSION (5' THROAT OPENING) (I.D. 2' X 5') EA 200 (S 2,400.00 | S 4,800.00 | S 3,800.00 | S 7,600.00 | S 3,500.00 | $ 7,000.00
F-D7 |NEW 4-INCH CURB AND GUTTER LF 6,980.00 | $ 45.00 [ $ 314,100.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 202,420.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 153,560.00
F-D8 |NEW 6-INCH CURB AND GUTTER LF 17,325.00 | $ 45.00 [ $ 779,625.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 502,425.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 519,750.00
F-D9 |TYPE 'B' STORM MANHOLE (I.D. 4'X4') 0 -5 FEET DEEP EA 200 (S 6,500.00 | S 13,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | S 18,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 12,000.00
F-D10 |TYPE 'C' STORM MANHOLE (I.D. 4'X4") 5 -7 FEET DEEP EA 3.00($ 6,600.00 | S 19,800.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 22,500.00
F-D11 |CURB & GUTTER DEMOLITION (4-INCH, 6-INCH AND DRIVEWAY) LF 24,305.00 | $ 450 |$ 109,372.50 | $ 7.00 | $ 170,135.00 | $ 7.00 [ $ 170,135.00
F-D12 |VALLEY GUTTER SF 2,394.00 | $ 27.00 | $ 64,638.00 | $ 17.00 | S 40,698.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 67,032.00
F-D13 |VALLEY GUTTER DEMOLITION SF 2,893.00 | $ 450 (S 13,018.50 | $ 400 (S 11,572.00 | $ 8.75|$ 25,313.75
F-D14 |18-INCH ARCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS IV) LF 100.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 227.00 | $ 22,700.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 25,000.00
F-D15 |18-INCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS IIl) LF 440.00 | S 110.00 | $ 48,400.00 | $ 170.00 | S 74,800.00 | S 150.00 | $ 66,000.00
F-D16 |24-INCH ARCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS IlI) LF 100.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 22,500.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 27,500.00
F-D17 |24-INCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS IIl) LF 568.00 [ $ 120.00 | $ 68,160.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 113,600.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 99,400.00
F-D18 |CONCRETE COLLAR (18-24 INCH PIPE) EA 3.00($ 1,400.00 | $ 4,200.00 | S 830.00 | $ 2,490.00 | S 1,250.00 | $ 3,750.00
F-D19 |REMOVAL OF REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (12 - 15 INCH) LF 294.00 | $§ 35.00 | $ 10,290.00 | $ 59.00 | $ 17,346.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 7,350.00
F-D20 |REMOVAL OF REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (18 - 24 INCH) LF 166.00 | $ 62.00 | $ 10,292.00 | $ 106.00 | $ 17,596.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 4,980.00
F-D21 |TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER LINES (0 - 5 FEET DEEP) LF 908.00 | $ 470 | $ 4,267.60 | S 3.00|S 2,724.00 | S 30.00 | $ 27,240.00
F-D22 |TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER LINES (5 - 10 FEET DEEP) LF 100.00 | $ 14.25 | S 1,425.00 | $ 7.00 | S 700.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 4,000.00
F-D23 |TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER INLETS/ TYPE 'B' MANHOLE (0 - 5 FEET DEEP) EA 12.00 [ $ 960.00 | $ 11,520.00 | $ 180.00 | S 2,160.00 | S 1,000.00 | $ 12,000.00
F-D24 |TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER INLETS/ TYPE 'C' MANHOLE (5 - 10 FEET DEEP) EA 3.00 (S 1,200.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 4,800.00 | $ 1,950.00 | $ 5,850.00
F-D25 |ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1.00 [ ¢ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (F-D1 THRU F-D25) 3 1,705,308.60 3 1,419,866.00 S 1,422,621.98 NO BID NO BID
Part E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
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BID DATE: Wed., October 6, 2021
RESIDENTIAL STREET REBUILD PROGRAM (RSRP) YEAR 2 BAY LTD. JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES A. ORTIZ CONSTRUCTION & PAVING INC. GRACE PAVING & CONSTRUCTION, INC. HAAS-ANDERSON CONSTRUCTION, LTD
PROJECT NO. 18164A 401 CORN PRODUCTS RD. 7505 UP RIVER RD. 102 AIRPORT RD. 4237 BALDWIN BLVD. 1402 HOLLY RD.
RFB # 3861 CC, TX 78409 CC, TEXAS 78409 CC, TX 78405 CC, TX 78405 CC, TX 78417
ITEM DESCRIPTION | UN|T| Qry UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID F
F-E1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART E) LS 1.00|$ 2,400.00 | S 2,400.00 | $ 3,000.00 | S 3,000.00 | S 4,477.50 | $ 4,477.50
F-E2  |6-INCH OR 8-INCH A.C.P. WATERLINE TO BE REMOVED AND DISPOSED LF 100.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 96.00 | $ 9,600.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 9,500.00
F-E3 6-INCH OR 8-INCH A.C.P. TO D.I. COUPLINGS EA 8.00 [ $ 700.00 | $ 5,600.00 | S 616.00 | $ 4,928.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 8,000.00
F-E4  |6-INCH WATERLINE ADJUSTMENT EA 5.00 [ $ 4,600.00 | $ 23,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | S 15,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 25,000.00
F-E5 |8-INCH WATERLINE ADJUSTMENT EA 200 (S 5,200.00 | S 10,400.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | S 5,750.00 | $ 11,500.00
F-E6 FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY TYPE 1 (INCLUDES MAIN LINE FITTING) EA 200 (S 5,500.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 8,200.00 | S 16,400.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 19,000.00
F-E7 FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY TYPE 2 (INCLUDES MAIN LINE FITTING) EA 200 (S 5,600.00 | S 11,200.00 | $ 8,300.00 | S 16,600.00 | $ 10,750.00 | $ 21,500.00
F-E8 |ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1.00 [ § 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (E1 THRU E8) S 75,600.00 S 78,528.00 S 103,977.50 NO BID NO BID
Part F - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR
F-F1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART F) LS 1.00 | $ 99.00 | $ 99.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 90.00
F-F2 |ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1.00 [ § 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (F - F1 THRU F - F2) S 2,099.00 S 2,100.00 S 2,090.00 NO BID NO BID
Part G -GAS IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
F-G1 |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART G) LS 100 [$ 199.00 | $ 199.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 225.00
EXCAVATION, BACKFILL AND COMPACTION OF TRENCH FOR GAS LINE (ADJUSTMENT TO BE
F-G2 |COMPLETED BY THE CITY GAS DEPARTMENT) LF 100.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 5,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (F - G1 THRU F - G2) S 4,399.00 S 6,600.00 S 5,225.00 NO BID
TOTAL BASE BID F - (PARTS A THRU G) S 6,876,814.10 S 7,203,126.05 S 7,750,685.45 NO BID NO BID
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TABULATION OF BIDS
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT

BID DATE: Wed., October 6, 2021
RESIDENTIAL STREET REBUILD PROGRAM (RSRP) YEAR 2 GRACE PAVING & CONSTRUCTION, INC. BAY LTD. JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES HAAS-ANDERSON CONSTRUCTION, LTD A. ORTIZ CONSTRUCTION & PAVING, INC.
PROJECT NO. 18164A 4237 BALDWIN BLVD. 401 CORN PRODUCTS RD. 7505 UP RIVER RD. 1402 HOLLY RD. 102 AIRPORT RD.
RFB #3861 CC, TX 78405 CC, TX 78409 CC, TEXAS 78409 CC, TEXAS 78417 CC, TX 78405
ITEM | DESCRIPTION | UN|T| Qry UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID G
Part A - General (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
G-Al [MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART A) LS 1.00($ 5,219.82 | $ 5,219.82 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 7,000.00
G-A2 [BONDS AND INSURANCE (MAX 2%) AL 1.00($ 116,822.09 | $ 116,822.09 | $ 34,115.00 | $ 34,115.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 49,000.00 | $ 49,000.00
STORMWATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN (SWPPP) (PER STREET SEGMENT EXCLUDING
G-A3  [SILT FENCE AND INLET PROTECTION) EA 13.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 16,250.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 24,700.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 19,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 65,000.00
G-A4  [SILT FENCE (FOR SWPPP) LF 100.00 | § 411 S 411.00 | $ 6.30 (S 630.00 | $ 6.00 |$ 600.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 1,200.00
G-AS5  [INLET PROTECTION (FOR SWPPP) EA 63.00 | $§ 68.10 | $ 4,290.30 | $ 180.00 | 11,340.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 9,450.00 | $ 173.00 | $ 10,899.00
G-A6 |OZONE ACTION DAYS DAY 12.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 1,560.00 | $ 12.25 | $ 147.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 1.15($ 13.80
G-A7 [TRAFFIC CONTROL (PLAN PREPARATION) EA 13.00 | $ 1,875.00 | $ 24,375.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 24,700.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 36,400.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 65,000.00
G-A8 [TRAFFIC CONTROL (MOBILIZATION, IMPLEMENTATION, AND ADJUSTMENTS) MO 29.00 | $§ 1,769.30 | $ 51,309.70 | $ 5,300.00 | $ 153,700.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 87,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 72,500.00
G-A9 [DOOR HANGERS, PRINTED AND DELIVERED (2 PER RESIDENCE) EA 780.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 7,800.00 | $ 6.40 [ S 4,992.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 3,120.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 7,800.00
G-A10 [ALLOWANCES FOR UNANTICIPATED GENERAL ACTIVITIES AL 1.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (ltems G-A1 thru G-A10) S 238,037.91 S 274,324.00 $  221,582.00 $ 288,412.80 NO BID
Part B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
G-B1 [MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART B) LS 1.00($ 156,787.70 | $ 156,787.70 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 115,200.00 | $ 115,200.00 | $ 200,000.00 | $ 200,000.00
G-B2 [REHABILITATION - MILLING OF EXISTING TOP LAYER OF PAVEMENT ASPHALT AND BASE SY-IN 37,677.00 | $ 2.85|$ 107,379.45 | $ 195 |$ 73,470.15 | $ 2.00 | $ 75,354.00 | $ 1.15|$ 43,328.55
G-B3  [REHABILITATION - SURFACE PREPARATION sy 4,187.00 | § 750 | $ 31,402.50 | $ 530 (S 22,191.10 | $ 9.00 | $ 37,683.00 | $ 240 S 10,048.80
G-B4 [1.5INCH HMAC (TYPE D) sy 2,287.00 | $ 1475 | $ 33,733.25 | $ 15.00 | $ 34,305.00 | $ 1350 | $ 30,874.50 | $ 15.00 | $ 34,305.00
G-B5 |2 INCH HMAC (TYPE D) sy 38,614.00 ( S 16.50 | $ 637,131.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 617,824.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 695,052.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 656,438.00
G-B6 |3 INCHHMAC (TYPE D) sy 4,187.00 | $ 2138 | S 89,518.06 | $ 24.00 | S 100,488.00 | $ 2500 | $ 104,675.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 92,114.00
G-B7 [SINGLE COURSE SURFACE TREATMENT sy 45,088.00 | 500 (S 225,440.00 | $ 520(S 234,457.60 | $ 480 | S 216,422.40 | $ 400 S 180,352.00
G-B8 [PRIME COAT, MC-30 (0.20 GAL/SY) GAL 8,180.00 | § 493 (S 40,327.40 | $ 6.50 | $ 53,170.00 | $ 6.00 |$ 49,080.00 | $ 400 |$S 32,720.00
G-B9 [CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE (TYPE A, GRADE 1-2) SY-IN | 174,658.00 | $ 3.00 (S 523,974.00 | $ 240 |S 419,179.20 | $ 370 | $ 646,234.60 | $ 450 |$ 785,961.00
G-B10 [TENSAR GEOGRID (TX5) sy 2,000.00 | $ 423 (S 8,460.00 | $ 380 (S 7,600.00 | $ 580 (S 11,600.00 | $ 400 S 8,000.00
G-B11 [8INCH LIME STABILIZED SUBGRADE (6%) sy 25,276.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 404,416.00 | $ 1150 | $ 290,674.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 303,312.00 | $ 13.00 | $ 328,588.00
G-B12 [8INCH LIME STABILIZED SUBGRADE (8%) sy 3,000.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 54,000.00 | $ 16.50 | $ 49,500.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 42,000.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 45,000.00
G-B13 (12 INCH MOISTURE CONDITIONED COMPACTED SUBGRADE sy 24,487.00 S 4.00 | $ 97,948.00 | $ 260 |S 63,666.20 | $ 360 (S 88,153.20 | $ 3.00|$ 73,461.00
G-B14 [REHABILITATION - 8 INCH LIME TREATED BASE AND SUBGRADE (6%) sy 4,544.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 72,704.00 | $ 1150 | $ 52,256.00 | $ 11.75 | $ 53,392.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 63,616.00
G-B15 [REHABILITATION - 8 INCH LIME TREATED BASE AND SUBGRADE (8%) sy 6,058.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 109,044.00 | $ 16.25 | $ 98,442.50 | $ 13.75 | $ 83,297.50 | $ 18.00 | $ 109,044.00
G-B16 [REHABILITATION - CEMENT TREATED BASE AND SUBGRADE (MIN 4") SY-IN 34,872.00( § 1.76 | $ 61,374.72 | $ 3.00 (S 104,616.00 | $ 350 (S 122,052.00 | $ 275 |$ 95,898.00
G-B17 [RECONSTRUCTION - STREET EXCAVATION (ASPHALT, BASE AND SUBGRADE) cy 8,185.00 | $ 1887 | $ 154,450.95 | $ 24.00 | S 196,440.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 286,475.00 | $ 2750 | $ 225,087.50
G-B18 [REHABILITATION - FULL DEPTH REPAIR sy 300.00 | $ 4352 | $ 13,056.00 | $ 56.00 | $ 16,800.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 11,700.00 | $ 42,00 | S 12,600.00
G-B19 [PAVEMENT REPAIR SF 210.00 | $ 1065 | $ 2,236.50 | $ 29.00 [ $ 6,090.00 | $ 34.00 | $ 7,140.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 2,100.00
G-B20 [RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS (TYPE II-B-B) (FIRE HYDRANT MARKING) EA 13.00 | $ 19.50 | $ 253.50 | $ 1850 | $ 240.50 | $ 16.00 | $ 208.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 208.00
G-B21 [CONCRETE DRIVEWAY DEMOLITION SF 35,268.00 | $ 385 (S 135,781.80 | $ 250 |$ 88,170.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 141,072.00 | $ 370 | $ 130,491.60
G-B22 [6-INCH CONCRETE DRIVEWAY SF 41,764.00 | $ 857 (S 357,917.48 | $ 12.00 | $ 501,168.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 501,168.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 584,696.00
G-B23 [ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING MANHOLE RING\COVER IN ROADWAY (SEWER, STORM) EA 7.00|$ 1,569.10 | $ 10,983.70 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 9,100.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 3,050.00 | $ 21,350.00
ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING MANHOLE RING\COVER AND INSTALL NEW RING\COVER IN
G-B24 |ROADWAY (SEWER,STORM) EA 16.00 | $ 1,899.95 | $ 30,399.20 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 30,400.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 40,000.00 | $ 2,870.00 | $ 45,920.00
G-B25 [ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING VALVE BOX (WATER, GAS) EA 1.00($ 923.00 | $ 923.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,150.00 | $ 1,150.00
G-B26 [ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING VALVE BOX AND INSTALL NEW VALVE BOX (WATER, GAS) EA 200($ 1,100.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 1,160.00 | $ 2,320.00
G-B27 [SPEED TABLE/SPEED HUMP EA 200($ 4,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 7,600.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 16,000.00 | $ 6,180.00 | $ 12,360.00
G-B28 [REMOVE EXISTING CHAIN LINK FENCE AND REPLACE WITH NEW LF 394.00 | $ 2145 | $ 8,451.30 | $ 37.00 | $ 14,578.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 15,760.00 | $ 53.00 [ $ 20,882.00
G-B29 [REMOVE EXISTING WOODEN FENCE AND REPLACE WITH NEW LF 304.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 9,120.00 | $ 49.00 | $ 14,896.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 12,160.00 | $ 53.00 [ $ 16,112.00
G-B30 [NEW SIGNAGE EA 72.00 | $ 143.00 | $ 10,296.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 10,080.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 10,800.00 | $ 116.00 | $ 8,352.00
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BID DATE: Wed., October 6, 2021
RESIDENTIAL STREET REBUILD PROGRAM (RSRP) YEAR 2 GRACE PAVING & CONSTRUCTION, INC. BAY LTD. JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES HAAS-ANDERSON CONSTRUCTION, LTD A. ORTIZ CONSTRUCTION & PAVING, INC.
PROJECT NO. 18164A 4237 BALDWIN BLVD. 401 CORN PRODUCTS RD. 7505 UP RIVER RD. 1402 HOLLY RD. 102 AIRPORT RD.
RFB # 3861 CC, TX 78405 CC, TX 78409 CC, TEXAS 78409 CC, TEXAS 78417 CC, TX 78405
ITEM DESCRIPTION [uniT] QTyY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID G
G-B31 [NEW STREET BLADE NAME SIGNS EA 90.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 16,200.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 20,250.00 | $ 174.00 | $ 15,660.00
G-B32 [RELOCATION OF EXISTING SIGNAGE EA 10.00 | $ 187.98 | $ 1,879.80 | $ 370.00 | $ 3,700.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 316.00 | $ 3,160.00
G-B33 [REMOVAL OF EXISTING SIGNAGE EA 7200 | $ 206.77 | S 14,887.44 | $ 93.00 | $ 6,696.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 7,200.00 | $ 79.00 | $ 5,688.00
G-B34 [SIGN SUPPORT ASSEMBLY (WEDGE ANCHOR STEEL SYSTEM) EA 65.00 | $ 260.00 | S 16,900.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 16,250.00 | $ 275.00 | S 17,875.00 | $ 211.00 | $ 13,715.00
G-B35 [SIGN SUPPORT ASSEMBLY (TRIANGULAR SLIPBASE SYSTEM) EA 6.00($S 455.00 | $ 2,730.00 | $ 430.00 | $ 2,580.00 | $ 475.00 | $ 2,850.00 | $ 369.00 | $ 2,214.00
G-B36 [REMOVE AND REPLACE EXISTING MAILBOX EA 10.00 | $ 260.00 | S 2,600.00 | $ 340.00 | $ 3,400.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 290.00 | $ 2,900.00
G-B37 [SODDING, CLEARING AND GRADING Sy 7,576.00 | $ 1075 | $ 81,442.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 75,760.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 113,640.00 | $ 23.00 | $ 174,248.00
G-B38 [WATER SERVICE LINE ADJUSTMENTS LF 2,000.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 76,000.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 80,000.00 | $ 46.00 | $ 92,000.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 22,000.00
G -B39 ([TYPE'C' PREFABRICATED STOP BAR STRIPING (24-INCH) LF 110.00 | § 26.00 | $ 2,860.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 2,750.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 2,420.00 | $ 21.00 | S 2,310.00
G -B40 (TYPE 1 REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKING (YELLOW) (SOLID) (4-INCH) LF 800.00 | 325 (S 2,600.00 | $ 3.10 (S 2,480.00 | $ 1.70 | $ 1,360.00 | $ 265 (S 2,120.00
G-B41 [RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS (TYPE II-A-A) EA 10.00 | § 15.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 1850 | $ 185.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 160.00
G-B42 [ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED STREET IMPROVEMENTS AL 1.00 (S 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (Items G - B1 thru G - B42) 3 3,640,958.75 S 3,418,403.25 $ 4,023,800.20 $  4,111,678.45 NO BID
Part C - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
G-C1 [MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART C) LS 1.00| $ 34,469.41 | $ 34,469.41 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 40,000.00 | $ 40,000.00
G-C2 [4-INCH CONCRETE SIDEWALK SF 56,744.00 | $ 724 | S 410,826.56 | S 9.90 | $ 561,765.60 | S 9.00 | $ 510,696.00 | $ 930 (S 527,719.20
G-C3 [SIDEWALK DEMOLITION SF 46,436.00 | $ 375|$ 174,135.00 | $ 430 | S 199,674.80 | $ 400 |$  185,744.00 | $ 245 S 113,768.20
G-C4 [CONCRETE CURB RAMP SF 8,056.00 | $ 2138 | $ 172,237.28 | $ 33.00 | $ 265,848.00 | $ 25.00 | $  201,400.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 241,680.00
G-C5 [CURBRAMP DEMOLITION SF 500.00 | $ 468 |$ 2,340.00 | $ 420 (S 2,100.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 375 (S 1,875.00
G-C6 |[TYPE'C' PREFABRICATED CROSSWALK STRIPING (12-INCH) LF 100.00 | $ 13.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 12.25 | $ 1,225.00 | $ 550 |$ 550.00 | $ 21.00 | S 2,100.00
G-C7 |TYPE 'C' PREFABRICATED CROSSWALK STRIPING (24-INCH) LF 198.00 [ ¢ 26.00 | $ 5,148.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 4,950.00 | $ 22.00 | § 4,356.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 4,158.00
SUBTOTAL PART C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (Items G - C1 thru G - C7) 3 800,456.25 S 1,041,563.40 3 928,746.00 $ 931,300.40 NO BID
Part D - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
G-D1 [MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART D) LS 1.00 | $ 48,503.89 | $ 48,503.89 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 90,000.00 | $ 90,000.00
G-D2 [DEMOLITION OF EXISTING INLET (0 - 5 FEET DEEP) EA 200($ 1,417.50 | $ 2,835.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 2,100.00
G-D3 [EXISTING CURB INLET TOP ADJUSTMENT (REMOVE AND REPLACE, 5' THROAT TYP.) EA 21.00 | $ 2,042.36 | $ 42,889.56 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 88,200.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 79,800.00 | $ 2,880.00 | $ 60,480.00
G-D4 [NEW CURB INLET (5' THROAT OPENING) (I.D. 3.5' X 5') 0-5 FEET DEEP EA 12.00 | $ 3,985.00 | $ 47,820.00 | $ 8,500.00 | $ 102,000.00 | $ 5,300.00 | $ 63,600.00 | $ 6,550.00 | $ 78,600.00
G-D5 [NEW CURB INLET (5' THROAT OPENING) (I.D. 4.5' X 5') 5 - 10 FEET DEEP EA 200($ 12,307.00 | $ 24,614.00 | $ 11,100.00 | $ 22,200.00 | $ 8,500.00 | $ 17,000.00 | $ 9,180.00 | $ 18,360.00
G-D6 [NEW CURB INLET EXTENSION (5' THROAT OPENING) (I.D. 2' X 5') EA 200($ 6,427.20 | $ 12,854.40 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 7,600.00 | $ 1,730.00 | $ 3,460.00
G-D7 [NEW 4-INCH CURB AND GUTTER LF 8,164.00 | $ 2350 | $ 191,854.00 | $ 46.00 | $ 375,544.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 236,756.00 | $ 49.00 | $ 400,036.00
G-D8 [NEW 6-INCH CURB AND GUTTER LF 12,288.00 | $ 2550 | $ 313,344.00 | $ 46.00 | $ 565,248.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 356,352.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 614,400.00
G-D9 [TYPE'B' STORM MANHOLE (I.D. 4'X4') 0 -5 FEET DEEP EA 4.00]|$ 5,618.60 | $ 22,474.40 | $ 6,700.00 | $ 26,800.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 36,000.00 | $ 6,320.00 | $ 25,280.00
G-D10 ([TYPE'C' STORM MANHOLE (I.D. 4'X4') 5 - 7 FEET DEEP EA 5.00($ 6,268.60 | $ 31,343.00 | $ 6,700.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 8,420.00 | $ 42,100.00
G-D11 [CURB & GUTTER DEMOLITION (4-INCH, 6-INCH AND DRIVEWAY) LF 20,452.00 | § 450 | S 92,034.00 | $ 490 (S 100,214.80 | $ 7.00 | $ 143,164.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 245,424.00
G-D12 [VALLEY GUTTER SF 2,029.00 | $ 1465 | $ 29,724.85 | $ 30.00 | $ 60,870.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 34,493.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 58,841.00
G-D13 [VALLEY GUTTER DEMOLITION SF 1,664.00 | $ 421 (S 7,005.44 | $ 440 (S 7,321.60 | $ 4.00 | $ 6,656.00 | $ 495 |$ 8,236.80
G-D14 [18-INCH ARCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS IV) LF 50.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 227.00 | $ 11,350.00 | $ 184.00 | $ 9,200.00
G-D15 [18-INCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS Ill) LF 1,707.00 | $ 78.34 | S 133,726.38 | $ 110.00 | $ 187,770.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 290,190.00 | $ 84.00 [ $ 143,388.00
G-D16 [24-INCH ARCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS Ill) LF 50.00 | $ 295.00 | $ 14,750.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 11,250.00 | $ 184.00 | $ 9,200.00
G-D17 [24-INCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS Ill) LF 463.00 | $ 90.95 | $ 42,109.85 | $ 120.00 | $ 55,560.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 92,600.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 48,615.00
G-D18 [CONCRETE COLLAR (18-24 INCH PIPE) EA 5.00($ 1,092.00 | $ 5,460.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 830.00 | $ 4,150.00 | $ 527.00 | $ 2,635.00
G-D19 [REMOVAL OF REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (12 - 15 INCH) LF 100.00 | $ 2638 (S 2,638.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 59.00 | $ 5,900.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 1,600.00
G-D20 [REMOVAL OF REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (18 - 24 INCH) LF 20.00 | $ 49.60 | $ 992.00 | $ 63.00 | S 1,260.00 | $ 106.00 | $ 2,120.00 | $ 21.00 [ $ 420.00
G-D21 [TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER LINES (0 - 5 FEET DEEP) LF 2,170.00 | 719 | $ 15,602.30 | $ 290 |$ 6,293.00 | $ 3.00 (S 6,510.00 | $ 1.05|$ 2,278.50
G-D22 [TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER LINES (5 - 10 FEET DEEP) LF 100.00 | § 9.18 | $ 918.00 | $ 1450 | $ 1,450.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 525 S 525.00
G-D23 [TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER INLETS/ TYPE 'B' MANHOLE (0 - 5 FEET DEEP) EA 9.00($ 1,011.11 | S 9,099.99 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 9,900.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 1,620.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 99.00
G-D24 |TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER INLETS/ TYPE 'C' MANHOLE (5 - 10 FEET DEEP) EA 10.00 | $ 1,377.50 | $ 13,775.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 16,000.00 | $ 26.00 | $ 260.00
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BID DATE: Wed., October 6, 2021
RESIDENTIAL STREET REBUILD PROGRAM (RSRP) YEAR 2 GRACE PAVING & CONSTRUCTION, INC. BAY LTD. JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES HAAS-ANDERSON CONSTRUCTION, LTD A. ORTIZ CONSTRUCTION & PAVING, INC.
PROJECT NO. 18164A 4237 BALDWIN BLVD. 401 CORN PRODUCTS RD. 7505 UP RIVER RD. 1402 HOLLY RD. 102 AIRPORT RD.
RFB # 3861 CC, TX 78405 CC, TX 78409 CC, TEXAS 78409 CC, TEXAS 78417 CC, TX 78405
ITEM | DESCRIPTION [uniT] QryY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID G
G- D25 [ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1.00( S 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (G - D1 THRU G - D25) 3 1,126,368.06 S 1,711,431.40 $ 1,506,811.00 $  1,875,538.30 NO BID
Part E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
G-E1  |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART E) LS 1.00 [ $ 6,293.28 | $ 6,293.28 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00
G-E2  [6-INCH OR 8-INCH A.C.P. WATERLINE TO BE REMOVED AND DISPOSED LF 225.00 | $ 113.78 | $ 25,600.50 | $ 70.00 | $ 15,750.00 | $ 96.00 | S 21,600.00 | $ 62.00 | S 13,950.00
G-E3  [6-INCH OR 8-INCH A.C.P. TO D.I. COUPLINGS EA 18.00 | § 725.00 | $ 13,050.00 | $ 720.00 | $ 12,960.00 | $ 616.00 | S 11,088.00 | $ 2,030.00 | $ 36,540.00
G-E4 [6-INCH WATERLINE ADJUSTMENT EA 6.00 | $ 4,225.00 | $ 25,350.00 | $ 4,700.00 | $ 28,200.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 9,850.00 | $ 59,100.00
G-E5 [8-INCH WATERLINE ADJUSTMENT EA 5.00( $ 5,330.00 | $ 26,650.00 | $ 5,300.00 | $ 26,500.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 12,100.00 | $ 60,500.00
G-E6 [FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY TYPE 1 (INCLUDES MAIN LINE FITTING) EA 200($ 10,400.00 | $ 20,800.00 | $ 5,700.00 | $ 11,400.00 | $ 8,200.00 | $ 16,400.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 22,000.00
G-E7 [FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY TYPE 2 (INCLUDES MAIN LINE FITTING) EA 200($ 11,700.00 | $ 23,400.00 | $ 5,700.00 | $ 11,400.00 | $ 8,300.00 | $ 16,600.00 | $ 11,100.00 | $ 22,200.00
G-E8 [ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1.00 (S 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (G - E1 THRU G - E8) 3 146,143.78 S 113,610.00 3 112,688.00 $ 229,790.00 NO BID
Part F - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR
G-F1  [MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART F) LS 1.00( ¢ 90.00 | S 90.00 | S 99.00 | $ 99.00 | S 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 50.00
G-F2 |ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 100 ¢ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (G - F1 THRU G - F2) 3 2,090.00 S 2,099.00 3 2,100.00 $ 2,050.00 NO BID
Part G -GAS IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
G-G1 |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART G) LS 1.00 | $ 166.73 | $ 166.73 | $ 199.00 | $ 199.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 316.00 | $ 316.00
EXCAVATION, BACKFILL AND COMPACTION OF TRENCH FOR GAS LINE (ADJUSTMENT TO BE
G-G2 [COMPLETED BY THE CITY GAS DEPARTMENT) LF 100.00 | § 37.05 | $ 3,705.00 | $ 43.00 | $ 4,300.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 68.00 | $ 6,800.00
SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (G - G1 THRU G - G2) S 3,871.73 $ 4,499.00 S 6,600.00 $ 7,116.00 NO BID
TOTAL BASE BID G - (PARTS A THRU G) S 5,957,926.48 S 6,565,930.05 $ 6,802,327.20 $  7,445,885.95 NO BID
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TABULATION OF BIDS
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT

BID DATE: Wed., October 6, 2021
RESIDENTIAL STREET REBUILD PROGRAM (RSRP) YEAR 2 BAY LTD. JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES HAAS-ANDERSON CONSTRUCTION, LTD A. ORTIZ CONSTRUCTION & PAVING INC. GRACE PAVING & CONSTRUCTION, INC.
PROJECT NO. 18164A 401 CORN PRODUCTS RD. 7505 UP RIVER RD. 1402 HOLLY RD. 102 AIRPORT RD. 4237 BALDWIN BLVD.
RFB # 3861 CC, TX 78409 CC, TEXAS 78409 CC, TEXAS 78417 CC, TX 78405 CC, TX 78405
ITEM | DESCRIPTION | UN|T| Qry UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID H
Part A - General (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
H-Al |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART A) LS 1.00($ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 11,23892 | $ 11,238.92
H-A2 |BONDS AND INSURANCE (MAX 2%) AL 1.00($ 35,115.00 | $ 35,115.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 51,100.00 | $ 51,100.00 | $ 149,342.85 | $ 149,342.85
STORMWATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN (SWPPP) (PER STREET SEGMENT EXCLUDING
H-A3 |SILT FENCE AND INLET PROTECTION) EA 12.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 21,600.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 30,000.00
H-A4 |SILT FENCE (FOR SWPPP) LF 100.00 | § 6.10 | $ 610.00 | $ 6.00 S 600.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 350|$ 350.00
H-A5 |INLET PROTECTION (FOR SWPPP) EA 51.00 | $ 180.00 | 9,180.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 7,650.00 | $ 173.00 | $ 8,823.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 8,925.00
H-A6 |OZONE ACTION DAYS DAY 11.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 132.00 | 1.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 1.00 [ $ 11.00
H-A7 |TRAFFIC CONTROL (PLAN PREPARATION) EA 12.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 21,600.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 33,600.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 30,000.00
H-A8 |TRAFFIC CONTROL (MOBILIZATION, IMPLEMENTATION, AND ADJUSTMENTS) MO 31.00 | $§ 5,700.00 | $ 176,700.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 93,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 77,500.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 15,500.00
H-A9 |DOOR HANGERS, PRINTED AND DELIVERED (2 PER RESIDENCE) EA 750.00 | $ 6.50 | $ 4,875.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 750 | S 5,625.00
H-A10 |ALLOWANCES FOR UNANTICIPATED GENERAL ACTIVITIES AL 1.00 $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (ltems H - Al thru H - A10) S 289,812.00 S 221,361.00 S 283,134.00 $ 260,992.77 NO BID
Part B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
H-B1 |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART B) LS 1.00($ 60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 117,200.00 | $ 117,200.00 | $ 200,000.00 | $ 200,000.00 | $ 218,672.83 | $ 218,672.83
H-B2 |REHABILITATION - MILLING OF EXISTING TOP LAYER OF PAVEMENT ASPHALT AND BASE SY-IN 34,152.00 | $ 1.85|$ 63,181.20 | $ 2.00|$ 68,304.00 | $ 110 | $ 37,567.20 | $ 1.85|$ 63,181.20
H-B3 |REHABILITATION - SURFACE PREPARATION sy 4,187.00 | § 520(S 21,772.40 | $ 9.00 | $ 37,683.00 | $ 240 | S 10,048.80 | $ 375|$ 15,701.25
H-B4 |1.5INCH HMAC (TYPE D) sy 2,287.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 34,305.00 | $ 16.50 | $ 37,735.50 | $ 15.00 | $ 34,305.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 38,879.00
H-B5 |2 INCHHMAC (TYPE D) sy 34,412.00 ( $ 16.00 | $ 550,592.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 619,416.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 585,004.00 | $ 19.00 | $ 653,828.00
H-B6 |3 INCHHMAC (TYPE D) sy 10,780.00 | $ 23.00 | S 247,940.00 | $ 2500 | $ 269,500.00 | $ 2200 (S 237,160.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 237,160.00
H-B7 |SINGLE COURSE SURFACE TREATMENT sy 47,479.00 | $ 510 (S 242,142.90 | $ 480 | S 227,899.20 | $ 340 (S 161,428.60 | $ 5.00|$ 237,395.00
H-B8 |PRIME COAT, MC-30 (0.20 GAL/SY) GAL 8,658.00 | 6.30 (S 54,545.40 | $ 6.00 |$ 51,948.00 | $ 375 (S 32,467.50 | $ 6.50 | $ 56,277.00
H-B9 |CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE (TYPE A, GRADE 1-2) SY-IN | 225,907.00 | $ 240 |$ 542,176.80 | $ 370 | $ 835,855.90 | $ 410 | S 926,218.70 | $ 450|$  1,016,581.50
H-B10 |TENSAR GEOGRID (TX5) sy 2,000.00 | $ 3.70 [ $ 7,400.00 | $ 580 (S 11,600.00 | $ 390 (S 7,800.00 | $ 5.00|$ 10,000.00
H-B11 |8 INCH LIME STABILIZED SUBGRADE (6%) sy 18,492.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 203,412.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 221,904.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 221,904.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 314,364.00
H-B12 |8 INCH LIME STABILIZED SUBGRADE (8%) sy 12,700.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 203,200.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 177,800.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 190,500.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 279,400.00
H-B13 |12 INCH MOISTURE CONDITIONED COMPACTED SUBGRADE sy 29,664.00 | S 270 | S 80,092.80 | $ 360 (S 106,790.40 | $ 250 (S 74,160.00 | $ 350 S 103,824.00
H-B14 |REHABILITATION - 8 INCH LIME TREATED BASE AND SUBGRADE (6%) sy 4,544.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 49,984.00 | $ 11.75 | $ 53,392.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 63,616.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 77,248.00
H-B15 |REHABILITATION - 8 INCH LIME TREATED BASE AND SUBGRADE (8%) sy 6,058.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 96,928.00 | $ 13.75 | $ 83,297.50 | $ 17.00 | $ 102,986.00 | $ 22.00 [ $ 133,276.00
H-B16 |REHABILITATION - CEMENT TREATED BASE AND SUBGRADE (MIN 4") SY-IN 13,722.00 | $ 280 | S 38,421.60 | $ 350 (S 48,027.00 | $ 275 37,735.50 | $ 350 |$ 48,027.00
H-B17 |RECONSTRUCTION - STREET EXCAVATION (ASPHALT, BASE AND SUBGRADE) cy 10,123.00 | $ 24.00 [ S 242,952.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 354,305.00 | $ 26.00 | $ 263,198.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 303,690.00
H-B18 |REHABILITATION - FULL DEPTH REPAIR sy 300.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 16,200.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 11,700.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 12,600.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 9,000.00
H-B19 |PAVEMENT REPAIR SF 200.00 | $§ 30.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 34.00 | $ 6,800.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 10,000.00
H-B20 |RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS (TYPE II-B-B) (FIRE HYDRANT MARKING) EA 11.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 198.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 176.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 187.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 110.00
H-B21 |CONCRETE DRIVEWAY DEMOLITION SF 51,641.00 | § 240 |$ 123,938.40 | $ 4.00 | $ 206,564.00 | $ 370 | $ 191,071.70 | $ 7.00 | S 361,487.00
H-B22 |6-INCH CONCRETE DRIVEWAY SF 52,069.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 624,828.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 624,828.00 | $ 13.00 | $ 676,897.00 | $ 10.25 | $ 533,707.25
H-B23 |ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING MANHOLE RING\COVER IN ROADWAY (SEWER, STORM) EA 7.00($ 1,200.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 8,750.00
ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING MANHOLE RING\COVER AND INSTALL NEW RING\COVER IN
H-B24 |ROADWAY (SEWER,STORM) EA 19.00 | § 1,800.00 | $ 34,200.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 47,500.00 | $ 2,820.00 | $ 53,580.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 23,750.00
H-B25 |ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING VALVE BOX (WATER, GAS) EA 1.00|$ 1,300.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,140.00 | $ 1,140.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 750.00
H-B26 |ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING VALVE BOX AND INSTALL NEW VALVE BOX (WATER, GAS) EA 16.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 22,400.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 1,150.00 | $ 18,400.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 12,000.00
H-B27 |SPEED TABLE/SPEED HUMP EA 200($ 3,700.00 | $ 7,400.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 16,000.00 | $ 6,160.00 | $ 12,320.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 9,000.00
H-B28 |REMOVE EXISTING CHAIN LINK FENCE AND REPLACE WITH NEW LF 50.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 2,750.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 1,900.00
H-B29 |REMOVE EXISTING WOODEN FENCE AND REPLACE WITH NEW LF 50.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 2,750.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 2,000.00
H-B30 |NEW SIGNAGE EA 71.00 | $§ 130.00 | $ 9,230.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 10,650.00 | $ 121.00 | $ 8,591.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 14,200.00

Page 7 of 9




BID DATE: Wed., October 6, 2021

RESIDENTIAL STREET REBUILD PROGRAM (RSRP) YEAR 2
PROJECT NO. 18164A

BAY LTD.

401 CORN PRODUCTS RD.

JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES
7505 UP RIVER RD.

HAAS-ANDERSON CONSTRUCTION, LTD
1402 HOLLY RD.

A. ORTIZ CONSTRUCTION & PAVING INC.

102 AIRPORT RD.

GRACE PAVING & CONSTRUCTION, INC.
4237 BALDWIN BLVD.

RFB # 3861 CC, TX 78409 CC, TEXAS 78409 CC, TEXAS 78417 CC, TX 78405 CC, TX 78405
ITEM DESCRIPTION [uniT] QTyY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID H
H-B31 |NEW STREET BLADE NAME SIGNS EA 86.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 17,200.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 19,350.00 | $ 182.00 | $ 15,652.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 21,500.00
H-B32 |RELOCATION OF EXISTING SIGNAGE EA 10.00 | $ 360.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 331.00 | $ 3,310.00 | $ 375.00 | $ 3,750.00
H-B33 |REMOVAL OF EXISTING SIGNAGE EA 71.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 6,390.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 7,100.00 | $ 83.00 | S 5,893.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 7,100.00
H-B34 |SIGN SUPPORT ASSEMBLY (WEDGE ANCHOR STEEL SYSTEM) EA 66.00 | $ 240.00 | 15,840.00 | $ 275.00 | S 18,150.00 | $ 221.00 | S 14,586.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 16,500.00
H-B35 |SIGN SUPPORT ASSEMBLY (TRIANGULAR SLIPBASE SYSTEM) EA 6.00($S 420.00 | $ 2,520.00 | $ 475.00 | $ 2,850.00 | $ 386.00 | S 2,316.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 2,400.00
H-B36 |REMOVE AND REPLACE EXISTING MAILBOX EA 10.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 3,300.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 303.00 | S 3,030.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 2,000.00
H-B37 |SODDING, CLEARING AND GRADING 5% 9,469.00 | $ 9.80 | $ 92,796.20 | $ 15.00 | $ 142,035.00 | $ 23.00 | $ 217,787.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 142,035.00
H-B38 |WATER SERVICE LINE ADJUSTMENTS LF 2,000.00 | § 40.00 | $ 80,000.00 | $ 46.00 | S 92,000.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 22,000.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 60,000.00
H-B39 |TYPE'C' PREFABRICATED STOP BAR STRIPING (24-INCH) LF 85.00 | 24.00 | S 2,040.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 1,870.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 1,870.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 2,125.00
H-B40 |TYPE 1 REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKING (YELLOW) (SOLID) (4-INCH) LF 800.00 | 3.00 S 2,400.00 | $ 1.70 | $ 1,360.00 | $ 275 | S 2,200.00 | $ 1.75 | $ 1,400.00
H-B41 |RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS (TYPE II-A-A) EA 10.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 100.00
H-B42 |ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED STREET IMPROVEMENTS AL 1.00( S 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (Items H - B1 thru H - B42) S 3,848,606.70 3 4,605,930.50 3 4,503,200.00 $  5,078,069.03 NO BID
Part C - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
H-C1 |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART C) LS 1.00 [ $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 48,855.44 | $ 48,855.44
H-C2  |4-INCH CONCRETE SIDEWALK SF 67,093.00 | $ 9.00 | $ 603,837.00 | $ 9.00 | $ 603,837.00 | S 9.80 | $ 657,511.40 | $ 8.00 [ S 536,744.00
H-C3 |SIDEWALK DEMOLITION SF 70,030.00 | $ 430 (s 301,129.00 | $ 4.00 | S 280,120.00 | $ 245 (S 171,573.50 | $ 475 (S 332,642.50
H-C4 |CONCRETE CURB RAMP SF 7,989.00 | 33.00 | $ 263,637.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 199,725.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 239,670.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 199,725.00
H-C5 |CURB RAMP DEMOLITION SF 500.00 | $ 410 | $ 2,050.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 3.70 | $ 1,850.00 | $ 575 |$ 2,875.00
H-C6 |TYPE'C' PREFABRICATED CROSSWALK STRIPING (12-INCH) LF 100.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 550 |$ 550.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 2,500.00
H-C7  |TYPE'C' PREFABRICATED CROSSWALK STRIPING (24-INCH) LF 373.00 | $ 24.00 | S 8,952.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 8,206.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 8,206.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 11,190.00
SUBTOTAL PART C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (Items H - C1 thru H - C7), S 1,186,805.00 3 1,118,438.00 3 1,129,910.90 $  1,134,531.94 NO BID
Part D - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
H-D1 |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART D) LS 1.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 90,000.00 | $ 90,000.00 | $ 60,432.03 | $ 60,432.03
H-D2 |DEMOLITION OF EXISTING INLET (O - 5 FEET DEEP) EA 500($ 1,600.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 7,500.00
H-D3 |EXISTING CURB INLET TOP ADJUSTMENT (REMOVE AND REPLACE, 5' THROAT TYP.) EA 12.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 50,400.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 45,600.00 | $ 2,880.00 | $ 34,560.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 18,000.00
H-D4 |NEW CURB INLET (5' THROAT OPENING) (1.D. 3.5' X 5') 0 -5 FEET DEEP EA 10.00 | $ 8,300.00 | $ 83,000.00 | $ 5,300.00 | $ 53,000.00 | $ 6,780.00 | $ 67,800.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 45,000.00
H-D5 |NEW CURB INLET (5' THROAT OPENING) (1.D. 4.5' X 5') 5 - 10 FEET DEEP EA 200($ 10,900.00 | $ 21,800.00 | $ 8,500.00 | $ 17,000.00 | $ 9,540.00 | $ 19,080.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 16,000.00
H-D6 |NEW CURB INLET EXTENSION (5' THROAT OPENING) (I.D. 2' X 5') EA 1.00]|$ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 1,730.00 | $ 1,730.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00
H-D7 |NEW 4-INCH CURB AND GUTTER LF 8,869.00 | $ 44.00 | $ 390,236.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 257,201.00 | $ 49.00 | $ 434,581.00 | $ 27.00 | $ 239,463.00
H-D8 |NEW 6-INCH CURB AND GUTTER LF 14,146.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 636,570.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 410,234.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 707,300.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 410,234.00
H-D9 |TYPE'B' STORM MANHOLE (I.D. 4'X4') 0 -5 FEET DEEP EA 200($ 6,500.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 6,620.00 | $ 13,240.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 12,000.00
H-D10 |TYPE'C' STORM MANHOLE (1.D. 4'X4') 5 -7 FEET DEEP EA 200($ 6,600.00 | $ 13,200.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 8,820.00 | $ 17,640.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 15,000.00
H-D11 |CURB & GUTTER DEMOLITION (4-INCH, 6-INCH AND DRIVEWAY) LF 23,015.00 | § 450 (S 103,567.50 | $ 7.00 | $ 161,105.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 276,180.00 | $ 7.00 | S 161,105.00
H-D12 |VALLEY GUTTER SF 2,234.00 | $ 27.00 | S 60,318.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 37,978.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 62,552.00 | $ 28.00 [ $ 62,552.00
H-D13 |VALLEY GUTTER DEMOLITION SF 2,832.00( $ 450 (S 12,744.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 11,328.00 | $ 495 (S 14,018.40 | $ 875 |$ 24,780.00
H-D14 |18-INCH ARCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS IV) LF 50.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 227.00 | $ 11,350.00 | $ 193.00 | $ 9,650.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 12,500.00
H-D15 |18-INCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS Ill) LF 1,385.00 | $§ 110.00 | $ 152,350.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 235,450.00 | $ 88.00 | $ 121,880.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 207,750.00
H-D16 |24-INCH ARCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS IIl) LF 50.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 11,250.00 | $ 193.00 | $ 9,650.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 13,750.00
H-D17 |24-INCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS Ill) LF 100.00 | $ 120.00 | 12,000.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 17,500.00
H-D18 |CONCRETE COLLAR (18-24 INCH PIPE) EA 5.00($ 1,400.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 830.00 | $ 4,150.00 | $ 552.00 | $ 2,760.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 6,250.00
H-D19 |REMOVAL OF REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (12 - 15 INCH) LF 100.00 | $ 25.00 | S 2,500.00 | $ 59.00 | $ 5,900.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 25.00 [ $ 2,500.00
H-D20 |REMOVAL OF REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (18 - 24 INCH) LF 70.00 | $§ 61.00 [ S 4,270.00 | $ 106.00 | $ 7,420.00 | $ 2200 (S 1,540.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 2,100.00
H-D21 |TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER LINES (0 - 5 FEET DEEP) LF 1,385.00 | 460 (S 6,371.00 | $ 3.00 (S 4,155.00 | $ 110 | $ 1,523.50 | $ 30.00 | $ 41,550.00
H-D22 |TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER LINES (5 - 10 FEET DEEP) LF 100.00 | $ 1425 | $ 1,425.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 550 |$ 550.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 4,000.00
H-D23 |TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER INLETS/ TYPE 'B' MANHOLE (0 - 5 FEET DEEP) EA 6.00($ 960.00 | $ 5,760.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 66.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 6,000.00
H-D24 |TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER INLETS/ TYPE 'C' MANHOLE (5 - 10 FEET DEEP) EA 200($ 1,100.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 56.00 | $ 1,950.00 | $ 3,900.00
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BID DATE: Wed., October 6, 2021

RESIDENTIAL STREET REBUILD PROGRAM (RSRP) YEAR 2
PROJECT NO. 18164A

BAY LTD.

401 CORN PRODUCTS RD.

JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES
7505 UP RIVER RD.

HAAS-ANDERSON CONSTRUCTION, LTD
1402 HOLLY RD.

A. ORTIZ CONSTRUCTION & PAVING INC.

102 AIRPORT RD.

GRACE PAVING & CONSTRUCTION, INC.
4237 BALDWIN BLVD.

RFB # 3861 CC, TX 78409 CC, TEXAS 78409 CC, TEXAS 78417 CC, TX 78405 CC, TX 78405
ITEM | DESCRIPTION [uniT] QTyY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID H
H-D25 |ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1.00 S 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (H - D1 THRU H - D25) S 1,626,711.50 3 1,378,901.00 3 1,914,556.90 $  1,403,366.03 NO BID
Part E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
H-E1  |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART E) LS 1.00|$ 2,400.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 5,410.00 | $ 5,410.00 | $ 3,227.63 | $ 3,227.63
H-E2 |6-INCH OR 8-INCH A.C.P. WATERLINE TO BE REMOVED AND DISPOSED LF 55.00 | $ 70.00 | 3,850.00 | $ 96.00 | S 5,280.00 | $ 65.00 | S 3,575.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 5,225.00
H-E3  |6-INCH OR 8-INCH A.C.P. TO D.l. COUPLINGS EA 4.00|$ 700.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 616.00 | S 2,464.00 | $ 2,130.00 | $ 8,520.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
H-E4 |6-INCH WATERLINE ADJUSTMENT EA 3.00|$ 4,600.00 | $ 13,800.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 10,300.00 | $ 30,900.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 15,000.00
H-E5 |8-INCH WATERLINE ADJUSTMENT EA 200($ 5,200.00 | $ 10,400.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 12,700.00 | $ 25,400.00 | $ 5,750.00 | $ 11,500.00
H-E6  |FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY TYPE 1 (INCLUDES MAIN LINE FITTING) EA 1.00|$ 5,500.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 8,200.00 | $ 8,200.00 | $ 11,600.00 | $ 11,600.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 9,500.00
H-E7 |FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY TYPE 2 (INCLUDES MAIN LINE FITTING) EA 200($ 5,600.00 | $ 11,200.00 | $ 8,300.00 | $ 16,600.00 | $ 11,600.00 | $ 23,200.00 | $ 10,750.00 | $ 21,500.00
H-E8 |ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1.00( S 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (H - E1 THRU H - E8) S 54,950.00 3 56,544.00 3 113,605.00 $ 74,952.63 NO BID
Part F - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR
H-F1  |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART F) LS 1.00|$ 99.00 | $ 99.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 50.00 | S 50.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 90.00
H-F2  [ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1.00[ ¢ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (H - F1 THRU H - F2) S 2,099.00 3 2,100.00 3 2,050.00 $ 2,090.00 NO BID
Part G -GAS IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
H-G1 |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART G) LS 1.00 | $ 199.00 | $ 199.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 331.00 | $ 331.00 | $ 225.00 | $ 225.00
EXCAVATION, BACKFILL AND COMPACTION OF TRENCH FOR GAS LINE (ADJUSTMENT TO BE
H-G2 |COMPLETED BY THE CITY GAS DEPARTMENT) LF 100.00 | § 43.00 | $ 4,300.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 72.00 | $ 7,200.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 5,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (H - G1 THRU H - G2) S 4,499.00 3 6,600.00 3 7,531.00 $ 5,225.00 NO BID
TOTAL BASE BID H - (PARTS A THRU G) $ 7,013,483.20 $  7,389,874.50 $ 7,953,987.80 $  7,959,227.40 NO BID
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