

TABULATION OF BIDS
City Project No. 18130A (RFB 5204)
Base Bid 1: Disposal to Cefe Valenzuela Landfill
DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING SERVICES - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE: Wednesday, November 29, 2023 at 2PM

O.N. Stevens Water Treatment Plant Pre-Sedimentation Basin Dredging				GFL Environmental Services USA, Inc. 3301 Benson Dr. Suite 601 Raleigh, NC 27609		American Process Group, LLC 1201 Pacific Ave. #600 Tacoma, WA 98402		Renda Environmental, Inc. 522 Benson Ln Roanoke, TX 76262		Denali Water Solutions LLC 3308 Bernice Ave Russellville, AR 72801	
Item	Description	Unit	Quantity	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
Part A - General											
A1	Mobilization (Maximum of 5% of Total Bid, Complete in Place per Lump Sum)	LS	1	\$299,000.00	\$ 299,000.00	\$433,160.00	\$ 433,160.00	\$620,000.00	\$ 620,000.00	\$700,000.00	\$ 700,000.00
A2	Bonds and Insurance (Maximum Allowance of 2% of Total Bid)	AL	1	\$47,850.00	\$ 47,850.00	\$73,888.00	\$ 73,888.00	\$244,400.00	\$ 244,400.00	\$279,000.00	\$ 279,000.00
A3	Removal, hauling, and disposal of cattails and other aquatic vegetation from Pre-sedimentation Basin, covering up to 50% of pre-sedimentation basin and side slope area, per section 4676 11, Complete in Place per Lump Sum	LS	1	\$222,555.00	\$ 222,555.00	\$156,202.00	\$ 156,202.00	\$75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$175,000.00	\$ 175,000.00
A4	Removal, hauling, and disposal of cattails and other aquatic vegetation from Pre-sedimentation Basin, covering the remaining 50% of pre-sedimentation basin and side slope area, per section 46 76 11, Complete in Place per Lump Sum	LS	1	\$0.00	\$ -	\$52,067.00	\$ 52,067.00	\$25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$175,000.00	\$ 175,000.00
A5	Owner Directed Pre-Sedimentation Basin Shutdown	Weeks	4	\$11,440.00	\$ 45,760.00	\$16,989.00	\$ 67,956.00	\$20,000.00	\$ 80,000.00	\$84,000.00	\$ 336,000.00
A6	Traffic Control Plan & Implementation	LF	1	\$46,400.00	\$ 46,400.00	\$6,310.00	\$ 6,310.00	\$50,000.00	\$ 50,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$ 15,000.00
Subtotal Part A - General (Items A1 thru A6)					\$ 661,565.00		\$ 789,583.00		\$ 1,094,400.00		\$ 1,680,000.00
Part B - Dredging, Dewatering, and Hauling											
B1	Dredging, Dewater, and Haul settled sediments from surface water sources and treatment residuals from Pre-Sedimentatin Basin to Cefe Valenzuela Landfill including all work, tipping fees per wet tons received at the landfill and materials considered subsidiary to this bid item as per specifications, Complete in Place per Dry Ton.	DT	28000	\$184.00	\$ 5,152,000.00	\$232.81	\$ 6,518,680.00	\$335.00	\$ 9,380,000.00	\$472.62	\$ 13,233,360.00
B2	Dredge, Dewater, and Haul additional settled sediments from surface water sources and treatment residuals over quantity specified in Item B1 (over 28,000 DT) from Pre-Sedimentatin basin to Cefe Valenzuela Landfill including all work, tipping fees, per wet tons received at the landfill and materials considered subsidiary to this bid item as per specifications, Complete in Place per Dry Ton.	DT	16000	\$184.00	\$ 2,944,000.00	\$191.97	\$ 3,071,520.00	\$126.60	\$ 2,025,600.00	\$472.62	\$ 7,561,920.00
Subtotal Part B - Dredging, Dewatering, and Hauling (Items B1 thru B2)					\$ 8,096,000.00		\$ 9,590,200.00		\$ 11,405,600.00		\$ 20,795,280.00
Grand Total					\$ 8,757,565.00		\$ 10,379,783.00		\$ 12,500,000.00		\$ 22,475,280.00

TABULATION OF BIDS
City Project No. 18130A (RFB 5204)
Base Bid 2: Disposal by Land Application
DEPARTMENT OF ENGINEERING SERVICES - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS

BID OPENING DATE: Wednesday, November 29, 2023 at 2PM

O.N. Stevens Water Treatment Plant Pre-Sedimentation Basin Dredging				GFL Environmental Services USA, Inc. 3301 Benson Dr. Suite 601 Raleigh, NC 27609		American Process Group, LLC 1201 Pacific Ave. #600 Tacoma, WA 98402		Renda Environmental, Inc. 522 Benson Ln Roanoke, TX 76262		Denali Water Solutions LLC 3308 Bernice Ave Russellville, AR 72801	
Item	Description	Unit	Quantity	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
Part A - General											
A1	Mobilization (Maximum of 5% of Total Bid, Complete in Place per Lump Sum)	LS	1	No Bid	No Bid			\$555,440.00	\$ 555,440.00	\$700,000.00	\$ 700,000.00
A2	Bonds and Insurance (Maximum Allowance of 2% of Total Bid)	AL	1					\$219,000.00	\$ 219,000.00	\$279,000.00	\$ 279,000.00
A3	Removal, hauling, and disposal of cattails and other aquatic vegetation from Pre-sedimentation Basin, covering up to 50% of pre-sedimentation basin and side slope area, per section 4676 11, Complete in Place per Lump Sum	LS	1					\$75,000.00	\$ 75,000.00	\$175,000.00	\$ 175,000.00
A4	Removal, hauling, and disposal of cattails and other aquatic vegetation from Pre-sedimentation Basin, covering the remaining 50% of pre-sedimentation basin and side slope area, per section 46 76 11, Complete in Place per Lump Sum	LS	1					\$25,000.00	\$ 25,000.00	\$175,000.00	\$ 175,000.00
A5	Owner Directed Pre-Sedimentation Basin Shutdown	Weeks	4					\$20,000.00	\$ 80,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$ 100,000.00
A6	Traffic Control Plan & Implementation	LF	1					\$50,000.00	\$ 50,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$ 15,000.00
Subtotal Part A - General (Items A1 thru A6)										\$ 1,004,440.00	
Part B - Dredging, Dewatering, and Hauling											
B1	Dredge residuals from Pre-Sedimentation Basin, Dewater (as applicable), Haul, and properly dispose of residuals at TCEQ registered land application sites including all work and materials considered subsidiary to this bid item as per specifications, Complete in Place per Dry Ton.	DT	28000	No Bid	No Bid			\$296.77	\$ 8,309,560.00	\$397.00	\$ 11,116,000.00
B2	Dredge residuals from Pre-Sedimentation Basin, Dewater (as applicable), Haul, and properly dispose of additional settled sediments and residuals over quantity specified in Item B1 (over 28,000 DT) at TCEQ registered land application sites including all work and materials considered subsidiary to this bid item as per specifications, Complete in Place per Dry Ton.	DT	16000					\$116.00	\$ 1,856,000.00	\$397.00	\$ 6,352,000.00
Subtotal Part B - Dredging, Dewatering, and Hauling (Items B1 thru B2)								\$ 10,165,560.00		\$ 17,468,000.00	
Grand Total								\$ 11,170,000.00		\$ 18,912,000.00	