CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI

PURCHASING DIVISION
BUYER: LATIFAH JACKSON

BID TABULATION
BI-0240-14
TRAFFIC SIGNS

Group | Group Il
Group llI GrouplV
CUSTOM PRODUCTS US STANDARD
CENTERLINE SUPPLY LLC | VULCAN SIGNS 3M COMPANY CORPORATION SIGN
San Antonio, TX Foley, Alabama St. Paul, Minnesota Jackson, Mississippi Franklin Park, lllinois
EXTENDED EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
1.0 |TRAFFIC SIGN POSTS
1.1 |Sign post 2 3/8” OD x .080 (wall 600 | EA |$ 2783($ 16,698.00 % 2219|$ 13,314.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 18.95|8%  11,370.00 | NOBID NO BID
thickness) Galvanized, Pre-drilled
10’ length A-15 hole pattern.
1.2 |Sign post 2 3/8” OD x .080 (wallf 200 [ EA |$ 56.40 | $ 11,280.00 | § 43471 % 8,694.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 4105 $ 8,210.00 | NO BID NO BID
thickness) Powder Coat High
Visibility Yellow, Pre-driled 12’
length A-15 hole pattern.
1.3 |Sign post 2 3/8” OD x .080 (wall 300 EA [S 31841% 955200 % 266419 7,992.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 2310 $ 6,930.00 | NO BID NO BID
thickness) Galvanized, Pre-drilled
12’ length A-15 hole pattern.
1.4.0 |Sign post Anchor System (Poz-
Lok-socket) with wedges.
1.4.1 127" Length 600 | EA |$ 9611% 5766.00]|% 1450 $  11,004.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 1247 | $ 7,482.00 | NOBID NO BID
14.2 |33 Length 100 | EA |$ 11358  1,135.00 | $ 1834 % 2,119.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 14.05| $ 1,405.00 | NOBID NO BID
1.4.3 36" Length 100 | EA |$ 12338  1,233.00($ 211919 275.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 1510 | $ 1,510.00 | NOBID NO BID
1.5 |Wedges Only for Anchor System | 600 | EA |$ 37718 226200 $ 275 % 1,650.00 | NO BID NO BID $ 34718 2,082.00 | NOBID NO BID
(Poz-Lok-socket).
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CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI

PURCHASING DIVISION
BUYER: LATIFAH JACKSON

BID TABULATION
BI-0240-14
TRAFFIC SIGNS

CUSTOM PRODUCTS US STANDARD
CENTERLINE SUPPLY LLC | VULCAN SIGNS 3M COMPANY CORPORATION SIGN
San Antonio, TX Foley, Alabama St. Paul, Minnesota Jackson, Mississippi Franklin Park, lllinois
EXTENDED EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
1.6 |Sign hardware caps (922-X-fits 2| 500 [ EA |$ 4421% 221000 9% 350 % 1,750.00 | NO BID NO BID $ 3108 1,550.00 | NO BID NO BID
3/8” O.D. posts) for extruded
blades.
1.7 |Sign Hardware (990-X-90 degree | 500 [ EA |$ 442($ 2210001 % 335]% 1,675.00 | NO BID NO BID $ 315($ 1,575.00 | NO BID NO BID
X Piece) for extruded blades.
GROUP I TOTAL $ 52,346.00 $  48,473.00 $  42,114.00
Manufacturer: Centerline Supply Stock Trinity RM Components (posts) CPC
(brackets
Lead Time: 30 Days ARO 10-12 weeks 84 (posts) 14 (brakcets)
Minimum Order: As Required Posts must be ordered in full
bundles
2.0 |TRAFFIC SIGN BLANKS
Aluminum Sign Blanks
2.1 12" x 24" Rectangle (vertical 50 EA |$ 556 | $ 278.00| $ 426 $% 213.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 51718 258.50 | § 439 219.50
holes)
22 |12"x 18" Rectangle (vertical 200 | EA |$ 407 ($ 814.00| $ 3.04]8% 608.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 365(% 730.00 | $ 3448 688.00
holes)
2.3 |18"x 18" Square (vertical holes) | 200 [ EA |$ 5501$  1,100.00 | § 471|$ 942.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 54118% 1,082.00 | $ 49418 988.00
24 |18" x 24" Rectangle (horizontal 100 | EA |$ 74518 745.00 | $ 597 % 597.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 715|$ 715.00 | $ 6.60 | $ 660.00
holes)
25 |18"x 48" Rectangle (no holes) 50 EA |$ 1426 | $ 713.00| $ 1245 $ 622.50 | NOBID NO BID $ 139719 698.45 | § 13201 % 660.00
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CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI

PURCHASING DIVISION
BUYER: LATIFAH JACKSON

BID TABULATION
BI-0240-14
TRAFFIC SIGNS

CUSTOM PRODUCTS US STANDARD
CENTERLINE SUPPLY LLC | VULCAN SIGNS 3M COMPANY CORPORATION SIGN
San Antonio, TX Foley, Alabama St. Paul, Minnesota Jackson, Mississippi Franklin Park, lllinois
EXTENDED EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
26 |18"x 60" Rectangle (no holes) 100 | EA |$§ 21448 2,14400|$ 1931 $ 1,931.00 | NO BID NO BID $ 1749 $ 1,749.00 | § 1651|$ 1,651.00
2.7 |18"x 72" Rectangle (no holes) 100 | EA |$ 2547($ 254700 $ 2322|$  2,322.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 2098 (% 2,098.00 | $ 2012 |$ 2,012.00
28 |24"x 24" Square (vertical holes) | 100 [ EA |$ 975 % 975.00 | $ 8199 819.00 | NO BID NO BID $ 9.381(% 938.00 | § 88198 881.00
2.9 24" x 30" Rectangle (horizontal 200 EA |$ 11698  2,338.00($% 1018 |$  2,036.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 1165 $ 2,330.00 | $ 11.01$  2,202.00

holes)
210 24" x 36" Rectangle (horizontal 100 | EA |$ 1404 |$  1,404.00|$ 1232 $ 1,232.00 | NO BID NO BID $ 13819 1,381.00 | § 1320 |$ 1,320.00

holes)
211 |24" x 48" Rectangle (horizontal 00| EA |$ 2311($ 231100 $ 20.081$  2,008.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 18.65| $ 1,865.00 | § 22.00|$ 2,200.00

holes)
212 |24" x 60" Rectangle (no holes) 25 EA |$ 2846|$ 71150 $ 2507 $ 626.75 | NO BID NO BID $ 232219 580.50 | $ 28.52|$ 713.00
2.13 30" x 30" Diamond (vertical holes) | 50 EA |$ 1545 | $ 77250 | $ 1265 $ 632.50 | NO BID NO BID $ 1457 $ 72850 | $ 1720 | $ 860.00
2.14 36" x 36" Rectangle (vertical 50 EA |$ 2678($% 1,339.00|$ 232419 1,162.00 | NO BID NO BID $ 20301 % 1,015.00 | § 2476 |$  1,238.00

holes)

Extruded Aluminum Sign

Blanks
215 |9"x24" 900 | EA [$ 6628 5958.00($% 461|%  4,149.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 6.21]9% 5,589.00 | $ 567|$% 6,390.00
225 ]9"x30 900 | EA [$ 785|%  7,065.00 | $ 575 % 5,175.00 | NO BID NO BID $ 7789 7,002.00 | $ 710|$ 7,668.00
226 ]9"x36" 90 | EA |$ 993|$ 8937.00]|$% 6.87 | $ 6,183.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 9338 8,397.00 | $ 852|$% 8946.00
227 |9"x42 900 | EA [$ 1128 |$ 10,152.00 | § 8.08|$% 7,272.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 1094 | $ 9,846.00 | $ 9.94 8% 8946.00

GROUP II TOTAL $ 50,304.00 $ 38,530.75 $  47,002.95 $ 48,242.50

Manufacturer: Centerline Supply Stock Vulcan CPC US Standard Sign

Lead Time: 30 Days ARO 30 Days ARO 21-30 24 Days

Minimum Order: As Required N/A $1,000.00 $2,500.00
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CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI

PURCHASING DIVISION
BUYER: LATIFAH JACKSON

BID TABULATION
BI-0240-14
TRAFFIC SIGNS

CUSTOM PRODUCTS US STANDARD
CENTERLINE SUPPLY LLC | VULCAN SIGNS 3M COMPANY CORPORATION SIGN
San Antonio, TX Foley, Alabama St. Paul, Minnesota Jackson, Mississippi Franklin Park, lllinois
EXTENDED EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
3 TRAFFIC SIGN SHEETING -
ROLL GOODS
3.0  |White, high intensity grade 5 |ROLLS|$ 436.74|$ 2,183.70|$ 366.00|$ 1,830.00 [ $ 354.00($ 1,770.00 | $ 375.05 | $ 1,875.25 | NOBID NO BID
reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive, 24” x 50 yds.
3.1 |White, high intensity grade 5 |ROLLS|$ 54592|$ 2,72960|$% 45750($% 228750|$ 44250 |8 221250 | $ 47250 | § 2,362.50 | NO BID NO BID
reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive 30" x 50 yds.
3.2 |White, high intensity grade 5 |ROLLS|$ 65511 [$%  3,27555|% 549.00]$ 2,745001$ 531.00|$% 2,655.00]|% 744.00 | $ 3,720.00 | NOBID NO BID
reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive 36" x 50 yds.
3.3 |White, super engineer grade 15 |ROLLS|$ 545.71|$  8,18565|$ 463.50|$ 6,95250 | $ 531.00|$ 7,965.00]|% 44550 | $ 6,682.50 | NO BID NO BID
reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive, 36" x 50 yds.
3.4 |White, super engineer grade 5 |ROLLS| $ 872(% 4360 $ 805]% 4025 % 922|9% 46.10 | $ 990 (% 49,50 | NOBID NOBID
reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive, 5/8" x 50 yds.
3.5  |White, super engineer grade 10 |ROLLS 10.35 § 103.50 | § 9.66 | $ 96.60|$ 11069 110.60 | $ 12.38 | $ 123.80 | NOBID NO BID
reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive, 3/4" x 50 yds.
3.6  |White, super engineer grade 10 |ROLLS| $ 70418 7040 | $ 6.44 1% 6440|$ 737.00|$ 7,370.00 | $ 79219 79.20 | NOBID NO BID
reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive, 1/2" x 50 yds.
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CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI BID TABULATION

PURCHASING DIVISION BI-0240-14
BUYER: LATIFAH JACKSON TRAFFIC SIGNS
CUSTOM PRODUCTS US STANDARD
CENTERLINE SUPPLY LLC | VULCAN SIGNS 3M COMPANY CORPORATION SIGN
San Antonio, TX Foley, Alabama St. Paul, Minnesota Jackson, Mississippi Franklin Park, lllinois
EXTENDED EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
3.7 |White, super engineer grade 10 |ROLLS| $ 1216 | $ 12160 | § 1126 | $ 11260 % 1291 |$ 12910 | § 1386 $ 138.60 | NOBID NO BID

reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive, 7/8" x 50 yds.

3.8 |Orange, super engineer grade 2 |ROLLS|$ 655.11|$  1,31022|$ 549.00|$  1,09800|$% 531.00($ 1,06200|$ 616.07|$ 123214 | NOBID NO BID
reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive, 30" x 50 yds.

3.9 |Orange/white, Barricade high 5 |ROLLS|$ 176.11|$ 880.55|% 123.00]$% 615.00 | § 125.00 | $ 625.00 | $ 13005 | $ 650.25 | NOBID NO BID
intensity grade reflective sheeting,
pressure sensitive, 8" x 50 yds.
(Left)

3.10 |Orange/white, Barricade high 5 |ROLLS|$ 176.11|$ 880.55|% 123.00]$% 615.00 | § 125.00 | $ 625.00 | $ 13005 | $ 650.25 | NOBID NO BID
intensity grade reflective sheeting,
pressure sensitive, 8" x 50 yds.
(Right)

3.1 [Yellow, high intensity grade 2 |ROLLS|$ 54592($% 1,09184|$% 457.00]$ 914.00 | $ 44250($ 885.00 | $ 51339 $ 1,026.78 | NO BID NO BID
reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive, 30" x 50 yds.

3.12 |Yellow, high intensity grade 1 |ROLLS|S$ 655.11]% 655.11|$%  549.00|$ 549.00 | $ 531.00 | $ 531.00 | § 578.07 | § 578.07 | NOBID NO BID
reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive, 36" x 50 yds.

3.13  |Green, high intensity grade 40 |ROLLS|$ 18197 ($ 727880|$ 46356 |$ 1854240|% 14750 |$ 5,900.00 | 189.00 | $ 7,560.00 | NO BID NO BID
reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive, 10" x 50 yds.

3.14 |Green, high intensity grade 3 |ROLLS|$ 32755($ 98265|% 27450]% 82350 | § 265.50 | $ 796.50 | $ 279.00 | $ 837.00 | NOBID NO BID
reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive, 18" x 50 yds.
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CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI

PURCHASING DIVISION
BUYER: LATIFAH JACKSON

BID TABULATION

BI-0240-14

TRAFFIC SIGNS

CUSTOM PRODUCTS US STANDARD
CENTERLINE SUPPLY LLC | VULCAN SIGNS 3M COMPANY CORPORATION SIGN
San Antonio, TX Foley, Alabama St. Paul, Minnesota Jackson, Mississippi Franklin Park, lllinois
EXTENDED EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE

3.15 |Green, high intensity grade 3 |ROLLS|$ 436.74 1,31022|$§  366.00 1,098.00 | § 354.00 1,062.00 | $ 375.06 | $ 1,125.18 | NO BID NO BID
reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive, 24" x 50 yds.

3.16 |Green, high intensity grade 2 |ROLLS|$ 54592 1,091.84 | §  457.50 915.00 | § 44250 885.00 | $ 466.00 | $ 932.00 | NOBID NO BID
reflective sheeting, pressure
sensitive, 30" x 50 yds.

3.17 |Black, non-reflective film, pressure| 5 [ROLLS| $ 7.34 36.70 | $ 7.96 39.801% 4.69 234519 8.66 | $ 43.30 | NOBID NOBID
sensitive, 1/2" x 50 yds.

3.18 |Black, non-reflective film, pressure| 10 [ROLLS| $ 9.17 9170 | $ 9.95 99.50 | $ 5.86 58.60 | $ 10.83 | $ 108.30 | NOBID NO BID
sensitive, 5/8" x 50 yds.

3.19 |Black, non-reflective film, pressure| 10 [ROLLS| $ 10.92 109.20 | § 11.93 119.30 | § 7.03 7030 | $ 1299 | $ 129.90 | NO BID NO BID
sensitive, 3/4" x 50 yds.

3.20 |Black, non-reflective film pressure | 5 [ROLLS| $ 12.85 64.251$ 13.92 69.60 | $ 8.20 41.00 | $ 15.16 | $ 75.80 | NOBID NO BID
sensitive, 7/8” x 50 yds.

321 |Black, non-reflective film, pressure| 4 |ROLLS|$ 42157 1,686.28 | §  270.00 1,080.00 | § 281.25 1,125.00 | $ 309.80 | $ 1,239.20 | NO BID NO BID
sensitive, 30" x 50 yds.

3.22 |SCPM - 3 application tape, 4" x 4 |ROLLS| S 17.90 71601$ 15780 63.121$  12.00 48.00 | $ 1253 $ 50.12 | NOBID NO BID
50 yds.

3.23 |SCPM - 3 application tape, 6" x50 4 |ROLLS|$  26.76 107.04 | $  22.800 91201$  18.00 7200 | $ 18.68 | $ 74.72 | NOBID NO BID
yds.

3.24 |SCPM - 3 application tape, 8" x 4 |ROLLS|$ 3567 142.68 | $  29.830 119.32|$  24.00 96.00 | $ 244319 97.72 | NOBID NO BID
50 yds.
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CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI
PURCHASING DIVISION
BUYER: LATIFAH JACKSON

BID TABULATION
BI-0240-14
TRAFFIC SIGNS

CUSTOM PRODUCTS US STANDARD
CENTERLINE SUPPLY LLC | VULCAN SIGNS 3M COMPANY CORPORATION SIGN
San Antonio, TX Foley, Alabama St. Paul, Minnesota Jackson, Mississippi Franklin Park, lllinois
EXTENDED EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE
3.25 |SPCM - 3 application tape 10" x 8 |ROLLS|$ 4390($ 35120 | $  35.080 | $ 280.64 | $ 30009 240.00 | $ 3018 | $ 241.44 | NOBID NO BID
50 yds.
326 |F-Cal Premium Grade Film24”x | 15 |ROLLS|$ 48048 |$  7,207.20|$ 570.00|$ 8,550.00 | $ 495.00|$% 7,42500]|9% 530.00 | $ 7,950.00 | NOBID NO BID
50 yds.
327 |F-Cal Premium Grade Film30"x | 15 [ROLLS|$ 60060 |$  9,000.00|$ 71250|$ 10,687.50|$% 61875|$ 9281.25[$ 725.07|$  10,876.05 | NOBID NO BID
50 yds.
3.28 |F-Cal Premium Grade Fim36”x | 15 |ROLLS|$ 720.72|$ 10,810.80|$% 85500 |$ 12,82500|$ 74250 |$% 11,137.50|$ 84582 %  12,687.30 | NOBID NO BID
50 yds.
GROUP Il TOTAL | $ 61,883.03 $ 60,498.73 $ 53,110.40 | $  63,196.87
Manufacturer: Avery 3M/ NCI/ ATSM 3M COMPNAY M
Lead Time: 30 Days ARO 30 Days ARO 20-30 DAYS ARO 21 Days
Minimum Order: As Required NONE
TOTAL AWARD
4.0 |Traffic Sign Posts
4.1  |Sign post 10 BWG Tubing (2.875" |  150|EA $  4104|$ 6,156.00 | $ 4619 $ 6,928.50 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
0D) 0.134 (wall thickness) 10’
length.
42  |Sign post 10 BWG Tubing (2.875" |  150|EA $ 4794($ 7,191.00($ 54481% 8,172.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OD) 0.134 (wall thickness) 12’
length.
4.3 |Sign post Sch. 80 Pipe (2.875" 100|EA $ 8100($ 8710000|% 118.02]$ 11,802.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
0D) 0.276 (wall thickness) 10’
length.
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CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI
PURCHASING DIVISION
BUYER: LATIFAH JACKSON

BID TABULATION
BI-0240-14
TRAFFIC SIGNS

CUSTOM PRODUCTS US STANDARD
CENTERLINE SUPPLY LLC | VULCAN SIGNS 3M COMPANY CORPORATION SIGN
San Antonio, TX Foley, Alabama St. Paul, Minnesota Jackson, Mississippi Franklin Park, lllinois
EXTENDED EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE

4.4 |Sign post Sch. 80 Pipe (2.875" 100|EA $ 84.00 | $ 840000 |$ 137.99|$  13,799.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
0D) 0.276 (wall thickness) 12’
length.

45 |Galvanized Triangular Slipbase 100|EA $ 84.20 | $ 842000 |$ 14517|$ 14,517.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Assembly consists of stub, collar,
nuts & bolts, bolt keeper plate
triangle breakaway

4.6  |U-Sign Supports for 2 7/8” OD 50]EA $ 7750 | $ 3875.00|$ 109.22|$ 5,461.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
post

4.7  |T-Sign Supports for 2 7/8” OD 50]EA $ 3770 | $ 1,885.00 | § 3752|$% 1,876.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
post

4.8  |U-Sign Support Extension Post for|  100|EA $ 1544 | $ 1,544.00 | § 18.83|$ 1,883.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
27/8” OD post

49  |U-Bolt Sign Clamps to fit 2 3/8” 600|EA $ 23519 1,410.00 | § 37419 2,244.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OD post

410 |U-Bolt Sign Clamps to fit 2 7/8” 600|EA $ 23519 1,410.00 | § 388]% 2,328.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
OD post

411 |12" Street Name Blade Cross 400|EA $ 11401$ 456000 $ 785]% 3,140.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 9501($ 3,800.00 | NOBID NO BID
Bracket for Extruded Blades

412 |Round Post Cap for 2 3/8” OD 400|EA $ 11401$ 456000 $ 785]% 3,140.00 | NOBID NO BID $ 9501($ 3,800.00 | NOBID NO BID
Post 12" Blade holder for
Extruded Blades

413 |Round Post Cap for 2 7/8” OD 400|EA $ 14409 5,760.00 | $ 1025]$ 4,100.00 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Post 12" Blade holder for
Extruded Blades

414  |Surface Mount Triangle Slipbase 50|EA $ 89.95(% 449750|$ 11327|$ 5,663.50 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Assembly
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CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI

PURCHASING DIVISION
BUYER: LATIFAH JACKSON

BID TABULATION
BI-0240-14
TRAFFIC SIGNS

CUSTOM PRODUCTS US STANDARD
CENTERLINE SUPPLY LLC | VULCAN SIGNS 3M COMPANY CORPORATION SIGN
San Antonio, TX Foley, Alabama St. Paul, Minnesota Jackson, Mississippi Franklin Park, lllinois
EXTENDED EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE UNIT PRICE PRICE

GROUP IV TOTAL | $  67,768.50 | $ 172,351.69 | | $  7,600.00 |
Manufacturer: Centerline Trinity
Lead Time: 30 Days ARO 10-12 weeks
Minimum Order: As Reuired

TOTAL AWARD
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