CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI
PURCHASING DIVISION

SENIOR BUYER: ELISA COVINGTON
DATE: JUNE 19, 2012

Champion Ford
Corpus Christi, Texas

BID INVITATION NO. BI-0044-12, BUYBOARD Contract # 358-10

Caldwell Country Ford
Caldwell, Texas

BID TABULATION

WORK TRUCKS

Philpott Motors
Nederland, Texas

Access Ford
Corpus Christi, Texas

Sames Ford Lincoln
Corpus Christi, Texas

Allen Samuels Chevrolet
Corpus Christi, Texas

DESCRIPTION

oTY]

UNIT

Unit Extended
Price Price

Unit
Price

Extended
Price

Extended
Price

Unit
Price

Unit Extended
Price Price

Unit Extended
Price Price

Unit Extended
Price Price

1. Series (PU-2), %2 Ton, Extended Cab
Pickup, Short (6 '%’) Bed, pipe rack, tow
package and saddle box, in Accordance
with Specification No. 1014. Color —
White.

Street Department

2. Lease Purchase - Series (PU-2), ¥2 Ton,
Crew Cab Pickup, Short (6 %2’) Bed, In
Accordance with Specification No. 1014.
Color — White.

Parks and Recreation Department

3. Series (PU-1), ¥ Ton, 4X4 Extended Cab
Compact Pickup, Short (6’) Bed Pickup, In
Accordance with Specification No. 1014.
Color — White.

Water Department

4. Series (PU-2), ¥ Ton, Extended Cab
Pickup, Short (6 2’) Bed, In Accordance
with Specification No. 1014. Color —
White.

Gas Department

5. Series (PU-2), ¥ Ton, Standard Cab
Pickup, Long (8’) Bed, In Accordance with
Specification No. 1014. Color — White.
Stormwater Department

6. Series (HT-1.5) 15,000 Ibs. GVWR Crew

Cab and Chassis, 60 inch cab-to-axle, with

Service Body and Canopy Top. (Rawson-
Koenig # E60D94, No Exception). In
Accordance with Specifications No. 1009,
1012, and 1013. Color — White.

Gas Department

7. Series (PU-2), ¥ Ton, 4X4 Extended Cab
Pickup, Short (6 ¥2’) Bed, In
Accordance with Specification No. 1014.
Color — White.

Water Department

8. Series (PU-2), %2 Ton, 4x4 Crew Cab
Pickup, Short (6 '2’) Bed, In Accordance
with Specification No. 1014. Color —
White. Parks
and Recreation Department

TOTAL AWARD:

GRAND TOTAL AWARD:

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

$19,685.00  $78,740.00

22,396.00 22,396.00

22,562.00 22,562.00

18,245.00 18,245.00

=2.279. Y

16,554.00 16,554.00

50,800.00  50,800.00 )

2o

22,540.00 22,540.00

L9700 Y

$209,275.00

$314,850.27

$20,644.00  $82,576.00

23,486.00 23,486.00

21,644.00

£, 00 Y

21,644.00

18,276.00

18,276.00

19,337.00

19,337.00

49,877.00  49,887.00

22,986.00 22,986.00

$21,644.00

27,977.09 83,931.27

o, I92.21

$83,931.27

$20,248.00  $80,992.00

22,774.00 22,774.00

22,666.00 22,666.00

No Bid

No Bid

16,717.00

16,717.00

53,298.00 53,298.00

22,670.00 22,670.00

@ Award recommendation based on section 271.905 of the local government code, (Consideration of Location of Bidders Principle Place of Business).

@ per BUYBOARD Contract # 358-10

$20,514.63 $82,058.52

23,036.63  23,036.63

No Bid No Bid

19,424.63

19,424.63

17,723.63

17,723.63

52,459.27  52,459.27

23,470.63  23,470.63

$28,200.00 $112,800.00

34,061.00 34,061.00

32,343.00  32,343.00

27,553.00

27,553.00

23,304.00

23,304.00

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid




