City of Corpus Christi Bid Tabulation
Purchasing Division Bid Invitation No. 167
Buyer: Michael Gutierrez Wrecker Services for City Owned Vehicles

Momento Towing LLC. DRR&RS Inc. dbg Apollo  |Morgan Towing Inc. d_ba Texas
Towing Service Wrecker Service
Corpus Christi, TX Corpus Christi, TX Corpus Christi, TX
ltem Description Unit QTY Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
GROUP 1
Category 1 (9,000 GVWR)
1 Zone 1 Tow EA 765 $59.95 $45,861.75 $65.00 $49,725.00 $125.00 $95,625.00
2 Zone 2 Tow EA 50 $59.95 $2,997.50 $65.00 $3,250.00 $150.00 $7,500.00
3 Zone 3 Tow EA 110 $59.95 $6,594.50 $65.00 $7,150.00 $195.00 $21,450.00
4 Mud Pulls EA 25 $59.95 $1,498.75 $100.00 $2,500.00 $150.00 $3,750.00
Category 2 (9,001-19,000 GVWR)
5 Zone 1 Tow EA 105 $93.50 $9,817.50 $150.00 $15,750.00 $174.50 $18,322.50
6 Zone 2 Tow EA 45 $93.50 $4,207.50 $150.00 $6,750.00 $235.00 $10,575.00
7 Zone 3 Tow EA 30 $93.50 $2,805.00 $150.00 $4,500.00 $287.50 $8,625.00
8 Mud Pulls EA 20 $93.50 $1,870.00 $100.00 $2,000.00 $200.00 $4,000.00
Jump Start
9 Zone 1 Tow EA 40 $46.20 $1,848.00 $50.00 $2,000.00 $110.00 $4,400.00
10 |Zone 2 Tow EA 105 $46.20 $4,851.00 $50.00 $5,250.00 $150.00 $15,750.00
11  |Zone 3 Tow EA 5 $46.20 $231.00 $50.00 $250.00 $195.00 $975.00
Police Flat
12 [Zone 1 Tow EA 315 $49.50 $15,592.50 $50.00 $15,750.00 $110.00 $34,650.00
13 |Zone 2 Tow EA 10 $49.50 $495.00 $50.00 $500.00 $150.00 $1,500.00
14 |Zone 3 Tow EA 35 $49.50 $1,732.50 $50.00 $1,750.00 $195.00 $6,825.00
Dolly Use
15 |[Zone 1 Tow EA 10 $44.00 $440.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
16 |Zone 2 Tow EA 5 $44.00 $220.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
17 |Zone 3 Tow EA 2 $44.00 $88.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
18 |Extra Mileage [ EA | 250 $2.50 | $625.00 $2.00 | $500.00 $2.49 | $622.50
TOTAL $101,775.50 $117,625.00 $234,570.00
GROUP 2
Category 3 (19,001-34,000 GVWR)
19 [Zone 1l Tow EA 50 no bid no bid $240.00 $12,000.00 $240.00 $12,000.00
20 |Zone 2 Tow EA 30 no bid no bid $240.00 $7,200.00 $275.00 $8,250.00
21  |Zone 3 Tow EA 25 no bid no bid $240.00 $6,000.00 $325.00 $8,125.00
22 |Mud Pulls EA 10 no bid no bid $200.00 $2,000.00 $250.00 $2,500.00
Category 4 (34,001+ GVWR)
23 |Zone 1 Tow EA 25 no bid no bid $300.00 $7,500.00 $340.00 $8,500.00
24 |Zone 2 Tow EA 20 no bid no bid $300.00 $6,000.00 $395.00 $7,900.00
25  |Zone 3 Tow EA 15 no bid no bid $300.00 $4,500.00 $465.00 $6,975.00
26 |Mud Pulls EA 5 no bid no bid $275.00 $1,375.00 $350.00 $1,750.00
Jump Start
27 |Zone 1 Tow EA 2 no bid no bid $0.00 $0.00 $195.00 $390.00
28 |Zone 2 Tow EA 2 no bid no bid $0.00 $0.00 $260.00 $520.00
29 |Zone 3 Tow EA 5 no bid no bid $0.00 $0.00 $300.00 $1,500.00
30 [Extra Mileage [ EA | 250 nobid [ nobid $3.00 | $750.00 $450 | $1,125.00
TOTAL $47,325.00 $59,535.00




