City of Corpus Chiristi
Contracts and Procurement Department
Buyer: Minerva Alvarado

Bid Tabulation
RFB No. 2362
Tires for Fleet

Southern Tire Mart

The Goodyear Tire &

T&W Tire, LLC

Beasley Tire Service -

Rubber Company Houston Inc
Corpus Christi, TX Akron, OH Oklahoma City, OK Houston, TX
Iteml Description Unit] QTY [Unit Price| Total Price |Unit Price| Total Price |Unit Price| Total Price |Unit Pricel Total Price
Group 1
1 |11R22.5-Yearl EA | 350 | $315.00 | $110,250.00 | $350.00 | $122,500.00 | $275.00 | $ 96,250.00 | $310.00 | $108,500.00
2 |11R22.5-Year 2 EA | 350 | $324.00 | $113,400.00 | $357.50 | $125,125.00 | $281.88 [ $ 98,658.00 | $310.00 | $108,500.00
3 |11R22.5-Year 3?2 EA | 350 | $334.00 | $116,900.00 | $365.00 | $127,750.00 | $288.92 | $101,122.00 | $326.00 | $114,100.00
$340,550.00 $375,375.00 $296,030.00 $331,100.00
Iltem Description Unit| QTY [Unit Price| Total Price |Unit Price| Total Price |Unit Price| Total Price |UnitPrice| Total Price
Group 2
P265/60R17 Firehawk -
1 lyear1 EA | 423 | $121.00 | $ 51,183.00 $ - $ - $135.00 | $ 57,105.00
P265/60R1/ Firehawk -
2 |vear?2 EA | 423 | $125.00 | $ 52,875.00 $145.00 | $ 61,335.00
P265/60R17 Firehawk -
3 |vears EA | 423 | $128.00 | $ 54,144.00 $155.00 | $ 65,565.00
$158,202.00 No Bid No Bid $184,005.00
Item| Description Unit] QTY [Unit Price| Total Price |Unit Price| Total Price |Unit Pricel Total Price
Group 3
P235/55R17 Goodyear
1 Eagle RSA - Year 1 EA | 150 $104.00 | $ 15,600.00 $120.00 | $ 18,000.00
P235/55R17 Goodyear
2 Eagle RSA - Year 2 EA | 150 $106.00 | $ 15,900.00 $122.00 | $ 18,300.00
P235/55R17 Goodyear
3 Eagle RSA - Year 3 EA | 150 $108.00 | $ 16,200.00 $124.00 | $ 18,600.00
P245/55R18 Goodyear
4 Eagle RSA - Year 1 EA | 425 $121.00 | $ 51,425.00 $139.00 | $ 59,075.00
5 P245/55R18 Goodyear ea | 425 $123.00 | $ 52275.00 $141.00 | $ 50.925.00
Eagle RSA - Year 2 ' 1409 . 1929,




Southern Tire Mart

The Goodyear Tire &

T&W Tire, LLC

Beasley Tire Service -

Rubber Company Houston Inc
Corpus Christi, TX Akron, OH Oklahoma City, OK Houston, TX
Iltem Description Unit| QTY [Unit Price| Total Price |Unit Price| Total Price |Unit Price| Total Price |Unit Price| Total Price
P245/55R18 Goodyear
6 Eagle RSA - Year 3 EA | 425 $125.00 | $ 53,125.00 $144.00 | $ 61,200.00
P205/60R16 Goodyear
7 Eagle Sport - Year 1 EA| 25 $ 7024 | $ 1,756.00 $ 80.00 | $ 2,000.00
P205/60R16 Goodyear
8 Eagle Sport - Year 2 EA| 25 $ 72.00 | $ 1,800.00 $ 83.00| $ 2,075.00
P205/60R16 Goodyear
9 Eagle Sport - Year 3 EA| 25 $ 7400 $ 1,850.00 $ 8500 | $ 2125.00
225/70R15 Goodyear
10 WRL SRA - Year 1 EA | 50 $ 8752 3% 4,376.00 $101.00 | $ 5,050.00
225/70R15 Goodyear
11 WRL SRA - Year 2 EA | 50 $ 89.00 [ $ 4,450.00 $102.00 | $ 5,100.00
225/70R15 Goodyear
12 WRL SRA - Year 3 EA | 50 $ 92.00  $ 4,600.00 $100.00 | $ 5,000.00
225/50R17 Goodyear
13 Eagle Sport - Year 1 EA| 75 $ 8575 % 6,431.25 $ 99.00 | $ 7,425.00
225/50R17 Goodyear
14 Eagle Sport - Year 2 EA| 75 $ 8750 (9% 6,562.50 $101.00 | $ 7,575.00
225/50R17 Goodyear
15 Eagle Sport - Year 3 EA| 75 $ 90.00 [ $ 6,750.00 $104.00 | $ 7,800.00
225/70R19.5 Goodyear
16 |G622 RSD - Year 1 EA | 150 $215.00 | $ 32,250.00 $247.00 | $ 37,050.00
225/70R19.5 Goodyear
17 |G622 RSD - Year 2 EA | 150 $220.00 | $ 33,000.00 $253.00 | $ 37,950.00
225/70R19.5 Goodyear
18 |G622 RSD - Year 3 EA | 150 $225.00 | $ 33,750.00 $259.00 | $ 38,850.00
225/70R19.5 Goodyear
19 |GB47RSS - Year 1 EA | 100 $215.00 | $ 21,500.00 $247.00 | $ 24,700.00
225/70R19.5 Goodyear
20 (G647 RSS - Year 1 EA | 100 $220.00 | $ 22,000.00 $253.00 | $ 25,300.00
225/70R19.5 Goodyear
21 |G647 RSS - Year 1 EA | 100 $225.00 | $ 22,500.00 $259.00 | $ 25,900.00
No Bid $408,100.75 No Bid $ 469,000.00
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