CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI

PURCHASING DIVISION

BUYER: GERALD GOODWIN

Storm Water Improved ROW

BID TABULATION

BID INVITATION NO. BI-0079-14
STORM WATER IMPROVED ROW STRIP MOWING &
BAYFRONT PARKS & MEDIANS TURF & GROUNDS MAINTENANCE

Dorame General

Strip Mowing Aspen Lawn Care, Barbarossa Repair & Lawn, LLC | Maldonado Nursery Tuff Cut Lawn &
LLC (1) Construction, LLC D-Bar Contractors 1) & Landscape, Inc. [O.J. Lawn Services Pang Construction Landscape
Corpus Christi, Texas| Corpus Christi, Texas | San Benito, Texas | Corpus Christi, Texas [Corpus Christi, Texas| Corpus Christi, Texas| Corpus Christi, Texas| Corpus Christi, Texas
UNIT | EXTENDED| UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT [EXTENDED| UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT [EXTENDED
ITEM| DESCRIPTION QTY. | UNIT |CYCLES| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1.0 [High-profile Areas:
1.1 |Group 4 mowing 32.65 | Acre 21 $95.00| $65,136.75| $105.00| $71,993.25( $85.00| $58,280.25| $95.00| $65,136.75| $85.00| $58,280.25( NOBID| NO BID |$100.00| $68,565.00( $150.00| $102,847.50
1.2 |Group 5A mowing | 37.22 | Acre 21 $95.00| $74,253.90( $105.00| $82,070.10( $85.00| $66,437.70|$109.50| $85,587.39( $85.00( $66,437.70| NOBID| NO BID ($110.00( $85,978.20( $150.00| $117,243.00
1.3 |Group 5B mowing | 18.15| Acre 21 $95.00| $36,209.25( $105.00| $40,020.75| $85.00| $32,397.75| $95.00| $36,209.25| $85.00( $32,397.75( NO BID| NO BID $95.00| $36,209.25| $150.00| $57,172.50
1.4 |Group 5C mowing | 11.00 | Each 12 $23.00| $3,036.00| $115.00| $15,180.00( $85.00| $11,220.00|$100.00| $13,200.00| $85.00| $11,220.00f NOBID| NO BID |$100.00| $13,200.00( $150.00| $19,800.00
1.5 |Group 6 mowing 6.50 | Acre 52 $95.00| $32,110.00| $105.00| $35,490.00( $85.00| $28,730.00|$120.00| $40,560.00| $85.00| $28,730.00f NOBID| NOBID |$125.00| $42,250.00( $150.00| $50,700.00
2.0 [Other Areas:
2.1 |Group 1 mowing 30.13 | Acre 21 $95.00| $60,109.35( $100.00| $63,273.00 $80.00| $50,618.40| $96.00| $60,742.08| $85.00( $53,782.05( NO BID| NO BID $95.00| $60,109.35| $150.00| $94,909.50
2.2 |Group 2 mowing 13.30 | Acre 21 $95.00| $26,533.50| $100.00| $27,930.00( $80.00| $22,344.00|$106.00| $29,605.80| $85.00| $23,740.50( $105.00( $29,326.50|$105.00| $29,326.50( $150.00| $41,895.00
2.3 |Group 3 mowing 13.06 | Acre 21 $95.00| $26,054.70| $100.00| $27,426.00( $80.00| $21,940.80|$106.00| $29,071.56| $85.00| $23,312.10( $105.00( $28,797.30|$104.00| $28,523.04( $150.00| $41,139.00
2.4 |Group 7 mowing 2.45 | Acre 8 $95.00| $1,862.00| NO BID NO BID| $80.00( $1,568.00($200.00| $3,920.00| $85.00| $1,666.00| NOBID| NOBID |$200.00| $3,920.00| $150.00( $2,940.00
TOTAL: $325,305.45 $363,383.10 $293,536.90 $364,032.83 $299,566.35 $58,123.80 $368,081.34 $528,646.50
AWARDED: $109,399.90 $52,186.40 $101,346.00 $47,052.60
TOTAL AWARD: $309,984.90

()]

NOTE: Maximum award to any single bidder for this service agreement contract is 38 acres. Contracts will be awarded to more than one bidder to ensure work is completed in a timely manner. Bidders for high-profile areas must

have performed similar work in a Storm Water Department high profile area within the last 24 months, have a local office with a local decision maker, and have 5 continuous years' experience in mowing and ditch slope mowing in
order to be qualified to mow a high-profile area. Aspen Lawn Care, LLC and Dorame General Repair and Lawn, LLC are the only bidders that meet these qualifications necessary to mow Storm Water Department high-profile areas.




Bayfront Parks & Medians
Turf & Grounds Maintenance

Aspen Lawn Care,

Barbarossa

Dorame General

Maldonado Nursery

Tuff Cut Lawn &

LLC Construction, LLC D-Bar Contractors | Repair & Lawn, LLC [& Landscape, Inc. (1)|] O.J. Lawn Services | Pang Construction Landscape
Corpus Christi, Texas [Corpus Christi, Texas |[San Benito, Texas Corpus Christi, Texas |Corpus Christi, Texas|Corpus Christi, Texas [Corpus Christi, Texas |Corpus Christi, Texas
UNIT [EXTENDED| UNIT |[EXTENDED| UNIT [EXTENDED| UNIT [EXTENDED| UNIT | EXTENDED| UNIT |EXTENDED| UNIT | EXTENDED| UNIT [EXTENDED
ITEM| DESCRIPTION | QTY.| UNIT |CYCLES| PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE | PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1.0 [High-profile Areas:
1.1 |Group 1 mowing 6.52 | Acre 42 $75.00| $20,538.00| $55.19| $15,113.23( $45.00| $12,322.80| NOBID| NOBID | $45.00| $12,322.80( NOBID| NOBID |NOBID| NOBID [NOBID| NOBID
1.2 |Group 1A mowing | 31.58 | Acre 42 $75.00| $99,477.00| $55.57| $73,705.83| $45.00| $59,686.20| NO BID| NOBID | $45.00| $59,686.20( NOBID| NOBID |NOBID| NOBID [NOBID| NOBID
1.3 |Group 2 mowing 39.79 | Acre 42 $75.00] $125,338.50| $55.32| $92,449.68( $45.00| $75,203.10/| NOBID| NOBID | $45.00| $75,203.10{ NOBID| NOBID |NOBID| NOBID [NOBID| NOBID
1.4 |Group 3 mowing 9.96 | Each 42 $75.00| $31,374.00| $54.91| $22,969.95( $45.00| $18,824.40| NOBID| NOBID | $45.00| $18,824.40( NOBID| NOBID |NOBID| NOBID [NOBID| NOBID
1.5 |Group 4 mowing 23.86 | Acre 42 $75.00| $75,159.00| $55.55| $55,667.77| $45.00| $45,095.40/| NOBID| NOBID | $45.00| $45,095.40( NOBID| NOBID |NOBID| NOBID [NOBID| NOBID
2.0 [Other Areas:
2.1 |Group 5 mowing 20.01 | Acre 42 $75.00| $63,031.50| $54.90| $46,139.06( $40.00| $33,616.80| $60.00| $50,425.20| $41.86| $35,179.98 NOBID| NOBID | $65.00| $54,627.30 NOBID| NO BID
2.2 |Group 6 mowing 7.55 | Acre 15 $75.00| $8,493.75| $54.00| $6,115.50( $40.00| $4,530.00| $90.00| $10,192.50| $41.86| $4,740.65( NOBID| NOBID | $90.00| $10,192.50( NOBID| NO BID
0.92 | Acre 21 $75.00| $1,449.00| $54.00| $1,043.28| $40.00 $772.80 $90.00| $1,738.80( $41.86 $808.74| NOBID| NOBID | $90.00| $1,738.80| NOBID| NO BID
39.07 | Acre 25 $75.00| $73,256.25| $54.00| $52,744.50( $40.00| $39,070.00| $90.00| $87,907.50| $41.86| $40,886.76( NOBID| NOBID | $90.00| $87,907.50( NOBID| NO BID
2.3 |Group 7 mowing 1.22 | Acre 15 $75.00| $1,372.50| $54.00 $988.20( $40.00 $732.00 $75.00] $1,372.50( $41.86 $766.04| NOBID| NOBID | $80.00| $1,464.00| NOBID| NO BID
41.23 | Acre 21 $75.00| $64,937.25( $54.00| $46,754.82( $40.00| $34,633.20| $75.00| $64,937.25( $41.86( $36,243.64| NOBID| NOBID | $80.00| $69,266.40( NOBID| NO BID
2.4 |Group 8 mowing 10.19 | Acre 15 $75.00| $11,463.75| $54.00| $8,253.90( $40.00| $6,114.00|$105.00| $16,049.25| $41.86] $6,398.30( NOBID| NOBID [$110.00| $16,813.50( NOBID| NO BID
20.47 | Acre 21 $75.00| $32,240.25| $54.00| $23,212.98( $40.00| $17,194.80|$105.00| $45,136.35| $41.86| $17,994.36( NOBID| NOBID [$110.00| $47,285.70 NOBID| NO BID
15.76 | Acre 25 $75.00| $29,550.00| $54.00| $21,276.00 $40.00| $15,760.00|$105.00| $41,370.00| $41.86| $16,492.84 NOBID| NOBID |$110.00| $43,340.00( NOBID| NOBID
TOTAL: $637,680.75 $466,434.69 $363,555.50 $319,129.35 $370,643.20 $332,635.70
AWARDED: $152,423.60 $211,131.90
TOTAL AWARD: $363,555.50
(1) NOTE: Maximum award to any single bidder for this service agreement contract is 160 acres. Contracts will be awarded to more than one bidder to ensure work is completed in a timely manner. Bidders for high-profile areas must

have performed similar work in a Parks & Recreation Department high profile area within the last 24 months, have a local office with a local decision maker, and 5 continuous years' experiencce in turf and grounds maintenance in
order to be qualified to mow a high-profile area . Maldonado Nursery & Landscape, Inc. is the only bidder that meets these qualifications necessary to mow Parks & Recreation Department high-profile areas.




