
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI BID TABULATION

PURCHASING DIVISION               BID INVITATION NO: BI-0146-13

BUYER: GABRIEL MALDONADO 

COUNCIL DATE: JULY 16, 2013

AUTO NATION FORD ACCESS FORD GRIFFITH FORD SEGUIN CALDWELL COUNTY FORD GRANDE TRUCK CENTER

CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS SEGUIN, TEXAS CALDWELL, TEXAS SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS

Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

Item Description Qty. Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

1 2 each $38,959.00 $77,918.00 $39,877.00 $79,754.00 40,192.31 $80,384.62 $41,998.00 $83,996.00 NO BID

 

 

2 1 each 22,750.00 $22,750.00 23,438.00 $23,438.00 23,222.40 $23,222.40 23,993.00 $23,993.00 NO BID

  

(1)  

3 1 each 21,895.00 $21,895.00  NO BID 22,863.56 $22,863.56 23,537.00 $23,537.00 NO BID

 

 

4 1 each 25,485.00 $25,485.00 $25,967.00 $25,967.00 26,098.55 $26,098.55 $27,186.00 $27,186.00 NO BID

 

5 1 each 23,886.00 $23,886.00 24,357.00 $24,357.00 24,280.29 $24,280.29 24,687.00 $24,687.00 NO BID

  

 

6 2 each 28,445.00 $56,890.00 29,802.00 $59,604.00 31,636.29 $63,272.58 32,877.00 $65,754.00 NO BID

  

(2)

7 2 each 23,638.00 $47,276.00 24,601.00 $49,202.00 22,955.38 $45,910.76 NO BID NO BID

  

(1)  

8 4 each 20,390.00 $81,560.00 NO BID 21,263.70 $85,054.80 21,891.00 $87,564.00 NO BID

 

9 1 each 48,441.00 $48,441.00 48,791.00 $48,791.00 49,355.99 $49,355.99 51,591.00 $51,591.00 39,773.00 $39,773.00

  

(2)  

10 2 each 52,758.00 $105,516.00 54,194.00 $108,388.00 50,497.56 $100,995.12 52,355.00 $104,710.00 55,063.00 $110,126.00

  

 

11 1 each 34,195.00 $34,195.00 34,516.00 $34,516.00 35,105.10 $35,105.10 35,571.00 $35,571.00 36,973.00 $36,973.00

 

12 2 each 27,545.00 $55,090.00 28,634.00 $57,268.00 29,598.82 $59,197.64 30,632.00 $61,264.00  NO BID

  

13 1 each 24,894.00 $24,894.00 25,498.00 $25,498.00 25,358.25 $25,358.25 25,793.00 $25,793.00  NO BID

  

 

14 2 each 20,298.00 $40,596.00 20,506.00 $41,012.00 20,698.82 $41,397.64 21,302.00 $42,604.00  NO BID

 

15 2 each 32,198.00 $64,396.00 33,425.00 $66,850.00 31,689.34 $63,378.68  NO BID NO BID

  

(2)  

16 1 each 21,798.00 $21,798.00 22,220.00 $22,220.00 21,535.91 $21,535.91 22,633.00 $22,633.00  NO BID

  

  PICKUP TRUCKS & VANS

Series (HT-1) 12,500 lbs GVWR Ext. Cab and Chassis, 60" cab-

to-axle w/service body. - Solid Waste Department                       

(Lease Purchase)

Series (PU-2), 1/2 Ton Crew Cab Pickup, Short (6 1/2' ) Bed. - 

Park & Recreation Department   (Lease Purchase)

Series (PU-1), 1/2 Ton 4 X4 Standard Cab Compact Pickup, 

Short (6 ' ) Bed. - Water Department 

Series (PU-2), 1/2 Ton 4 X4 Ext. Cab Pickup, Short (6 1/2' ) Bed. 

- Water Department 

Series (HT-1.5) 16,500 lbs GVWR Regular Cab and Chassis, 

60" cab-to-axle. - Gas Department 

Series (PU-3HD), 3/4 Ton Extended Cab Pickup, Long (8' ) Bed, 

w/ Service Body. 6.2 Liter V-8 Engine with Ford CNG Prep 

Package-     Gas Department 

Series (PU-2HD), 1/2 Ton 4 X4 Ext. Cab Pickup, Short (6 1/2' ) 

Bed. - Gas Department 

Series (PU-2), 1/2 Ton Ext. Cab Pickup, Short (6 1/2' ) Bed. - 

Gas Department 

Series (PU-3HD), 3/4 Ton Ext Cab Pickup, Short (6 1/2' ) Bed.  

6.2 Liter V-8 Engine with Ford CNG Prep Package-                       

Gas Department 

Series (PU-2HD), 1/2 Ton 4 X4 Ext. Cab Pickup, Short (6 1/2' ) 

Bed. - Water Department 

Series (PU-3HD), 3/4 Ton Standard Cab Pickup, Long (8' ) Bed, 

w/ Service Body. 6.2 Liter V-8 Engine with Ford CNG Prep 

Package- Water Department 

Series (PU-1), 1/2 Ton Ext. Cab Compact Pickup, Short (6 ' ) 

Bed. - Water Department 

Series (HT-1.5) 16,500 lbs GVWR Crew Cab and Chassis, 60" 

cab-to-axle w/Service Body. - Water Department 

Series (MV-3), Mini Cargo Van. 2.0 Liter I-4 Engine with Ford 

CNG Prep Package - Water Department 

Series (PU-3HD), 3/4 Ton Ext Cab Pickup, Short (6 1/2' ) Bed.  

6.2 Liter V-8 Engine with Ford CNG Prep Package-     

Wastewater Department 

Series (HT-1.5) 16,500 lbs GVWR Crew Cab and Chassis, 84" 

cab-to-axle w/Service Body & Canopy Top. - Gas Department 



AUTO NATION FORD ACCESS FORD GRIFFITH FORD SEGUIN CALDWELL COUNTY FORD GRANDE TRUCK CENTER
CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS SEGUIN, TEXAS CALDWELL, TEXAS SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS

Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Item Description Qty. Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

17 1 each 19,758.00 $19,758.00 19,966.00 $19,966.00 20,071.68 $20,071.68 20,382.00 $20,382.00  NO BID

 

18 1 each 25,065.00 $25,065.00 25,788.00 $25,788.00 26,381.78 $26,381.78 26,836.00 $26,836.00  NO BID

  

 

19 1 each 48,646.00 $48,646.00 NO BID 48,683.86 $48,683.86 53,578.00 $53,578.00  NO BID

  

 

20 1 each 40,186.00 $40,186.00 40,504.00 $40,504.00 41,639.90 $41,639.90 43,613.00 $43,613.00  NO BID

 

21 1 each 19,757.00 $19,757.00 20,198.00 $20,198.00 20,829.11 $20,829.11 20,273.00 $20,273.00  NO BID

  

 

22 9 each 15,800.00 $142,200.00 18,298.00 $164,682.00 16,456.15 $148,105.35 16,389.00 $147,501.00  NO BID

  

 

23 10 each 18,095.00 $180,950.00 18,359.00 $183,590.00 18,179.24 $181,792.40 18,683.00 $186,830.00  NO BID

 

$1,229,148.00 $1,121,593.00 $1,254,915.97 $1,179,896.00 $186,872.00

 

(1) Bid items three (3) and eight (8) are awarded on the basis of most advantageous bid. Although specifications required pricing for a compact pickup, none of the bidders were able to secure pricing

for this type of vehicle. Instructions included in the bid invitation allow the City to award an alternate bid when no bids are received that fully comply with the specification requirements.

(2) Bid item seven (7), ten (10) and sixteen (16) are awarded on the basis of lowest local bids in accordance with Section 26, of Council Policies of the City of Corpus Christi's Code of Ordinance.

Series (PU-2), 1/2 Ton Standard Cab Pickup, Short (6 1/2' ) Bed. 

- Development Services 

Series (PU-2), 1/2 Ton Standard Cab Pickup, Short (6 1/2' ) Bed. 

- Water Department

Series (PU-2), 1/2 Ton Ext. Cab Pickup, Short (6 1/2' ) Bed. - 

Wastewater Department 

Series (PU-3HD), 3/4 Ton Standard Cab Pickup, Long (8' ) Bed.  

6.2 Liter V-8 Engine with Ford CNG Prep Package-     

Stormwater Department 

Series (HT-1) 12,500 lbs GVWR Crew Cab and Chassis, 60" cab-

to-axle w/Caged Flatbed Dump Body. - Stormwater 

Department 

Series (HT-1) 12,500 lbs GVWR Crew Cab and Chassis, 60" cab-

to-axle w/Service Body. - Stormwater Department 

Series (PU-2), 1/2 Ton Ext. Cab Pickup, Short (6 1/2' ) Bed. - 

Neighborhood Services 


