
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI BID TABULATION

PURCHASING DIVISION BI-0119-13

SENIOR BUYER: ELISA COVINGTON STORM WATER DRAINAGE & STREET RIGHTS-OF-WAY

COUNCIL DATE: JULY 16, 2013 AND WATER PRODUCTION FACILITIES MOWING

Brown Mule Mowing Aspen Lawn Care, LLC 
1

Corpus Christi, Texas Corpus Christi, Texas

UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED

ITEM DESCRIPTION  QTY. UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1.
Base Bid 1 - Street (Base List) right-of-way mowing, 551.76 

acres per cycle (8 cycles for 1 year).
551.76 Acre 8 $43.88 $193,689.83 $27.00 $119,180.16

2.
Additive Alternate 2:  Drainage Ditch (Base List) right-of 

way mowing, 227.93 acres per cycle (4 cycles for 1 year).
227.93 Acre 4 $245.15 $223,508.16 $230.00 $209,695.60

3.

Additive Alternate 3:  Bulk Trash Removal – tires, furniture, 

brush, etc.  City will consider this option.  Contract 

administrator shall be contacted prior to removal of illegally 

dumped materials.  Weigh tickets shall be submitted with 

invoice for the reimbursement of landfill fees.  Price quoted 

shall only include the cost of removing and transporting 

material to the landfill.  Approximately 8 cycles, twice per 

cycle, for 1 year

2 Each 8 No Bid No Bid $150.00 $2,400.00

4.

Location: O.N. Stevens Water Treatment Plant, Section A - 

13101 Up River Rd - mowing, trimming, edging, application 

of  herbicide and litter pickup, consisting of approximately 

17.50 acres, 8 cycles for 1 year

17.50 Acre 8 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $9,100.00

5.

Location: O.N. Stevens Water Treatment Plant, Section B - 

13101 Up River Rd - mowing, trimming, edging, application 

of  herbicide and litter pickup, consisting of approximately 

59.93 acres, 8 cycles for 1 year

59.93 Acre 8 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $31,163.60

6.

Location: O.N. Stevens Water Treatment Plant, Section C - 

13101 Up River Rd – Slope mowing, trimming, and litter 

pickup, consisting of approximately 1.18 acres, 2 cycles for 

1 year

1.18 Acre 2 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $153.40

7.

Location: Stevens Plant Lagoon, 4400 Sharpsburg Rd.  - 

mowing, trimming, edging, application of herbicide and litter 

pickup, consisting of approximately 5.52 acres, 8 cycles for 

1 year

5.52 Acre 8 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $2,870.40

8.

Location:  Smith Nueces River Pump Station, 13701 Smith 

Dr.  – Mowing, trimming, application of herbicide and litter 

pickup, consisting of approximately 3.47 acres, 8 cycles for 

1 year

3.47 Acre 8 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $1,804.40

9

Location:  Holly Rd. Pump Station & Ball Park, 4901 Holly 

Rd.   –  mowing, trimming, edging, application of herbicide 

and litter pickup, consisting of approximately 15.41 acres, 8 

cycles for 1 year

15.41 Acre 8 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $8,013.20

10.

Location: Savage Lane Pump Station, 302 N. Navigation 

Blvd. - mowing, trimming, application of  herbicide and litter 

pickup, consisting of approximately 3.29 acres, 6 cycles for 

1 year

3.29 Acre 6 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $1,283.10

11.

Location:  Sand Dollar Pump Station, 14201 Sand Dollar Dr. 

- mowing, trimming, application of  herbicide and litter 

pickup, consisting of approximately 1.22 acres, 8 cycles for 

1 year

1.22 Acre 8 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $634.40

12
Location: Staples Street Pump Station, County Road 43 – 

mowing, trimming, application of herbicide and litter pickup, 

consisting of approximately 13.36 acres, 6 cycles for 1 year

13.66 Acre 6 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $5,327.40

13.

Location: N. Navigation Pump Station, 302 N. Navigation 

Blvd - mowing, trimming, edging, application of  herbicide 

and litter pickup, consisting of approximately 6.18 acres, 6 

cycles for 1 year

6.18 Acre 6 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $2,410.20

AWARD TOTAL: $417,197.99 $62,760.10 

GRAND TOTAL: $479,958.09

 

 

 

Group I - Storm Water Drainage and Street Rights-of-Way 

Group II - Water Production Facilities

Group III - Water Production Facilities

Number of Cycles 

during 

12 month service 

agreement

(1) Aspen Lawn Care LLC does not meet the minimum requirements regarding experience in mowing streets-rights-of-way or major drainage ditch rights-of-ways 

and therefore does not qualify for an award for Group 1.


