City of Corpus Christi
Purchasing Division
Buyer: Michael Gutierrez

Bid Tabulation

Bid Invitation No. 181
Veterinary Medicine and Supplies

Patterson Veterinary Supply, Inc.
Marion, Texas

Zoetis, Inc.
Parsippany, New Jersey

Ferguson
Corpus Christi, Texas

Iltem | Description QTY | Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price
GROUP 1 - SURGERY

1 |Ansell Sensi Touch sterile surgical 100 | Boxs0 |  $23.90 $2,390.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

gloves latex powdered size 7

(Polydioxanone Suture Violet

monofilament 30" Reverse Cutting FS-1) . . ) .
2 2-0 VES-1 with 3/8 circle 24mm 200 Box/12 $58.60 $11,720.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

GENERIC OKAY

(Polydioxanone Suture Violet

monofilament 30" Reverse Cutting FS-1) . . . .
3 2.0 VES-1 3/8 circle 24mm GENERIC 55 Box/36 $357.80 $19,679.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

OKAY

(25 Meters-Violet Monofilament

Polydioxanone Synthetic Absorbable . . . .
4 Sterile Suture on a cassette)2-0 50 Cassette $70.89 $3,544.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid

GENERIC OKAY

(Polydioxanone Suture Violet
5 |monofilament 30" Reverse Cutting CP- 300 Box/12 $57.72 $17,316.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

1)0-0 % circle 36mm GENERIC OKAY

(Polydioxanone Suture Violet
6 |monofilament 30” Reverse Cutting CP- 50 Box/36 $270.28 $13,514.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

1)0-0 % circle 36mm GENERIC OKAY

(25 Meters-Violet Monofilament
7 |Polydioxanone Synthetic Absorbable 20 | Cassette | $84.20 $1,684.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Sterile Suture on a cassette)0-0

GENERIC OKAY
8 S;ir)"e Surgical Blade Size 10 (100 per 50 | Box/100 | $15.35 $767.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
9 |Isoflurane, USP 250mL bottles 60 2b50281e|/ $21.90 $1,314.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Marcaine 0.5% (bupivacaine HCI . . . . .
10 injection, USP) 50mL Multiple-Dose Vial 60 50ml vial $5.50 $330.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Carprofen 50mg/mL Injectable 20mL . . . . .
11 bottle GENERIC OKAY 60 20ml vial $113.20 $6,792.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Carprofen 50mg/mL Injectable 50mL 50ml . . . . . .
12 bottle GENERIC OKAY 60 bottle no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Carprofen 25mg Chewable 180 tablets . . . .
13 GENERIC OKAY 50 Bottle/180 $52.72 $2,636.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Carprofen 75mg Chewable 180 tablets . . . .
14 GENERIC OKAY 50 Bottle/180 $60.83 $3,041.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Carprofen 100mg Chewable 180 tablets . . . .
15 GENERIC OKAY 50 Bottle/180 $76.87 $3,843.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
16 )“('Z,’,“jtgi"f 200 Non-woven Sponges 4" | 50 | goy1g $2.20 $1,100.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
17 [Endotracheal Tube 3.0 15 single $1.35 $20.25 no_bid no bid no bid no bid
18 [Endotracheal Tube 3.5 15 single $1.35 $20.25 no_bid no bid no bid no bid
19 [Endotracheal Tube 4.0 15 single $1.35 $20.25 no_bid no bid no bid no bid
20 |Endotracheal Tube 4.5 15 single $1.35 $20.25 no_bid no bid no bid no bid
21 |Endotracheal Tube 5.0 15 single $1.35 $20.25 no_bid no bid no bid no bid
22 |Endotracheal Tube 5.5 15 single $1.35 $20.25 no_bid no bid no bid no bid
23 [Endotracheal Tube 6.0 30 single $1.35 $40.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
24 |Endotracheal Tube 6.5 30 single $1.35 $40.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
25 [Endotracheal Tube 7.0 30 single $1.35 $40.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
26 |[Endotracheal Tube 7.5 30 single $1.35 $40.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
27 |Endotracheal Tube 8.0 30 single $1.35 $40.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
28 [Endotracheal Tube 8.5 30 single $1.35 $40.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
29 [Endotracheal Tube 9.0 30 single $1.35 $40.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
30 [Endotracheal Tube 9.5 30 single $1.35 $40.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
31 [Endotracheal Tube 10.0 30 single $1.35 $40.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
32 |Endotracheal Tube 11.0 15 single $8.30 $124.50 no_bid no bid no bid no bid
33 |Surgical Drape Material 300 yds  38.5 12 Box/ $93.30 $1,119.60 no bid no bid no bid no bid

inch 300 yds
34 [Carb O2 Lime Sodasorb 5 gal 20 5 gallon $85.50 $1,710.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
35 [Chlorohexidine Solution 2% gallon 5 1 Gal. $6.40 $32.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
36 [Chlorohexidine Scrub 2% gallon 5 1 Gal. $15.35 $76.75 no bid no bid no bid no bid
37 |Blue Medicine Vial Medium 400ct 8 dram Box $48.45 $145.35 no bid no bid no bid no bid
38 |Ketchum Animal Tattoo 1 ounce green 10 Tube $5.20 $52.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
39 |3M Vetbond Tissue Glue .1fl ounce (3ml) 30 Tube $14.10 $423.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
40 [Ear Loop Masks 2ply Jorvet 5 Box/50 $4.15 $20.75 no_bid no bid no bid no bid
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Patterson Veterinary Supply, Inc.

Marion, Texas

Zoetis, Inc.
Parsippany, New Jersey

Ferguson
Corpus Christi, Texas

Iltem Description QTY Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price
41 |[21” Bouffant Caps GENERIC OKAY 5 Box $4.35 $21.75 no bid no bid no bid no bid
42 |Steam Indicator Tape 15 Roll $2.55 $38.25 no bid no bid no bid no bid

GROUP 1 - TOTAL $93,921.95 no bid no bid
GROUP 2 - ANESTHETICS

Iltem Description QTY Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price

43 |Setamine 100mg/ml 1OmIvial GENERIC| 560 | somivial [ $5.00 $1,018.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Torbugesic 10mg/ml 50ml bottle 50ml . . . .

44 GENERIC OKAY 20 Bottle $147.00 $2,940.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Hydromorphine 2mg/mL (20mL) 20ml . . . .

45 GENERIC OKAY 80 Bottle $15.90 $1,272.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Acepromazine 10mg/mL 50ml bottle 50ml . . . .

46 GENERIC OKAY 5 Bottle $17.60 $88.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Xylazine 100mg/mL 50ml bottle 50ml . . . .

47 GENERIC OKAY 5 Bottle $17.35 $86.75 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Medetomidine .5mg/ml 10ml vial . . . . . . .

48 GENERIC OKAY 60 10ml vial no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

a9 |Soapol 1-8mL 10mL vial GENERIC 2 |1omLvial|  nobid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

50 g:g:\z(olam Smg/ml 10mivial GENERIC | 555 | 10mj vial $6.98 $2,094.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

GROUP 2 - TOTAL 7,498.75 no bid no bid

GROUP 3 - VACCINATIONS

Item Description QTY Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price
51 |DHPP vaccine injectable 1ml 10,000 Sm\?i: ml $5.65 $56,500.00 $2.49 $24,900.00 no bid no bid
52 |Bordetella bronchiseptica intranasal 1ml | 10,000 Sm\?i: mi $5.55 $55,500.00 $2.55 $25,500.00 no bid no bid
53 |Rabies 3 year vaccine 10,000 | SMIEM g5 01 $29,100.00 $0.98 $9,800.00 no bid no bid
54 |FVRCP vaccine injectable 1ml 5,000 Sm\?i: ml $5.95 $29,750.00 $2.01 $10,050.00 no bid no bid

GROUP 3-TOTAL $170,850.00 $70,250.00 no bid
GROUP 4 - MEDICAL SUPPLIES
Item Description QTY Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price
Artificial Tears Ointment (Lubricant . . . )
55 Ophthalmic Ointment {Sterile}) 1/80z 240 Ea $3.10 $744.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
56 |Strongid T (pyrantel pamoate) 1 QT 50 S;ﬁ: $23.35 $1,167.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Panacur (fenbendazole) Suspension 1000 ml . . . )
57 10% (100 mg/mL) 1,000mL 100 Bottle $107.23 $10,723.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
58 |Heartworm antigen test 60 Box/100 $234.00 $14,040.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
59 |FeLV antigen and FIV antibody test 120 Box/25 $291.38 $34,965.60 no bid no bid no bid no bid
60 |1mL Nipro Syringes w/o needles (Sterile) 70 Box/100 $7.45 $521.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
61 ggémsey)””ges W/ 259 x 5/8" Needle 100 | Box/100 $9.78 $978.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
- =
62 ?é‘t’;msey)””ges W/ 22G x %" Needle 100 | Box/100 $5.90 $590.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Insulin Syringe w/ 29g x 2" Needle U- . . ) )
63 100 100ct (.5c¢ syringes) 20 100/box $9.05 $181.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
64 |3mL Syringes w/20g Needle 100 Box/100 $5.55 $555.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Plain Microscope Slides 72ct — Clear
65 |Glass — Ground Edges — 1” x 3" 1.0mm x 20 Box/72 $3.00 $60.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
1.2mm Thick
66 [Microscope Cover Slips 24 Box $2.25 $54.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
67 |Nipro Syringes 5mL without needle 30 Box/50 $8.05 $241.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
68 |Nipro Syringes 10mL without needle 30 Box/100 $9.50 $285.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
69 |Nipro Syringes 20mL without needle 30 Box/50 $11.90 $357.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
70 |Powered Latex exam gloves size Small 20 Box/100 $5.40 $108.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
71 |Powered Latex exam Gloves size Large 20 Box/100 $5.40 $108.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
72 |Activyl Plus 88-132Ibs 40 Box/6x6 $277.17 $11,086.80 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Amber Medicine Vial 100ct 2 ounce- Box/ . . . .
73 16dram 10 100 ct $39.00 $390.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
74 L‘Eréamyc'” ophthalmic ointment 1/8 0z. | Ea $11.90 $1,428.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
75 |Praziquantel Injectable 56.8mg/mL 10 |Box/50ml| $290.55 $2,905.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid

GENERIC OKAY
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Iltem Description QTY Unit Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price
76 gi‘:‘\?'exme (Rilexine)300mg GENERIC | 5, ngge/ $34.25 $685.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
77 |Minocycline 100mg GENERIC OKAY 10 Bsgt(t)l(i/ $132.00 $1,320.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
78 |Minocycline 50mg GENERIC OKAY 10 Bsgt(t)l(i/ $14.55 $145.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
79 |Metronidizole 250mg GENERIC OKAY 10 1%?;';] $7.45 $74.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
80 |Terbinafine 250mg GENERIC OKAY 20 SBOO'II'I::E)/ $3.65 $73.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
81 |Prednisone 10mg GENERIC OKAY 2 Bl%tgg/ $124.95 $249.90 no bid no bid no bid no bid
g2 |Sarbrofen 100mg caplets GENERIC 0 | BoMel 1 se1.90 $1,857.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
ga |Sarbrofen 25mg caplets GENERIC 0 | POl | sa0.95 $1,228.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
ga | Sarbrofen 75mg caplets GENERIC 0 | BNl 1 ss0.60 $1,518.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
85 |Lime Sulfur dip concentrated 1 gallon 10 gallon $79.84 $798.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid
86 ZD:;’;’j‘anthasone Injectable Somis/bottle |, so0ml $3.95 $7.90 no bid no bid no bid no bid
87 |ivomec 1% Solution Injectable 500mL 2 | DM | s13527 $270.54 no bid no bid no bid no bid
88 |Elizabethan Collar (Buster Style) Sz 12.5 50 single $1.55 $77.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
89 |Elizabethan Collar (Buster Style) Sz 15.0 50 single $2.50 $125.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
90 |Elizabethan Collar (Buster Style) Sz 20.0 [ 100 single $2.80 $280.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
91 |Elizabethan Collar (Buster Style) Sz 25.0 | 100 single $3.35 $335.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
92 |Elizabethan Collar (Buster Style) Sz 30.0 [ 100 single $4.20 $420.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
93 |5 Gallon Sharps Container 20 single $11.10 $222.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
94 |Canine Parvo SNAP Test 15 Box/20S $220.50 $3,307.50 no bid no bid no bid no bid
95 E’;E‘E”;ﬂggiﬁgoo 1mg/mi 30mibottle | 5 sgtﬂé $14.77 $73.85 no bid no bid no bid no bid
96 |Empty 50mL Vials 4 Box/25 $65.75 $263.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
97 gg’\fgg@”&g“g capsules 500 count |, gggfé $15.05 $301.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
98 gg?\‘ags{g%icf;ng capsules 500 count |, gggfé $32.35 $647.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid
99 Egtrtlligigi(?o%géojiits nius"e”sm” 250ml |y ii?t'l‘;' $8.80 $352.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid

GROUP 4 - TOTAL $96,121.49 no bid no bid
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