TABULATION OF BIDS
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - PROCUREMENT
BID DATE: Wednesday , December 1, 2021
JUNIOR BECK DR (BEAR LN TO OLD BROWNSVILLE RD) Haas-Anderson Construction, LTD Clark Pipeline Services, LLC JE Construction Services, LLC Bay Ltd. Jimenez Engineering Solution dba ICE Reytec Construction Resources, Inc.
PROJECT NO. 18023A 1402 Holly Rd 6229 Leopard Street 7505 Up River Rd. 401 Corn Products Rd Bldg 1 261 Saratoga Blvd. 1901 Hollister St
RFB # 3916 CC, TX 78417 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78417 Houston, TX 77080
ITEM DESCRIPTION [uniT] ary UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID A - HMAC
PART A - GENERAL
A1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART A) LS 1 $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 22,800.00 | $ 22,800.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 16,500.00 | $ 16,500.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
A2 Bonds and Insurance AL 1 $ 34,500.00 | $ 34,500.00 | $ 69,600.00 | $ 69,600.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 37,500.00 | $ 37,500.00 | $  290,000.00 | $ 290,000.00
A3 Ozone Day DAY 1 $ 1.00 | $ 1.00|$ 420.00 | $ 420.00 | $ 1.00|$ 1.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
A4 Clear ROW AC 71$ 35,000.00 | $ 245,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 105,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 49,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 28,000.00
AS Traffic Control Mobilization/Adjustments EA 403 25,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 | $ 3,090.00 | $ 12,360.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 6,700.00 | $ 26,800.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 40,000.00
A6 Traffic Control Items (Signs, Barricades, etc) MO 14( $ 5,000.00 | $ 70,000.00 | $ 2,940.00 | $ 41,160.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 42,000.00 | $ 5,800.00 | $ 81,200.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 140,000.00
A7 Portable Changeable Message Signs for Traffic Control EA 403 8,000.00 | $ 32,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 84,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 96,000.00 | $ 22,300.00 | $ 89,200.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
A8 Truck Mounted Attenuator for Traffic Control EA 1 $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 53,550.00 | $ 53,550.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 44,600.00 | $ 44,600.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
A9 Block Sodding Sy 3200 $ 7.00 [ $ 22,400.00 | $ 7.80 | $ 24,960.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 25,600.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 25,600.00 | $ 15.00 [ $ 48,000.00
A10 Seeding SY 6700 $ 1358 9,045.00 | $ 240 | $ 16,080.00 | $ 3.00 | $ 20,100.00 | $ 3.00 | $ 20,100.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 6,700.00
A1l Silt Fence LF 1000| $ 4.60 | $ 4,600.00 | $ 5.40 | $ 5,400.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 9.00 | $ 9,000.00
A12 Curb Inlet Protection EA 13 $ 346.00 | $ 4,498.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 3,900.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 2,080.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 4,550.00
A13 Storm Water Pollution Prevention Plan and Other BMP's EA 1 $ 5,770.00 | $ 5,770.00 | $ 42,000.00 | $ 42,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
Al4 EDA Project Sign LS 1's 865.00 | $ 865.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL] $ 557,179.00 $ 482,130.00 $ 299,301.00 $ 403,320.00 $ 642,250.00 NO BID
PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS
B1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART B) LS 1 $ 101,000.00 | $ 101,000.00 | $ 132,000.00 | $ 132,000.00 | $ 151,000.00 | $ 151,000.00 | $ 48,400.00 | $ 48,400.00 | $  125,000.00 | $ 125,000.00
B2 Street Salvage And Excavation Sy 14040| $ 13.00 | $ 182,520.00 | $ 16.56 | $ 232,502.40 | $ 14.00 | $ 196,560.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 196,560.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 112,320.00
s3 Demolition of Driveway SF 8724] $ 1.75]$ 15,267.00 | $ 333 (¢ 29,050.92 | $ 4.00 | $ 34,896.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 61,068.00 | $ 3.00 [ $ 26,172.00
B4 Demolition of TxDOT Driveway and Culverts and Regrade Ditch LS 1 $ 4,510.00 | $ 4,510.00 | $ 19,800.00 | $ 19,800.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 25,500.00 | $ 25,500.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
85 3.5" TY 'D' HMAC Sy 18472| $ 22.00 | $ 406,384.00 | $ 3282 (¢ 606,251.04 | $ 33.00 | $ 609,576.00 | $ 27.00 | $ 498,744.00 | $ 33.00 | $ 609,576.00
3 4" TY 'B' HMAC Sy 18472 $ 23.00 | $ 424,856.00 | $ 30.54 | $ 564,134.88 | $ 32.00 | $ 591,104.00 | $ 25.50 | $ 471,036.00 | $ 37.00 | $ 683,464.00
87 Under Seal Sy 18472| $ 3.15([$ 58,186.80 | $ 450 | $ 83,124.00 | $ 5.50 | $ 101,596.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 73,888.00 | $ 450 |$ 83,124.00
B8 Limestone Base (16") SY 22003 $ 33.00 | $ 726,099.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 660,090.00 | $ 44.00 | $ 968,132.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 836,114.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 616,084.00
B9 8" Lime Stabilized Subgrade Sy 22003] $ 7.85[$ 172,723.55 | $ 18.60 | $ 409,255.80 | $ 11.00 | $ 242,033.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 330,045.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 176,024.00
B10 Compacted Subgrade (12") Sy 22003| $ 110 | $ 24,203.30 | $ 2.88 | $ 63,368.64 | $ 3.50 | $ 77,010.50 | $ 3.00 | $ 66,009.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 110,015.00
B11 Driveways SF 8724] $ 13.00 [ $ 113,412.00 | $ 11.40 | $ 99,453.60 | $ 14.00 | $ 122,136.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 157,032.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 87,240.00
prp  |Furnishand Install Roadside Traffic Sign and Sign Support Assembly (Triangular Slipbase) |\ 29| $ 634.00 | $ 18,386.00 | $ 660.00 | $ 19,140.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 21,750.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 20,300.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 58,000.00
B13 Remove Existing Sign and Support EA 403 69.00 | $ 276.00 | $ 72.00 | $ 288.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 76.00 | $ 304.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 1,600.00
B14 REFL PAV MKR TY 1 (Y)(4")(SLD)(090MIL) LF 1800| $ 0.90 | $ 1,620.00 | $ 096 | $ 1,728.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 1.50 | $ 2,700.00
815 REFL PAV MKR TY 1 (Y)(4")(BRK)(090MIL) LF 3755[ $ 085S 3,191.75 [ $ 0.90 | $ 3,379.50 | $ 1.00|$ 3,755.00 | $ 1.00|$ 3,755.00 | $ 150 | $ 5,632.50
B16 REFL PAV MKR TY 1 (SHADOW)(4")(BRK)(090MIL) LF 280| $ 1458 406.00 | $ 1.50 | $ 420.00 | $ 2.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 1.60 | $ 448.00 | $ 1.50 | $ 420.00
B17 REFL PAV MKR TY 1 (W)(4")(SLD)(090MIL) LF 3390 $ 0.80|$ 2,712.00 | $ 0.84|$ 2,847.60 | $ 1.00|$ 3,390.00 [ $ 0.90 | $ 3,051.00 | $ 150 | $ 5,085.00
B18 REFL PAVMKR TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED THERMOPLASTIC LF 122 $ 16.00 | $ 1,952.00 | $ 16.80 | $ 2,049.60 | $ 18.00 | $ 2,196.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 2,196.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 1,830.00
(W)(24")(SLD)(125MIL)
B19 TY Il A-A RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER (REFLECTORIZED) (YELLOW) EA 111) $ 8.05[$ 893.55 | $ 840 |$ 93240 | $ 9.00 | $ 999.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 888.00 | $ 15.00 [ $ 1,665.00
B20 TY |1 B-B RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER (REFLECTORIZED) (FIRE HYDRANT) (BLUE) EA 9 s 14.00 | $ 126.00 | $ 14.40 | $ 129.60 | $ 15.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 135.00
[B22 Crosswalk Striping (Per Crosswalk) EA 1 $ 980.00 | $ 980.00 | $ 1,020.00 | $ 1,020.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00
B22 Allowance for Unanticipated Street Improvements AL 1S 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS; $ 2,284,704.95 $ 2,955,965.98 $ 3,174,948.50 $ 2,823,273.00 $ 2,744,586.50 NO BID
PART C - STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS
c1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART C) LS 1 $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 19,200.00 | $ 19,200.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00
c2 Demolition of Sidewalk SF 21965| $ 1.00 | $ 21,965.00 | $ 240 | $ 52,716.00 | $ 3.00 | $ 65,895.00 | $ 2.00 | $ 43,930.00 | $ 2.00 [ $ 43,930.00
c3 Sidewalk Retaining Curb LF 250 $ 66.00 | $ 16,500.00 | $ 44.74 | $ 11,185.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 8,750.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 5,000.00
c4 Sidewalk Drain EA 6/ $ 2,310.00 | $ 13,860.00 | $ 3,240.00 | $ 19,440.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 4,500.00
cs Sidewalk SF 27455( $ 8.25|$ 226,503.75 | $ 10.40 | $ 285,532.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 274,550.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 329,460.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 219,640.00
c6 ADA Ramp SF 272 $ 33.00 | $ 8,976.00 | $ 45.60 | $ 12,403.20 | $ 39.00 | $ 10,608.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 9,520.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 408,000.00
c7 Allowance for unanticipated ADA improvements AL 1] $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
SUBTOTAL PART C - STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS $ 300,304.75 $ 402,976.20 $ 391,953.00 $ 438,160.00 $ 713,570.00 NO BID
PART D - WATER IMPROVEMENTS
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TABULATION OF BIDS
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - PROCUREMENT

BID DATE: Wednesday , December 1, 2021
JUNIOR BECK DR (BEAR LN TO OLD BROWNSVILLE RD) Haas-Anderson Construction, LTD Clark Pipeline Services, LLC JE Construction Services, LLC Bay Ltd. Jimenez Engineering Solution dba ICE Reytec Construction Resources, Inc.
PROJECT NO. 18023A 1402 Holly Rd 6229 Leopard Street 7505 Up River Rd. 401 Corn Products Rd Bldg 1 261 Saratoga Blvd. 1901 Hollister St
RFB #3916 CC, TX 78417 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78417 Houston, TX 77080
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT [ QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
D1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART D) LS 1 s 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 22,800.00 | $ 22,800.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
D2 Adjust Existing Ring and Cover To Grade LF 7| S 2,710.00 | $ 18,970.00 | $ 1,620.00 | $ 11,340.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 17,500.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 18,900.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 10,500.00
D3 Demolition of Curb and Gutter LF 5,930| $ 5.00|$ 29,650.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 35,580.00 | $ 5.00|$ 29,650.00 | $ 6.60 | $ 39,138.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 59,300.00
D4 Safety End Treatment Pipe-Cross Drainage EA 6[$ 1,870.00 | $ 11,220.00 | $ 1,820.00 | $ 10,920.00 | $ 3,100.00 | $ 18,600.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 14,400.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 9,000.00
D5 Safety End Treatment Box-Parallel Drainage EA 2|$ 10,600.00 | $ 21,200.00 | $ 12,600.00 | $ 25,200.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 9,600.00 | $ 19,200.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
D6 18" RCP (Class I11) LF 168| $ 104.00 | $ 17,472.00 | $ 174.96 | $ 29,393.28 | $ 137.00 | $ 23,016.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 20,160.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 15,120.00
D7 7'x2' RCB LF 94 s 501.00 | $ 47,094.00 | $ 683.92 | $ 64,288.48 | $ 820.00 | $ 77,080.00 | $ 860.00 | $ 80,840.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 94,000.00
D8 Ditch excavation SY 4,800 $ 4.00 | $ 19,200.00 | $ 8.40 [ $ 40,320.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 67,200.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 57,600.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 38,400.00
D9 6" Curb and Gutter LF 5,930| $ 21.00 [ $ 124,530.00 | $ 2520 [ $ 149,436.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 177,900.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 124,530.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 106,740.00
D10 Reconstruct top 24" of Inlet EA 13[ $ 4,520.00 | $ 58,760.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 23,400.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 45,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 32,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 97,500.00
D11 Level A SUE By Hydroexcavation EA 118 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 36,000.00 | $ 36,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 18,500.00 | $ 18,500.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00
D12 OSHA Trench Safety Plan LF 356 $ 8.10 | $ 2,883.60 | $ 9.60 [ $ 3,417.60 | $ 5.00 [ $ 1,780.00 | $ 6.00 [ $ 2,136.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 7,120.00
D13 OSHA Manhole/Junction Box/Inlet Safety Plan EA 118 288.00 | $ 288.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
D14 Allowance for Unanticipated Stormwater Improvements AL 11 $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART D - WATER IMPROVEMENTS| $ 392,767.60 $ 472,995.36 $ 564,026.00 $ 474,404.00 $ 504,680.00 NO BID
PART E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS
E1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART E) LS 1 $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 14,705.00 | $ 14,705.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00
E2 8" PVC C-900 Water line LF 3130| $ 153.00 | $ 478,890.00 | $ 76.32 | $ 238,881.60 | $ 61.00 | $ 190,930.00 | $ 86.00 | $ 269,180.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 219,100.00
E3 8"x45° D. |. Bend EA 60| $ 617.00 | $ 37,020.00 | $ 572.40 | $ 34,344.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 54,000.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 114,000.00
E4 8"D. . Tee EA 8 $ 1,050.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 816.00 | $ 6,528.00 [ $ 1,350.00 | $ 10,800.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 15,200.00
ES 8" Gate Valve & Box EA 16| $ 1,880.00 | $ 30,080.00 | $ 1,812.00 | $ 28,992.00 | $ 2,300.00 | $ 36,800.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 40,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 40,000.00
E6 Water Connection (Tie to Existing) EA 11| $ 4,450.00 | $ 48,950.00 | $ 4,432.80 | $ 48,760.80 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 92,400.00 | $ 6,400.00 | $ 70,400.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 110,000.00
E7 Fire Connection EA 7% 11,800.00 | $ 82,600.00 | $ 5,748.00 | $ 40,236.00 | $ 3,100.00 | $ 21,700.00 | $ 6,400.00 | $ 44,800.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 35,000.00
E8 Fire Hydrant, Type 1, Complete Installation to Main EA 8| S 8,560.00 | $ 68,480.00 | $ 4,566.00 | $ 36,528.00 | $ 6,800.00 | $ 54,400.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 64,000.00 | $ 8,500.00 | $ 68,000.00
E9 OSHA Trench Safety Plan LF 3130 $ 3.70 [ $ 11,581.00 | $ 240 | $ 7,512.00 | $ 4.00|$ 12,520.00 | $ 2.00]$ 6,260.00 | $ 5.00|$ 15,650.00
E10 Allowance for Unanticipated Water Improvements AL 1s 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS - LOOP OF SYSTEM!| $ 826,001.00 $ 490,782.40 $ 525,550.00 $ 608,345.00 $ 671,950.00 NO BID
PART F - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS
F1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART F) LS 1 $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 26,400.00 | $ 26,400.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 25,482.00 | $ 25,482.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
F2 Adjust Existing Ring and Cover to Grade EA 14| $ 1,890.00 | $ 26,460.00 | $ 2,022.00 | $ 28,308.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 36,400.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 21,000.00
F3 8" HDPE By Pipe Burst LF 2784 $ 97.00 | $ 270,048.00 | $ 96.48 | $ 268,600.32 | $ 90.00 | $ 250,560.00 | $ 114.00 | $ 317,376.00 | $ 91.00 | $ 253,344.00
F4 8" PVC Pressure Rated WW MAIN LF 156[ $ 226.00 | $ 35,256.00 | $ 188.59 | $ 29,420.04 | $ 110.00 | $ 17,160.00 | $ 260.00 | $ 40,560.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 14,040.00
FS Manhole Rehab EA 14 $ 10,900.00 | $ 152,600.00 | $ 8,556.00 | $ 119,784.00 | $ 4,700.00 | $ 65,800.00 | $ 12,300.00 | $ 172,200.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 49,000.00
F6 Doghouse Manhole EA 1 s 18,600.00 | $ 18,600.00 | $ 12,480.00 | $ 12,480.00 | $ 6,300.00 | $ 6,300.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00
F7 WW Service Reconstruction (6" or smaller) EA 12| $ 6,820.00 | $ 81,840.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 28,800.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 25,200.00 | $ 7,800.00 | $ 93,600.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 36,000.00
F8 Control of W.W. Flow LS 1 s 27,900.00 | $ 27,900.00 | $ 54,000.00 | $ 54,000.00 | $ 26,000.00 | $ 26,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00
F9 OSHA Manhole/Pit Safety Plan EA 12| $ 600.00 | $ 7,200.00 | $ 960.00 | $ 11,520.00 | $ 5,300.00 | $ 63,600.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 9,600.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 30,000.00
F10 OSHA Pipe Safety LF 156[ $ 13.00 | $ 2,028.00 | $ 26.40 | $ 4,118.40 | $ 21.00 | $ 3,276.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 1,560.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 1,560.00
F11 Allowance for Unanticipated Wastewater Improvements AL s 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART F - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS| $ 676,932.00 $ 608,430.76 $ 540,296.00 $ 790,378.00 $ 507,944.00 NO BID
PART G - GAS IMPROVEMENTS
G1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART G) LS 1 s 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 8,525.00 | $ 8,525.00 S
G2 Trench Backfill and Compaction LF 3360 $ 37.00 | $ 124,320.00 | $ 21.60 | $ 72,576.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 53,760.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 50,400.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 151,200.00
G3 OSHA Trench Safety LF 3360| $ 3.00 | $ 10,080.00 | $ 120 | $ 4,032.00 | $ 2.00 [ $ 6,720.00 | $ 2.00 [ $ 6,720.00 | $ 5.00 [ $ 16,800.00
G4 Allowance for Unanticipated Gas Improvements AL s 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
SUBTOTAL PART G - GAS IMPROVEMENTS $ 141,900.00 $ 82,108.00 $ 65,580.00 $ 62,120.00 $ 179,025.00 $
TOTAL BASE BID "A" HMAC - (PARTS A THRU G) $ 5,179,789.30 $ 5,495,388.70 $ 5,561,654.50 $ 5,600,000.00 $ 5,964,005.50 NO BID
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TABULATION OF BIDS
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - PROCUREMENT
BID DATE: Wednesday , December 1, 2021
JUNIOR BECK DR (BEAR LN TO OLD BROWNSVILLE RD) Reytec Construction Resources, Inc. JE Construction Services, LLC Bay Ltd. Haas - Anderson Construction, LTD Jimenez Engineering Solution dba ICE Clark Pipeline Services, LLC
PROJECT NO. 18023A 1901 Hollister St. 7505 Up River Rd. 401 Corn Products Rd Bldg 1 1402 Holly Rd 261 Saratoga Blvd. 6229 Leopard Street
RFB #3916 Houston, TX 77080 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78417 CC, TX 78417 CC, TX 78409
ITEM DESCRIPTION [uniT] ary UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID B - CONCRETE
PART A - GENERAL
AL MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART A) LS 1 $ 12,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 16,500.00 | $ 16,500.00 | $ 26,000.00 | $ 26,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
A2 Bonds and Insurance AL 1 s 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 48,000.00 | $ 48,000.00 | $ 37,500.00 | $ 37,500.00 | $ 36,500.00 | $ 36,500.00 | $ 325,000.00 | $ 325,000.00
A3 Ozone Day DAY 1 $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1.00|$ 1.00|$ 140.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 115 | $ 115 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
A4 Clear ROW AC 718 7,200.00 | $ 50,400.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 49,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 350,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 28,000.00
AS Traffic Control Mobilization/Adjustments EA 4's 3,800.00 | $ 15,200.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 6,700.00 | $ 26,800.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 80,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 40,000.00
A6 Traffic Control Items (Signs, Barricades, etc) MO 14( $ 6,200.00 | $ 86,800.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 42,000.00 | $ 5,800.00 | $ 81,200.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 70,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 140,000.00
A7 Portable Changeable Message Signs for Traffic Control EA 4's 12,000.00 | $ 48,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 96,000.00 | $ 22,300.00 | $ 89,200.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 36,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
A8 Truck Mounted Attenuator for Traffic Control EA 1 $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 4,000.00 | S 4,000.00 | $ 44,600.00 | $ 44,600.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
A9 Block Sodding sY 3200( $ 450 |$ 14,400.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 25,600.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 25,600.00 | $ 6.65|$ 21,280.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 48,000.00
A10 Seeding SY 6700| $ 0.50 | $ 3,350.00 | $ 3.00 [ $ 20,100.00 | $ 3.00 [ $ 20,100.00 | $ 130 $ 8,710.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 6,700.00
A1l Silt Fence LF 1000| $ 350 [ $ 3,500.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 440 $ 4,400.00 | $ 9.00 [$ 9,000.00
A12 Curb Inlet Protection EA 13| $ 120.00 | $ 1,560.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 2,080.00 | $ 331.00 | $ 4,303.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 4,550.00
A13 Storm Water Pollution Prevention Plan & Other BMP's EA 1 $ 16,000.00 | $ 16,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 5,770.00 | $ 5,770.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
Al4 EDA Project Sign LS 1 s 800.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 827.00 | $ 827.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL] $ 306,010.00 $ 297,301.00 $ 403,320.00 $ 647,291.15 $ 677,250.00 NO BID
PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS
B1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART B) LS 1 $ 70,000.00 | $ 70,000.00 | $ 151,000.00 | $ 151,000.00 | $ 44,600.00 | $ 44,600.00 | $  120,000.00 | $ 120,000.00 | $  125,000.00 | $ 125,000.00
||BZ Street Salvage And Excavation sy 14040 $ 8.00 | $ 112,320.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 210,600.00 | $ 570 | $ 80,028.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 140,400.00 | $ 8.00 [ $ 112,320.00
(B3 Demolition of Driveway SF 8724| $ 1.00]$ 8,724.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 34,896.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 61,068.00 | $ 1.60 | $ 13,958.40 | $ 3.00|$ 26,172.00
||34 Demolition of TXxDOT Driveway and Culverts and Regrade Ditch LS 1 $ 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | S 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 25,500.00 | $ 25,500.00 | $ 4,560.00 | $ 4,560.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
(IBs 8" Continuously Reinforced Concrete Pavement SF 178560| $ 10.00 | $ 1,785,600.00 | $ 10.70 | $ 1,910,592.00 | $ 10.25 | $ 1,830,240.00 | $ 10.25 | $ 1,830,240.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 2,856,960.00
||BG Limestone Base (7") SY 22003| $ 21.00 | $ 462,063.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 440,060.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 396,054.00 | $ 16.50 | $ 363,049.50 | $ 12.00 | $ 264,036.00
87 Compacted Subgrade (12") sY 22003| $ 3.75[$ 82,511.25 | $ 3.50 | $ 77,010.50 | $ 3.00 | $ 66,009.00 | $ 155 (S 34,104.65 | $ 6.00 | $ 132,018.00
||BB Driveways SF 8724( $ 11.00 | $ 95,964.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 122,136.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 157,032.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 122,136.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 244,272.00
||BS Furnish and Install Roadside Traffic Sign and Sign Support Assembly (Triangular Slipbase) EA 29| $ 560.00 | $ 16,240.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 21,750.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 20,300.00 | $ 607.00 | $ 17,603.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 58,000.00
||BlO Remove Existing Sign and Support EA 4 s 65.00 | $ 260.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 320.00 | $ 76.00 | S 304.00 | $ 66.00 | S 264.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 1,600.00
||311 REFL PAV MKR TY 1 (Y)(4")(SLD)(090MIL) LF 1800| $ 1.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 150 | $ 2,700.00
[B12 REFL PAV MKR TY 1 (Y)(4")(BRK)(090MIL) LF 3755 $ 090 |$ 3,379.50 | $ 1.00|$ 3,755.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 3,755.00 | $ 095|% 3,567.25 | $ 150 | $ 5,632.50
||313 REFL PAV MKR TY 1 (SHADOW)(4")(BRK)(090MIL) LF 3755| $ 1.60 | $ 6,008.00 | $ 2.00|$ 7,510.00 | $ 1.60 | $ 6,008.00 | $ 1.65| S 6,195.75 [ $ 150 | $ 5,632.50
[B14 REFL PAV MKR TY 1 (W)(4")(SLD)(090MIL) LF 3390| $ 075]% 2,542.50 | $ 1.00|$ 3,390.00 | $ 090|% 3,051.00 | $ 075|% 2,542.50 | $ 150 | $ 5,085.00
“315 REFLPAVMKR TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED THERMOPLASTIC (W)(24")(SLD)(125MIL) |, 122| $ 17.00 | $ 2,074.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 2,196.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 2,196.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 2,196.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 1,830.00
||316 TY Il A-A RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER (REFLECTORIZED) (YELLOW) EA 111 $ 9.00 | $ 999.00 | $ 9.00 | $ 999.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 888.00 | $ 885 |$ 98235 | $ 15.00 | $ 1,665.00
[B17 TY I B-B RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER (REFLECTORIZED) (FIRE HYDRANT) (BLUE) EA 9 $ 16.00 | $ 144.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 135.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 153.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 135.00
[B18 Crosswalk Striping (Per Crosswalk) EA 1 $ 980.00 | $ 980.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00
B19 Allowance for Unanticipated Street Improvments AL 13 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS; $ 2,680,609.25 $ 3,034,149.50 $ 2,724,968.00 $ 2,689,802.40 S 3,881,558.00 NO BID
PART C - STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS
c1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART C) LS 1 $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00
C2 Demolition of Sidewalk SF 21965| $ 0.50 | $ 10,982.50 | $ 3.00 [ $ 65,895.00 | $ 2.00 [ $ 43,930.00 | $ 0.90 | $ 19,768.50 | $ 2.00 [ $ 43,930.00
c3 Sidewalk Retaining Curb LF 250 $ 60.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 35.00 [ $ 8,750.00 | $ 68.00 | $ 17,000.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 5,000.00
C4 Sidewalk Drain EA 6 S 3,300.00 | $ 19,800.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 2,310.00 | $ 13,860.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 4,500.00
cs Sidewalk SF 27455 $ 8.00 | $ 219,640.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 274,550.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 329,460.00 | $ 855|$ 234,740.25 | $ 8.00[$ 219,640.00
C6 ADA Ramp SF 272| $ 25.00 | $ 6,800.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 9,520.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 9,520.00 | $ 34.00 | $ 9,248.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 408,000.00
c7 Allowance for unanticipated ADA improvements AL s 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
SUBTOTAL PART C - STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS $ 284,722.50 $ 391,865.00 $ 438,160.00 $ 307,116.75 $ 713,570.00 NO BID
PART D - WATER IMPROVEMENTS
D1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART D) LS 1 s 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
D2 Adjust Existing Ring & Cover To Grade LF 7% 1,700.00 | $ 11,900.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 17,500.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 18,900.00 | $ 2,790.00 | $ 19,530.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 10,500.00
D3 Demolition of Curb and Gutter LF 5930| $ 2.50 | $ 14,825.00 | $ 5.00 [ $ 29,650.00 | $ 6.60 [ $ 39,138.00 | $ 4.60 [ $ 27,278.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 59,300.00
D4 Safety End Treatment Pipe-Cross Drainage EA 6 $ 2,700.00 | $ 16,200.00 | $ 3,100.00 | $ 18,600.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 14,400.00 | $ 1,920.00 | $ 11,520.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 9,000.00
D5 Safety End Treatment Box-Parallel Drainage EA 2| S 12,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 9,600.00 | $ 19,200.00 | $ 10,900.00 | $ 21,800.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
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TABULATION OF BIDS

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - PROCUREMENT

BID DATE: Wednesday , December 1, 2021

JUNIOR BECK DR (BEAR LN TO OLD BROWNSVILLE RD) Reytec Construction Resources, Inc. JE Construction Services, LLC Bay Ltd. Haas - Anderson Construction, LTD Jimenez Engineering Solution dba ICE Clark Pipeline Services, LLC
PROJECT NO. 18023A 1901 Hollister St. 7505 Up River Rd. 401 Corn Products Rd Bldg 1 1402 Holly Rd 261 Saratoga Blvd. 6229 Leopard Street
RFB #3916 Houston, TX 77080 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78417 CC, TX 78417 CC, TX 78409
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT [ QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
D6 18" RCP (Class ll) LF 168| $ 165.00 | $ 27,720.00 | $ 137.00 | $ 23,016.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 20,160.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 18,480.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 15,120.00
D7 7'x2' RCB LF 9| $ 680.00 | $ 63,920.00 | $ 820.00 | $ 77,080.00 | $ 860.00 | $ 80,840.00 | $ 529.00 | $ 49,726.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 94,000.00
D8 Ditch excavation sY 4800 $ 8.00 | $ 38,400.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 67,200.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 57,600.00 | $ 4.05|$ 19,440.00 | $ 8.00[$ 38,400.00
D9 6" Curb & Gutter LF 5930| $ 450 |$ 26,685.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 118,600.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 124,530.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 71,160.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 106,740.00
D10 Reconstruct top 24" of Inlet EA 13 $ 5,000.00 | $ 65,000.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 45,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 32,500.00 | $ 3,930.00 | $ 51,090.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 97,500.00
D11 Level A SUE By Hydroexcavation EA 1 s 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 18,500.00 | $ 18,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00
D12 OSHA Trench Safety Plan LF 356| $ 5.00 | $ 1,780.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 1,780.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 2,136.00 | $ 8.10|$ 2,883.60 | $ 20.00 | $ 7,120.00
D13 OSHA Manhole/Junction Box/Inlet Safety Plan EA 1 s 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 288.00 | $ 288.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
D14 Allowance for Unanticipated Stormwater Improvements AL s 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART D - WATER IMPROVEMENTS $ 327,530.00 $ 504,726.00 $ 474,404.00 $ 336,695.60 $ 504,680.00 NO BID
PART E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS - LOOP OF SYSTEM
E1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART E) LS 1 s 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 13,010.00 | $ 13,010.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00
E2 8" PVC C-900 Water line LF 3130 $ 98.00 | $ 306,740.00 | $ 61.00 | $ 190,930.00 | $ 86.00 | $ 269,180.00 | $ 147.00 | $ 460,110.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 219,100.00
E3 8"x45° D. |. Bend EA 60| $ 555.00 | $ 33,300.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 54,000.00 | $ 590.00 | $ 35,400.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 114,000.00
E4 8"D. . Tee EA 8 $ 767.00 | $ 6,136.00 | $ 1,350.00 | $ 10,800.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 15,200.00
ES5 8" Gate Valve & Box EA 16| $ 1,300.00 | $ 20,800.00 | $ 2,300.00 | $ 36,800.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 40,000.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 28,800.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 40,000.00
E6 Water Connection (Tie to Existing) EA 1] $ 1,400.00 | $ 15,400.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 92,400.00 | $ 6,400.00 | $ 70,400.00 | $ 4,260.00 | $ 46,860.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 110,000.00
E7 Fire Connection EA 718 3,100.00 | $ 21,700.00 | $ 3,100.00 | $ 21,700.00 | $ 6,400.00 | $ 44,800.00 | $ 11,300.00 | $ 79,100.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 35,000.00
E8 Fire Hydrant, Type 1, Complete Installation to Main EA 8 $ 6,300.00 | $ 50,400.00 | $ 6,800.00 | $ 54,400.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 64,000.00 | $ 8,190.00 | $ 65,520.00 | $ 8,500.00 | $ 68,000.00
E9 OSHA Trench Safety Plan LF 3130| $ 1.00 | $ 3,130.00 | $ 4.00 [ $ 12,520.00 | $ 2.00 [ $ 6,260.00 | $ 3.55($ 11,111.50 | $ 5.00 [ $ 15,650.00
E10 Allowance for Unanticipated Water Improvements AL 1 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS - LOOP OF SYSTEM! $ 502,606.00 $ 525,550.00 $ 606,650.00 $ 794,901.50 $ 671,950.00 NO BID
PART F - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS
F1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART F) LS 1 s 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 25,482.00 | $ 25,482.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
F2 Adjust Existing Ring and Cover to Grade EA 14 $ 1,300.00 | $ 18,200.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 36,400.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 1,810.00 | $ 25,340.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 21,000.00
F3 8" HDPE By Pipe Burst LF 2784 $ 130.00 | $ 361,920.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 250,560.00 | $ 114.00 | $ 317,376.00 | $ 93.00 | $ 258,912.00 | $ 91.00 | $ 253,344.00
F4 8" PVC PRESSURE RATED WW MAIN LF 156| $ 216.00 | $ 33,696.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 17,160.00 | $ 260.00 | $ 40,560.00 | $ 216.00 | $ 33,696.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 14,040.00
F5 Manhole Rehab EA 14 $ 11,400.00 | $ 159,600.00 | $ 4,700.00 | $ 65,800.00 | $ 12,300.00 | $ 172,200.00 | $ 10,400.00 | $ 145,600.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 49,000.00
F6 Doghouse Manhole EA 1 $ 6,500.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 6,300.00 | $ 6,300.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 17,800.00 | $ 17,800.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00
F7 WW Service Reconstruction (6" or smaller) EA 12| $ 750.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 25,200.00 | $ 7,800.00 | $ 93,600.00 | $ 6,530.00 | $ 78,360.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 36,000.00
F8 Control of W.W. Flow LS 1 $ 17,000.00 | $ 17,000.00 | $ 26,000.00 | $ 26,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 26,700.00 | $ 26,700.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00
F9 OSHA Manhole/Pit Safety Plan EA 12| $ 50.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 5,300.00 | $ 63,600.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 9,600.00 | $ 574.00 | $ 6,888.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 30,000.00
F10 OSHA Pipe Safety LF 156| $ 5.00 [ $ 780.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 3,276.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 1,560.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 1,872.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 1,560.00
F11 Allowance for Unanticipated Wastewater Improvements AL 13 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART F - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS| $ 657,296.00 $ 540,296.00 $ 790,378.00 $ 650,168.00 S 507,944.00 NO BID
PART G - GAS IMPROVEMENTS
G1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART G) LS 1 s 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 8,525.00 | $ 8,525.00
G2 Trench Backfill and Compaction LF 3360| $ 36.00 | $ 120,960.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 53,760.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 50,400.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 120,960.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 151,200.00
G3 OSHA Trench Safety LF 3360 $ 010]$ 336.00 | $ 2.00 | $ 6,720.00 | $ 2.00 | $ 6,720.00 | $ 285]$ 9,576.00 | $ 5.00|$ 16,800.00
G4 Allowance for Unanticipated Gas Improvements AL 13 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
SUBTOTAL PART G - GAS IMPROVEMENTS| $ 129,796.00 $ 65,580.00 $ 62,120.00 $ 138,036.00 $ 179,025.00 NO BID
TOTAL BASE BID "B" CONCRETE - (PARTS A THRU G)I $ 4,888,569.75 $ 5,359,467.50 $ 5,500,000.00 $ 5,564,011.40 $ 7,135,977.00 NO BID
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