
RFB 4788 Purchase of Utility and Tag Along Trailers

Item Description Unit Qty Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total Cost Total
1 FY23 Gas 13 EA 1 * * $18,500.00 $18,500.00 $39,205.00 $39,205.00 $20,200.00 $20,200.00 $18,800.00 $18,800.00
2 FY23 PWSW29 EA 1 * * $14,500.00 $14,500.00 $33,381.00 $33,381.00 $17,750.00 $17,750.00 $15,950.00 $15,950.00
3 FY23 WTR 14, 23 WW 6,7,46,55 EA 6 * * $30,000.00 $180,000.00 $37,488.00 $224,928.00 $27,600.00 $165,600.00 $23,520.00 $141,120.00
4 FY23 Gas 39, 40 EA 2 No Bid No Bid $7,870.00 $15,740.00 $13,958.00 $27,916.00 $7,411.25 $14,822.50 $7,460.00 $14,920.00
5 FY23 Gas 14, 15, 16 EA 3 $3,262.89 $9,788.67 $4,175.00 $12,525.00 $12,025.00 $36,075.00 $3,674.00 $11,022.00 $4,250.00 $33,066.00
6 FY23 PwSW 8 EA 1 $3,475.22 $3,475.22 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $13,959.00 $13,959.00 $4,116.00 $4,116.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
7 FY23 WTR 22, 27 WW 9, PKS 34, 35 36 EA 6 $3,467.75 $20,806.50 $4,450.00 $26,700.00 $12,187.00 $73,122.00 $3,839.00 $23,034.00 $4,480.00 $26,880.00
8 FY23 WW 34, 37 EA 2 $5,470.51 $10,941.02 $6,300.00 $12,600.00 $13,373.00 $26,746.00 $6,778.00 $13,556.00 $7,300.00 $14,600.00
9 FY23 PKS 39 EA 1 $5,765.01 $5,765.01 $6,600.00 $6,600.00 $14,728.00 $14,728.00 $7,114.00 $7,114.00 $7,280.00 $7,280.00
10 FY23 PWSTR22, 23, 24 EA 3 No Bid No Bid $19,962.00 $59,886.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

* Line 1, 2 , 3 for Ron Hoover Equipment were non responsive
Did not meet the specifications 
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