
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI BID TABULATION

PURCHASING DIVISION

BUYER: LYDIA JUAREZ
 

UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED

ITEM UNIT QTY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1 LBS 16,000     NO BID

0.83$      13,280.00$    

NO BID NO BID NO BID

0.702$    11,232.00$    

2 LBS 18,700     NO BID

0.83$      15,521.00$    
NO BID NO BID NO BID

0.702$    13,127.40$    

3 LBS 39,000     NO BID

0.83$      32,370.00$    
NO BID NO BID NO BID

0.702$    27,378.00$    

4 LBS 6,900       NO BID

0.83$      5,727.00$      
NO BID NO BID NO BID

0.702$    4,843.80$      

5 LBS 55,200     NO BID

0.83$      45,816.00$    
NO BID NO BID NO BID

0.702$    38,750.40$    

6 LBS 2,300       NO BID

0.83$      1,909.00$      
NO BID NO BID NO BID

0.702$    1,614.60$      

NO BID  $     114,623.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 96,946.20$   

* Bidder showed interest in submitting a letter of no bid however, was not able to meet requirements at this time. 

** Bidder provided a response of no bid. 

*** Bidder showed interest in submitting a letter of no bid however, was unable to offer a competive bid at this time.

**** Bidder showed interest in submitting a letter of no bid however, was unable to offer a bid at this time.

Polydyne, Inc.

Columbia, Tennessee Lawrence, Kansas Riceboro, Georgia

Sludge Dewatering Polymer Allison Treatment 

Plant

DESCRIPTION

BID EVENT NO. 991

*** Sterling
**** Kemira Water 

Solutions

SLUDGE DEWATERING POLYMER FOR WASTEWATER PLANTS

Total

** Color Source, Inc.

Corpus Christi, Texas

Solenis, LLC* Univar USA, Inc.

Wilmington, DelawareKent, Washington

Sludge Dewatering Polymer Broadway 

Treatment Plant

Sludge Dewatering Polymer Greenwood 

Treatment Plant

Sludge Dewatering Polymer Laguna Madre 

Treatment Plant

Sludge Dewatering Polymer Oso Treatment 

Plant

Sludge Dewatering Polymer Whitecap 

Treatment Plant


