City of Corpus Christi Bid Tabulation

Finance & Procurement RFB # 5859
Sr. Buyer : Cynthia Perez Liquid Cationic Polymer (PolyDadmac)
Bid opening June 18, 2024
Polydyne Inc. -
Riceboro, Georgia
A4-105¢
L. . 12- Month L. .
ITEM Description Unit Qty Unit Price Total Price
Liquid Cationic Polymer Wet
1 |(PolyDadmac) Clarifloc C- Tons 450 $ 2,480.00|$ 1,116,000.00
318
2 Unloading Delay Hrs. 40 | S 85.00 | S 3,400.00
Total S 1,119,400.00




City of Corpus Christi Bid Tabulation

Contracts and Procurement RFB # 3854
Sr. Buyer : Cynthia Perez Liquid Cationic Polymer (PolyDadmac)
Polydyne Inc. -
Riceboro, Georgia
Al- (449
FIRST YEAR
12- Month
ITEM Description Unit Qty Unit Price Total Price
Liquid Cationic Polymer Wet
1 |(PolyDadmac) Clarifloc C- Tons 450
318 on $ 2,140.00 | $  963,000.00
1-Year Total s 963,000.00

FIRST - 1 YEAR Extension Option

AL : 12- Month . .
ITEM Description Unit Qty Unit Price Total Price
Liquid Cationic Polymer Wet
1 [(PolyDadmac) Clarifloc C- Tons 450
31

. $ 2,340.00 | $ 1,053,000.00
First 1-Year Option Total S 1,053,000.00
Grand Total § 2,016,000.00




CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI
Contracts and Procurement
Request for Bid

Bid Tabulation
TITLE: RFB 2629 Liquid Cationic Polymer
Senior Buyer: Cynthia Perez
/Q" /@é’ 2 Supplier 1 Supplier 2 Supplier 3
GEO Specialty Polydyne, Inc. Sterling Water Technologies
Little Rock, AR Riceboro, GA Columbia, TN
UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION Unit QTY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Liquid Cationic
1 Polymer(PolyDadmac) WetTons| 870 | $ 1,910.00 $1.661,700.00 |3$1,840.00 $1,600,800.00 $1.861.99 $1,619,929.82
TOTAL $1,661,700.00 $1,600,800.00 $1,619,929.82




City of Corpus Christi
Purchasing Division
Buyer: Cynthia Perez

(8-7397

Bid Tabulation
RFB No. 1902

Liquid Cationic Polymer

BASF Corporation Polydyne, Inc.

Charlotte, NC Riceboro, GA
Item Description Unit QTY Unit Price  Total Price | Unit Price Total Price
1 |Liquid Cationic Polymer Wet Tons 435 $1,700.00 ] $739,500.00 | $1,680.00 | $730,800.00

Total

$739,500.00

$730,800.00




CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI BID TABULATION EVENT 116

PURCHASING DIVISION Liquid Cationic Polymer
BUYER: DOMINGO VALDEZ
Lé ﬂ&p?f Recorded by: Jamye Clark
SNF Polydyne Univar USA, Inc. Ferguson Geo Specialty Chemicals, Inc.
Riceboro, Ga Corpus Christi, TX Corpus Christi, TX Deer Park, TX
Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Item Description Qty. Unit Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1.0 |Liquid Cationic Polymer 435 |Wet Ton $794.00 $345,390.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

TOTAL: $345,390.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00



[5-0002¢

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI
PURCHASING DIVISION

SENIOR BUYER - TOM RICHEY
COUNCIL DATE: February 26, 2013

BID TABULATION

BID INVITATION NO. BI-C050-13
WATER TREATMENT CHEMICALS

Mosaic Crop Nutrition Polydyne Inc. Pennco BASF Corp.
CHEMICAL QTY UNIT Lithia, FL. Riceboro, GA San Felipe, TX Suffolk, VA
UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
Hydrofluorosilicic acid 217 TONS | $646.00 $140,182.00 NO BID $684.00 $148,428.00 NO BID
Cationic Polymer 324 TONS NO BID $1,180.00 $382,320.00 NO BID $1,240.00 $401,760.00



