
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI BID TABULATION

PURCHASING DIVISION BID INVITATION NO. BI-0175-12

BUYER: GERALD GOODWIN HEAVY TRUCKS

BID CLOSING: 5/16/12

CORPUS CHRISTI FREIGHTLINER FREIGHTLINER OF AUSTIN SANTEX TRUCK CENTER, LTD.

CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS AUSTIN, TEXAS SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS

UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1

Series HT-4, 33,000 lbs. GVWR, Standard Cab and 

Chassis, 72 inch CA, with a 5-7 cubic yard Dump Body. 4 each $84,962 $339,848  $84,815 $339,260

2

Series HT-4, 33,000 lbs. GVWR, Standard Cab and 

Chassis, 84 inch CA, with a Dutec Asphalt Body or equal. 1 each $87,092 $87,092  $86,665 $86,665

3

Series HT-3, 25,500 lbs. GVWR, Standard Cab and 

Chassis, 72 to 84 inch CA, with an Altec Flat Bed Body 

with Tool Boxes and an Altec 57’ Rear-Mounted Aerial 

Manlift Boom Model # LRV58 - No Exception. 1 each $129,162 $129,162 $132,536 $132,536 $122,975 $122,975

4

Series HT-3, 25,500 lbs. GVWR, Standard Cab and 

Chassis, 120 inch CA, with a Stake Bed Body and a 

Heavy Duty Hydraulic Liftgate. 1 each $82,312 $82,312  $76,728 $76,728

5

Series HT-5 Crane Truck, 33,000 lbs. GVWR, 168 inch 

CA, Standard Cab and Chassis, with a 18' Flat Bed Body 

and a Front-Mounted Crane Rated 36,000 lbs. @ 5 ft. 

Radius, (National Crane Model # 571E2 or Altec Crane 

Model # AC18-70B). 1 each $187,462 $187,462  $185,854 $185,854

6

Series HT-4, 33,000 lbs. GVWR, Crew Cab and Chassis, 

84 inch CA, with Service Body (RKI - E84DW94 or Equal) 

and a Built-In Hydraulic Power Supply. 2 each $104,562 $209,124   

7

Series HT-3, 25,500 lbs. GVWR, Crew Cab and Chassis, 

102 inch CA, equipped with 3 cubic yard Dump Body. 1 each $90,212 $90,212  $81,397 $81,397

8

Dump Truck, 56,000 GVWR, 108" CT, with 10-12 cubic 

yard Dump Body. 1 each $110,062 $110,062   

9

Dump Truck, 56,000 GVWR, 108" CT, Standard Cab and 

Chassis, with 10-12 cubic yard Dump Body. 3 each $111,062 $333,186   

         TOTAL: 15  $1,568,460  $132,536  $892,879



CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI BID TABULATION

PURCHASING DIVISION EVENT # 63

BUYER: JEANNETTE P. TIJIERNA

UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1 2016 Ford Fusion SE Hybrid - Lease Purchase 20 each $23,650.00 $473,000.00 $23,311.08 $466,221.60 $23,600.21 $472,004.20

2 2015 Cheverolet Tahoe 4x4 - Purchase 2 each NO BID NO BID $37,395.00 $74,790.00 NO BID NO BID

3 2016 Ford Utility Interceptor - Purchase 40 each $27,370.00 $1,094,800.00 $26,805.08 $1,072,203.20 $27,592.21 $1,103,688.40

Total: $1,567,800.00 $74,790.00

Price Total: $1,642,590.00

$30,670.12

Total Cost: $1,673,260.12

Interest for Lease:

PURCHASE AND LEASE PURCHASE

OF POLICE VEHICLES

AutoNation Ford

Corpus Christi, TX

Silsbee Ford

Silsbee, TX

Eddie Yaklin

Kingsville, TX


