TABULATED BY: Nick Cecava, P.E.
DESIGN ENGINEER: Freese and Nichols, Inc.
BID DATE: Wednesday, May 17, 2023

TABULATION OF BIDS
PROCUREMENT - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS

RFB 4751 JE Construction Services, LLC Bay Ltd. Reytec Construction
PROJECT NO. 18015A, 21052, 21056 - Everhart Road — S.P.1.D. to Alameda Street Bond 2018 & 2020 7505 Up River Rd. 401 Corn Products Rd., Bldg. 1 1901 Hollister St.
BASE BID 1 - HMAC Corpus Christi, TX 78409 Corpus Christi, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080
NO BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Part A - GENERAL

1-A1 |Mobilization (Max 5% Part A) LS 119 65,000.00 | $ 65,000.00 | $ 85,000.00 | $ 85,000.00
1-A2 |Bonds and Insurance (Max 2%) LS 11$% 170,000.00 | § 170,000.00 | $ 1.50 | § 1.50
1-A3 |Clear Right-of-Way AC 1419% 43,000.00 | $ 602,000.00] $ 156,725.00 | $ 2,194,150.00
1-A4 |Ozone Day DAY 419% 1.00 | $ 40019% 750.00 | $ 3,000.00
1-A5 |Survey Monument EA 219 1,250.00 | $ 2,500.001 % 380.00 | $ 760.00
1-A6 |Traffic Control Mobilization/Adjustments LS 11$ 385,000.00 | % 385000.00]% 53,000.00 | $ 53,000.00
1-A7 |Traffic Control ltems (Signs, Barricades, Channelizing Devices, LPCBs, etc.) MO 2419 3,500.00 | $ 84,000.001 $ 11,800.00 [ $ 283,200.00
1-A8 |Arrow Boards for Traffic Control EA 419 6,700.00 | $ 26,800.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 38,000.00
1-A9 |Message Boards for Traffic Control (Full Matrix) EA 51% 25,000.00 [ $ 125,000.00) % 14,400.00 | $ 72,000.00
1-A10 |Temporary Signalization for Traffic Control LS 119% 59,000.00 | $ 59,000.00 | $ 66,500.00 | $ 66,500.00
1-A11 |Temporary Pavement for Detours SY 50001 % 50.00| $ 250,000.001 % 73.00| $ 365,000.00
1-A12 |Block Sodding SY 6,180 ] $ 11.00 | $ 67,980.001 $ 13.00 | $ 80,340.00
1-A13 |Silt Fence for Storm Water Pollution Prevention LF 9,3521 9% 400 1| $ 37,408.001 $ 7501 % 70,140.00
1-A14 |Curb Inlet Protection EA 571 9% 250.00 | $ 14,250.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 11,970.00
1-A15 |Storm Water Pollution Prevention Plan LS 119 13,000.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 3,800.00

SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (Items A1 thru A15) $ 1,901,942.00 $ 3,326,861.50

Part B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS

1-B1 |Mobilization (Max 5% Part B) LS 119 158,400.00 | $ 158,400.00 ] $ 302,000.00 [ $ 302,000.00
1-B2 |[Street Excavation SY 49,7811 % 26.00 | $ 1,294,306.00§ $ 1750 | $ 871,167.50
1-B3 |8" Lime Stabilized Subgrade SY 49,7811 % 19.00 | $ 945,839.00f % 29.00 | $ 1,443,649.00
1-B4 |16" Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (Type A, Gr. 1-2) SY 49,7811 $ 56.00 | $ 2,787,736.00 $ 7200 | $ 3,584,232.00
1-B5 |Prime Coat (0.15 GAL/SY) GAL 6,699 ] % 8.00| % 53,592.001 $ 8.50| % 56,941.50
1-B6 |One Course Surface Treatment Underseal (Asphalt Binder and Aggregate) SY 44,378 | $ 500 % 221,890.00] % 6.00| $ 266,268.00
1-B7 |3" HMACP (Type D) Surface Course SY 44,3781 $ 3200 | $ 1,420,096.00) $ 30.00 | $ 1,331,340.00
1-B8 14.5" HMACP (Type B) Base Course SY 44662 | $ 39.00 (% 1,741,818.00] $ 37.00 [ $ 1,652,494.00
1-B9 |6" Concrete Driveway (Class A) SF 36,712 $ 1450 |$ 532,324.00) $ 21.00| $ 770,952.00
1-B10 [6" Concrete Driveway (Class HES) SF 6,000 $ 15.00 | $ 90,000.00§ $ 2200|$ 132,000.00
1-B11 |Concrete Median SF 27431 % 11.00 | $ 30,173.00| $ 1750 | $ 48,002.50
1-B12 |2" Mill and Overlay SY 530 $ 61.00 | $ 32,330.001 $ 53.00 | $ 28,090.00
1-B13 |6" Header Curb (Type B) LF 1001 $ 11.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 5,500.00
1-B14 |Unanticipated Concrete Driveway Removal SF 2501 9% 3.00| % 750.00 | $ 1750 | $ 4,375.00

Page 1 of 10




TABULATION OF BIDS
PROCUREMENT - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS

TABULATED BY: Nick Cecava, P.E.
DESIGN ENGINEER: Freese and Nichols, Inc.
BID DATE: Wednesday, May 17, 2023

RFB 4751 JE Construction Services, LLC Bay Ltd. Reytec Construction
PROJECT NO. 18015A, 21052, 21056 - Everhart Road — S.P.I.D. to Alameda Street Bond 2018 & 2020 7505 Up River Rd. 401 Corn Products Rd., Bldg. 1 1901 Hollister St.
BASE BID 1 - HMAC Corpus Christi, TX 78409 Corpus Christi, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080
NO BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT | QTY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1-B15 |Asphalt Pavement Repair (Type 1) SY 5001 $ 93.00 | $ 46,500.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 60,000.00
1-B16 |Asphalt Pavement Repair (Parking Lots) SF 3,00019% 14.00 | $ 42,000.00 | $ 16.50 | $ 49,500.00
1-B17 |6" Concrete Pavement Repair (Parking Lots) SF 2500] % 11.00 | $ 27,500.00 | $ 31.00 | $ 77,500.00
1-B18 |Adjust Existing Manhole to Finish Grade EA 319 2,700.00 | $ 8,100.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 8,100.00
REFL PAV MRK TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED THERMOPLASTIC
1-B19 [(W)(ARROW)(125MIL) EA 6319% 187.00 | $ 11,781.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 13,230.00
REFL PAV MRK TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED THERMOPLASTIC
1-B20 [(W)(WORD)(125MIL) EA 141 9$ 310.00 | $ 4,340.001 $ 350.00 | $ 4,900.00
1-B21 [REFL PAV MRK TY | (Y) 4"(BRK)(090MIL) LF 1,800 | $ 1.00 [ $ 1,800.00 | $ 1.00 [ $ 1,800.00
1-B22 |REFL PAV MRK TY | (Y) 4"(SLD)(090MIL) LF 8,4011% 1.00 [ $ 8,401.00] $ 1.00 [ $ 8,401.00
1-B23 [REFL PAV MRK TY | (Y) 4"(SLD)(DBL)(090MIL) LF 1,785 $ 200($ 3,670.001 % 250 (% 4,462.50
1-B24 |[REFL PAV MRK TY | (W) 4"(BRK)(090MIL) LF 31201 % 1.00 [ $ 3,120.00]1 $ 1.00 [ $ 3,120.00
1-B25 |[REFL PAV MRK TY | (W) 4"(SLD)(090MIL) LF 20719 1.00 [ $ 207.00 | $ 1.00 [ $ 207.00
1-B26 [REFL PAV MRK TY | (W) 4"(DOTTED)(2' SEG, 4' GAP)(090MIL) LF 2601 % 1.00 [ $ 260.00 ] $ 1.00 [ $ 260.00
1-B27 |REFL PAV MRK TY | (W) 8"(SLD)(090MIL) LF 1,350 | § 200($ 2,700.001 $ 200 (% 2,700.00
REFL PAV MRK TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED THERMOPLASTIC
1-B28 [(W)24”(SLD)(125MIL) LF 4001 % 20.00 | $ 8,000.001 $ 22.00 | § 8,800.00
1-B29 |TY II-C Raised Pavement Marker (Reflectorized) EA 3251 9% 6.00| % 1,950.00]1 % 700 1| % 2,275.00
1-B30 |TY II-A-A Raised Pavement Marker (Reflectorized) EA 250 | $ 6.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 1,750.00
1-B31 |TY |I-B-B Raised Pavement Marker (Reflectorized) EA 461 $ 7.00 | $ 322001 $ 850 | % 391.00
1-B32 |Furnish and Install Street Sign Assembly w/Stop Sign Only EA 219 980.00 | $ 1,960.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 2,200.00
1-B33 |Furnish and Install Street Sign Assembly w/9" Blades (Green) and Stop Sign EA 121 9% 1,100.00 | $ 13,200.00] $ 1,300.00 | $ 15,600.00
Furnish And Install Roadside Traffic Sign And Sign Support Assembly (Triangular Slipbase
1-B34 |[System) EA 3919 950.00 | $ 37,050.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 42,900.00
1-B35 |Allowance for Unanticipated Street -Related Improvements LS 119 100,000.00 | $ 100,000.001 $ 100,000.00 | $ 100,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (ltems B1 thru B35) $ 9,634,615.00 $ 10,905,108.00
Part C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS
1-C1 |Mobilization (Max 5% Part C) LS 119 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.001 % 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
1-C2 |9" Concrete Bus Stop Pad SF 39601 $ 15.00 | $ 59,400.00 | $ 33.00| $§ 130,680.00
1-C3 |5" Pedestrian Concrete Bus Stop Pad SF 1,0821 9% 14.00 | $ 15,148.00 | $ 43.00 | $ 46,526.00
SUBTOTAL PART C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (Items C1 thru C3) $ 77,548.00 $ 182,206.00
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TABULATION OF BIDS
PROCUREMENT - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS
TABULATED BY: Nick Cecava, P.E.
DESIGN ENGINEER: Freese and Nichols, Inc.
BID DATE: Wednesday, May 17, 2023

RFB 4751 JE Construction Services, LLC Bay Ltd. Reytec Construction
PROJECT NO. 18015A, 21052, 21056 - Everhart Road — S.P.I.D. to Alameda Street Bond 2018 & 2020 7505 Up River Rd. 401 Corn Products Rd., Bldg. 1 1901 Hollister St.
BASE BID 1 - HMAC Corpus Christi, TX 78409 Corpus Christi, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080
NO BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT | QTY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Part D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS
1-D1  [Mobilization (Max 5% Part D) LS 119 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 ] $ 22,000.00 | $ 22,000.00
1-D2 [4" Thick Concrete Sidewalk SF 50,548 | $ 9.50 | $§ 480,206.00 ] $ 11.00 | $§ 556,028.00
1-D3 |Concrete Curb Ramp SF 43281 9% 35.00| % 151,480.00] $ 37.00| $ 160,136.00
1-D4  [Sidewalk Retaining Curb LF 53519 21.00 [ $ 11,235.00] $ 58.00 | $ 31,030.00
REFL PAV MRK TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED THERMOPLASTIC
1-D5  [(W)(24")(SLD)(125MIL) LF 6501 $ 20.00 | $ 13,000.00 ] $ 22.00 | $ 14,300.00
1-D6 |Unanticipated Concrete Sidewalk Removal SF 500 $ 3.00| % 1,500.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 3,500.00
1-D Allowance for Unanticipated ADA Improvements LS 119 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.001 $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART D - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (Items D1 thru D7) $ 690,421.00 $ 801,994.00
Part E - |.T. IMPROVEMENTS
1-E1 |Mobilization (Max 5% Part E) LS 119 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00] $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
1-E2 |2" PVC Schedule 40 IT Conduit with Mule Tape LF 7,200 1 $ 15.00 | $§ 108,000.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 122,400.00
1-E3 |2" PVC Schedule 40 IT Conduit with Mule Tape (BORE) LF 2621 % 38.00 | $ 9,956.00] $ 42.00 | $ 11,004.00
1-E4 |24"x36"x24" Pullbox (Handhole) EA 1419 2,700.00 | $ 37,800.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 42,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART E - I.T. IMPROVEMENTS (Items E1 thru E4) $ 163,756.00 $ 180,404.00
Part F - SIGNALIZATION IMPROVEMENTS
1-F1 |Mobilization (Max 5% Part F) LS 119 72,000.00 | $ 72,000.00 | $ 47,000.00 | $ 47,000.00
1-F2 |Drill Shaft (Trf. Sig. Pole) (24") LF 1191 $ 164.00 | $ 19,516.00] $ 180.00 | $ 21,420.00
1-F3 |Pedestal Pole Spread Footing (Burney Drive) EA 119 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 14,000.00
1-F4 |Drill Shaft (Trf. Sig. Pole) (36") LF 226 | $ 350.00 | $ 79,100.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 90,400.00
1-F5 |Conduit (PVC) (Sch. 40) (2") LF 36219 25.00 | $ 9,050.00] $ 28.00 | $ 10,136.00
1-F6 [Conduit (PVC) (Sch. 40) (2") (Bore) LF 15751 % 37.00 | $ 58,275.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 66,150.00
1-F7 |Conduit (PVC) (Sch. 40) (3") LF 5201 $ 31.00 | $ 16,120.00 ] $ 3500 | $ 18,200.00
1-F8 [Conduit (PVC) (Sch. 40) (4") LF 1791 $ 37.00 | $ 6,623.00]1 $ 42.00 | $ 7,518.00
1-F9 |Conduit (PVC) (Sch. 40) (4") (Bore) LF 1,402 | $ 50.00 | $ 70,100.00 | $ 56.00 | $ 78,512.00
1-F10 |Elec. Condr. (No. 6) Bare LF 3719 3.00 | 9% 111.00] $ 350|9% 129.50
1-F11 |Elec. Condr. (No. 6) Insulated LF 7419% 3.00|% 222.001 $ 4.00 | $ 296.00
1-F12 |Elec. Condr. (No. 8) Insulated LF 22521% 200 | $ 4504.00] % 200 | $ 4,504.00
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TABULATED BY: Nick Cecava, P.E.
DESIGN ENGINEER: Freese and Nichols, Inc.
BID DATE: Wednesday, May 17, 2023

TABULATION OF BIDS
PROCUREMENT - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS

RFB 4751 JE Construction Services, LLC Bay Ltd. Reytec Construction
PROJECT NO. 18015A, 21052, 21056 - Everhart Road — S.P.I.D. to Alameda Street Bond 2018 & 2020 7505 Up River Rd. 401 Corn Products Rd., Bldg. 1 1901 Hollister St.
BASE BID 1 - HMAC Corpus Christi, TX 78409 Corpus Christi, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080
NO BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT | QTY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1-F13 |Tray Cable (3 Condr.) (12 AWG) LF 3,1551 % 200 | $ 6,310.00 | $ 250 | % 7,887.50
1-F14 |Luminaire Cbl. (12 AWG) (2 Condr.) W/ Ground LF 931 % 200 | $ 1,806.00 | $ 250 | $ 2,257.50
1-F15 |Ground Box Type D (162922) W/ Apron EA 2019 2,000.00 | $ 40,000.00]1 $ 1,900.00 | $ 38,000.00
1-F16 |Install Highway Traffic Signal (Isolated) EA 41% 6,800.00 | $ 27,200.00 | $ 7,700.00 | $ 30,800.00
Louvered Vacuum Formed ABS Back Plate (12") (3 SEC) with 3M, 2” Yellow Reflective
1-F17 |Tape EA 3019% 218.00 | $ 6,540.00 | $ 240.00 | $ 7,200.00
Louvered Vacuum Formed ABS Back Plate (12") (4 SEC) with 3M, 2” Yellow Reflective
1-F18 |Tape EA 131 % 243.00 | $ 3,159.00] $ 270.00 | $ 3,510.00
1-F19 |Veh. Sig. Sec. (12") LED (Grn.) EA 3019 350.00 | $ 10,500.00 ] $ 390.00 | $ 11,700.00
1-F20 |Veh. Sig. Sec. (12") LED (Yel.) EA 3019% 350.00 | $ 10,500.00 ] $ 390.00 | $ 11,700.00
1-F21 |Veh. Sig. Sec. (12") LED (Red ) EA 3019 350.00 | $ 10,500.00 ] $ 390.00 | $ 11,700.00
1-F22 |Veh. Sig. Sec. (12") LED (Grn. Arrow) EA 131 % 350.00 | $ 4,550.00 | $ 390.00 | $ 5,070.00
1-F23 |Veh. Sig. Sec. (12") LED (Yel. Arrow ) EA 26195 350.00 | $ 9,100.00]1 $ 390.00 | $ 10,140.00
1-F24 |Veh. Sig. Sec. (12") LED (Red Arrow) EA 131 % 350.00 | $ 4,550.00 | $ 390.00 | $ 5,070.00
1-F25 |Trf. Sig. Cbl. (Type A) (12 AWG) (2 Condr.) LF 3,302 % 200 | $ 6,604.00 | $ 250 | % 8,255.00
1-F26 |Trf. Sig. Cbl. (Type A) (14 AWG) (4 Condr.) LF 297219% 200 | $ 5944.00] % 3.00|% 8,916.00
1-F27 |Trf. Sig. Cbl. (Type A) (14 AWG) (5 Condr.) LF 3201 % 3.00 | 9% 960.00 | $ 3.00 | 9% 960.00
1-F28 |Trf. Sig. Cbl. (Type A) (14 AWG) (7 Condr.) LF 1,087 | $ 3.00|% 3,261.00] $ 350 9% 3,804.50
1-F29 |Trf. Sig. Cbl. (Type A) (14 AWG) (16 Condr.) LF 20481 9% 10.00 | $ 20,480.00]1 $ 11.50 | § 23,552.00
1-F30 |Ins. Trf. Sig. PL AM (S) 1 Arm (20') Lum. EA 119 13,000.00 | $ 13,000.00 ] $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00
1-F31 |Ins. Trf. Sig. PL AM (S) 1 Arm (36") EA 119 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 ] $ 16,500.00 | $ 16,500.00
1-F32 |Ins. Trf. Sig. PL AM (S) 1 Arm (36') Lum. EA 119 16,000.00 | $ 16,000.00 | $ 18,300.00 | $ 18,300.00
1-F33 |Ins. Trf. Sig. PL AM (S) 1 Arm (40") EA 3195 16,000.00 | $ 48,000.00]1 $ 17,600.00 | $ 52,800.00
1-F34 |Ins. Trf. Sig. PL AM (S) 1 Arm (44") EA 69 16,000.00 | $ 96,000.00 | $ 18,500.00 | $  111,000.00
1-F35 |Ins. Trf. Sig. PL AM (S) 1 Arm (44') Lum. EA 219 18,000.00 | $ 36,000.00 | $ 20,500.00 | $ 41,000.00
1-F36 |Ped. Detect Push Button (APS) w/ R10-3E sign (Polara INS APS with iDetect) EA 281 9% 1,100.00 | $ 30,800.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 33,600.00
1-F37 |Polara Ped Detector Controller Unit (ICCU-S2) and Interconnect Board (iN2-iCB) EA 419% 5,000.00 | $ 20,000.00]1 $ 5,600.00 | $ 22,400.00
1-F38 |Ped. Sig. Sec. (LED) (Countdown) EA 281 9% 685.00 | $ 19,180.00 ] $ 770.00 | $ 21,560.00
1-F39 |Ped. Pole Assembly EA 181 9% 1,400.00 | $ 25,200.00]1 $ 1,600.00 | $ 28,800.00
1-F40 |Radar Presence Detector (Wavetronix Smartsensor Matrix) EA 1519 9,400.00|$ 141,000.00]1 % 10,500.00 [ $ 157,500.00
1-F41 [Wavetronix Click 656 Cabinet Interface Device EA 419% 9,000.00 | $ 36,000.00 | $ 10,100.00 | $ 40,400.00
1-F42 |Radar Presence Detector Comm. & Power Cable (Smartsensor 6/C) LF 21111 9% 400 1| $% 8,444.001 $ 500 1| % 10,555.00
1-F43 |Mast Arm Damper (Valmont Mitigator TR1) EA 141 $ 3,500.00 | $ 49,000.00 | $ 3,800.00 [ $ 53,200.00
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TABULATION OF BIDS
PROCUREMENT - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS

TABULATED BY: Nick Cecava, P.E.
DESIGN ENGINEER: Freese and Nichols, Inc.
BID DATE: Wednesday, May 17, 2023

RFB 4751 JE Construction Services, LLC Bay Ltd. Reytec Construction
PROJECT NO. 18015A, 21052, 21056 - Everhart Road — S.P.I1.D. to Alameda Street Bond 2018 & 2020 7505 Up River Rd. 401 Corn Products Rd., Bldg. 1 1901 Hollister St.
BASE BID 1 - HMAC Corpus Christi, TX 78409 Corpus Christi, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080
NO BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Camera PTZ (Axis P5655-E PTZ, 1080P, WDR, x32, IP66, Dome Network Camera)
1-F44 |including mounting equipment EA 419 4,700.00 | $ 18,800.00 | $ 5,300.00 | $ 21,200.00
1-F45 |Ethernet Cable CAT 5E for PTZ LF 9031 $ 2.00 | $ 1,806.00 | $ 3.00| % 2,709.00
1-F46 |Electrical Service and Cabinet EA 419 6,800.00 | $ 27,200.00 | $ 7,700.00 | $ 30,800.00
1-F47 |ILSN (LED) 8S (Duralight JXM-STN) (Rigid Back Mount) EA 151 9% 4,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 67,500.00
1-F48 |Controller Cabinet (TS-2) with Extension EA 419 19,000.00 | $ 76,000.00 | $ 21,700.00 | $ 86,800.00
1-F49 |[Controller Foundation EA 419% 3,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 3,300.00 | $ 13,200.00
1-F50 |Controller Econolite Cobalt ATC 1000 EA 41% 5,400.00 | $ 21,600.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 24,000.00
1-F51 |MMU2-16LEip With Ethernet Port EA 419% 2,200.00 | $ 8,800.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 9,600.00
1-F52 |Miovision TrafficLink Detection (To Include Smartview 360 and Core DCM) EA 419 40,000.00 | $ 160,000.001 $ 45,500.00 | $ 182,000.00
Alpha FXM HP 1100 Rugged UPS Module with 48” Outdoor BBS Enclosure (SE48-1616)

1-F53 |(To Include All System Options) EA 419 10,000.00 | $ 40,000.00§ $ 11,000.00 | $ 44,000.00
1-F54 |Allowance for Unanticipated Signalization Improvements LS 119 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00]1 % 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00

SUBTOTAL PART F - SIGNALIZATION IMPROVEMENTS (ltems F1 thru F54) $ 1,513,915.00 $ 1,678,212.00

Part G - STORM WATER DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS

1-G1 |Mobilization (Max 5% Part G) LS 11$ 193,000.00 | $ 193,000.00] $ 108,000.00 | $ 108,000.00
1-G2 |12" Dia. RCP (Class lll) LF 91% 170.00 | $ 1,530.00] $ 470.00 | $ 4,230.00
1-G3 |15" Dia. RCP (Class lll) LF 41% 184.00 | $ 736.00 | $ 910.00 | $ 3,640.00
1-G4 |18" Dia. RCP (Class lll) LF 24701 $ 172.00 [ $ 424,840.00] $ 200.00 | $ 494,000.00
1-G5 |24" Dia. RCP (Class lll) LF 7071 $ 180.00 | $ 127,260.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 148,470.00
1-G6 |30" Dia. RCP (Class lll) LF 7751 $ 23500 [ $ 182,125.00) % 240.00 | $ 186,000.00
1-G7 |36" Dia. RCP (Class lll) LF 7621 $ 303.00|$ 230,886.00] % 290.00 | $ 220,980.00
1-G8 |42" Dia. RCP (Class lll) LF 1,960 | $ 381.00 | $ 746,760.00) $ 340.00 | § 666,400.00
1-G9 |54" Dia. RCP (Class lll) LF 3719 675.00 | $ 24975.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 19,980.00
1-G10 |60" Dia. RCP (Class IlIl) LF 491 9% 800.00 | $ 39,200.00 | $ 590.00 | $ 28,910.00
1-G11 |Tie-In Existing 12" Dia. RCP EA 119% 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00
1-G12 |Tie-In Existing 15" Dia. RCP EA 219% 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00§ $ 1,400.00 | $ 2,800.00
1-G13 |Tie-In Existing 18" Dia. RCP EA 1019 1,550.00 | $ 15,500.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 14,000.00
1-G14 |Tie-In Existing 24" Dia. RCP EA 219% 1,600.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00
1-G15 |Tie-In Existing 30" Dia. RCP EA 31% 1,800.00 | $ 5,400.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 4,500.00
1-G16 |Tie-In Existing 42" Dia. RCP EA 119% 3,300.00 | $ 3,300.00 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 1,700.00
1-G17 |Tie-In Existing 54" Dia. RCP EA 119% 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00
1-G18 |Tie-In Existing 5' x 5' RCB EA 119% 3,700.00 | $ 3,700.00 | $ 5,300.00 | $ 5,300.00
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TABULATED BY: Nick Cecava, P.E.
DESIGN ENGINEER: Freese and Nichols, Inc.
BID DATE: Wednesday, May 17, 2023

TABULATION OF BIDS
PROCUREMENT - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS

PROJECT NO. 18015A, 21052, 21056 - Everhart Road — S.P.1.D. to Alameda Street Bond 2018 & 2020

RFB 4751

BASE BID 1 - HMAC

JE Construction Services, LLC

7505 Up River Rd.

Corpus Christi, TX 78409

Bay Ltd.

401 Corn Products Rd., Bldg. 1
Corpus Christi, TX 78409

Reytec Construction
1901 Hollister St.
Houston, TX 77080

NO BID

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1-G19 |Tie-In to Proposed Inlet EA 31% 1,550.00 | $ 4,650.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 3,900.00
1-G20 |Tie-In to Existing Inlet EA 319% 1,550.00 | $ 465000 % 3,800.00 | $ 11,400.00
1-G21 |Tie-In to Proposed Manhole EA 719% 3,200.00 | $ 22,400.001 $ 1,700.00 | $ 11,900.00
1-G22 |Tie-In to Existing Manhole EA 219 3,200.00 | $ 6,400.00| $ 5,100.00 | $ 10,200.00
1-G23 [Sidewalk Drain EA 519% 4,000.00 | $ 20,000.00§ $ 2,200.00 | $ 11,000.00
1-G24 |5' Standard Curb Inlet EA 5319% 5,300.00 | $ 280,900.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 445,200.00
1-G25 [5' Curb Inlet Extension EA 3019 3,300.00 | $ 99,000.00 $ 2,400.00 | $ 72,000.00
1-G26 |Special Curb Inlet EA 219 43,400.00 | $ 86,800.001 $ 9,100.00 | $ 18,200.00
1-G27 |4' Dia. Concrete Storm Water Manhole (Type 'A") EA 719 13,000.00 | $ 91,000.00 | $ 8,700.00 | $ 60,900.00
1-G28 |5' Dia. Concrete Storm Water Manhole (Type 'A") EA 719% 14,000.00 | $ 98,000.00 | $ 10,200.00 | $ 71,400.00
1-G29 |6' Dia. Concrete Storm Water Manhole (Type 'A") EA 119% 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 11,000.00
1-G30 |Concrete Storm Water Manhole (Type 'C') EA 719% 17,000.00 [ $ 119,000.00 | $ 13,800.00 | $ 96,600.00
1-G31 |Concrete Storm Water Manhole (Type 'D") EA 131 9% 22,000.00 | $ 286,000.00] $ 13,100.00 | $ 170,300.00
1-G32 |Adjust Existing Storm Water MH to Grade EA 219 2,700.00 | $ 5,400.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 6,000.00
1-G33 [Special Junction Box EA 119% 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.001 $ 22,300.00 | $ 22,300.00
1-G34 |[Special Manhole Riser EA 719% 16,000.00 | $ 112,000.00 | $ 8,200.00 | $ 57,400.00
1-G35 [Concrete Cap Repair on Exist. 5' x 5' RCB EA 719 3,500.00 | $ 24,500.00 1 $ 4,700.00 | $ 32,900.00
1-G36 |Concrete Cap Repair on Exist. 60" RCP EA 119 2,800.00 | $ 2,800.00]1 % 4,600.00 | $ 4,600.00
1-G37 |[6" Concrete Curb and Gutter LF 14,363 | $ 27.00| % 387,801.00) % 51.00 | § 732,513.00
1-G38 |6" Concrete Curb LF 441 % 14.00 | $ 616.00| $ 79.00 | $ 3,476.00
1-G39 |[Trench Safety for Storm Water Conduits LF 6,687 | $ 10.00 | $ 66,870.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 46,809.00
1-G40 |[Trench Safety for Storm Water Manhole, Junction Box, and Inlets EA 951% 470.00 | $ 44,650.00]1 % 290.00 | $ 27,550.00
1-G41 |Allowance for Unanticipated Storm Water Improvements LS 119 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 ) $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00

SUBTOTAL PART G - STORM WATER DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (Items G1 thru G41) $ 3,871,849.00 $ 3,892,958.00

Part H - WATER IMPROVEMENTS

1-H1 [Mobilization (Max 5% Part H) LS 11$ 314,000.00 | $ 314,000.00] $ 155,000.00 | $ 155,000.00
1-H2 [4" Tie-In Connection EA 219 3,900.00 | $ 7,800.001 $ 9,000.00 | $ 18,000.00
1-H3 [6" Dia. D.l. Waterline LF 1,0411 9% 280.00 [ $ 291,480.00) 9% 190.00 | $ 197,790.00
1-H4 [6" Tie-In Connection EA 161 $ 5,000.00 | $ 80,000.001 $ 9,000.00 | $ 144,000.00
1-H5 |[6" Dia. 45° D.l. Bend EA 1419 550.00 | $ 7,700001 $ 420.00 | $ 5,880.00
1-H6 [6" Dia. 90° D.I. Bend EA 119 580.00 | $ 580.00| $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00
1-H7 |6" Gate Valve with Box and Cover EA 319% 2,400.00 | $ 7,200001 $ 1,700.00 | $ 5,100.00
1-H8 |8" Dia. C900 PVC Waterline (DR 18) LF 57801 9% 149.00 | $ 861,220.00| $ 110.00 | $ 635,800.00
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TABULATED BY: Nick Cecava, P.E.
DESIGN ENGINEER: Freese and Nichols, Inc.
BID DATE: Wednesday, May 17, 2023

TABULATION OF BIDS
PROCUREMENT - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS

RFB 4751
PROJECT NO. 18015A, 21052, 21056 - Everhart Road — S.P.1.D. to Alameda Street Bond 2018 & 2020
BASE BID 1 - HMAC

JE Construction Services, LLC
7505 Up River Rd.
Corpus Christi, TX 78409

Bay Ltd.
401 Corn Products Rd., Bldg. 1
Corpus Christi, TX 78409

Reytec Construction
1901 Hollister St.
Houston, TX 77080

NO BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT | QTY | UNITPRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1-H9 |[8" Dia. D.l. Waterline LF 20291 9% 29500 [ $ 598,555.00) % 170.00 | $ 344,930.00
1-H10 |8" Dia. 11.25° D.Il. Bend EA 219 71500 | $ 1,430.00] $ 560.00 | $ 1,120.00
1-H11 |8" Dia. 22.5° D.l. Bend EA 319% 700.00 | $ 2,100.00 $ 540.00 | $ 1,620.00
1-H12 |8" Dia. 45° D.I. Bend EA 136 | $ 700.00 | $ 95,200.001 $ 550.00 | $ 74,800.00
1-H13 |8" Dia. 90° D.l. Bend EA 119 800.00 | $ 800.00| % 610.00 | $ 610.00
1-H14 |8" Gate Valve with Box and Cover EA 491 % 2,900.00($ 142,100.001 $ 2,400.00 [ $ 117,600.00
1-H15 |8" Tie-in Connection EA 91% 5,500.00 | $ 49,500.00§ $ 10,000.00 | $ 90,000.00
1-H16 |8"x 8" D.l. Tee EA 2219 1,000.00 | $ 22,000.00 $ 850.00 | $ 18,700.00
1-H17 |[8" x 6" Tapping Sleeve EA 119 14,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 8,900.00 | $ 8,900.00
1-H18 |8" x 6" D.l. Reducer EA 1319% 615.00 | $ 7995001 % 460.00 | $ 5,980.00
1-H19 |8"x 6" D.l. Tee EA 219 940.00 | $ 1,880.00 | $ 820.00 | $ 1,640.00
1-H20 |8" x 4" D.l. Reducer EA 219 600.00 | $ 1,200.00 $ 470.00 | $ 940.00
1-H21 |12" Dia. D.l. Waterline LF 1301 $ 420.00 | $ 54,600.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 26,000.00
1-H22 |12" Dia. 45° D.l. Bend EA 619% 1,600.00 | $ 9,600.001 $ 1,300.00 | $ 7,800.00
1-H23 |12" x 8" Cross EA 119 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00 ) $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00
1-H24 12" x 8" Tee EA 119 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00| $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00
1-H25 |12" Tie-in Connection EA 219 9,500.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 10,900.00 | $ 21,800.00
1-H26 |12" Gate Valve with Box and Cover EA 419 5,500.00 | $ 22,000.00§ $ 4,700.00 | $ 18,800.00
1-H27 |16" Tie-in Connection EA 119 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 11,100.00 | $ 11,100.00
1-H28 |24" Dia. C900 PVC Waterline (DR 18) LF 6,992 1 9% 490.00 | $ 3,426,080.00 | $ 350.00 [ $ 2,447,200.00
1-H29 |24" Dia. D.l. Waterline LF 1471 9% 870.00 | $ 127,890.00 | $ 460.00 | $ 67,620.00
1-H30 |24" Horiz. Gate Valve with 6' x 6' Vault EA 319% 80,000.00 | $ 240,000.00] $ 71,600.00 | $§ 214,800.00
1-H31 |24" Gate Valve with Box and Cover EA 219 45,000.00 | $ 90,000.00 $ 41,400.00 | $ 82,800.00
1-H32 |24" Dia. 11.25° D.I. Bend EA 319% 4,400.00 | $ 13,200.00 1 $ 3,600.00 | $ 10,800.00
1-H33 |24" Dia. 22.5° D.Il. Bend EA 119 4,700.00 | $ 4,700.00 $ 3,600.00 | $ 3,600.00
1-H34 |24" Dia. 45° D.l. Bend EA 2419% 4,600.00 | $ 110,400.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 86,400.00
1-H35 |24" x 8" D.l. Tee EA 419 4,800.00 | $ 19,200.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 16,000.00
1-H36 |24" x 12" D.I. Tee EA 219 5,300.00 | $ 10,600.00 | $ 4,300.00 | $ 8,600.00
1-H37 |24" x 24" D.I. Tee EA 219 7,200.00 | $ 14,400.00 | $ 5,900.00 | $ 11,800.00
1-H38 |24" x 16" D.I. Reducer EA 119 4,000.00 | $ 4,000.00) $ 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00
1-H39 |24" x 20" D.I. Reducer EA 219 4,300.00 | $ 8,600.00] $ 3,500.00 | $ 7,000.00
1-H40 [42" Dia. Steel Casing Pipe (Open Cut) LF 2419% 1,070.00 | $ 25,680.001 $ 670.00 | $ 16,080.00
1-H41 |Remove Existing 20" Valve Assembly and Vault EA 41% 4,300.00 | $ 17,200.00 | $ 7,200.00 | $ 28,800.00
1-H42 |20" Tie-in Connection EA 219% 14,000.00 | $ 28,000.00 $ 20,100.00 | $ 40,200.00
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TABULATED BY: Nick Cecava, P.E.
DESIGN ENGINEER: Freese and Nichols, Inc.
BID DATE: Wednesday, May 17, 2023

TABULATION OF BIDS
PROCUREMENT - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS

RFB 4751

PROJECT NO. 18015A, 21052, 21056 - Everhart Road — S.P.1.D. to Alameda Street Bond 2018 & 2020

BASE BID 1 - HMAC

JE Construction Services, LLC
7505 Up River Rd.
Corpus Christi, TX 78409

Bay Ltd.
401 Corn Products Rd., Bldg. 1
Corpus Christi, TX 78409

Reytec Construction
1901 Hollister St.
Houston, TX 77080

NO BID

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1-H43 |[Fire Hydrant Assembly (Type 1) EA 451$  11,600.00 | $ 522,000.00 | $ 9,800.00 [ $  441,000.00
1-H44 |Fire Hydrant Assembly (Type 2) EA 119 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,600.00 | $ 10,600.00
1-H45 |Adjust Exist. Water Valve Box to Finish Grade EA 51% 915.00 | § 4575.001 $ 1,500.00 | $ 7,500.00
1-H46 [1" Water Service (Short) EA 8195 2,600.00 | $ 20,800.00] $ 3,100.00 | $ 24,800.00
1-H47 (1" Water Service (Long) EA 219 4,400.00 | $ 8,800.00]1 % 3,200.00 | $ 6,400.00
1-H48 |[Abandon in Place Ex. 6" AC waterline (Fill with Grout) LF 18311 9% 23.00 | $ 42.113.001 % 7501 9% 13,732.50
1-H49 |Abandon in Place Ex. 8" AC waterline (Fill with Grout) LF 544319 2400 $ 130,632.001 $ 10.50 | $ 57,151.50
1-H50 |Trench Safety for Waterlines LF 16,0531 $ 700($% 112,371.001 % 3.00(% 48,159.00
1-H51 |Allowance for Unanticipated Water Improvements LS 119 75,000.00 | $ 75,000.001 $ 75,000.00 | $ 75,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART H - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (ltems H1 thru H51) $ 7,691,981.00 $ 5,646,953.00

Part | - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS
1-11  |Mobilization (Max 5% Part I) LS 119% 54,000.00 | $ 54,000.00 | $ 43,000.00 | $ 43,000.00
1-12  |Rehab Existing 27" Dia. VCP Wastewater Gravity Line with C.I.P.P. LF 27641 9% 26000 | $ 718,640.00] % 290.00 [ $ 801,560.00
1-13  [Rehabilitate Existing Brick Manhole EA 319 30,600.00 | $ 91,800.00 | $ 34,100.00 | $  102,300.00
1-14  |Bypass Pumping of Raw Sewage LS 11% 124,000.00 [ $ 124,000.00 | $ 84,000.00 | $ 84,000.00
1-15 |Trench Safety for Wastewater Manhole EA 31% 630.00 | $ 1,890.00 | $ 690.00 | $ 2,070.00
1-16  |Well Point Dewatering LF 27641 9% 40.00|$ 110,560.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 193,480.00
1-17  |Adjust Existing Manhole to Finish Grade EA 1419% 4,900.00 | $ 68,600.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 77,000.00
1-18 |Wastewater Service Connection with Cleanout EA 81% 5,000.00 | $ 40,000.001 % 5,700.00 | $ 45,600.00
1-19  |Abandon in Place Ex. 8" wastewater line (Fill with Grout) LF 2451 % 45.00 | $ 11,025.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 2,695.00
1-110 |8" Dia. Plug EA 119 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 3,600.00
1-111  |30" Dia. C900 PVC Force Main (DR 18) EA 1241 % 975.00 [ $§ 120,900.00 | $ 1,100.00 | § 136,400.00
1-112 30" Dia. 45° D.l. Bend with Ceramic Epoxy Lining EA 419 14,700.00 | $ 58,800.00 | $ 16,400.00 | $ 65,600.00
1-113 |30" Dia. 90° D.l. Bend with Ceramic Epoxy Lining EA 119 16,000.00 | $ 16,000.00 | $ 17,900.00 | $ 17,900.00
1-114 30" Dia. Plug EA 219 6,900.00 | $ 13,800.00 ] $ 7,800.00 | $ 15,600.00
1-115 |Allowance for Unanticipated Wastewater Improvements LS 119 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 ) $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART | - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items 11 thru 115) $ 1,483,215.00 $ 1,640,805.00
Part J - GAS IMPROVEMENTS

1-J1 |Mobilization (Max 5% Part J) LS 119 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 ] $ 13,000.00 | $ 13,000.00
1-J2  |Trenching/Backfilling for Gas Lines (2" - 6" Dia.) LF 2,636 1% 28.00 | $ 73,808.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 131,800.00
1-J3 |Trenching/Backfilling for Gas Lines (8" - 10" Dia.) LF 47241 9% 36.00 | $ 170,064.00] $ 51.00 | $§ 240,924.00
1-J4  |Adjust Existing Gas Valve Boxes To Finish Grade EA 1019 767.00 | § 7,670.001 % 1,600.00 | $ 16,000.00
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TABULATED BY: Nick Cecava, P.E.
DESIGN ENGINEER: Freese and Nichols, Inc.
BID DATE: Wednesday, May 17, 2023

TABULATION OF BIDS
PROCUREMENT - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS

PROJECT NO. 18015A, 21052, 21056 - Everhart Road — S.P.1.D. to Alameda Street Bond 2018 & 2020

RFB 4751

BASE BID 1 - HMAC

JE Construction Services, LLC
7505 Up River Rd.
Corpus Christi, TX 78409

Bay Ltd.

401 Corn Products Rd., Bldg. 1
Corpus Christi, TX 78409

Reytec Construction
1901 Hollister St.
Houston, TX 77080

NO BID

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
- Remove Existing Gas Lines LF 662 | $ 33.00 | $ 21,846.00 1 $ 89.00 | $ 58,918.00
- Abandon in Place Existing 4" Gas Line LF 1451 % 12.00 | $ 1,740.00]1 $ 8.00|9% 1,160.00
- Abandon in Place Existing 6" Gas Line LF 3141 9% 13.00 | $ 4,082.001 % 6.00 | $ 1,884.00
- Abandon in Place Existing 8" Gas Line LF 1,207 1 $ 14.00 | $ 16,898.001 $ 400 1| 9% 4,828.00
- Abandon in Place Existing 10" Gas Line LF 3,1391 9% 16.00 | $ 50,224.00 | $ 350 (9% 10,986.50
SUBTOTAL PART J - GAS IMPROVEMENTS (ltems J1 thru J9) $ 364,332.00 $ 479,500.50

Part K - ENVIRONMENTAL IMPROVEMENTS
1-K1  [Allowance for Unanticipated Disposal of Contaminated Soil or Groundwater | LS | 119 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART K - ENVIRONMENTAL IMPROVEMENTS (ltem K1) $ 50,000.00 $ 50,000.00
Part L - S.P.I.D. INTERSECTION WATERLINE IMPROVEMENTS

1-L1  |Mobilization (Max 5% Part L) LS 11% 157,000.00 [ $ 157,000.00 § $ 60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00
1-L2 [8" Dia. D.I. Waterline (Material Only) LF 1401 $ 56.00 | $ 7,840.00]1 % 62.00 | $ 8,680.00
1-L3 [8" Dia. 45° D.l. Bend (Material Only) EA 8195 475.00 | $ 3,800.00]1 % 550.00 | $ 4,400.00
1-L4 |8" Gate Valve with Box and Cover (Material Only) EA 31% 2,500.00 | $ 7,500.001 % 2,400.00 | $ 7,200.00
1-L5 [8" x 8" D.I. Tee (Material Only) EA 119 780.00 | $ 780.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 850.00
1-L6  [24" Dia. C900 PVC Waterline (DR 18) (Material Only) LF 5000 % 250.00 | $ 125,000.00 ) $ 240.00 | $ 120,000.00
1-L7 |30" Dia. C900 PVC Waterline (DR 18) (Material Only) LF 200§ 385.00 [ $  77,000.00 ] $ 380.00 [$  76,000.00
1-L8 [42" Dia. Steel Casing Pipe, 5/8" (Bore) (Material Only) LF 4001 % 432.00 | $ 172,800.00 | $ 390.00 | $ 156,000.00
1-L9 [48" Dia. Steel Casing Pipe, 5/8" (Open Cut) (Material Only) LF 2001 $ 640.00 | $ 128,000.00] $ 580.00 [ $ 116,000.00
1-L10 [30" Horiz. Gate Valve with 6' x 6' Vault (Material Only) EA 3195 85,000.00 | $§ 255,000.00 | $ 75,400.00 | $  226,200.00
1-L11 [24" Dia. 45° D.l. Bend (Material Only) EA 219 4,100.00 | $ 8,200.00]1 % 4,000.00 | $ 8,000.00
1-L12 [30" Dia. 45° D.l. Bend (Material Only) EA 219 9,600.00 | $ 19,200.00 ] $ 8,900.00 | $ 17,800.00
1-L13 [24" x 8" D.I. Tee (Material Only) EA 41% 4,200.00 | $ 16,800.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 16,000.00
1-L14 [30" x 30" D.I. Tee (Material Only) EA 119% 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 ] $ 14,100.00 | $ 14,100.00
1-L15 [36" x 30" D.I. Tee (Material Only) EA 119% 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 ] $ 16,900.00 | $ 16,900.00
1-L16 [36" x 24" D.I. Reducer (Material Only) EA 119 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00] $ 8,200.00 | $ 8,200.00
1-L17 [Remove Existing 30" Valve Assembly and Vault EA 119% 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 1 $ 7,800.00 | $ 7,800.00
1-L18 |Remove Existing 30" Waterline LF 2001 % 98.00 | $ 19,600.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 28,000.00
1-L19 |Grout Fill and Abandon Existing 20" Waterline LF 3501 % 82.00 | $ 28,700.00 | $ 1250 | § 4,375.00
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TABULATION OF BIDS
PROCUREMENT - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS

TABULATED BY: Nick Cecava, P.E.
DESIGN ENGINEER: Freese and Nichols, Inc.
BID DATE: Wednesday, May 17, 2023

RFB 4751 JE Construction Services, LLC Bay Ltd. Reytec Construction
PROJECT NO. 18015A, 21052, 21056 - Everhart Road — S.P.1.D. to Alameda Street Bond 2018 & 2020 7505 Up River Rd. 401 Corn Products Rd., Bldg. 1 1901 Hollister St.
BASE BID 1 - HMAC Corpus Christi, TX 78409 Corpus Christi, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080
NO BID
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT| QTY | UNITPRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1-L20 |Grout Fill and Abandon Existing 36" Waterline LF 5019 260.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 1,000.00
1-L21 [8" Tie-in Connection EA 219 6,700.00 | $ 13,400.00 ] $ 6,700.00 | $ 13,400.00
1-L22 |[30" Tie-in Connection EA 219 23,000.00 | $ 46,000.00] $ 12,400.00 | $ 24,800.00
1-L.23 |[36" Tie-in Connection EA 119 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 17,800.00 | $ 17,800.00
1-L.24 |[30" D.l. Water Line Stop EA 219 85,000.00 | $ 170,000.00f$ 119,500.00 | § 239,000.00
1-L25 [Flowable Fill (Excavatable) CY 4001 $ 250.00 | $ 100,000.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 380,000.00
1-L26 |Trench Safety for Waterlines LF 3401 % 32.00 | $ 10,880.00 | $ 1250 | § 4,250.00
1-L27 |Curb Inlet Protection EA 819% 315.00 | $ 2,520.001$% 240.00 | $ 1,920.00
1-L28 [Street Excavation SY 500 $ 55.00 | $ 27,500.001 $ 27.00 | $ 13,500.00
1-L29 |12" Crushed Limestone Flexible Base (Type A, Gr. 1-2) SY 5000 % 65.00 | $ 32,500.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 37,500.00
1-L30 |Prime Coat (0.15 GAL/SY) GAL 751 9% 25.00 | $ 1,875.00 | $ 10.50 | $ 787.50
1-L31 [2" HMACP (Type D) Surface Course SY 5001 $ 44.00 | $ 22,000.00] $ 30.00 | $ 15,000.00
1-L32 [|8" HMACP (Type B) Base Course SY 5001 $ 116.00 | $ 58,000.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 55,000.00
1-L33 [2" Mill and Overlay SY 600 ] $ 55.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 91.00 | $ 54,600.00
1-L34 |4" Thick Stamped Colored Concrete SY 2001 $ 123.00 [ $ 24,600.00 | $ 110.00 [ $ 22,000.00
REFL PAV MRK TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED THERMOPLASTIC
1-L35 |(W)(ARROW)(125MIL) EA 5% 186.00 | $ 930.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 1,050.00
REFL PAV MRK TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED THERMOPLASTIC
1-L36 |(W)(WORD)(125MIL) EA 3]s 310.00 | $ 930.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 1,050.00
1-L37 |REFL PAV MRK TY | (W) 4"(BRK)(090MIL) LF 3001 9% 1.00 | § 300.00 | $ 1.00 | § 300.00
1-L.38 |REFL PAV MRK TY | (W) 6"(SLD)(090MIL) LF 300 $ 1.00 | $ 300.00 [ $ 1.50 | $ 450.00
1-L39 [REFL PAV MRK TY | (W) 4"(DOTTED)(2' SEG, 4' GAP)(090MIL) LF 2601 $ 1.00 | § 260.00 | $ 1.00 | § 260.00
1-L40 |REFL PAV MRK TY | (W) 8"(SLD)(090MIL) LF 300 $ 1.00 | $ 300.00 [ $ 1.00 | $ 300.00
REFL PAV MRK TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED THERMOPLASTIC
1-L41 |(W)24”(SLD)(125MIL) LF 100 | $ 20.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 2,200.00
1-L42 |TY II-C-R Raised Pavement Marker (Reflectorized) EA 50]1% 7.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 7.00| $ 350.00
1-L43 |TY II-A-A Raised Pavement Marker (Reflectorized) EA 501 $ 6.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 850 | % 425.00
1-L44 |Allowance for Installation of Water Improvements LS 119% 1,500,000.00 [ $ 1,500,000.00§ % 1,500,000.00 | $ 1,500,000.00
1-L45 [Allowance for Additional Traffic Control LS 11$%$ 300,000.00 | $ 300,00000Q % 300,000.00 | $ 300,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART L - S.P.I.D. INTERSECTION WATERLINE IMPROVEMENTS (ltems L1 thru L45) $ 3,464,165.00 $ 3,583,447.50
TOTAL BASE BID 1 - HMAC $ 30,907,739.00 1 $ 32,368,449.50 NO BID
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