BID DATE: Wednesday, February 12, 2020

TABULATION OF BIDS
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT

AIRLINE ROAD - S.P.I.D. TO MCARDLE RD (BOND 2018)

JE Construction Services

Reytec Construction

Diamond X Contracting Inc

Clark Pipeline Serv

Bay Ltd

PROJECT NO. 18004A 7505 UpRiver Road 1901 Hollister St PO Box 1701 6229 Leopard St 401 Corn Products Rd
RFB 2873 Corpus Christi, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080 Johnson City, TX 78635 Corpus Christi, TX 78409 Corpus Christi, TX 78412
ITEM DESCRIPTION I UNIT | QTyY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID NO. 2 (CONCRETE PAVEMENT)
PART AA - GENERAL (per Section 01 29 01)
AA1l |Mobilization (5% Max. Part AA) LS 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00( $20,000.00 $20,000.00
AA2 [Bonds & Insurance LS 1 $31,900.00 $31,900.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00( $50,000.00 $50,000.00
AA3 [Storm Water Pollution Prevention Plan LS 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00
AA4 |Grate Inlet Protection EA 4 $196.00 $784.00 $160.00 $640.00 $175.00 $700.00
AAS5 [Curb Inlet Protection EA 11 $196.00 $2,156.00 $150.00 $1,650.00 $140.00 $1,540.00
AA6 |Stabilized Construction Entrance EA 2 $3,200.00 $6,400.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00
AA7 |Revegetation (St. Augustine Sod) sy 560 $8.00 $4,480.00 $12.00 $6,720.00 $15.00 $8,400.00
AA8 [Tree Protection EA 9 $131.00 $1,179.00 $700.00 $6,300.00 $500.00 $4,500.00
AA9 |[Traffic Control Plan & Preparation LS 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00( $15,000.00 $15,000.00
AA10 |Traffic Control Plan Mobilization/Adjustments LS 1 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00
AA11 |Traffic Control Items (Barricades, Signs, & Traffic Handling) MO 6 $4,000.00 $24,000.00| $17,500.00 $105,000.00 $10,000.00 $60,000.00
AA12 |Low Profile Concrete Barriers (20') EA 60 $1,800.00 $108,000.00 $700.00 $42,000.00 $2,700.00( $162,000.00
AA13 [Electronic Message Board EA 4 $12,000.00 $48,000.00 $15,000.00 $60,000.00( $12,000.00 $48,000.00
AA14 [Clear Right-Of-Way AC 2.4 $2,600.00 $6,240.00 $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $22,000.00 $52,800.00
AA15 [Ozone Action Day DAYS 5 $256.00 $1,280.00 $100.00 $500.00 $3,700.00 $18,500.00
SUBTOTAL PART AA - GENERAL (Items AA1 thru AA15) $271,419.00 $348,310.00 $484,440.00 NO BID NO BID
PART BB - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (per Section 01 29 01)
BB1 |Mobilization (5% Max. Part BB) LS 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00( $30,000.00 $30,000.00
BB2 |Remove Existing Signs LS 1 $680.00 $680.00 $120.00 $120.00 $200.00 $200.00
BB3 |Remove Concrete Driveway SF 4,151 $4.00 $16,604.00 $1.25 $5,188.75 $5.00 $20,755.00
BB4 |Remove Parking Lot Asphalt Pavement SF 2,223 $4.20 $9,336.60 $1.25 $2,778.75 $4.00 $8,892.00
BB5 |Remove Existing Pvmt. Markings LS 1 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,700.00 $3,700.00
BB6 |Remove Concrete Pavement (RT TRN LN To S.P.I.D. + Bus Pull Ou|  SY 553 $21.00 $11,613.00 $8.00 $4,424.00 $22.00 $12,166.00
BB7 |Street Excavation (1' B.0.C) sy 8,976 $14.00 $125,664.00 $14.00 $125,664.00 $17.00 $152,592.00
BB8 |Subgrade Preparation (1' B.O.C.) sy 8,976 $2.50 $22,440.00 $8.00 $71,808.00 $15.00| $134,640.00
BB9 |6" Crushed, Limestone Base (Type A, Grade 1-2) (1' B.0.C.) sy 8,976 $14.00 $125,664.00 $19.00 $170,544.00 $40.00|  $359,040.00
BB10 |9.5" 4000 PSI Concrete Pavement SY 8,712 $97.50 $849,420.00 $114.00 $993,168.00 $170.00| $1,481,040.00
BB11 |Concrete Driveway SF 6,402 $10.00 $64,020.00 $13.00 $83,226.00 $16.00 $102,432.00
BB12 |Adjust AT&T Manholes EA 3 $2,800.00 $8,400.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $22,500.00
Reflective Pavement Markings TY.1(W) (24") (SLD) (100 mil) - L o8
BB13 |Stop Bar $28.00 $1,904.00 $24.00 $1,632.00 $22.00 $1,496.00
Reflective Pavement Markings TY.1(W) (24") (SLD) (100 mil) - L 180
BB14 |Crosswalk $28.00 $5,292.00 $24.00 $4,536.00 $22.00 $4,158.00
BB15 |Reflective Pavement Markings TY.1 (W) (8") (SLD) (100 mil) LF 455 $3.50 $1,592.50 $3.00 $1,365.00 $3.00 $1,365.00
BB16 |Reflective Pavement Markings TY.1 (Y) (4") (SLD) (100 mil) LF 2,813 $1.00 $2,813.00 $1.00 $2,813.00 $1.00 $2,813.00
BB17 |Reflective Pavement Markings TY.1 (Y) (4") (BKN) (100 mil) LF 400 $1.00 $400.00 $1.00 $400.00 $1.00 $400.00
BB18 |Reflective Pavement Markings TY.1 (W) (4") (BKN) (100 mil) LF 620 $1.00 $620.00 $1.00 $620.00 $1.00 $620.00
Prefabricated Pavement Markings TY.1 (W) (Word) "Only" (100 A 3
BB19 |mil) $450.00 $1,350.00 $380.00 $1,140.00 $433.00 $1,299.00
Prefabricated Pavement Markings TY.1 (W) (Left Turn Arrow) A ;
BB20 |(100 mil) $360.00 $2,520.00 $300.00 $2,100.00 $340.00 $2,380.00
Prefabricated Pavement Markings TY.1 (W) (Right Turn Arrow) A )
BB21 |(100 mil) $360.00 $720.00 $300.00 $600.00 $340.00 $680.00
Prefabricated Pavement Markings TY.1 (W) (Straight-Right A )
BB22 |Arrow) (100 mil) $590.00 $1,180.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $556.00 $1,112.00
BB23 |Raised Reflective Pavement Markings (TYII-A-A) Yellow EA 96 $16.00 $1,536.00 $13.00 $1,248.00 $15.00 $1,440.00
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BB24 |Raised Reflective Pavement Markings (TYI-C) White EA 50 $16.00 $800.00 $13.00 $650.00 $15.00 $750.00
BB25 |Raised Reflective Pavement Markings (TYII-B-B) Blue EA 10 $20.00 $200.00 $16.00 $160.00 $18.00 $180.00
BB26 |Speed Limit Sign (R2-1) (Incl. Metal Pole and Foundation) EA 2 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00
BB27 |Yield Sign (R1-2) (Incl. Metal Pole and Foundation) EA 1 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00
BB28 |Lane Control Sign (Incl. Metal Pole and Foundation) EA 2 $1,400.00 $2,800.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,300.00 $2,600.00
Allowance For  Unanticipated  Street  Improvements s .
BB29 |(MANDATORY) $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00( $10,000.00 $10,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART BB - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (Items BB1 thru BB29) $1,285,169.10 $1,561,585.50 $2,362,850.00 NO BID NO BID
PART CC - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (per Section 01 29 01)
CC1 [Mobilization (5% Max. Part CC) LS 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00
CC2 [Concrete Bus Pull Out (9.5" 4000 PSI Concrete Pvmt.) SY 175 $135.00 $23,625.00 $150.00 $26,250.00 $250.00 $43,750.00
CC3 |6" Crushed, Limestone Base (Type A, Grade 1-2) sy 196 $35.00 $6,860.00 $16.00 $3,136.00 $70.00 $13,720.00
SUBTOTAL PART CC - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (ltems CC1 thru CC4) $32,485.00 $30,586.00 $60,270.00 NO BID NO BID
PART DD - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (per Section 01 29 01)
DD1 |Mobilization (5% Max. Part DD) LS 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00( $11,258.00 $11,258.00
DD2 |[Remove Existing Concrete Sidewalk SF 10,247 $2.10 $21,518.70 $0.50 $5,123.50 $5.00 $51,235.00
DD3 |Concrete Sidewalk SF 12,956 $8.50 $110,126.00 $10.00 $129,560.00 $12.00| $155,472.00
DD4 |Curb Ramps SF 527 $30.00 $15,810.00 $26.00 $13,702.00 $13.00 $6,851.00
SUBTOTAL PART DD - ADA IMPROVEMENTS (Items DD1 thru DD4) $149,454.70 $153,385.50 $224,816.00 NO BID NO BID
PART EE - IT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL IMPROVEMENTS (per Section 01 29 01)
EE1 |Mobilization (5% Max. Part EE) LS 1 $3,300.00 $3,300.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,400.00 $2,400.00
EE2 |2" Blank Sch. 40 PVC Conduit with Mule Tape LF 1,265 $16.00 $20,240.00 $13.00 $16,445.00 $15.00 $18,975.00
EE3 |24"x36"x18" Pull Box EA 3 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,300.00 $6,900.00
EE4 |CONDT (PVC) (SCHD 40) (3") LF 70 $21.00 $1,470.00 $18.00 $1,260.00 $19.00 $1,330.00
EE5 |ELEC CONDR (NO.8) INSULATED LF 85 $2.50 $212.50 $2.20 $187.00 $2.50 $212.50
EE6 |GROUND BOXTY A (1222311) W/ APRON EA 3 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $850.00 $2,550.00 $965.00 $2,895.00
EE7 |PED SIG SEC (LED) (COUNTDOWN) EA 4 $650.00 $2,600.00 $550.00 $2,200.00 $620.00 $2,480.00
EE8 |TRF SIG CBL (TY A) (12 AWG) (2 CONDR) LF 200 $2.50 $500.00 $2.00 $400.00 $2.30 $460.00
EE9 |TRF SIG CBL (TY A) (14 AWG) (5 CONDR) LF 200 $2.50 $500.00 $2.20 $440.00 $2.50 $500.00
EE10 |PED POLE ASSEMBLY EA 2 $2,600.00 $5,200.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00 $2,400.00 $4,800.00
EE11 |PED DETECT PUSH BUTTON (APS) W/R10-3a SIGN EA 4 $900.00 $3,600.00 $750.00 $3,000.00 $880.00 $3,520.00
EE12 |PED DETECTOR CONTROLLER UNIT EA 1 $3,700.00 $3,700.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART EE - IT & TRAFFIC SIGNAL IMPROVEMENTS (Items EE1 thru EE12) $51,822.50 $41,682.00 $49,472.50 NO BID NO BID
PART FF - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (per Section 01 29 01)
FF1 |Mobilization (5% Max. Part F) LS 1 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $23,395.00 $23,395.00
FF2 |Remove Existing Curb Inlet EA 6 $900.00 $5,400.00 $330.00 $1,980.00 $620.00 $3,720.00
FF3 |Remove Existing Manhole EA 3 $3,600.00 $10,800.00 $700.00 $2,100.00 $990.00 $2,970.00
FFA |Remove Existing 18" RCP Lateral LF 254 $39.00 $9,906.00 $27.00 $6,858.00 $49.00 $12,446.00
Grout-fill & Abandon-In-Place Ex. RCP Storm Mains (24", 30", & oy 204
FF5 [36") $183.00 $37,332.00 $247.00 $50,388.00 $136.00 $27,744.00
FF6 |Remove Existing Curb and Gutter LF 1,593 $3.50 $5,575.50 $3.00 $4,779.00 $6.00 $9,558.00
FF7 |Remove Existing Header Curb LF 313 $7.00 $2,191.00 $5.00 $1,565.00 $5.00 $1,565.00
FF8 |18" Dia. RCP (Class Ill) LF 188 $143.00 $26,884.00 $158.00 $29,704.00 $88.00 $16,544.00
FF9 |24" Dia. RCP (Class Ill) LF 197 $175.00 $34,475.00 $209.00 $41,173.00 $95.00 $18,715.00
FF10 |36" Dia. RCP (Class Ill) LF 1,107 $236.00 $261,252.00 $240.00 $265,680.00 $150.00| $166,050.00
FF11 |Pipe Trench Safety LF 1,492 $8.50 $12,682.00 $5.00 $7,460.00 $6.00 $8,952.00
FF12 |Connect to Existing Grate Inlets EA 4 $1,600.00 $6,400.00 $700.00 $2,800.00 $1,237.00 $4,948.00
FF13 |5' Curb Inlet EA 5 $6,300.00 $31,500.00 $5,500.00 $27,500.00 $4,000.00 $20,000.00
FF14 |10' Curb Inlet EA 6 $11,000.00 $66,000.00 $8,800.00 $52,800.00 $5,500.00 $33,000.00
FF15 |Standard 4' Diam. Type A Manhole EA 1 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $4,700.00 $4,700.00 $4,700.00 $4,700.00
FF16 |Standard 5' Diam. Type A Manhole EA 7 $8,700.00 $60,900.00 $6,600.00 $46,200.00 $6,000.00 $42,000.00
FF17 |MH-9 7.2'x4.7' Type 'D' Juntion Box/Manhole EA 1 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00( $10,000.00 $10,000.00
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FF18 |MH-107.2'x4.7' Type 'D' Modified Juntion Box/Manhole EA 1 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00( $11,000.00 $11,000.00
FF19 |Stormwater Structure Trench Safety EA 21 $550.00 $11,550.00 $50.00 $1,050.00 $620.00 $13,020.00
FF20 |6" Header Curb (Conc. Pvmt.) LF 1,771 $14.00 $24,794.00 $5.00 $8,855.00 $20.00 $35,420.00
FF21 |Standard 6" Curb & Gutter LF 66 $71.00 $4,686.00 $35.00 $2,310.00 $43.00 $2,838.00
Allowance For Unanticipated Drainage Improvements s N
FF22 [(MANDATORY) $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART FF - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS (ltems FF1 thru FF22) $683,327.50 $623,902.00 $473,585.00 NO BID NO BID
PART GG - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (per Section 01 29 01)
GG1 [Mobilization (5% Max. Part GG) LS 1 $18,000.00 $18,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00( $25,018.00 $25,018.00
GG2 |Remove Existing 16" CIP Waterline (Incl. Dewatering Line) LF 1,245 $22.00 $27,390.00 $16.00 $19,920.00 $40.00 $49,800.00
GG3 |Remove and Salvage Existing Fire Hydrant EA 4 $315.00 $1,260.00 $800.00 $3,200.00 $247.00 $988.00
GG4 (16" Dia. C900 PVC Waterline (DR 18) LF 1,040 $137.50 $143,000.00 $197.00 $204,880.00 $138.00| $143,520.00
GG5 (16" Dia. DIP Waterline (CL350) LF 208 $236.00 $49,088.00 $280.00 $58,240.00 $163.00 $33,904.00
GG6 |Trench Safety for Waterlines LF 2,493 $6.50 $16,204.50 $1.00 $2,493.00 $6.00 $14,958.00
GG7A|30"x16" TS&V EA 1 $23,000.00 $23,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00( $37,000.00 $37,000.00
Sawcut & Remove Portion of 30" Sleeve and Install 1- 16"x16" s N
GG7B [TS&V $34,000.00 $34,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00( $40,000.00 $40,000.00
GG8 |16"x16" TS&V EA 1 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $26,000.00 $26,000.00( $32,000.00 $32,000.00
GG9 [16"x6" Cross EA 4 $1,500.00 $6,000.00 $1,700.00 $6,800.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00
GG10 [16" 45 Deg Bend EA 14 $1,000.00 $14,000.00 $1,300.00 $18,200.00 $1,300.00 $18,200.00
GG11 [16" 22.5 Deg Bend EA 1 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00
GG12 [16" Cap EA 2 $2,700.00 $5,400.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $750.00 $1,500.00
GG13 |16" Double Line Stop EA 1 $34,000.00 $34,000.00 $102,000.00 $102,000.00 $36,000.00 $36,000.00
GG14 [2" New Water Service (Short) EA 1 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $500.00 $500.00
GG15 [2" New Water Service (Long) EA 1 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $3,300.00 $3,300.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00
GG16 [6" Fire Line (Long) LS 2 $8,000.00 $16,000.00 $8,200.00 $16,400.00 $5,200.00 $10,400.00
GG17 [6" Fire Line (Short) LS 1 $4,725.00 $4,725.00 $4,600.00 $4,600.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00
GG18 [Ty. 1 Fire Hydrant Assembly (No Tee) - Short EA 4 $8,000.00 $32,000.00 $4,800.00 $19,200.00 $3,800.00 $15,200.00
GG19 [Ty. 1 Fire Hydrant Assembly (No Tee) - Long EA 4 $12,500.00 $50,000.00 $9,400.00 $37,600.00 $4,700.00 $18,800.00
GG20 [Ty. 1 Fire Hydrant Assembly (W/16"x6" Tee) - Short EA 1 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $7,700.00 $7,700.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
GG21 [Ty. 1 Fire Hydrant Assembly (W/16"x6" Tee) - Long EA 1 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $6,400.00 $6,400.00
GG22 |Allowance For Unanticipated Water Improvements (MANDATOR)| LS 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART GG - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (ltems GG1 thru GG22) $543,367.50 $609,033.00 $510,788.00 NO BID NO BID
PART HH - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (per Section 01 29 01)
H1 Mobilization (5% Max. Part HH) LS 1 $200.00 $200.00 $500.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00
H2 Adjust Ex. Manhole Ring and Cover EA 1 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
H3 Adjustment of Private 1.5" PVC FM LS 3 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00
H4 Adjustment of Private 3" PVC FM LS 2 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,400.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00
Allowance For Unanticipated Wastewater Improvements s N
H5 (MANDATORY) $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00
SUBTOTAL PART HH - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items HH1 thru HH5) $14,300.00 11,700.00 21,000.00 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL BASE BID NO. 2 (Parts AA thru HH) [ $3,031,345.30] [ $3,380,184.00] [ $4,187,221.50] NO BID NO BID
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