CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI
PURCHASING DIVISION
BUYER: GERALD GOODWIN

BID TABULATION

BID INVITATION NO. BI-0216-12
TRAFFIC SIGN BLANKS, SHEETING/ROLL GOODS, POSTS/ANCHORS

ALLIED TUBE & VULCAN SIGNS 3M CO. PATHMARK TRAFFIC |US STANDARD AMERICAN SIGNAL
GROUP 1 CONDUIT CORP. PRODUCTS OF TX SIGN
Harvey, IL Foley, AL St. Paul, MN San Marcos, TX Franklin Park, IL San Antonio, TX
UNIT [ EXTENDED | UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED
ITEM |DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT | PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1.0 |TRAFFIC SIGN POSTS 3550 EA $42,644.00 $53,222.00 NO BID $40,967.50 NO BID $77,259.00
Items include sign posts INCOMPLETE
and anchor systems in BID (1)
various sizes and
hardware.
ALLIED TUBE & VULCAN SIGNS 3M CO. PATHMARK TRAFFIC |US STANDARD AMERICAN SIGNAL
GROUP 2 CONDUIT CORP. PRODUCTS OF SIGN
Harvey, IL Foley, AL St. Paul, MN San Marcos, TX Franklin Park, IL San Antonio, TX
UNIT [ EXTENDED | UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED [ UNIT | EXTENDED
ITEM |DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
2.0 [TRAFFIC SIGN BLANKS 4800 EA NO BID $46,341.50 NO BID $37,157.00 $49,939.00 $64,859.00
Items include aluminum INCOMPLETE
and extruded aluminum BID (1)
sign blanks in various
sizes.
ALLIED TUBE & VULCAN SIGNS 3M CO. PATHMARK TRAFFIC |US STANDARD AMERICAN SIGNAL
GROUP 3 CONDUIT CORP. PRODUCTS OF SIGN
Harvey, IL Foley, AL St. Paul, MN San Marcos, TX Franklin Park, IL San Antonio, TX
UNIT [ EXTENDED | UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT | EXTENDED | UNIT | EXTENDED
ITEM |DESCRIPTION QTY | UNIT | PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
3.0 [TRAFFIC SIGN 289 |ROLLS NO BID $57,247.39 $70,915.39 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SHEETING/ROLL
GOODS
Items include reflective
and/or pressure sensitive
metal sheeting and
application tape in various
sizes, and protective film.
TOTAL AWARD: $42,644.00 $103,588.89

1)

Pathmark Traffic Products of Texas submitted an incomplete bid. When comparing like items, the bid from Allied Tube & Conduit Corp. was $3,982.50 lower
for Groun | items and the bid from Vulcan Sians was $8.016.00 lower for Groun Il items.
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