
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

A1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% OF PART A) AL 1           12,000.00$        12,000.00$        16,000.00$        16,000.00$        28,500.00$        28,500.00$               19,000.00$        19,000.00$        15,000.00$        15,000.00$        
A2 BONDS & INSURANCE AL 1           56,000.00$        56,000.00$        36,000.00$        36,000.00$        66,500.00$        66,500.00$               28,100.00$        28,100.00$        100,000.00$      100,000.00$      
A3 CLEAR RIGHT OF WAY AC 2           8,000.00$          17,840.00$        7,000.00$          15,610.00$        465.50$             1,038.07$                 9,000.00$          20,070.00$        7,000.00$          15,610.00$        
A4 OZONE DAY DAY 2           1.00$                 2.00$                 1.00$                 2.00$                 17,290.00$        34,580.00$               100.00$             200.00$             1.00$                 2.00$                 
A5 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL MO 8           4,000.00$          32,000.00$        17,000.00$        136,000.00$      22,526.15$        180,209.20$             12,500.00$        100,000.00$      16,500.00$        132,000.00$      

A6
TEMPORARY INTERSECTION SIGNAL ADJUSTMENTS (ALL PHASES OF TRAFFIC
CONTROL) EA 1           17,537.50$        17,537.50$        17,000.00$        17,000.00$        26,600.00$        26,600.00$               22,000.00$        22,000.00$        2,500.00$          2,500.00$          

A7 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC MESSAGE BOARD EA 3           22,977.00$        68,931.00$        27,000.00$        81,000.00$        28,767.90$        86,303.70$               33,500.00$        100,500.00$      25,000.00$        75,000.00$        

A8
TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL DESIGN BY A PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER (ALL
PHASES) LS 1           11,500.00$        11,500.00$        14,000.00$        14,000.00$        9,975.00$          9,975.00$                 15,000.00$        15,000.00$        30,000.00$        30,000.00$        

A9
TEMPORARY TRAFFIC SIGNAL DESIGN BY A PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER (ALL
PHASES) LS 1           5,000.00$          5,000.00$          17,000.00$        17,000.00$        46,550.00$        46,550.00$               15,000.00$        15,000.00$        7,500.00$          7,500.00$          

A10 TRAFFIC CONTROL POLICE OFFICER ASSISTANCE HR 40         100.00$             4,000.00$          320.00$             12,800.00$        465.50$             18,620.00$               100.00$             4,000.00$          125.00$             5,000.00$          
A11 STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN LS 1           10,000.00$        10,000.00$        2,200.00$          2,200.00$          16,625.00$        16,625.00$               3,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          
A12 SILT FENCE LF 2,774    5.00$                 13,870.00$        4.00$                 11,096.00$        6.65$                 18,447.10$               10.00$               27,740.00$        4.00$                 11,096.00$        
A13 INLET PROTECTION EA 12         100.00$             1,200.00$          250.00$             3,000.00$          332.50$             3,990.00$                 500.00$             6,000.00$          200.00$             2,400.00$          
A14 SURVEY MONUMENT EA 2           1,500.00$          3,000.00$          1,900.00$          3,800.00$          1,130.50$          2,261.00$                 930.00$             1,860.00$          750.00$             1,500.00$          
A15 BLOCK SODDING SY 1,355    10.00$               13,550.00$        20.00$               27,100.00$        8.65$                 11,720.75$               16.00$               21,680.00$        15.00$               20,325.00$        
A16 PRIVATE PROPERTY VEGETATION REPLACEMENT LS 1           5,000.00$          5,000.00$          3,200.00$          3,200.00$          46,550.00$        46,550.00$               8,000.00$          8,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          
A17 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED VEGETATION ISSUES AL 1           5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$                 5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          
A18 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED ENVIRONMENTAL ISSUES AL 1           5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$                 5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          

281,430.50$      405,808.00$      608,469.82$             402,150.00$      433,933.00$      NO BID

B1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% OF PART B) AL 1           40,000.00$        40,000.00$        24,000.00$        24,000.00$        56,600.00$        56,600.00$               50,000.00$        50,000.00$        47,961.00$        47,961.00$        
B2 HMAC (TYPE D) (FINAL SURFACE) (4-INCH THICK) SY 6,295    42.82$               269,551.90$      35.00$               220,325.00$      59.19$               372,601.05$             43.50$               273,832.50$      48.50$               305,307.50$      
B3 ONE-COURSE SURFACE TREATMENT (UNDERSEAL) SY 6,295    5.38$                 33,867.10$        6.00$                 37,770.00$        6.98$                 43,939.10$               5.25$                 33,048.75$        7.50$                 47,212.50$        
B4 PRIME COAT (MC-30)(0.15 GAL/SY) GAL 945       7.38$                 6,974.10$          8.00$                 7,560.00$          11.64$               10,999.80$               9.00$                 8,505.00$          9.00$                 8,505.00$          
B5 CRUSHED LIMESTONE FLEX BASE (TYPE A, GRADE 1-2) (10-INCH THICK) SY 6,295    32.00$               201,440.00$      35.00$               220,325.00$      42.56$               267,915.20$             41.00$               258,095.00$      35.00$               220,325.00$      

B6
LIME STABILIZED AND COMPACTED SUBGRADE (OVERALL 12-INCH THICK
COMPACTED WITH UPPER 8-INCH LIME STABILIZED) SY 6,161    16.50$               101,656.50$      16.00$               98,576.00$        10.97$               67,586.17$               21.00$               129,381.00$      13.00$               80,093.00$        

B7 STREET EXCAVATION AND EMBANKMENT SY 7,745    12.00$               92,940.00$        19.00$               147,155.00$      18.62$               144,211.90$             14.00$               108,430.00$      13.00$               100,685.00$      
B8 REINFORCED CONCRETE DRIVEWAY (6-INCH THICK) SF 4,554    8.75$                 39,847.50$        13.00$               59,202.00$        19.29$               87,846.66$               29.00$               132,066.00$      14.00$               63,756.00$        
B9 DEMOLITION OF CONCRETE DRIVEWAY SF 4,173    5.00$                 20,865.00$        4.00$                 16,692.00$        4.16$                 17,359.68$               13.50$               56,335.50$        5.00$                 20,865.00$        

B10 ASPHALT TO ASPHALT PAVEMENT TIE-IN LF 108       50.00$               5,400.00$          120.00$             12,960.00$        146.33$             15,803.64$               59.00$               6,372.00$          50.00$               5,400.00$          
B11 REFL PAV MRK TY I (Y) 4" (DBL) (090 MIL) LF 168       1.96$                 329.28$             2.00$                 336.00$             2.26$                 379.68$                    2.40$                 403.20$             2.25$                 378.00$             
B12 REFL PAV MRK TY I (Y) 4" (BRK) (090 MIL) LF 1,365    0.98$                 1,337.70$          1.00$                 1,365.00$          1.13$                 1,542.45$                 1.20$                 1,638.00$          1.50$                 2,047.50$          
B13 REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) 4" (SLD) (090 MIL) LF 2,873    0.98$                 2,815.54$          1.00$                 2,873.00$          1.13$                 3,246.49$                 1.20$                 3,447.60$          1.00$                 2,873.00$          

B14
REFL PAV MRK TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED THERMOPLSTIC (W) 24"
(SLD) (125 MIL) LF 54         20.70$               1,117.80$          23.00$               1,242.00$          23.94$               1,292.76$                 26.00$               1,404.00$          23.00$               1,242.00$          

B15 REFL PAV MRKR TY II-A-A EA 34         6.04$                 205.36$             7.00$                 238.00$             6.98$                 237.32$                    7.50$                 255.00$             8.00$                 272.00$             
B16 REFL PAV MRKR TY II-B-B EA 8           6.04$                 48.32$               7.00$                 56.00$               6.98$                 55.84$                      7.50$                 60.00$               8.00$                 64.00$               

B17
FURNISH AND INSTALL ROADSIDE TRAFFIC SIGN AND SIGN SUPPORT ASSEMBLY
(TRIANGULAR SLIPBASE)* EA 15         833.75$             12,506.25$        900.00$             13,500.00$        964.25$             14,463.75$               1,000.00$          15,000.00$        1,100.00$          16,500.00$        

B18
FURNISH AND INSTALL STOP & ALL WAY SIGN WITH NEW STREET NAME BLADES
(2) AND SIGN SUPPORT ASSEMBLY (TRIANGULAR SLIPBASE) EA 3           1,092.50$          3,277.50$          3,500.00$          10,500.00$        1,230.25$          3,690.75$                 1,300.00$          3,900.00$          1,400.00$          4,200.00$          

B19

FURNISH AND INSTALL SCHOOL ZONE FLASHER BEACON ASSEMBLY (SOLAR
POWERED) W/ 5 LF OF 8-INCH DIAMETER SCREW-IN TYPE ANCHOR FOUNDATION
AND 5 YEARS CELLULAR COMMUNICATIONS AND SUPPORT PACKAGE, GLANCE
SOFTWARE AND CONFIGURATION EA 2           10,637.50$        21,275.00$        11,000.00$        22,000.00$        13,300.00$        26,600.00$               13,200.00$        26,400.00$        12,500.00$        25,000.00$        

B20 REMOVE AND DISPOSE OF EXISTING SIGN(S) AND SUPPORT ASSEMBLY (1) EA 18         132.25$             2,380.50$          145.00$             2,610.00$          152.95$             2,753.10$                 160.00$             2,880.00$          250.00$             4,500.00$          
B21 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED STREET IMPROVEMENTS AL 1           50,000.00$        50,000.00$        50,000.00$        50,000.00$        50,000.00$        50,000.00$               50,000.00$        50,000.00$        50,000.00$        50,000.00$        

907,835.35$      949,285.00$      1,189,125.34$          1,161,453.55$   1,007,186.50$   NO BID

C1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART C) AL 1           7,500.00$          7,500.00$          9,400.00$          9,400.00$          9,975.00$          9,975.00$                 9,500.00$          9,500.00$          8,000.00$          8,000.00$          

C2
REINFORCED CONCRETE SIDEWALK (4-INCH THICK) (INCLUDING 2-INCH THICK
SAND CUSHION AND SUBGRADE PREP) SF 10,493  8.50$                 89,190.50$        11.00$               115,423.00$      12.86$               134,939.98$             12.00$               125,916.00$      12.00$               125,916.00$      

C3 DEMOLITION OF CONCRETE SIDEWALK SF 8,484    5.00$                 42,420.00$        3.00$                 25,452.00$        3.99$                 33,851.16$               5.00$                 42,420.00$        5.00$                 42,420.00$        

C4 REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB RAMP (INCLUDES 6-INCH TRANSITION CURB) SF 496       25.00$               12,400.00$        48.00$               23,808.00$        45.22$               22,429.12$               39.00$               19,344.00$        15.00$               7,440.00$          
C5 DEMOLITION OF CONCRETE CURB RAMP SF 196       5.00$                 980.00$             12.00$               2,352.00$          5.99$                 1,174.04$                 34.00$               6,664.00$          5.00$                 980.00$             

C6
REFL PAV MRK TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED THERMOPLSTIC (W) 24"
(SLD) (125 MIL) LF 162       2.50$                 405.00$             23.00$               3,726.00$          18.62$               3,016.44$                 26.00$               4,212.00$          32.00$               5,184.00$          

C7 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED ADA IMPROVEMENTS AL 1           9,000.00$          9,000.00$          9,000.00$          9,000.00$          9,000.00$          9,000.00$                 9,000.00$          9,000.00$          9,000.00$          9,000.00$          
161,895.50$      189,161.00$      214,385.74$             217,056.00$      198,940.00$      NO BID
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Reytec Construction Resources, 
Inc

1901 Hollister
Huston, TX 77080

Clark Pipeline Services, LLC Bay Ltd.

401 Corn Products Rd, Bldg 1
Corpus Christi, TX 78409

RFB 4296 Mako Contracting JE Construction Services, LLC

TABULATION OF BIDS
PROCUREMENT - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS

TABULATED BY:   RJB
DESIGN ENGINEER: RTE
BID DATE:  Wednesday, August 17, 2022

P t A  GENERAL 

PROJECT NO. 21048 Wildcat Dr. (FM 624 to Teague Ln.) 3636 S. Alameda, Ste. B153 7505 Up River Rd
BASE BID #1 HMAC Corpus Christi, TX 78411 Corpus Christi, TX 78409

6229 Leopard Street
Corpus Christi, TX 78409

Bridges Specialties Inc

4233 FM 624
Robstown, TX 78380

D1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART D) AL 1           1,400.00$          1,400.00$          1,000.00$          1,000.00$          3,458.00$          3,458.00$                 800.00$             800.00$             1,100.00$          1,100.00$          

D2
REINFORCED CONCRETE BUS ROADWAY PAD (8-INCH THICK WITH 12-INCH THICK
LIMESTONE FLEX BASE) SF 660       30.00$               19,800.00$        24.00$               15,840.00$        45.89$               30,287.40$               30.00$               19,800.00$        24.00$               15,840.00$        

D3
REINFORCED CONCRETE BUS SHELTER PAD (5-INCH THICK) (INCLUDING 2-INCH
THICK SAND CUSHION AND SUBGRADE PREP) SF 240       24.00$               5,760.00$          26.00$               6,240.00$          28.60$               6,864.00$                 25.00$               6,000.00$          22.00$               5,280.00$          

D4 DEMOLITION OF CONCRETE BUS SHELTER PAD SF 133       8.00$                 1,064.00$          10.00$               1,330.00$          13.30$               1,768.90$                 10.00$               1,330.00$          5.00$                 665.00$             
D5 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED RTA IMPROVEMENTS AL 1           1,000.00$          1,000.00$          1,000.00$          1,000.00$          1,000.00$          1,000.00$                 1,000.00$          1,000.00$          1,000.00$          1,000.00$          

29,024.00$        25,410.00$        43,378.30$               28,930.00$        23,885.00$        NO BID

E1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART E) AL 1           4,000.00$          4,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          4,655.00$          4,655.00$                 3,800.00$          3,800.00$          4,500.00$          4,500.00$          
E2 2-INCH PVC (SCH.40) CONDUIT (IT/MIS) WITH MULE TAPE BY OPEN-CUT LF 1,659    17.25$               28,617.75$        14.00$               23,226.00$        20.38$               33,810.42$               17.25$               28,617.75$        20.00$               33,180.00$        
E3 2-INCH PVC (SCH.40) CONDUIT (IT/MIS) WITH MULE TAPE BY BORING LF 35         46.00$               1,610.00$          68.00$               2,380.00$          59.85$               2,094.75$                 57.00$               1,995.00$          29.00$               1,015.00$          
E4 POLYMER CONCRETE PULL BOX (IT/MIS) WITH 3-INCH GRAVEL BASE EA 8           2,415.00$          19,320.00$        2,200.00$          17,600.00$        2,793.00$          22,344.00$               3,000.00$          24,000.00$        3,000.00$          24,000.00$        
E5 72 COUNT SINGLEMODE FIBER CABLE LF 2,459    9.20$                 22,622.80$        5.00$                 12,295.00$        10.64$               26,163.76$               11.50$               28,278.50$        10.00$               24,590.00$        
E6 24 COUNT SINGLEMODE FIBER CABLE LF 225       11.50$               2,587.50$          5.00$                 1,125.00$          13.30$               2,992.50$                 14.25$               3,206.25$          12.00$               2,700.00$          
E7 TRACER WIRE (#10 SOLID GREEN) LF 1,694    1.38$                 2,337.72$          3.00$                 5,082.00$          1.60$                 2,710.40$                 1.70$                 2,879.80$          1.85$                 3,133.90$          
E8 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED IT (FIBER) IMPROVEMENTS AL 1           3,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$                 3,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          

84,095.77$        67,708.00$        97,770.83$               95,777.30$        96,118.90$        NO BID

F1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART F) AL 1           30,000.00$        30,000.00$        23,000.00$        23,000.00$        33,250.00$        33,250.00$               34,723.35$        34,723.35$        45,000.00$        45,000.00$        
F2 5-FOOT STANDARD CURB INLET REPLACEMENT EA 10         7,548.00$          75,480.00$        7,000.00$          70,000.00$        5,187.00$          51,870.00$               7,600.00$          76,000.00$        8,000.00$          80,000.00$        
F3 3-FOOT X 3-FOOT POST INLET EA 1           6,105.00$          6,105.00$          6,000.00$          6,000.00$          3,059.00$          3,059.00$                 6,700.00$          6,700.00$          6,250.00$          6,250.00$          
F4 15-INCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE LF 21         105.45$             2,214.45$          300.00$             6,300.00$          360.96$             7,580.16$                 315.00$             6,615.00$          220.00$             4,620.00$          

F5
15-INCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE REPLACEMENT (TO NEAREST JOINT OR
STORM WATER MANHOLE) EA 2           2,220.00$          4,440.00$          6,000.00$          12,000.00$        3,657.50$          7,315.00$                 6,600.00$          13,200.00$        3,000.00$          6,000.00$          

F6
18-INCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE REPLACEMENT(TO NEAREST JOINT OR
STORM WATER MANHOLE) EA 8           2,775.00$          22,200.00$        6,300.00$          50,400.00$        3,657.50$          29,260.00$               7,000.00$          56,000.00$        4,000.00$          32,000.00$        

F7 4-FOOT X 2-FOOT CONCRETE BOX CULVERT LF 451       582.75$             262,820.25$      600.00$             270,600.00$      523.75$             236,211.25$             740.00$             333,740.00$      1,100.00$          496,100.00$      
F8 DEMOLITION OF 36-INCH STORM WATER LINE LF 451       22.20$               10,012.20$        34.00$               15,334.00$        93.10$               41,988.10$               38.00$               17,138.00$        200.00$             90,200.00$        
F9 CEMENT STABILIZED SAND SUBGRADE CY 25         138.75$             3,468.75$          85.00$               2,125.00$          266.00$             6,650.00$                 88.00$               2,200.00$          80.00$               2,000.00$          

F10 TYPE C MANHOLE (JUNCTION BOX) EA 4           16,650.00$        66,600.00$        14,000.00$        56,000.00$        16,625.00$        66,500.00$               15,800.00$        63,200.00$        22,000.00$        88,000.00$        
F11 DEMOLITION OF STORM WATER MANHOLE EA 3           2,775.00$          8,325.00$          2,000.00$          6,000.00$          3,524.50$          10,573.50$               2,100.00$          6,300.00$          3,500.00$          10,500.00$        

F12 TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORM WATER MANHOLE (JUNCTION BOX) AND INLETS EA 14         555.00$             7,770.00$          700.00$             9,800.00$          931.00$             13,034.00$               720.00$             10,080.00$        1,200.00$          16,800.00$        

F13
CONCRETE COLLAR FOR STORM LINE AT TIE-IN TO INLET, MANHOLE, OR STORM
LINE EA 21         555.00$             11,655.00$        1,400.00$          29,400.00$        4,322.50$          90,772.50$               1,500.00$          31,500.00$        850.00$             17,850.00$        

F14

REINFORCED CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER (6-INCH) (INCLUDES BASE AND
SUBGRADE PREP UNDERNEATH CURB AND GUTTER AND 2-FOOT BEYOND BC, AND
BACKFILL 2-FOOT BEYOND BC) LF 3,114    28.00$               87,192.00$        32.00$               99,648.00$        25.27$               78,690.78$               60.00$               186,840.00$      35.00$               108,990.00$      

F15 DEMOLITION OF CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER (6-INCH AND DRIVEWAY) LF 3,114    10.00$               31,140.00$        7.00$                 21,798.00$        9.98$                 31,077.72$               11.25$               35,032.50$        12.00$               37,368.00$        
F16 SIDEWALK DRAIN (INCLUDES CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER LF 15         50.00$               750.00$             1,200.00$          18,000.00$        437.57$             6,563.55$                 900.00$             13,500.00$        150.00$             2,250.00$          
F17 CONCRETE VALLEY GUTTER REPAIR SF 79         20.00$               1,580.00$          72.00$               5,688.00$          55.20$               4,360.80$                 68.00$               5,372.00$          25.00$               1,975.00$          
F18 ADJUST EXISTING STORM WATER MANHOLE TO FINISHED GRADE EA 3           1,650.00$          4,950.00$          2,600.00$          7,800.00$          2,085.88$          6,257.64$                 3,400.00$          10,200.00$        2,500.00$          7,500.00$          
F19 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1           27,000.00$        27,000.00$        27,000.00$        27,000.00$        27,000.00$        27,000.00$               27,000.00$        27,000.00$        27,000.00$        27,000.00$        

663,702.65$      736,893.00$      752,014.00$             935,340.85$      1,080,403.00$   NO BID

G1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART G) AL 1           25,000.00$        25,000.00$        26,000.00$        26,000.00$        26,600.00$        26,600.00$               29,400.00$        29,400.00$        30,000.00$        30,000.00$        
G2 8-INCH DIA C900 PVC WATERLINE (DR 18) LF 1,613    104.50$             168,558.50$      130.00$             209,690.00$      117.51$             189,543.63$             150.00$             241,950.00$      122.00$             196,786.00$      
G3 6-INCH DIA C900 PVC WATERLINE (DR 18) LF 38         77.00$               2,926.00$          250.00$             9,500.00$          224.77$             8,541.26$                 270.00$             10,260.00$        120.00$             4,560.00$          
G4 2-INCH DIA C901 POLYETHYLENE WATERLINE (SDR 9) LF 43         19.80$               851.40$             87.00$               3,741.00$          91.90$               3,951.70$                 97.00$               4,171.00$          38.00$               1,634.00$          
G5 TRENCH SAFETY FOR WATERLINE LF 1,651    5.50$                 9,080.50$          4.00$                 6,604.00$          5.32$                 8,783.32$                 4.80$                 7,924.80$          1.00$                 1,651.00$          
G6 16-INCH X 8-INCH TAPPING SLEEVE EA 1           11,550.00$        11,550.00$        2,500.00$          2,500.00$          6,716.50$          6,716.50$                 2,700.00$          2,700.00$          8,500.00$          8,500.00$          
G7 8-INCH X 8-INCH TAPPING SLEEVE EA 1           8,800.00$          8,800.00$          2,400.00$          2,400.00$          5,386.50$          5,386.50$                 2,700.00$          2,700.00$          6,250.00$          6,250.00$          
G8 8-INCH GATE VALVE (DI) (MJ) (INCLUDES RESTRAINTS) EA 15         3,300.00$          49,500.00$        2,700.00$          40,500.00$        2,320.85$          34,812.75$               3,000.00$          45,000.00$        3,800.00$          57,000.00$        
G9 6-INCH GATE VALVE (DI) (MJ) (INCLUDES RESTRAINTS) EA 3           2,530.00$          7,590.00$          1,900.00$          5,700.00$          1,549.45$          4,648.35$                 2,000.00$          6,000.00$          2,500.00$          7,500.00$          

G10 8-INCH 45-DEG BEND (DI) (MJ) (INCLUDES RESTRAINTS) EA 32         990.00$             31,680.00$        700.00$             22,400.00$        599.83$             19,194.56$               690.00$             22,080.00$        1,200.00$          38,400.00$        
G11 8-INCH 22.5-DEG BEND (DI) (MJ) (INCLUDES RESTRAINTS) EA 2           1,100.00$          2,200.00$          600.00$             1,200.00$          598.50$             1,197.00$                 680.00$             1,360.00$          1,200.00$          2,400.00$          
G12 6-INCH 45-DEG BEND (DI) (MJ) (INCLUDES RESTRAINTS) EA 6           935.00$             5,610.00$          450.00$             2,700.00$          472.15$             2,832.90$                 500.00$             3,000.00$          1,000.00$          6,000.00$          
G13 8-INCH X 8-INCH CROSS (DI) (MJ) (INCLUDES RESTRAINTS) EA 1           3,025.00$          3,025.00$          1,400.00$          1,400.00$          1,064.00$          1,064.00$                 1,500.00$          1,500.00$          2,800.00$          2,800.00$          
G14 8-INCH X 6-INCH CROSS (DI) (MJ) (INCLUDES RESTRAINTS) EA 4           2,640.00$          10,560.00$        1,200.00$          4,800.00$          1,097.25$          4,389.00$                 1,400.00$          5,600.00$          2,600.00$          10,400.00$        
G15 8-INCH X 8-INCH TEE (DI) (MJ) (INCLUDES RESTRAINTS) EA 1           1,650.00$          1,650.00$          1,100.00$          1,100.00$          864.50$             864.50$                    1,300.00$          1,300.00$          2,400.00$          2,400.00$          
G16 8-INCH X 6-INCH TEE (DI) (MJ) (INCLUDES RESTRAINTS) EA 5           1,540.00$          7,700.00$          900.00$             4,500.00$          732.83$             3,664.15$                 1,100.00$          5,500.00$          2,200.00$          11,000.00$        
G17 2-INCH X 2-INCH TEE EA 1           880.00$             880.00$             700.00$             700.00$             645.05$             645.05$                    760.00$             760.00$             1,200.00$          1,200.00$          
G18 8-INCH X 6-INCH REDUCER (DI) (MJ) (INCLUDES RESTRAINTS) EA 1           935.00$             935.00$             600.00$             600.00$             445.55$             445.55$                    680.00$             680.00$             1,120.00$          1,120.00$          

SUBTOTAL PART D - RTA IMPROVEMENTS (Items D1 thru D5)

Part D - RTA IMPROVEMENTS

SUBTOTAL PART E -  IT (FIBER) IMPROVEMENTS (Items E1 thru E8)

Part F - STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS

Part E - IT (FIBER) IMPROVEMENTS

SUBTOTAL PART F - STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items F1 thru F19)

Part G -  WATER IMPROVEMENTS
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ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

Reytec Construction Resources, 
Inc

1901 Hollister
Huston, TX 77080

Clark Pipeline Services, LLC Bay Ltd.

401 Corn Products Rd, Bldg 1
Corpus Christi, TX 78409

RFB 4296 Mako Contracting JE Construction Services, LLC

TABULATION OF BIDS
PROCUREMENT - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS

TABULATED BY:   RJB
DESIGN ENGINEER: RTE
BID DATE:  Wednesday, August 17, 2022

P t A  GENERAL 

PROJECT NO. 21048 Wildcat Dr. (FM 624 to Teague Ln.) 3636 S. Alameda, Ste. B153 7505 Up River Rd
BASE BID #1 HMAC Corpus Christi, TX 78411 Corpus Christi, TX 78409

6229 Leopard Street
Corpus Christi, TX 78409

Bridges Specialties Inc

4233 FM 624
Robstown, TX 78380

G19 8-INCH PLUG (DI) (MJ) (INCLUDES RESTRAINTS) EA 3           665.50$             1,996.50$          600.00$             1,800.00$          578.55$             1,735.65$                 680.00$             2,040.00$          520.00$             1,560.00$          
G20 6-INCH CAP WITH 2-INCH THREADED TAP (DI) (MJ) (INCLUDES RESTRAINTS) EA 1           599.50$             599.50$             900.00$             900.00$             784.70$             784.70$                    1,100.00$          1,100.00$          1,800.00$          1,800.00$          
G21 16-INCH TIE-IN CONNECTION EA 1           1,100.00$          1,100.00$          15,000.00$        15,000.00$        8,379.00$          8,379.00$                 16,900.00$        16,900.00$        10,500.00$        10,500.00$        
G22 8-INCH TIE-IN CONNECTION EA 2           5,500.00$          11,000.00$        9,000.00$          18,000.00$        4,588.50$          9,177.00$                 10,400.00$        20,800.00$        8,000.00$          16,000.00$        
G23 6-INCH TIE-IN CONNECTION EA 3           3,850.00$          11,550.00$        5,000.00$          15,000.00$        1,635.90$          4,907.70$                 5,600.00$          16,800.00$        6,800.00$          20,400.00$        

G24
FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY (INCLUDING FH, VALVE, BENDS, AND DI LEAD) (NOT
INCLUDING TEE) (SHORT) EA 8           9,350.00$          74,800.00$        9,000.00$          72,000.00$        5,472.95$          43,783.60$               4,800.00$          38,400.00$        11,500.00$        92,000.00$        

G25
FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY (INCLUDING FH, VALVE, BENDS, AND DI LEAD) (NOT
INCLUDING TEE) (LONG) EA 6           10,450.00$        62,700.00$        13,000.00$        78,000.00$        7,368.20$          44,209.20$               7,100.00$          42,600.00$        15,000.00$        90,000.00$        

G26 REMOVE EXISTING WATERLINE (INCLUDES 8-INCH AND 6-INCH) LF 571       82.50$               47,107.50$        62.00$               35,402.00$        47.73$               27,253.83$               70.00$               39,970.00$        55.00$               31,405.00$        
G27 GROUT FILL AND ABANDON IN PLACE EXISTING 8-INCH WATERLINE LF 1,126    13.75$               15,482.50$        18.00$               20,268.00$        22.61$               25,458.86$               42.00$               47,292.00$        12.00$               13,512.00$        
G28 REMOVE AND SALVAGE FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY EA 7           550.00$             3,850.00$          143.00$             1,001.00$          666.33$             4,664.31$                 1,600.00$          11,200.00$        2,000.00$          14,000.00$        

G29
WATER METER RECONNECTION (INCLUDING REMOVAL OF EXISTING SERVICE AND
INSTALLATION OF NEW SERVICE) EA 8           2,200.00$          17,600.00$        2,700.00$          21,600.00$        4,661.65$          37,293.20$               3,000.00$          24,000.00$        2,000.00$          16,000.00$        

G30 ADJUST EXISTING WATER VALVE VAULT MANHOLE TO FINISHED GRADE EA 1           3,850.00$          3,850.00$          5,600.00$          5,600.00$          458.85$             458.85$                    6,300.00$          6,300.00$          2,500.00$          2,500.00$          
G31 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1           25,000.00$        25,000.00$        25,000.00$        25,000.00$        25,000.00$        25,000.00$               25,000.00$        25,000.00$        25,000.00$        25,000.00$        

624,732.40$      655,606.00$      556,386.62$             684,287.80$      724,278.00$      NO BID

H1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART H) AL 1           9,000.00$          9,000.00$          9,600.00$          9,600.00$          8,645.00$          8,645.00$                 7,000.00$          7,000.00$          7,000.00$          7,000.00$          

H2
REHABILITATE EXISTING 8-INCH DIA. VCP WASTEWATER GRAVITY LINE BY PIPE
BURSTING W/ 10-INCH HDPE LF 132       246.40$             32,524.80$        300.00$             39,600.00$        414.32$             54,690.24$               290.00$             38,280.00$        235.00$             31,020.00$        

H3
REHABILITATE EXISTING 10-INCH DIA. VCP WASTEWATER GRAVITY LINE BY PIPE
BURSTING W/ 12-INCH HDPE LF 238       302.40$             71,971.20$        375.00$             89,250.00$        219.45$             52,229.10$               330.00$             78,540.00$        285.00$             67,830.00$        

H4 4-FOOT DIA. FIBERGLASS MANHOLE (3.0 TO 6.0 FEET DEEP) EA 3           14,000.00$        42,000.00$        12,000.00$        36,000.00$        10,674.58$        32,023.74$               12,200.00$        36,600.00$        12,000.00$        36,000.00$        
H5 TRENCH SAFETY FOR WASTEWATER MANHOLE EA 3           1,120.00$          3,360.00$          350.00$             1,050.00$          1,996.00$          5,988.00$                 360.00$             1,080.00$          800.00$             2,400.00$          
H6 SIDEWALK REPLACEMENT SF 40         10.00$               400.00$             27.00$               1,080.00$          75.37$               3,014.80$                 120.00$             4,800.00$          25.00$               1,000.00$          
H7 CURB AND GUTTER REPLACEMENT LF 10         40.00$               400.00$             76.00$               760.00$             46.55$               465.50$                    270.00$             2,700.00$          185.00$             1,850.00$          
H8 PAVEMENT REPAIR SY 3           330.00$             990.00$             190.00$             570.00$             399.00$             1,197.00$                 1,800.00$          5,400.00$          1,500.00$          4,500.00$          

H9
DEMOLITION AND REMOVAL OF EXISTING 8-INCH DIA VCP WASTEWATER GRAVITY
LINE STUB (6-FEET) AND PLUG EA 1           1,680.00$          1,680.00$          2,200.00$          2,200.00$          7,162.05$          7,162.05$                 1,800.00$          1,800.00$          1,000.00$          1,000.00$          

H10 EXISTING 4-INCH WASTEWATER GRAVITY LINE TIE-IN TO NEW MANHOLE EA 1           3,920.00$          3,920.00$          2,300.00$          2,300.00$          2,779.70$          2,779.70$                 2,100.00$          2,100.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          
H11 EXISTING 6-INCH WASTEWATER GRAVITY LINE TIE-IN TO NEW MANHOLE EA 1           5,040.00$          5,040.00$          2,300.00$          2,300.00$          2,799.65$          2,799.65$                 2,100.00$          2,100.00$          3,200.00$          3,200.00$          
H12 EXISTING 10-INCH WASTEWATER GRAVITY LINE TIE-IN TO NEW MANHOLE EA 3           6,160.00$          18,480.00$        2,500.00$          7,500.00$          2,959.25$          8,877.75$                 2,500.00$          7,500.00$          3,500.00$          10,500.00$        
H13 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1           5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$                 5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          

194,766.00$      197,210.00$      184,872.53$             192,900.00$      174,300.00$      NO BID

I1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART I) AL 1           2,500.00$          2,500.00$          2,000.00$          2,000.00$          1,330.00$          1,330.00$                 1,500.00$          1,500.00$          2,000.00$          2,000.00$          

I2
EXCAVATION, BACKFILL AND COMPACTION OF TRENCH FOR ADJUSTED GAS LINE
(ADJUSTMENTS TO BE COMPLETED BY THE CITY GAS DEPARTMENT) LF 1,520    33.60$               51,072.00$        28.00$               42,560.00$        56.53$               85,925.60$               25.00$               38,000.00$        28.00$               42,560.00$        

I3 TRENCH SAFETY FOR GAS LINE LF 1,520    2.24$                 3,404.80$          5.00$                 7,600.00$          1.33$                 2,021.60$                 5.00$                 7,600.00$          1.00$                 1,520.00$          
I4 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED GAS IMPROVEMENTS AL 1           5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$                 5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          

61,976.80$        57,160.00$        94,277.20$               52,100.00$        51,080.00$        NO BID

J1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART J) AL 1           6,000.00$          6,000.00$          7,000.00$          7,000.00$          7,980.00$          7,980.00$                 7,000.00$          7,000.00$          6,500.00$          6,500.00$          

J2

INSTALL HWY TRF SIG (UPGRADE) (INCLUDING REMOVAL OF EXISTING ITEMS TO
BE REPLACED SUCH AS PUSH BUTTONS, WIRING, MAST ARM SIGNS, AND OTHER
ITEMS CONSIDERED AS INCIDENTAL TO UPGRADING THE TRAFFIC SIGNAL) EA 1           20,700.00$        20,700.00$        9,500.00$          9,500.00$          23,940.00$        23,940.00$               15,000.00$        15,000.00$        15,800.00$        15,800.00$        

J3 ELEC CONDR (NO.8) BARE LF 500       1.96$                 980.00$             2.00$                 1,000.00$          2.26$                 1,130.00$                 2.50$                 1,250.00$          2.50$                 1,250.00$          
J4 ILSN (LED) 8S (DURALIGHT) (RIGID BACK MOUNT) EA 4           3,737.50$          14,950.00$        6,000.00$          24,000.00$        4,322.50$          17,290.00$               4,700.00$          18,800.00$        3,800.00$          15,200.00$        
J5 TRF SIG CBL (TY A)(12 AWG)(2 CONDR) LF 1,410    1.96$                 2,763.60$          2.00$                 2,820.00$          2.46$                 3,468.60$                 2.50$                 3,525.00$          2.50$                 3,525.00$          
J6 TRF SIG CBL (TY A)(14 AWG)(3 CONDR) LF 855       2.01$                 1,718.55$          2.00$                 1,710.00$          2.66$                 2,274.30$                 2.50$                 2,137.50$          2.50$                 2,137.50$          

J7
PED DETECT PUSH BUTTON (APS - POLARA TOUCHLESS ACTUATION) W/R10-3E
SIGN EA 8           1,017.75$          8,142.00$          1,400.00$          11,200.00$        1,177.05$          9,416.40$                 1,300.00$          10,400.00$        1,500.00$          12,000.00$        

J8 PED DETECTOR CONTROLLER UNIT EA 1           4,427.50$          4,427.50$          7,600.00$          7,600.00$          5,120.50$          5,120.50$                 5,500.00$          5,500.00$          5,000.00$          5,000.00$          

J9

MIOVISION CAMERA**
**ITEMS SUBSIDIARY TO MIOVISION CAMERA
(1) SMARTLINK WIRELESS CONN AND SENSOR HUB (PX11215-001)
(1) SMARTSENSE MUTLIMODAL VIDEO DETECTION (PX11215-002)
(2) SMARTVIEW 360 CAMERA W/ BELL HOUSING (PXX11215-003)
(1) SOFTWARE: TRAFFIC LINK SIG COMM & TRAFF OPS (PBU11217-001)
(1) SOFTWARE: TRAFFIC LINK PERFORMANCE (PBU11217-002)
(1) SOFTWARE: TRAFFIC LINK MULTIMOD DET & COUNTS (PBU11217-003)
(2) MOUNT: 120", PENDANT, SS CBL & HW, J-PIPE LS 1           47,121.25$        47,121.25$        43,000.00$        43,000.00$        54,530.00$        54,530.00$               58,700.00$        58,700.00$        51,000.00$        51,000.00$        

SUBTOTAL PART G - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items G1 thru G31)

Part H - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS

Part J - TRAFFIC SIGNAL IMPROVEMENTS

SUBTOTAL PART H - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (Items H1 thru H13)

Part I - GAS IMPROVEMENTS

SUBTOTAL PART I - GAS IMPROVEMENTS (Items I1 thru I4)
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ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

Reytec Construction Resources, 
Inc

1901 Hollister
Huston, TX 77080

Clark Pipeline Services, LLC Bay Ltd.

401 Corn Products Rd, Bldg 1
Corpus Christi, TX 78409

RFB 4296 Mako Contracting JE Construction Services, LLC

TABULATION OF BIDS
PROCUREMENT - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS

TABULATED BY:   RJB
DESIGN ENGINEER: RTE
BID DATE:  Wednesday, August 17, 2022

P t A  GENERAL 

PROJECT NO. 21048 Wildcat Dr. (FM 624 to Teague Ln.) 3636 S. Alameda, Ste. B153 7505 Up River Rd
BASE BID #1 HMAC Corpus Christi, TX 78411 Corpus Christi, TX 78409

6229 Leopard Street
Corpus Christi, TX 78409

Bridges Specialties Inc

4233 FM 624
Robstown, TX 78380

J10 ETHERNET CABLET CAT 5E LF 410       1.73$                 709.30$             1.00$                 410.00$             2.00$                 820.00$                    2.20$                 902.00$             2.50$                 1,025.00$          
J11 WAVETRONIX CLICK 656 CABINET INTERFACE DEVICE EA 1           7,705.00$          7,705.00$          10,000.00$        10,000.00$        8,911.00$          8,911.00$                 9,600.00$          9,600.00$          8,500.00$          8,500.00$          
J12 RADAR ADVANCE DETECTOR (WAVETRONIX) EA 2           8,165.00$          16,330.00$        11,000.00$        22,000.00$        9,443.00$          18,886.00$               10,200.00$        20,400.00$        9,000.00$          18,000.00$        

J13 RADAR ADVANCE DETECTOR COMM. & POWER CABLE (SMARTSENSOR 6/C) LF 460       3.22$                 1,481.20$          5.00$                 2,300.00$          3.72$                 1,711.20$                 4.00$                 1,840.00$          5.00$                 2,300.00$          
J14 TR1 MITIGATOR DAMPING PLATES EA 2           793.50$             1,587.00$          4,700.00$          9,400.00$          931.00$             1,862.00$                 990.00$             1,980.00$          850.00$             1,700.00$          
J15 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED TRAFFIC SIGNAL IMPROVEMENTS AL 1           7,500.00$          7,500.00$          7,500.00$          7,500.00$          7,500.00$          7,500.00$                 7,500.00$          7,500.00$          7,500.00$          7,500.00$          

142,115.40$      159,440.00$      164,840.00$             164,534.50$      151,437.50$      NO BID

K1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART K) AL 1           5,000.00$          5,000.00$          2,000.00$          2,000.00$          4,655.00$          4,655.00$                 5,000.00$          5,000.00$          6,000.00$          6,000.00$          
K2 CONDT (PVC) SCH 40 (2") LF 1,488    25.00$               37,200.00$        13.00$               19,344.00$        21.28$               31,664.64$               25.00$               37,200.00$        20.00$               29,760.00$        
K3 CONDT (PVC) SCH 40 (4" SLEEVE) LF 241       32.20$               7,760.20$          40.00$               9,640.00$          37.24$               8,974.84$                 40.00$               9,640.00$          36.00$               8,676.00$          
K4 GROUND BOX TY A (122311) W/APRON EA 8           1,081.00$          8,648.00$          1,400.00$          11,200.00$        1,263.50$          10,108.00$               1,300.00$          10,400.00$        2,500.00$          20,000.00$        
K5 DEMOLISH EXISTING LIGHT FIXTURES EA 3           172.50$             517.50$             930.00$             2,790.00$          2,593.50$          7,780.50$                 210.00$             630.00$             1,000.00$          3,000.00$          

K6
INSTALL NEW STREET LIGHT POLE AND WIRING WITH MAST ARM AND LED
LUMINAIRE EA 7           7,820.00$          54,740.00$        8,600.00$          60,200.00$        4,874.45$          34,121.15$               9,700.00$          67,900.00$        8,800.00$          61,600.00$        

K7
INSTALL NEW STREET LIGHT AND WIRING WITH MAST ARM AND LED LUMINAIRE
ON EXISTING POLE EA 1           1,380.00$          1,380.00$          1,900.00$          1,900.00$          1,183.70$          1,183.70$                 1,700.00$          1,700.00$          3,200.00$          3,200.00$          

K8 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED LIGHTING IMPROVEMENTS AL 1           3,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$                 3,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          3,000.00$          
118,245.70$      110,074.00$      101,487.83$             135,470.00$      135,236.00$      NO BID

NO BID4,007,008.21$                        4,070,000.00$                   TOTAL BASE BID 3,269,820.07$                   3,553,755.00$                   4,076,797.90$                   

SUBTOTAL PART K - LIGHTING IMPROVEMENTS (Items K1 thru K8)

SUBTOTAL PART J - TRAFFIC SIGNAL IMPROVEMENTS (Items J1 thru J15)

Part K - LIGHTING IMPROVEMENTS
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