CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI
PURCHASING DIVISION
BUYER: GERALD GOODWIN

BID TABULATION

BID EVENT NO. 13
UTILITY WORKSITE
RESTORATION SERVICES

Dorame General
Repair & Lawn
Corpus Christi, TX

Barcom

Consruction, Inc.
Corpus Christi, TX

UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT | PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. Saw Cut, Remove & Dispose of Concrete Curb 1,000 | LF $15.00 $15,000.00( $11.50 $11,500.00
2. Saw Cut, Remove and Dispose of Concrete 6,800 | SF 4.00 27,200.00 10.55 71,733.20
Sidewalks, Driveways, Medians

3. Saw Cut, Remove & Dispose of Asphalt Concrete 2,700 | SF 5.00 13,500.00| NO BID
4.  Flexible Base 100 | CY 125.00 12,500.00| NO BID
5.  HMAC Type D- 2-inches thick 300 | SY 150.00 45,000.00( NO BID
6. Prime Coat 45 GA 75.00 3,375.00| NO BID
7. Concrete Curb & Gutter 1,000 LF 32.50 32,500.00 92.81 92,810.00
8.  Concrete Sidewalk 3,000 | SF 12.00 36,000.00 8.69 26,073.00
9.  Concrete Driveway 2,000 | SF 12.75 25,500.00 17.22 34,432.00
10. Commercial Driveway 2,000 | SF 13.00 26,000.00( NO BID
11. Exposed Aggregate 400 | SF 14.00 5,600.00| NO BID
12. Concrete Around Valve Collar 30| EA 300.00 9,000.00| NO BID
13. Curb Ramp 400 | SF 18.00 7,200.00 36.46 14,582.00
14. Top Soil 1,200 [ CY 35.00 42,000.00( NO BID
15. Bermuda Sod 150 | SY 30.00 4,500.00| NO BID
16. St. Augustine Sod 850 | SY 30.00 25,500.00( NO BID
17. Replace Fence to match existing 400 LF 21.00 8,400.00| NO BID
18. Repair Fence 100 LF 21.00 2,100.00| NO BID
19. Barricades, Signs, & Traffic Handling 150 | EA 40.00 6,000.00| 1,234.70 185,205.00
20. Miscellaneous Debris Removal 100 | CY 50.00 5,000.00| NO BID
21. Flowable Fill 50 CY 145.00 7,250.00| NO BID
22. Cement Stabilized Sand 50 CY 90.00 4,500.00| NO BID
23.  Washing/Cleaning 30| SYy 20.00 600.00| NO BID

SUBTOTAL: $364,225.00 $436,335.20




