
ACRES CYCLES

551.759 8 no bid no bid $30,346.75 $242,774.00 $24,211.19 $193,689.52 $19,311.00 $154,488.00

226.9 4 no bid no bid $60,128.50 $240,514.00 $55,624.54 $222,498.16 $53,321.00 $213,284.00

no bid $483,288.00 $416,187.68 $367,772.00                         TOTAL

UNIT PRICE 

PER CYCLE
TOTAL PRICE

UNIT PRICE 

PER CYCLE
TOTAL PRICE

Street Right-of-Ways

Storm Water Drainage

UNIT PRICE 

PER CYCLE
TOTAL PRICE

*Charlton Holding, LLC 

Corpus Christi, TX

2Chainz Brush Clearing, LLC    

Lolita, TX

UNIT PRICE PER 

CYCLE
TOTAL PRICE

City of Corpus Christi

Purchasing Division

Buyer: Michael Gutierrez

Mowing of Storm Water and Right-of-Ways

BID EVENT No. 165

BID TABULATION

Bonco, LLC                   

Driscoll, TX

Brown Mule Mowing, Inc 

Corpus Christi, TX

DESCRIPTION


