
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI

PURCHASING DIVISION

BUYER: LYDIA JUAREZ

UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED

ITEM UNIT QTY PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1 JOB MOBILIZATION SEWER CLEANING, CCTV EA 6 NO BID $1,700.00 $10,200.00 $14,950.00 $89,700.00

2 JOB MOBILIZATION EMERGENCY EA 1 NO BID $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $17,950.00 $17,950.00

3 TRAFFIC CONTROL ARTERIAL STREET DAY 20 NO BID $1,200.00 $24,000.00 $1,600.00 $32,000.00

4 TRAFFIC CONTROL COLLECTOR STREET DAY 10 NO BID $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00

5 TRAFFIC CONTROL LOCAL ACCESS STREET DAY 20 NO BID $1,000.00 $20,000.00 $950.00 $19,000.00

6 TRAFFIC CONTROL TXDOT ROW DAY 5 NO BID $3,500.00 $17,500.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00

7 TRAFFIC CONTROL 
CHANGEABLE VARIABLE 

MESSAGE BOARDS (EA)
DAY 40 NO BID

$350.00 $14,000.00 $100.00 $4,000.00

8
LIGHT TO MEDIUM 

CLEANING
18” PIPE SIZE LF 2,500 NO BID

$2.15 $5,375.00 $12.00 $30,000.00

9
LIGHT TO MEDIUM 

CLEANING 
20-21” PIPE SIZE LF 1,500 NO BID

$2.15 $3,225.00 $12.50 $18,750.00

10
LIGHT TO MEDIUM 

CLEANING 
24” PIPE SIZE LF 2,500 NO BID

$2.85 $7,125.00 $18.00 $45,000.00

11
LIGHT TO MEDIUM 

CLEANING 
27” PIPE SIZE LF 1,200 NO BID

$2.85 $3,420.00 $24.00 $28,800.00

12
LIGHT TO MEDIUM 

CLEANING 
30” PIPE SIZE LF 1,200 NO BID

$5.65 $6,780.00 $24.00 $28,800.00

13
LIGHT TO MEDIUM 

CLEANING 
36” PIPE SIZE LF 1,500 NO BID

$5.65 $8,475.00 $24.00 $36,000.00

14
LIGHT TO MEDIUM 

CLEANING 
42” PIPE SIZE LF 1,200 NO BID

$6.40 $7,680.00 $26.00 $31,200.00

15
LIGHT TO MEDIUM 

CLEANING 
48” PIPE SIZE LF 800 NO BID

$6.40 $5,120.00 $35.00 $28,000.00

16
LIGHT TO MEDIUM 

CLEANING 
54” PIPE SIZE LF 800 NO BID

$9.30 $7,440.00 $40.00 $32,000.00

17
LIGHT TO MEDIUM 

CLEANING 
60” PIPE SIZE LF 800 NO BID

$9.30 $7,440.00 $40.00 $32,000.00

18 HEAVY CLEANING 18” PIPE SIZE LF 2,500 NO BID $8.10 $20,250.00 $13.20 $33,000.00

19 HEAVY CLEANING 20”-21” PIPE SIZE LF 1,500 NO BID $8.10 $12,150.00 $13.75 $20,625.00

20 HEAVY CLEANING 24” PIPE SIZE LF 2,500 NO BID
$12.35 $30,875.00 $19.80 $49,500.00

21 HEAVY CLEANING 27” PIPE SIZE LF 1,200 NO BID $12.35 $14,820.00 $26.40 $31,680.00

22 HEAVY CLEANING 30” PIPE SIZE LF 1,200 NO BID $24.70 $29,640.00 $26.40 $31,680.00

23 HEAVY CLEANING 36” PIPE SIZE LF 1,500 NO BID
$24.70 $37,050.00 $26.40 $39,600.00

BID TABULATION

BID EVENT NO. 1004/194
CCTV CLEANING & INSPECTION LARGE DIAMETER
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24 HEAVY CLEANING 42” PIPE SIZE LF 1,200 NO BID
$29.15 $34,980.00 $28.60 $34,320.00

25 HEAVY CLEANING 48” PIPE SIZE LF 800 NO BID $29.15 $23,320.00 $38.50 $30,800.00

26 HEAVY CLEANING 54” PIPE SIZE LF 800 NO BID
$41.70 $33,360.00 $44.00 $35,200.00

27 HEAVY CLEANING 60” PIPE SIZE LF 800 NO BID $41.70 $33,360.00 $44.00 $35,200.00

28
LIGHT TO MEDIUM GROUT 

REMOVAL CLEANING 
18” PIPE SIZE LF 500 NO BID

$8.50 $4,250.00 $24.00 $12,000.00

29
LIGHT TO MEDIUM GROUT 

REMOVAL CLEANING 
20"-21” PIPE SIZE LF 250 NO BID

$8.50 $2,125.00 $24.00 $6,000.00

30
LIGHT TO MEDIUM GROUT 

REMOVAL CLEANING 
24” PIPE SIZE LF 500 NO BID

$10.40 $5,200.00 $24.00 $12,000.00

31
LIGHT TO MEDIUM GROUT 

REMOVAL CLEANING 
27” PIPE SIZE LF 150 NO BID

$10.40 $1,560.00 $24.00 $3,600.00

32
LIGHT TO MEDIUM GROUT 

REMOVAL CLEANING 
30” PIPE SIZE LF 150 NO BID

$12.75 $1,912.50 $35.00 $5,250.00

33
LIGHT TO MEDIUM GROUT 

REMOVAL CLEANING 
36” PIPE SIZE LF 250 NO BID

$12.75 $3,187.50 $35.00 $8,750.00

34
LIGHT TO MEDIUM GROUT 

REMOVAL CLEANING 
42” PIPE SIZE LF 150 NO BID

$19.00 $2,850.00 $35.00 $5,250.00

35
LIGHT TO MEDIUM GROUT 

REMOVAL CLEANING 
48” PIPE SIZE LF 75 NO BID

$19.00 $1,425.00 $35.00 $2,625.00

36
LIGHT TO MEDIUM GROUT 

REMOVAL CLEANING 
54” PIPE SIZE LF 75 NO BID

$25.50 $1,912.50 $40.00 $3,000.00

37
LIGHT TO MEDIUM GROUT 

REMOVAL CLEANING 
60” PIPE SIZE LF 75 NO BID

$25.50 $1,912.50 $40.00 $3,000.00

38
HEAVY GROUT REMOVAL 

CLEANING 
18” PIPE SIZE LF 500 NO BID

$20.95 $10,475.00 $70.00 $35,000.00

39
HEAVY GROUT REMOVAL 

CLEANING 
20” - 21” PIPE SIZE LF 250 NO BID

$20.95 $5,237.50 $70.00 $17,500.00

40
HEAVY GROUT REMOVAL 

CLEANING 
24” PIPE SIZE LF 500 NO BID

$24.55 $12,275.00 $70.00 $35,000.00

41
HEAVY GROUT REMOVAL 

CLEANING 
27” PIPE SIZE LF 150 NO BID

$24.55 $3,682.50 $70.00 $10,500.00

42
HEAVY GROUT REMOVAL 

CLEANING 
30” PIPE SIZE LF 150 NO BID

$29.70 $4,455.00 $70.00 $10,500.00
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43
HEAVY GROUT REMOVAL 

CLEANING 
36” PIPE SIZE LF 250 NO BID

$29.70 $7,425.00 $76.00 $19,000.00

44
HEAVY GROUT REMOVAL 

CLEANING 
42” PIPE SIZE LF 150 NO BID

$37.55 $5,632.50 $76.00 $11,400.00

45
HEAVY GROUT REMOVAL 

CLEANING 
48” PIPE SIZE LF 75 NO BID

$37.55 $2,816.25 $76.00 $5,700.00

46
HEAVY GROUT REMOVAL 

CLEANING 
54” PIPE SIZE LF 75 NO BID

$56.00 $4,200.00 $76.00 $5,700.00

47
HEAVY GROUT REMOVAL 

CLEANING 
60” PIPE SIZE LF 75 NO BID

$56.00 $4,200.00 $76.00 $5,700.00

48 REVERSE SETUP ALL PIPE SIZES EA 10 NO BID $100.00 $1,000.00 $150.00 $1,500.00

49 ADDER FOR ITEMS 8-47 COST PER (ADDITION) LF 100 NO BID $0.50 $50.00 $20.00 $2,000.00

50 CCTV 18” PIPE SIZE LF 2,500 NO BID $0.85 $2,125.00 $4.75 $11,875.00

51 CCTV 20” - 21” PIPE SIZE LF 1,500 NO BID $0.85 $1,275.00 $4.50 $6,750.00

52 CCTV 24” PIPE SIZE LF 2,500 NO BID $0.90 $2,250.00 $7.00 $17,500.00

53 CCTV 27” PIPE SIZE LF 1,200 NO BID $0.90 $1,080.00 $7.00 $8,400.00

54 CCTV 30” PIPE SIZE LF 1,200 NO BID $1.05 $1,260.00 $7.00 $8,400.00

55 CCTV 36” PIPE SIZE LF 1,500 NO BID $1.05 $1,575.00 $7.15 $10,725.00

56 CCTV 42” PIPE SIZE LF 1,200 NO BID $1.10 $1,320.00 $9.50 $11,400.00

57 CCTV 48” PIPE SIZE LF 800 NO BID $1.10 $880.00 $9.50 $7,600.00

58 CCTV 54” PIPE SIZE LF 800 NO BID $1.20 $960.00 $9.50 $7,600.00

59 CCTV 60” PIPE SIZE LF 800 NO BID $1.20 $960.00 $9.50 $7,600.00

NO BID $536,553.75 $1,156,130.00Total
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