
BID TABULATION

RFB1257 - Office Supplies

A&W Office 

Supply, Inc.

Gateway 

Printing & 

Office Supply, 

Inc.

Office Depot, 

Inc
Adorama, Inc Algae Solution

Corpus Christi, 

TX

Corpus Christi, 

TX
Boca Raton, 

FL
New York, NY Culver City, CA

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1

8.5x11 White Copy 

Paper
CS $29.00 $24.00 $27.50 No Bid No Bid

2

8.5x14 White Copy 

Paper
CS $39.45 $36.50 $39.99 No Bid No Bid

3

11x17 White Copy 

Paper
RM $6.20 $5.90 $7.01 No Bid No Bid

4 8.5x11 Laser Paper RM $5.10 $3.50 $4.68 No Bid No Bid

5

Cartridge, HP950XL, 

Blk
EA $33.31 $15.00 $32.97 No Bid No Bid

6

Cartridge, HPCE285A, 

Blk
EA $57.16 $25.00 $59.95 $68.63 No Bid

7

Cartridge, 

HEWCE260A, Blk
EA $132.83 $60.00 $139.31 No Bid No Bid

8 Cartridge, PH93XL, Blk EA $29.14 $13.00 $28.84 No Bid No Bid

9 Cartridge, HPCE390A EA $143.69 $65.00 $150.72 $161.07 No Bid

10

Cartridge, HP564XL, 

Blk
EA $18.85 $10.00 $22.11 No Bid No Bid

11 Catalog Discount 71.02% 88% 48% 1% No Bid

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI

PURCHASING DIVISION

BUYER:  MINERVA ALVARADO


