
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI BID TABULATION
PURCHASING DIVISION
BUYER: ROBERTA ORTIZ
 

UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED UNIT EXTENDED
ITEM DESCRIPTION CYCLES PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

1 Year One - Group 3 20 $1,500.00 $30,000.00 $1,879.50 $37,590.00 $1,440.95 $28,819.00 $1,065.00 $21,300.00 $90.00 $1,800.00 $1,630.00 $32,600.00 $4,345.00 $86,900.00 $1,200.00 $24,000.00 $975.00 $19,500.00
2 Year Two - Group 3 20 $1,500.00 $30,000.00 $1,879.50 $37,590.00 $1,440.95 $28,819.00 $1,065.00 $21,300.00 $90.00 $1,800.00 $1,630.00 $32,600.00 $4,345.00 $86,900.00 $1,200.00 $24,000.00 $975.00 $19,500.00
3 Year Three - Group 3 20 $1,500.00 $30,000.00 $1,879.50 $37,590.00 $1,440.95 $28,819.00 $1,065.00 $21,300.00 $90.00 $1,800.00 $1,630.00 $32,600.00 $4,345.00 $86,900.00 $1,200.00 $24,000.00 $975.00 $19,500.00

$90,000.00 $112,770.00 $86,457.00 $63,900.00 $5,400.00 $97,800.00 $260,700.00 $72,000.00 $58,500.00

4 Year One - Group 4 20 $2,500.00 $50,000.00 $5,145.00 $102,900.00 $3,773.00 $75,460.00 $2,572.00 $51,440.00 $85.00 $1,700.00 $4,459.00 $89,180.00 $7,770.00 $155,400.00 $2,692.55 $53,851.00 $1,475.00 $29,500.00
5 Year Two - Group 4 20 $2,500.00 $50,000.00 $5,145.00 $102,900.00 $3,773.00 $75,460.00 $2,572.00 $51,440.00 $85.00 $1,700.00 $4,459.00 $89,180.00 $7,770.00 $155,400.00 $2,692.55 $53,851.00 $1,475.00 $29,500.00
6 Year Three - Group 4 20 $2,500.00 $50,000.00 $5,145.00 $102,900.00 $3,773.00 $75,460.00 $2,572.00 $51,440.00 $85.00 $1,700.00 $4,459.00 $89,180.00 $7,770.00 $155,400.00 $2,692.55 $53,851.00 $1,475.00 $29,500.00

$150,000.00 $308,700.00 $226,380.00 $154,320.00 $5,100.00 $267,540.00 $466,200.00 $161,553.00 $88,500.00

7 Year One - Group 5A 20 $2,900.00 $58,000.00 $5,733.00 $114,660.00 $4,800.00 $96,000.00 $2,865.00 $57,300.00 $90.00 $1,800.00 $4,968.60 $99,372.00 $7,900.00 $158,000.00 $3,000.27 $60,005.40 $1,650.00 $33,000.00
8 Year Two - Group 5A 20 $2,900.00 $58,000.00 $5,733.00 $114,660.00 $4,800.00 $96,000.00 $2,865.00 $57,300.00 $90.00 $1,800.00 $4,968.60 $99,372.00 $7,900.00 $158,000.00 $3,000.27 $60,005.40 $1,650.00 $33,000.00
9 Year Three - Group 5A 20 $2,900.00 $58,000.00 $5,733.00 $114,660.00 $4,800.00 $96,000.00 $2,865.00 $57,300.00 $90.00 $1,800.00 $4,968.60 $99,372.00 $7,900.00 $158,000.00 $3,000.27 $60,005.40 $1,650.00 $33,000.00

$174,000.00 $343,980.00 $288,000.00 $171,900.00 $5,400.00 $298,116.00 $474,000.00 $180,016.20 $99,000.00

10 Year One - Group 5B 20 $2,000.00 $40,000.00 $2,722.50 $54,450.00 $1,679.00 $33,580.00 $1,361.00 $27,220.00 $80.00 $1,600.00 $2,359.00 $47,180.00 $3,450.00 $69,000.00 $1,524.60 $30,492.00 $1,000.00 $20,000.00
11 Year Two - Group 5B 20 $2,000.00 $40,000.00 $2,722.50 $54,450.00 $1,679.00 $33,580.00 $1,361.00 $27,220.00 $80.00 $1,600.00 $2,359.00 $47,180.00 $3,450.00 $69,000.00 $1,524.60 $30,492.00 $1,000.00 $20,000.00
12 Year Three - Group 5B 20 $2,000.00 $40,000.00 $2,722.50 $54,450.00 $1,679.00 $33,580.00 $1,361.00 $27,220.00 $80.00 $1,600.00 $2,359.00 $47,180.00 $3,450.00 $69,000.00 $1,524.60 $30,492.00 $1,000.00 $20,000.00

$120,000.00 $163,350.00 $100,740.00 $81,660.00 $4,800.00 $141,540.00 $207,000.00 $91,476.00 $60,000.00

13 Year One - Group 5C 12 $16,666.64 $199,999.68 $16,000.00 $192,000.00 No Bid No Bid $600.00 $7,200.00 $480.00 $5,760.00 $6,800.00 $81,600.00 No Bid No Bid $12,000.00 $144,000.00 $160.00 $1,920.00
14 Year Two - Group 5C 12 $16,666.64 $199,999.68 $16,000.00 $192,000.00 No Bid No Bid $600.00 $7,200.00 $480.00 $5,760.00 $6,800.00 $81,600.00 No Bid No Bid $12,000.00 $144,000.00 $160.00 $1,920.00
15 Year Three - Group 5C 12 $16,666.64 $199,999.68 $16,000.00 $192,000.00 No Bid No Bid $600.00 $7,200.00 $480.00 $5,760.00 $6,800.00 $81,600.00 No Bid No Bid $12,000.00 $144,000.00 $160.00 $1,920.00

$599,999.04 $576,000.00 $0.00 $21,600.00 $17,280.00 $244,800.00 $0.00 $432,000.00 $5,760.00

16 Year One - Group 6 42 $1,000.00 $42,000.00 $975.00 $40,950.00 $1,400.00 $58,800.00 $960.00 $40,320.00 $90.00 $3,780.00 $975.00 $40,950.00 $1,725.00 $72,450.00 $595.00 $24,990.00 $400.00 $16,800.00
17 Year Two - Group 6 42 $1,000.00 $42,000.00 $975.00 $40,950.00 $1,400.00 $58,800.00 $960.00 $40,320.00 $90.00 $3,780.00 $975.00 $40,950.00 $1,725.00 $72,450.00 $595.00 $24,990.00 $400.00 $16,800.00
18 Year Three - Group 6 42 $1,000.00 $42,000.00 $975.00 $40,950.00 $1,400.00 $58,800.00 $960.00 $40,320.00 $90.00 $3,780.00 $975.00 $40,950.00 $1,725.00 $72,450.00 $595.00 $24,990.00 $400.00 $16,800.00

$126,000.00 $122,850.00 $176,400.00 $120,960.00 $11,340.00 $122,850.00 $217,350.00 $74,970.00 $50,400.00

NOTE:

Corpus Christi, TX

Charlton Holding LLC dba 
Lawn in Order

Corpus Christi, TX

BID NO. 1232
MOWING AND GROUNDS MAINTENANCE SERVICES OF 
STREET R-O-W, MEDIANS AND CIRCLES

CC Academy 12 Lawn 
ServiceTony's Lawn Service **Aspen Lawn ServicesCML Services, LLC

GROUP 4 TOTAL

Tuff Environmental 
Services, LLC

Odem, TX

Maldonado Nursery and 
Landscaping, Inc

Dorame General Repair 
& Lawn, LLC

San Antonio, TXCorpus Christi, TX

GROUP 3 TOTAL

Rockport, TX Corpus Christi, TX

Cornerstone Lawn Service

Corpus Christi, TXAransas Pass, TX

GROUP 5A TOTAL

GROUP 5B TOTAL

GROUP 5C TOTAL

GROUP 6 TOTAL

**Aspen Lawn Serivces was the lowest responsible bidder for Groups 3, 4, 5A, 5B, 5C, and 6, however, Aspen Laswn Serivces declined the offers.  CC Academy 12 Lawn Service was the second lowest bidder for Groups 3, 4, 5A, 5B, 5C, and 6, they declined the offer for Groups 4, 5A, and 
5C, therefore recommendatoin for the thrid lowest bidders for each group is being recommended for the award.  Cornerstone Lawn Service is being recommended for Group 4 and Tony's Lawn Service is being recommended for Groups 5A and 5C.   
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