
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI PRICE SHEET

PURCHASING DIVISION MARY RHODES PHASE 2 PRE-PURCHASE OF PUMPS & MOTORS

SMITH PUMP COMPANY, INC. SULZER PUMPS (US), INC. WEIR FLOWAY, INC.

Austin, TX Brookshire, TX Fresno, CA

UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL UNIT TOTAL

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY. UNIT PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

River Pump Station

1 Vertical Turbine Pumping Unit - Approx. 10,417 gpm capacity 1 Each $453,364.00 $453,364.00 $598,060.00 $598,060.00 NO BID NO BID

2 Vertical Turbine Pumping Unit - Approx. 21,528 gpm capacity 2 Each $587,595 $1,175,190.00 $530,690.00 $1,061,380.00 NO BID NO BID

3 Maintenance Agreement 1 Each $284,471 $284,471.00 $399,990.00 $399,990.00 NO BID NO BID

4 Testing of Pumps & Motors 1 Each $46,554 $46,554.00 Included $0.00 NO BID NO BID

River Pump Station Subtotal $1,959,579.00 $2,059,430.00 NO BID

Booster Pump Station

5 Vertical Turbine Pumping Unit - Approx. 10,417 gpm capacity 1 Each $367,023 $367,023.00 $557,580.00 $557,580.00 $472,284.00 $472,284.00

6 Vertical Turbine Pumping Unit - Approx. 15,972 gpm capacity 3 Each $651,074 $1,953,222.00 $541,450.00 $1,624,350.00 $757,947.00 $2,273,841.00

7 Maintenance Agreement for Booster Pump Station 1 Each $352,246 $352,246.00 $517,410.00 $517,410.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00

8 Testing of Pumps & Motors 1 Each $85,126 $85,126.00 Included $0.00 $23,875.00 $23,875.00

Booster Pump Station Subtotal $2,757,617.00 $2,699,340.00 $2,890,000.00

9 Deduction if Awarded Pumps & Motors for the River and 

Booster Pump Stations
1 Each -$162,752 -$162,752.00 NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00

         TOTAL: $4,554,444.00 $4,758,770.00 (1) $2,890,000.00 (1)

.
(1) Deemed non-responsive and eliminated from consideration for failure to meet minimum requirements
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