CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI
PURCHASING DIVISION
BUYER: MINERVA ALVARADO

BID TABULATION
RFB 1832-EMS Medications

Life-Assist, Inc. Bound Tree Medical Medline Industries, Inc.
ITEM DESCRIPTION ary|luom Rancho Cordova, CA Dublin, OH Chicago, IL
UNIT UNIT UNIT

PRICE |TOTALPRICE| PRICE |TOTALPRICE] PRICE |TOTAL PRICE
1 |Acetaminophen Box 30| PK $1.00 $30.00 $3.81 $114.30 $0.99 $29.70
2 |Acetaminophen Elixer Bottle | 30| EA $4.96 $148.80 $1.23 $36.90 $2.85 $85.50
3 |Adenosine 40| PK $62.00| $2,480.00 $22.90 $916.00 $34.16 $1,366.40
4 |Albuterol 70| PK $6.30 $441.00 $5.49 $384.30 $5.03 $352.10
5 |Amidarone 20| BX $81.25| $1,625.00 $43.50 $870.00 $37.85 $757.00
6 |Aspirin 288( EA $1.08 $311.04 $0.74 $213.12 $0.81 $233.28
7 |Atropine Sulfate 70| BX | $106.60| $7,462.00 $97.30 $6,811.00 $88.58 $6,200.60
8 |CA Gluconate 10% IV 12| PK | $280.00f $3,360.00| $294.50 $3,534.00 | $243.75 $2,925.00
9 |CA Gluconate 2.5% Gel 80| EA $35.50| $2,840.00 $30.26 $2,420.80 $33.07 $2,645.60
10 |Dextrose 50% 90| BX $85.90| $7,731.00 $95.91 $8,631.90 $85.50 $7,695.00

11 [Diazepam 20| BX No Bid No Bid $335.31 $6,706.20 No Bid No Bid
12 [Diphenthydramine 20| BX $25.00 $500.00 $24.25 $485.00 $24.60 $492.00
13 |Dopamine 8| BX $77.50 $620.00 $81.50 $652.00 $70.96 $567.68
14 |Ephinephrine 1:1000 20 BX | $410.00] $8,200.00| $482.25 $9,645.00 $394.89 $7,897.80
15 |Ephinephrine 1: 10,000 94| BX $48.50| $4,559.00 $57.70 $5,423.80 $48.10 $4,521.40
16 [Furosemide 24| BX $82.00| $1,968.00 $84.75 $2,034.00 $91.67 $2,200.08
17 |Glucagon 180 EA | S$178.00( $32,040.00 | S$181.42 $32,655.60 $180.73 $32,531.40
18 |Glucose Paste 600| EA $1.20 $720.00 $1.16 $696.00 $1.78 $1,066.98
19 |Labetalol 20| BX $55.50 $1,110.00 $82.80 $1,656.00 $71.56 $1,431.20
20 [Lidocaine 56| BX $29.40| $1,646.40 $28.90 $1,618.40 $32.27 $1,807.12
21 [Magnesium Sulfate 50% 7| BX $60.00 $420.00 $54.50 $381.50 $46.71 $326.97
22 [Methylpred 15| BX | $270.00| $4,050.00| $304.75 $4,571.25 $261.01 $3,915.15
23 [Naloxone 128| BX | $330.00( $42,240.00 | $336.00( $43,008.00 $337.16 $43,156.48

24 [Midazolam 16| BX $27.00 $432.00 $12.57 $201.12 No Bid No Bid

25 [Morphine Sulfate 48| BX $52.00| $2,496.00 $53.53 $2,569.44 | No Bid No Bid
26 |Nitrostat Spray 98| EA| $146.00 $14,308.00 | $138.60( $13,582.80 $216.93 $21,259.14
27 |Ondansetron 130{ BX $12.48 $1,622.40 $32.88 $4,274.40 $45.67 $5,937.10
28 |Sodium Bicarbonade 17| BX | $135.00f $2,295.00| $103.20 $1,754.40 $110.67 $1,881.39
29 [Transexxamic Acid 30| EA $10.28 $308.40 $36.43 $1,092.90 $10.83 $324.99
30 [Expedited Deliveries 1| LS |$1,000.00f $1,000.00 |$1,000.00 $1,000.00 | $1,000.00 $1,000.00
TOTAL $146,964.04 $157,940.13 $152,607.06

Item 11 - Diazepam is not available nationwide. Vendors have not had this drug available to sell for over 10 months. There
is no time frame that has been given when the drug will become available for purchase.
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