TABULATION OF BIDS
CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT - CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI

Contracts Admin: Sylvia Arriaga
Bid Date: Friday - October 25, 2019 Design Consultant: Urban Engineering
PARK ROAD 22 BRIDGE BOND 2004 (REBID) Haas-Anderson Constr Ltd Bay Ltd
PROJECT NO. 6281 1402 Holly Rd 401 Corn Products Rd
CC,TX 78417 CC,TX 78412
Item DESCRIPTION UNIT E;LmATTTE? UNIT PRICE El:(;lE(;\'UD;? UNIT PRICE EAXI.JI?UD;‘II')
JPart A - GENERAL (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
Al Mobilization LS 1 $ 690,000.00 | $690,000.00 | S 618,000.00 | S 618,000.00
A2 Bonds and Insurance LS 1 $118,000.00 | $118,000.00 | $ 97,000.00 | S 97,000.00
A3 Storm Water Pollution Prevention LS 1 $ 100,000.00 | $100,000.00 | S 65,000.00 | S 65,000.00
A4 Traffic Control LS 1 $ 150,000.00 | $ 150,000.00 | S 276,450.00 | § 276,450.00
SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL (Items A1l thru A4) $ 1,058,000.00 $ 1,056,450.00
fPart B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
B1 Prepare ROW STA 20 $ 2,550.00 S 51,000.00 S 12,500.00 | S 250,000.00
B2 Remove Concrete Driveways EA 1 S 3,000.00 |$ 3,000.00|S 4,200.00|S 4,200.00
B3 Replace Concrete Driveways SF 1,422 S 11.00 [ S 15,642.00 | $ 16.00 | S 22,752.00
B4 Excavation (HMAC+Base 15") SY 29,080 S 5.80 [ $ 168,664.00 | S 11.00 | $ 319,880.00
B5 Excavation (Canal) CcYy 4,800 S 11.00 | S 52,800.00 | $ 29.00 [ $ 139,200.00
B6 Embankment cY 18,000 S 25.00 | $ 450,000.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 396,000.00
B7 Compacted Subgrade (12") SY 25,302 S 1.80|$ 45,543.60 | S 4.00 | S 101,208.00
B8 Geogrid SY 25,302 S 340 (S 86,026.80 (S 5.00 (S 126,510.00
B9 11.5" Limestone Base (TY A, GR 1) SY 25,302 S 25.00 | $ 632,550.00 | S 30.00 | $ 759,060.00
B10 Tack Coat GAL 2,348 S 345 (S 8,100.60 | S 200 (S 4,696.00
B11 Prime Coat GAL 5,870 S 425|S 2494750 | S 6.00 | S 35,220.00
B12 |3" Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete (1st Course)(TY B) SY 23,482 S 17.00 | $ 399,194.00 | $ 17.00 | S 399,194.00
B13 |2" Hot Mix Asphaltic Concrete (2nd Course)(TY D) SY 23,482 S 12.00 | $ 281,784.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 352,230.00
B14 Railing (Type T-223) LF 2,183 S 92.00 | $ 200,836.00 | S 130.00 [ S 283,790.00
B15 |Metal Beam Guard Fence LF 327 S 28.00 [ S 9,156.00 | S 50.00 | S 16,350.00
B16 Terminal Anchor Section - MSKT-MASH-TL3 EA 2 S 3,64000|S 7,280.00|S 7,000.00 (S 14,000.00
B17 |MBGF Transition with Thrie Beam EA 4 S 165000|S 6,60000|S 2,000.00]|S 8,000.00
B18 |Downstream Anchor Terminal EA 2 S 1,650.00 S 3,300.00|S 1,400.00|S 2,800.00
B19 Striping LS 1 S 18,800.00 | $ 18,800.00 | S 26,000.00 | S 26,000.00
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Item DESCRIPTION UNIT E;LmATTTE? UNIT PRICE El:(;lE(;\'UD;? UNIT PRICE EAXI.JI?UD;‘II')
B20 Signs LS 1 S 14,700.00 | $ 14,700.00 | S 16,500.00 | $ 16,500.00
B21 Light Poles EA 18 $ 9,200.00 | S 165,600.00 [ S 16,000.00 [ S 288,000.00
B22 |Temporary Access and Detour Roads SY 2,500 S 50.00 | $ 125,000.00 | S 44.00 | S 110,000.00
B23 |Low Profile Concrete Barriers EA 52 S 1,085.00 | $ 56,420.00 | S 1,400.00 | $ 72,800.00
B24 ([Seeding and Fertilizing (Roadway) SY 34,126 S 0.45 (S 15,356.70 | S 0.75|S  25,594.50
B25 Vegetative Watering SY 34,126 S 0.65 (S 22,181.90 | S 1.00|S 34,126.00
B26 |Dewatering North Bound Bridge LS 1 S 45,000.00 | $ 45,000.00 | S 95,000.00 | $ 95,000.00
B27 Dewatering South Bound Bridge LS 1 S 45,000.00 | S 45,000.00 | S 95,000.00 | S 95,000.00
B28 |Ozone Advisory Days EA 5 S 1,000.00 [$ 5,000.00|S 300.00 | S 1,500.00
B29 Temporary Retaining Wall SF 14,480 S 16.00 | $ 231,680.00 | $ 30.00 | S 434,400.00
B30 |Ground Improvements (Allowance) LS 1 S 500,000.00 | $ 500,000.00 | S 500,000.00 [ S 500,000.00
B31 [|Allowance for Unanticipated Street Improvements LS 1 S 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | S 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS (Items B1 thru B31) $ 3,701,163.10 $ 4,944,010.50
Part C - BRIDGE & RETAINING IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
C1 Precast Arch (36'x9.5') SF 7,130 S 130.00 | $ 926,900.00 | S 135.00 [ S 962,550.00
C2 Precast Arch (48'x11') SF 4,712 S 165.00 | S 777,480.00 | $ 140.00 | S 659,680.00
C3 Precast Headwalls SF 2,044 S 150.00 | $ 306,600.00 | S 160.00 [ S 327,040.00
ca Retaining Wall (Special) SF 20,967 S 144.00 | $ 3,019,248.00 | S 140.00 | $ 2,935,380.00
C5 Flowable Backfill cY 13 S 943.00 | § 12,259.00 | $ 850.00 | $§ 11,050.00
c6 Drill Shaft 36" LF 3,532 S 350.00 [ ¢ 1,236,200.00 | S 290.00 | $ 1,024,280.00
c7 Class C Conc (Abutment) cY 66 $ 1,000.00 | S 66,000.00 S 1,350.00 (S 89,100.00
Cc8 Class C Conc (Cap) cYy 103 S 1,000.00 | $ 103,000.00 | S 1,250.00 [ $ 128,750.00
c9 Structural Steel (Misc Non-Bridge) LB 2,550 S 16.00 | $ 40,800.00 | $ 30.00| S  76,500.00
C10 Railing (TY T223) LF 512 S 92.00 | $ 47,104.00 | S 130.00 | S 66,560.00
C11 Pipe Under Drain LF 1,996 S 20.00 | § 39,920.00 | $ 45.00 | S 89,820.00
C12 [Type 'A' Backfill Behind Walls and Arches cYy 3,000 S 73.00 | $ 219,000.00 | S 100.00 | S 300,000.00
C13 |Type 'D' Backfill Behind Walls and Arches cY 11,250 S 73.00 | $ 821,250.00 | S 99.00 | $ 1,113,750.00
C14 Allowance for Unanticipated Bridge and Retaining Wall s 1 $ 10,000.00 [ $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
Improvements
SUBTOTAL PART C - BRIDGE & RETAINING IMPROVEMENTS (Items C1 thru C14) $ 7,625,761.00 S 7,794,460.00
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JPart D - CANAL BULKHEAD & WALKS IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
D1 Bulkhead and Tie-Back LF 400 S 908.00 | $ 363,200.00 | $ 2,000.00 [ S 800,000.00
D2 Sidewalk SF 12,700 S 8.60 | $109,220.00 | S 9.00 | S 114,300.00
D3 Pedestrian Lighting LS 1 $136,687.30 | $ 136,687.30 | $ 215,000.00 [ S 215,000.00
D4 Articulated Concrete Block Mats SF 8,800 S 12.00 | S 105,600.00 | $ 10.00 | S 88,000.00
D5 Allowance for Unanticipated Canal Bulkhead & Walks s 1 $ 10,000.00 [ $ 10,000.00 [ $ 10,000.00 |$  10,000.00
Improvements
SUBTOTAL PART D - CANAL BULKHEAD & WALKS IMPROVEMENTS (D1 THRU D5) $ 724,707.30 $ 1,227,300.00
JPart E - STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
El 18" Reinforced Concrete Pipe LF 112 11100 | $ 12,432.00 150| S 16,800.00
E2 Safety End Treatment Double 18" Pipe EA 2 3,920.00 | $ 7,840.00 4000| $ 8,000.00
E3 24" Reinforced Concrete Pipe LF 333 150.00 | $ 49,950.00 200 S 66,600.00
E4 Safety End Treatment 24" Pipe EA 2 2,080.00 | $ 4,160.00 3100| S 6,200.00
E5 Safety End Treatment Double 24" Pipe EA 4 4,160.00 | $ 16,640.00 4800 S 19,200.00
E6 36" Reinforced Concrete Pipe LF 141 266.00 | $ 37,506.00 | S 330.00 | S 46,530.00
E7 5x5 Inlet Junction Box w/4x4 Grate EA 3 7,180.00 | $ 21,540.00 [ S 11,000.00 | S 33,000.00
ES OSHA Trench Safety LF 586 5.15|% 3,017.90 [ S 3.00 S 1,758.00
E9 OSHA Inet/Manhole Safety EA 3 201.00 | $ 603.00 | S 525.00 | S 1,575.00
E10 Confined Space Entry LS 1 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00 | § 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00
E11  |Allowance for Unanticipated Storm Water s 1 $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 [ $ 10,000.00 [$  10,000.00
Improvements
SUBTOTAL PART E - STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS (E1 THRU E11) $ 165,088.90 S 212,863.00
fPart F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
F1 16" Fused PVC Directional Drill (East Row) LF 400 S 364.00 | $ 145,600.00 | S 470.00 | $ 188,000.00
F2 16" Fused PVC Directional Drill (West Row) LF 400 S 364.00 | $ 145,600.00 | S 470.00 | $ 188,000.00
F3 16" PVC C-905 LF 769 S 174.00 | S 133,806.00 | S 240.00 | S 184,560.00
F4 16" Gate Valve EA 4 $ 10,900.00 | $ 43,600.00 | $ 13,000.00 | S 52,000.00
F5 16"x12" Reducer EA 2 S 1,450.00|S 2,900.00 S 2,200.00 | S 4,400.00
F6 16"x45° D. I. Bend EA 8 $ 1,730.00 | § 13,840.00 | S 2,500.00 | S 20,000.00
F7 12" PVC C-900 LF 40 S 300.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 350.00 | S 14,000.00
F8 2" Combination Air Release Valves EA 4 S 16,900.00 | S 67,600.00 | S 21,000.00 [ S  84,000.00
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F9 OSHA Trench Safety LF 809 S 330|S 2,669.70 | S 13.00 | S 10,517.00
F10 |Allowance for Unanticipated Water Improvements LS 1 S 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | S 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS (F1 THRU F10) $ 577,615.70 S 755,477.00
JPart G -WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
G1 Remove and Dispose of 15" VCP LF 130 S 143.00 | S 18,590.00 | $ 190.00 | S 24,700.00
G2 Grout in Place 15" VCP LF 430 S 39.00 [ S 16,770.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 20,640.00
G3 Allowance for Unanticipated Wastewater Improvements LS 1 $ 10,000.00 | S 10,000.00 | S 10,000.00 | S 10,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS (G1 THRU G3) $ 45,360.00 S 55,340.00
fPart H - CONDUIT FOR MIS IMPROVEMENTS (per SECTION 01 29 01 MEASUREMENT AND BASIS FOR PAYMENT)
H1 2" Conduit LF 1,600 $17.00( S 27,200.00 | S 36.00 | S 57,600.00
H2 Pull Boxes EA 4 $2,160.00( S 8,640.00 | S 2,900.00 | $ 11,600.00
H3 Allowance for Unanticipated Conduit for MIS s 1 $ 10,000.00 $10,000.00( $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
Improvements
SUBTOTAL PART H - CONDUIT FOR MIS IMPROVEMENTS (H1 THRU H3) $45,840.00 $79,200.00
jPart | - ADDITIVE/DEDUCTIVE ALTERNATE TO REDUCE RETAINING WALLS (per SECTION 01 23 10 ALTERNATES AND ALLOWANCES)
AAl1 [Deduct Item C4 - Retaining Wall (SPECIAL) SF (20,967) |NO BID NO BID S 135.14 | S(2,833,480.38)
AA2 [Retaining Wall (SPECIAL) LS 1 NO BID NO BID $ 1,108,786.00 | S 1,108,786.00
AA3 [Additional Select Fill LS 1 NO BID NO BID $ 212,500.00 | S 212,500.00
AA4 |Additional Sloped Embankment LS 1 NO BID NO BID $ 212,500.00 | S 212,500.00
AA5 Additional Underground Storm Water Improvements LS 1 NO BID NO BID $ 12,500.00 | S 12,500.00
AA6 |Additional Seeding and Fertilizing LS 1 NO BID NO BID $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
AA7 |Additional Vegetative Watering LS 1 NO BID NO BID S 3,500.00 | S 3,500.00
SUBTOTAL PART | - ADDITIVE/DEDUCTIVE ALTERNATE (IAA1 THRU AA7) NO BID S (1,281,194.38)

TOTAL PROJECT BASE BID (PARTS A THRU H)

$ 13,943,536.00

$ 16,125,100.50

TOTAL BASE BID + ADDITIVE/DEDUCTIVE ALTERNATE (AA1 THRU AA7)

$13,943,536.00

$ 14,843,906.12

*Bidders extended totals have been adjusted on bid tab - ltem AA1 in Part | is a deduct item, bid tab reflects AA1 deducted from Subtotal Part | as intended.
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