City of Corpus Christi

Contracts and Procurement
Department

BUYER : Cynthia Perez

Bid Tabulation

RFB 2700- Sodium Hypochlorite

Utilities Department

Brenntag Southwest Inc
Lancaster, TX

DPC Industries Company
Houston, TX

**Commercial Chemical
Products DBA Purify,
Houston, TX

Item Location Chemical W.'th UOM Qty 2 Years Unit Rate Total Price Unit Rate Total Price Unit Rate Total Price
Concentration
Sodium Hypochlorite
1 |Broadway Plant 10- 15% GAL 846,110.00| $ 0.5766 | $ 487,867.03 | $ 0.80 676,888.00 NO BID
Sodium Hypochlorite
2 |Oso Plant 10- 15% GAL 7,000,000.00| $ 0.5766 | $ 4,036,200.00 | $ 0.80 5,600,000.00 NO BID
- 0
. Sodium Hypochlorite
3 |Allison Plant 10- 15% GAL 438,120.00| $ 0.5766 | $ 252,619.99 | $ 0.80 350,496.00 NO BID
Sodium Hypochlorite
4 |Laguna Madre Plant 10- 15% GAL 375,000.00( $ 0.5766 | $ 216,225.00 | $ 0.80 300,000.00 NO BID
- 0
. Sodium Hypochlorite
5 [Sand Dollar Pump Station 10% GAL 144,000.00| $ 2.3300 | $ 335,520.00 | $ 2.45 352,800.00 1.58
6 |Staples Pump Station SOd'“ml';ys’i?Ch'O”te GAL 187,500.00| $ 0.5766 | $ 108,112.50 | $  0.80 150,000.00 | NO BID
. (o]
7 |Unloading Delay Hours 50| $ 75.0000 | $ 3,750.00 [ $ 75.00 3,750.00 NO BID
Total $ 5,440,294.52 $ 7,433,934.00 Non-responsive

** Non-responsive - submitted price for only one line item.
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