City of Corpus Christi Bid Tabulation

Contracts and Procurement RFB No. 2887

Buyer: Sandra Rodriguez Mowing and Grounds Maintenance
for Parks 9, 10

Doramfa%vennf[?:l Repair & Czaggi';;slﬂirgzgc Tony' s Lawn Service Cutrite Landscaping APS Lawn Care Tiple G Lawn Services, LLC Circslz“}ji:;z\;vlgare Ma"{'ai:%slf:,;,%ﬁg nd
Corpus Christi, Texas Corpus Christi, Texas Rockport, Texas San Antonio, Texas Corpus Christi, Texas Corpus Christi, Texas Cuero, Texas Corpus Christi, Texas
Item Description ‘ QTY ‘ Unit  [Unit Price ‘ Price Total Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
Group 9
5:;5 1Mai”te"ance Group 9 20 | Cycles [ $  1,30000|$ 2600000 [ $  1,41000| $ 2820000 | $ 1,486.00( $ 29,720.00 | $ 1,569.40| $ 3138800 $ 1,631.35| $ 32,627.00| $ 2000.00| $ 4000000 | $ 2,336.26| $  46,725.20 | $ 5080.00 | $ 101,600.00
1 szgszMai”te"ance Group 9 20 | Cycles | $  1,30000| $ 26,00000($  1,400.00| § 2800000 $ 1,486.00| $ 29,720.00|$ 1,616.00| $ 3232000 $ 1,631.35| $ 32,627.00| $§ 2100.00| $ 4200000 | $ 245307| $  49,061.40 | $ 5080.00| $ 101,600.00
;Pfer l;sr '\;aime”ance Group 20 | Cycles [ $  150000| $  3000000|$  1,390.00| $ 27,800.00 | $ 148600 $ 29,720.00 | $ 1,664.48| $ 33,7289.60 | $ 163135\ $ 32,627.00| $ 2,200.00| $  44,00000|$ 257572 $ 51,514.40| $ 5080.00 | $ 101,600.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 82,000.00 $ 84,000.00 $ 89,160.00 $ 96,997.60 $ 97,881.00 $ 126,000.00 $ 147,301.00 $ 304,800.00
Manning Lawn Care Cutrite Landscaping Dorame General Repair & Charlto[\ HolqingsaLLC dba Tony' s Lawn Service APS Lawn Care Services Cirz;le K Lawr:L?:are Tiple G Lawn Services, LLC
cggrLT;dCsﬁcmege';;S San Antonio, Texas Cormf \g:ri:lLiCTexas Cor;ilvgncmrislz, Teerxas Rockport, Texas Corpus Christi, Texas Cir;:g,e'?éxas Corpus Christ, Texas
Item Description ‘ QTY ‘ Unit  [Unit Price Price Total Unit Price Total Price Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
Group 10
Parks Maintenance Group 10
Year 1 20 | Cycles | $ 1,020.80 $ 20,416.00 | $ 1,392.00| $ 27,840.00 [ $ 1,500.00| $ 30,000.00 | $ 1,575.00| $ 31,500.00( $ 1,670.00( $ 33,400.00( $ 1,851.36| $ 37,027.20 [ $ 4,625.90| $ 92,518.00 No Bid No Bid
Parks Maintenance Group 10
2 Year 2 20 | Cycles | $ 1,020.80| $ 20,416.00 | $ 1,433.73| $ 28,674.60 | $ 1,500.00| $ 30,000.00 | $ 1,570.00| $ 31,400.00| $ 1,670.00| $ 33,400.00| $ 1,851.36| $ 37,027.20| $ 4,857.19( $ 97,143.80 No Bid No Bid
*Parks Maintenance Group
10 Year 3 20 | Cycles | $ 1,020.80 $ 20,416.00 | $ 1,476.77| $ 29,535.40 ( $ 1,500.00| $ 30,000.00 | $ 1,565.00| $ 31,300.00( $ 1,670.00( $ 33,400.00( $ 1,853.36| $ 37,067.20 [ $ 5,100.05( $ 102,001.00 No Bid No Bid
GRAND TOTAL $ 61,248.00 $ 86,050.00 $ 90,000.00 $ 94,200.00 $ 100,200.00 $ 111,121.60 $ 291,662.80 $ -

*Year 3 is an option term.
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