BID DATE: Wed., August 5, 2020

TABULATION OF BIDS
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT DEPT.

LAGUNA SHORES RD - GRAHAM TO SPID Mako Contracting Haas-Anderson Constr Bay Ltd Clark Pipeline Services Reytec Constr Resources
PROJ NO 18026A (SEGMENT 1) - BASEBID 1 3636 S Alameda #B153 1402 Holly Rd 401 Corn Products Rd 6229 Leopard St 1901 Hollister
RFB #3127 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080
ITEM DESCRIPTION I UNITI QTyY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
PART 1A - GENERAL
1A1 [Mobilization (Max. 5% of Part 1A) LS $  4,000.00|$ 4,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00
1A2 [Bonds & Insurance (Base Bid 1) AL $ 51,000.00 | $ 51,000.00 | $ 28,000.00 | $ 28,000.00 | $ 49,000.00 | $ 49,000.00 | $ 78,000.00 | $ 78,000.00
1A3 [Traffic Control Mobilization/Adjustments LS $  8,000.00 |$ 8,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 | $ 11,800.00 | $ 11,800.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 0
Traffic Control Items (Signs, Barricades, MO -
1A4 [Channelizing Devices, LPCB, etc.) $  1,080.00 | $ 7,560.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 21,900.00 | $ 153,300.00 | $ 2,370.00 | $ 16,590.00 0
1A5 |Message Boards for Traffic Control EA 5 $  12,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 75,000.00 | $ 24,300.00 | $ 121,500.00 | $ 23,706.76 | $ 118,533.80 0
1A6 |Ozone Advisory Day DAYS 3 $ 1.00 | $ 3.00|$ 1.00 | $ 3.00|$ 490.00 | $ 1,470.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 540.00 0
1A7 [Storm Water Pollution Prevention Plan LS 1 $  5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 52,000.00 | $ 52,000.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 0
1A8 |[Inlet Protection EA 2 $ 125.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 288.00 | $ 576.00 | $ 840.00 | $ 1,680.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 600.00 0
1A9 [Rock Filter Dam EA 14 | 800.00 | $ 11,200.00 | $ 748.00 | $ 10,472.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 42,000.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 36,400.00 0
1A10 |Silt Fence LF | 3,290 |$ 42518 13,982.50 | $ 5.05|$ 16,614.50 | $ 6.50 | $ 21,385.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 19,740.00 0
1A11 [Revegetation (Hydromulch) SY | 3,532 |$ 1.50 | $ 5,298.00 | $ 1.55|$ 5,474.60 | $ 5.00($ 17,660.00 | $ 1.20 | $ 4,238.40 0
Contingency Allowance for Unanticipated AL 1
1A12 |Disposal of Contaminated Groundwater $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 0
SUBTOTAL PART 1A - GENERAL $ 171,293.50 $ 343,140.10 $ 438,595.00 $ 315,642.20 NO BID
PART 1B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS
1B1 |Mobilization (Max. 5% of Part 1B) LS 1 $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 56,000.00 | $ 56,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 102,000.00 | $ 102,000.00 0
1B2 [Remove Curb and Gutter LF 92 S 350 (S 322.00 11.00 | $ 1,012.00 | $ 42,00 | $ 3,864.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 1,472.00
1B3 Removal of Sign and Sign Support Assembly EA 10 $ 114.00 | $ 1,140.00 | $ 86.00 | $ 860.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 900.00
1B4 [Remove Existing Metal Beam Guard Rail LF 390 |$ 5.00 | $ 1,950.00 | $ 255 |S 994.50 | $ 23.00 | $ 8,970.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 74,100.00 0
Pulverize & Recompact Existing Roadway
1B5 [Pavement SY | 2,280 $ 25.00 | $ 57,000.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 2,280.00 | $ 9.50 | $ 21,660.00 | $ 17.60 | $ 40,128.00 0
1B6 [Street Excavation (1' Beyond E.O.P.) SY | 9,428 | $ 10.00 | $ 94,280.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 47,140.00 | $ 11.75 | $ 110,779.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 169,704.00 0
1B7 |Subgrade Preparation (1' Beyond E.O.P.) SY [11,708|$ 3.00($ 35,124.00 | $ 260 (S 30,440.80 | $ 370 $ 43,319.60 | $ 10.80 | $ 126,446.40 0
1B8 |TX-5 Geogrid (1' Beyond E.O.P.) SY |11,708]|$ 4.00|$ 46,832.00 | $ 3.65|S 42,734.20 | $ 570 | $ 66,735.60 | $ 7.80 | S 91,322.40 0
8" Type A, Grade 1-2 Crushed, Limestone Base
per TxDOT Std. Spec. Item No. 247 (1' Beyond| SY | 11,708
1B9 |E.O.P.) $ 22.00|$ 257,576.00 | $ 18.75 | $ 219,525.00 | $ 22.00|$ 257,576.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 421,488.00
1B10 [One Course Surface Treatment Underseal SY [11,708|$ 253 (S 29,621.24 [ $ 245 (S 28,684.60 | $ 470 S 55,027.60 | $ 780 (S 91,322.40
1B11 |3" Type 'D' HMAC SY |11,024|$ 2426 | $ 267,442.24 18.70 | $ 206,148.80 | $ 34.00 | $ 374,816.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 396,864.00
Level Up Mill (0"-1") & 1 1/2" HMAC Type D
1B12 |Overlay SY | 2180 S 19.46 | S 42,422.80 | $ 22.00|$ 47,960.00 | $ 44,00 | $ 95,920.00 | $ 28.80 | $ 62,784.00 0
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LAGUNA SHORES RD - GRAHAM TO SPID

Mako Contracting

Haas-Anderson Constr

Bay Ltd

Clark Pipeline Services

Reytec Constr Resources

PROJ NO 18026A (SEGMENT 1) - BASE BID 1 3636 S Alameda #B153 1402 Holly Rd 401 Corn Products Rd 6229 Leopard St 1901 Hollister
RFB #3127 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT| QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT

1B13 [Full Depth Pavement Repair SY 190 S 117.88 22,397.20 132.00 | $ 25,080.00 290.00 | S 55,100.00 102.00 19,380.00

1B14 (6" Curb and Gutter LF 139 S 25.00 3,475.00 32.00 | $ 4,448.00 62.00 | $ 8,618.00 21.60 3,002.40
Concrete Driveway (Incl. Existing Driveway SF 3292

1B15 [Removal) ! S 12.50 41,150.00 11.00 | $ 36,212.00 18.75 | $ 61,725.00 13.20 43,454.40
Pavement Markings (24" Wide, White, Type C
Hear  Applied, 125 mil, Preformed| LF 39

1B16 [Thermoplastic "Stop Bar" Marking Lines) S 21.60 842.40 21.00 | $ 819.00 27.00 | $ 1,053.00 21.60 842.40
Pavement Markings (Crosswalk Markings -
Total LF of 24" Wide, White, Type C Heat| LF 38
Applied, 125 mil, Preformed Thermoplastic)

1B17 S 21.60 820.80 21.00 | $ 798.00 27.00 | $ 1,026.00 21.60 820.80
Pavement Marking, Reflectorized
Thermoplastic, Type 1, 90 mil thickness —| LF 4,666

1B18 |[Yellow 4” Solid S 0.66 3,079.56 0.65|$ 3,032.90 0.80|$ 3,732.80 0.66 3,079.56
Pavement Marking, Reflectorized
Thermoplastic, Type I, 90 mil thickness —| LF 150

1B19 |[Yellow 4” Broken S 1.50 225.00 1.45|S 217.50 1.85 ]S 277.50 1.50 225.00
Pavement Marking, Reflectorized
Thermoplastic, Type 1, 90 mil thickness —| LF 6,006

1B20 [White 4” Solid S 0.66 3,963.96 0.65|$ 3,903.90 0.80|$ 4,804.80 0.66 3,963.96
TYII-A-A Raised Pavement Marker EA 66

1B21 [(Reflectorized) S 6.00 396.00 577 |$ 380.82 750 |$ 495.00 6.00 396.00
TYII-B-B Raised Pavement Market EA 5

1B22 [(Reflectorized) S 18.00 36.00 17.00 | $ 34.00 23.00 | $ 46.00 18.00 36.00
Type 2 Object Marker with Flexible Post (OM- EA 7

1B23 [2Z) (FLX) S 114.00 798.00 109.00 | $ 763.00 140.00 | $ 980.00 114.00 798.00
Chevron Alignment (W1-8L) (18"x24") (Incl. EA 5

1B24 [Metal Pole and Foundation) S 528.00 2,640.00 506.00 | S 2,530.00 660.00 | S 3,300.00 528.00 2,640.00
Chevron Alignment (W1-8R) (18"x24") (Incl. EA 5

1B25 [Metal Pole and Foundation) S 528.00 2,640.00 506.00 | S 2,530.00 660.00 | S 3,300.00 528.00 2,640.00
Combo Stop Sign (R1-1) (30"x30") / Street EA 4
Name Sign (Incl. Metal Pole and Foundation)

1B26 S 750.00 3,000.00 719.00 | S 2,876.00 940.00 | $ 3,760.00 750.00 3,000.00
Stop Ahead (W3-1) (30"x30") (Incl. Metal Pole EA 5

1B27 [and Foundation) S 570.00 1,140.00 547.00 | S 1,094.00 710.00 | S 1,420.00 570.00 1,140.00
Speed Limit Sign (R2-1) (24"x30") (Incl. Metal EA 4

1B28 [Pole and Foundation) S 540.00 2,160.00 518.00 | S 2,072.00 680.00 | S 2,720.00 540.00 2,160.00
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LAGUNA SHORES RD - GRAHAM TO SPID

Mako Contracting

Haas-Anderson Constr

Bay Ltd

Clark Pipeline Services

Reytec Constr Resources

PROJ NO 18026A (SEGMENT 1) - BASE BID 1 3636 S Alameda #B153 1402 Holly Rd 401 Corn Products Rd 6229 Leopard St 1901 Hollister
RFB #3127 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT| QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
Reverse Curve (W1-4L) (30"x30") (Incl. Metal EA 5
1B29 [Pole and Foundation) S 570.00 | S 1,140.00 | $ 547.00 | S 1,094.00 | $ 710.00 | S 1,420.00 | $ 570.00 | $ 1,140.00 0
Merge (W4-1R) (30"x30") (Incl. Metal Pole and EA 1
1B30 [Foundation) S 570.00 | S 570.00 | $ 547.00 | $ 547.00 | S 710.00 | $ 710.00 | S 570.00 | $ 570.00 0
One Way (R6-1R) (36"x12") (Incl. Metal Pole EA 1
1B31 [and Foundation) S 510.00 | S 510.00 | $ 489.00 | $ 489.00 | $ 640.00 | S 640.00 | S 510.00 | $ 510.00 0
1B32 [Traffic Rail - Type 631LS LF 625 S 69.00 | $ 43,125.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 43,750.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 87,500.00 | $ 86.40 | S 54,000.00 0
1B33 [Guardrail Terminal EA 4 S 3,450.00 | S 13,800.00 | $ 3,440.00 | S 13,760.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 6,888.00 | S 27,552.00 0
1B34 [Erosion Control Matting (TRM) SY 7,751 | S 19.44 | S 150,679.44 | $ 19.00 | $ 147,269.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 85,261.00 | $ 13.28 | $ 102,933.28 0
1B35 [Temporary Cofferdam EA 2 $ 10,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 1.00 | S 2.001(S 42,100.00 | $ 84,200.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 0
1B36 |[Select Fill Embankment cYy 1,216 | $ 32.00 | $ 38,912.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 36,480.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 47,424.00 | $ 31.20 | $ 37,939.20 0
Articulated Concrete Block Matting Sy 1205
1B37 [(Revetment) ! S 130.00 | $ 156,650.00 | $ 113.00 | $ 136,165.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 192,800.00 | $ 98.40 | S 118,572.00 0
Allowance for Unanticipated Street AL 1
1B38 [Improvements $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | S 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | S 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | S 25,000.00 0
SUBTOTAL PART 1B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS S 1,397,860.64 S 1,175,127.02 S 1,757,680.90 $ 2,058,326.20 NO BID
PART 1C - ADA IMPROVEMENTS
1C1 Mobilization (Max. 5% of Part 1C) LS 1 S 250.00 | S 250.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 480.00 | $ 480.00 0
1C2 [Remove Existing Concrete Sidewalk SF 73 S 3.00|$ 219.00 | $ 225(S 164.25 | $ 40.00 | $ 2,920.00 | $ 5.00|$ 365.00 0
1C3 [Remove Existing Curb Ramp SF 147 |S 4.001|$ 588.00 | $ 260 |S 382.20 | S 19.75 | $ 2,903.25 | $ 30.00 | $ 4,410.00 0
1C4 |5' Concrete Pedestrian Sidewalk SF 25 S 8.00 S 200.00 | $ 37.00 | $ 925.00 | $ 38.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 9.60 | $ 240.00 0
1C5 Sidewalk Ramp SF 182 S 25.00 | $ 4,550.00 | $ 40.00 | S 7,280.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 9,828.00 | $ 27.60 | $ 5,023.20 0
SUBTOTAL PART 1C - ADA IMPROVEMENTS S 5,807.00 S 8,851.45 S 18,101.25 S 10,518.20 NO BID
PART 1D - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS
1D1 Mobilization (Max. 5% of Part 1D) LS 1 25,000.00 | S 25,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | S 30,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 39,600.00 | S 39,600.00 0
1D2 Remove Existing 12" RCP LF 46 2352 |$ 1,081.92 | $ 525|$ 24150 | $ 87.00 | S 4,002.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 966.00 0
1D3 Remove Existing 12" CPP LF 18 2352 |$ 42336 | $ 445 (S 80.10 | $ 97.00 | S 1,746.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 378.00 0
1D4 Remove Existing 15" RCP LF 292 2352 |$ 6,867.84 | $ 7.45|S 2,175.40 | $ 55.00 | $ 16,060.00 | $ 21.00 | $ 6,132.00 0
1D5 Remove Existing 18" RCP LF 250 2352 |$ 5,880.00 | $ 9.00 | $ 2,250.00 | $ 32.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 7,000.00 0
1D6 Remove Existing 24" RCP LF 76 2464 | S 1,872.64 | $ 15.00 | $ 1,140.00 | $ 53.00 | $ 4,028.00 | $ 42.00 | S 3,192.00 0
1D7 Remove Existing 24" CPP LF 164 30.80 | $ 5,051.20 | $ 14.00 | $ 2,296.00 | $ 43.00 | S 7,052.00 | $ 84.00 | S 13,776.00 0
Remove Existing 8'x4' Reinforced Concrete LF 183
1D8 Box Culvert 140.00 | $ 25,620.00 | $ 206.00 | S 37,698.00 | $ 340.00 | S 62,220.00 | $ 210.00 | S 38,430.00 0
1D9 Remove Existing Curb Inlet EA 2 1,064.00 | $ 2,128.00 | $ 482.00 | $ 964.00 | $ 2,000.00 | S 4,000.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $ 2,160.00 0
1D10 |Remove Existing Headwall/Wingwall EA 2 3,136.00 | S 6,272.00 | $ 2,350.00 | $ 4,700.00 | $ 8,000.00 | S 16,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | S 6,000.00 0
1D11 |Remove Concrete Channel LF 133 11.20 | $ 1,489.60 | $ 50.00 | $ 6,650.00 | $ 83.00 | S 11,039.00 | $ 80.00 | S 10,640.00 0
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LAGUNA SHORES RD - GRAHAM TO SPID
PROJ NO 18026A (SEGMENT 1) - BASE BID 1

Mako Contracting
3636 S Alameda #B153

Haas-Anderson Constr
1402 Holly Rd

Bay Ltd

401 Corn Products Rd

Clark Pipeline Services
6229 Leopard St

Reytec Constr Resources
1901 Hollister

RFB #3127 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT| QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT

1D12 Ditch Excavation and Regrading/Reshaping LF 3,453 12.00 | $ 41,436.00 | $ 6.70 | $ 23,135.10 | $ 18.75 | $ 64,743.75 | $ 21.00 | $ 72,513.00 0
13.5"x22" Class Ill Reinforced Concrete Arch LF 229

1D13 [Pipe 204.96 | S 46,935.84 | $ 155.00 | $ 35,495.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 36,640.00 | $ 217.12 | S 49,720.48 0
18"x28.5" Class Ill Reinforced Concrete Arch LF 151

1D14 [Pipe 21840 | S 32,978.40 | $ 174.00 | $ 26,274.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 24,160.00 | $ 249.66 | S 37,698.66

1D15 |18" Class IV RCP LF 32 60.48 | $ 1,93536 | $ 105.00 | $ 3,360.00 | $ 290.00 | S 9,280.00 | $ 15838 | $ 5,068.16

1D16 |24" Class IV RCP LF 297 7840 | S 23,284.80 | $ 114.00 | $ 33,858.00 | $ 200.00 | S 59,400.00 | $ 189.60 | $ 56,311.20 0
13.5"x22" Class IV Reinforced Concrete Arch LF 43

1D17 [Pipe 220.64 | S 9,487.52 | $ 187.00 | $ 8,041.00 | $ 260.00 | S 11,180.00 | $ 234.28 | S 10,074.04 0
18"x28.5" Class IV Reinforced Concrete Arch LF 174

1D18 [Pipe 235.20 | S 40,924.80 | $ 209.00 | S 36,366.00 | $ 210.00 | S 36,540.00 | $ 269.46 | S 46,886.04 0

1D19 |10'x4' Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert LF 216 1,120.00 | $ 241,920.00 | $ 917.00 | $ 198,072.00 | $ 2,000.00 | S 432,000.00 | $ 923.40 | $ 199,454.40 0

1D20 |Pipe Trench Safety LF 1,142 560 |$ 6,395.20 | $ 1.00 | S 1,142.00 | $ 18.25 | $ 20,841.50 | $ 240 | S 2,740.80 0

1D21 |Well Pointing LF 1,142 28.00 | $ 31,976.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 62,810.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 125,620.00 | $ 84.00 | S 95,928.00 0

1D22 |Headwall/Wingwalls for O'Neill Channel EA 2 21,000.00 | S 42,000.00 | $ 40,000.00 | $ 80,000.00 | $ 51,100.00 | $ 102,200.00 | $ 10,680.00 | $ 21,360.00 0

1D23 |5" Concrete Rip Rap for O'Neill Channel SF 1,719 13.44 | $ 23,103.36 | $ 16.00 | $ 27,504.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 42,975.00 | $ 3360 |$ 57,758.40 0

1D24 |Safety End Treatment (Type Il) (3:1) (24") EA 12 2,128.00 | $ 25,536.00 | $ 1,410.00 | $ 16,920.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 32,400.00 | $ 2,152.00 | $ 25,824.00 0
Safety End Treatment (Type 1) (3:1) EA 3

1D25 |[(13.5"x22") 2,016.00 | S 6,048.00 | $ 1,440.00 | $ 4,320.00 | $ 2,300.00 | S 6,900.00 | $ 1,967.20 | $ 5,901.60 0
Safety End Treatment (Type Il) (6:1) EA 1

1D26 |[(13.5"x22") 2,688.00 | S 29,568.00 | $ 1,720.00 | $ 18,920.00 | $ 2,700.00 | S 29,700.00 | $ 3,23440 | S 35,578.40 0
Safety End Treatment (Type II) (3:1) EA 5

1D27 [(18"x28.5") 2,688.00 | S 13,440.00 | $ 1,820.00 | $ 9,100.00 | $ 3,200.00 | S 16,000.00 | $ 2,152.00 | $ 10,760.00 0
Safety End Treatment (Type II) (6:1) EA 1

1D28 |[(18"x28.5") 2,856.00 | S 2,856.00 | $ 2,420.00 | S 2,420.00 | $ 6,400.00 | S 6,400.00 | $ 3,604.00 | S 3,604.00

1D29 |4" Concrete Slope Protection SF 275 1232 | $ 3,388.00 | $ 9.60 | $ 2,640.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 6,600.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 3,300.00 0

1D30 4-8"x4" Junction Box with Grate/Frame Unit EA 1 7,616.00 | S 7,616.00 | $ 5,610.00 | S 5,610.00 13,200.00 | $ 13,200.00 | $ 8,550.00 | S 8,550.00 0

1D31 |5'Curb Inlet EA 1 5,320.00 | $ 5,320.00 | $ 5,330.00 | $ 5,330.00 11,600.00 | $ 11,600.00 | $ 4,680.00 | $ 4,680.00
Precast Special Junction Box w/ 5' Curb Inlet EA 1

1D32 14,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 10,700.00 | $ 10,700.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 9,390.00 | $ 9,390.00 0
Junction Box/Grate Inlet/Curb Inlet Trench EA 3

1D33 |Safety 616.00 | S 1,848.00 | $ 1.00 | S 3.00 2,700.00 | S 8,100.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 5,400.00

1D34 [Pipe Support EA 2,688.00 | S 10,752.00 | $ 1,590.00 | $ 6,360.00 6,500.00 | S 26,000.00 | $ 3,360.00 | S 13,440.00

1D35 |Temporary Cofferdam EA 2 25,384.00 | S 50,768.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 43,000.00 | $ 86,000.00 | $ 11,520.00 | $ 23,040.00 0
Allowance for Unanticipated Drainage AL 1

1D36 [Improvements 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 0
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LAGUNA SHORES RD - GRAHAM TO SPID Mako Contracting Haas-Anderson Constr Bay Ltd Clark Pipeline Services Reytec Constr Resources
PROJ NO 18026A (SEGMENT 1) - BASE BID 1 3636 S Alameda #B153 1402 Holly Rd 401 Corn Products Rd 6229 Leopard St 1901 Hollister
RFB #3127 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080
ITEM DESCRIPTION | UNIT| QTyY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
SUBTOTAL PART 1D - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS S 805,203.84 S 816,575.10 $ 1,386,627.25 S 943,255.18 NO BID
PART 1E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS

1E1 [Mobilization (Max. 5% of Part 1E) LS 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 21,900.00 | $ 21,900.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 0
1E2 |Remove and Salvage Existing Fire Hydrant EA 1,680.00 | S 1,680.00 | $ 2,140.00 | $ 2,140.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 874.40 | $ 874.40 0
1E3  [Remove Existing 6" PVC Waterline LF 91 2240 | S 2,038.40 | $ 25.00 | $ 2,275.00 | $ 33.00|$ 3,003.00 | $ 34.40|$ 3,130.40 0
1E4 [Remove Existing 6" CIP Waterline LF 580 28.00 | $ 16,240.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 17,400.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 22,620.00 | $ 50.40 | $ 29,232.00 0
1E5 [Remove Existing 6" ACP Waterline LF 496 28.00 | $ 13,888.00 | $ 43,00 | $ 21,328.00 | $ 56.00 | $ 27,776.00 | $ 62.00 | $ 30,752.00 0
1E6 |Remove Existing 8" Waterline LF 40 4480 | S 1,792.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 59.00 | $ 2,360.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 2,160.00 0
1E7 |Remove Existing 12" Waterline LF 43 56.00 | $ 2,408.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 1,935.00 | $ 59.00 | $ 2,537.00 | $ 57.00 | $ 2,451.00 0
1E8 |Remove Existing CIP Waterline to Gateway Lift| LF 40 28.00 | $ 1,120.00 | $ 3200 |$ 1,280.00 | $ 42.00 | S 1,680.00 | $ 62.00 | $ 2,480.00 0
1E9 [Remove Water Service LF 196 4480 | $ 8,780.80 | $ 35.00 | $ 6,860.00 | $ 4500 | $ 8,820.00 | $ 3360 | $ 6,585.60 0
1E10 |Remove Water Meter EA 9 224.00 | $ 2,016.00 | $ 189.00 | $ 1,701.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 2,250.00 | $ 1,482.00 | $ 13,338.00 0
1E11 |6" DIP Waterline (Class 350) LF 101 112.00 | $ 11,312.00 | $ 522.00 | $ 52,722.00 | $ 680.00 | $ 68,680.00 | $ 184.80 | $ 18,664.80 0
1E12 |8" C900 PVC Waterline LF | 1,120 85.00 | $ 95,200.00 | $ 86.00 | $ 96,320.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 123,200.00 | $ 8490 | $ 95,088.00 0
1E13 12" C900 PVC Waterline LF 44 88.00 | $ 3,872.00 | $ 153.00 | $ 6,732.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 8,800.00 | $ 125.35 | $ 5,515.40 0
1E14 |Pipe Trench Safety LF | 1,265 550 (% 6,957.50 | $ 6.93|$ 8,766.45 | $ 9.00 | $ 11,385.00 | $ 240|$ 3,036.00 0
1E15 |Well Pointing LF | 1,265 43.00 | $ 54,395.00 | $ 4500 | $ 56,925.00 | $ 59.00 | $ 74,635.00 | $ 84.00 | $ 106,260.00 0
1E16 |6" DI 45° Bend EA 4 616.00 | $ 2,464.00 | $ 285.00 | $ 1,140.00 | $ 370.00 | $ 1,480.00 | $ 202.80 | $ 811.20 0
1E17 |6" DI 90° Bend EA 4 632.50 | $ 2,530.00 | $ 336.00 | $ 1,344.00 | $ 440.00 | $ 1,760.00 | $ 247.20 | $ 988.80 0
1E18 |8" DI 45° Bend EA 2 660.00 | $ 1,320.00 | $ 361.00 | $ 722.00 | $ 470.00 | $ 940.00 | $ 267.60 | $ 535.20 0
1E19 |8" Gate Valve & Box EA 4 1,792.00 | $ 7,168.00 | $ 1,450.00 | $ 5,800.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 7,600.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 6,000.00 0
1E20 |12"11.25° Bend EA 2 825.00 | $ 1,650.00 | $ 556.00 | $ 1,112.00 | $ 720.00 | $ 1,440.00 | $ 434.40 | $ 868.80 0
1E21 |12" Gate Valve & Box EA 1 2,695.00 | $ 2,695.00 | $ 2,740.00 | $ 2,740.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 3,043.20 | $ 3,043.20 0
1E22 |8" x 6" Reducer EA 2 550.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 314.00 | $ 628.00 | $ 410.00 | $ 820.00 | $ 288.00 | $ 576.00 0
1E23 |8" Tee EA 2 770.00 | $ 1,540.00 | $ 514.00 | $ 1,028.00 | $ 670.00 | $ 1,340.00 | $ 399.60 | $ 799.20 0
1E24 [12"x8" Reducer EA 1 715.00 | $ 715.00 | $ 44400 | $ 444,00 | $ 580.00 | $ 580.00 | $ 1,478.40 | $ 1,478.40 0

1625 Adjust. 8" Waterline (I.nc.ludes 60 LF DIP EA 5
Waterline and All Req'd Fittings) 6,944.00 | $ 34,720.00 | $ 9,670.00 | $ 48,350.00 | $ 12,600.00 | $ 63,000.00 | $ 10,452.00 | $ 52,260.00 0

1£26 E::Eiercetd IEic')cti:;(lss)t\I/r\:iih e(3)m:ivccou\:)vlli-ng(ISnycsléer':” EA 3
1,705.00 | $ 5,115.00 | $ 7,050.00 | $ 21,150.00 | $ 9,200.00 | $ 27,600.00 | $ 1,620.00 | $ 4,860.00 0

1e27 E::Eiercetd IEic')cti::ss)t\I/:igth f)m:iCCPou\:)vlli-ng( ISnycsléeri” EA 1
1,705.00 | $ 1,705.00 | $ 7,050.00 | $ 7,050.00 | $ 9,200.00 | $ 9,200.00 | $ 2,226.00 | $ 2,226.00 0

S S EY I
2,062.50 | $ 2,062.50 | $ 6,920.00 | $ 6,920.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 2,310.00 | $ 2,310.00 0
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LAGUNA SHORES RD - GRAHAM TO SPID

Mako Contracting

Haas-Anderson Constr

Bay Ltd

Clark Pipeline Services

Reytec Constr Resources

PROJ NO 18026A (SEGMENT 1) - BASE BID 1 3636 S Alameda #B153 1402 Holly Rd 401 Corn Products Rd 6229 Leopard St 1901 Hollister
RFB #3127 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT| QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
1E29 |Connect to Existing 12" WL (Incl. All Required F| EA 1 2,750.00 | S 2,750.00 7,060.00 | S 7,060.00 | $ 9,200.00 | S 9,200.00 | $ 4,920.00 | $ 4,920.00
1E30 |[Fire Hydrant Assembly (Type 2) EA 1 11,200.00 | $ 11,200.00 9,250.00 | $ 9,250.00 | $ 12,100.00 | $ 12,100.00 | $ 5,779.20 | $ 5,779.20 0
1631 1" PE Water Service (Incl. Service Saddle, Corp LF 184
Stop, PE, and Reconnection) 14224 | $ 26,172.16 | $ 78.00 | $ 14,352.00 100.00 | $ 18,400.00 | $ 57.17 | $ 10,519.28 0
1E32 |Allowance for Unanticipated Water Improveme| AL 1 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART 1E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS S 351,606.36 S 439,174.45 S 558,606.00 S 445,542.88 NO BID
PART 1F - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS
1F1 Mobilization (Max. 5% of Part 1F) LS 1 25,000.00 | S 25,000.00 | $ 45,500.00 | $ 45,500.00 | $ 45,000.00 | $ 45,000.00 | $ 37,200.00 | S 37,200.00 0
16 Rehab 8" Wastewater Line (Static Pipe LF 589
Bursting w/ IPS DR 17) (10'-18') 13440 $ 79,161.60 | $ 194.00 | $ 114,266.00 | $ 270.00 | S 159,030.00 | $ 354.56 | S 208,835.84 0
1F3 Remove Existing 12" VCP Wastewater LF 221 56.00 | $ 12,376.00 | $ 53.00 | $ 11,713.00 | $ 69.00 | $ 15,249.00 | $ 56.40 | $ 12,464.40 0
1F4 Remove Existing 10" CIP Force Main LF 93 56.00 | $ 5,208.00 | $ 41.00 | S 3,813.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 5,022.00 | $ 52.80 | $ 4,910.40 0
1F5 |Remove Existing 18" PVC Force Main LF 102 56.00 | $ 5,712.00 | $ 48.00 | S 4,896.00 | $ 63.00 | $ 6,426.00 | $ 7050 | $ 7,191.00 0
1F6 |Remove Wastewater Service LF 186 2240 (S 4,166.40 | $ 52.00 | $§ 9,672.00 | $ 68.00 | $ 12,648.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 22,320.00 0
1F7 6" C900 (DR-18) PVC (8'-10'") LF 187 95.20 | S 17,802.40 | $ 145.00 | $ 27,115.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 35,530.00 | $ 95.00 | S 17,765.00 0
1F8 12" C900 (DR-18) PVC (8'-10") LF 34 14560 | $ 4,950.40 | $ 166.00 | $ 5,644.00 | $ 220.00 | S 7,480.00 | $ 22415 | S 7,621.10 0
1F9 10" DI Force Main LF 107 207.20 | S 22,170.40 | $ 713.00 | S 76,291.00 | $ 930.00 | $ 99,510.00 | $ 23539 | S 25,186.73 0
1F10 |18" DI Force Main LF 117 263.20 | S 30,794.40 | $ 926.00 | $ 108,342.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 140,400.00 | $ 387.00 | $ 45,279.00 0
1F11 |Pipe Trench Safety LF 445 28.00 | $ 12,460.00 | $ 32.00 | $ 14,240.00 | $ 42.00 | S 18,690.00 | $ 720 | S 3,204.00 0
1F12 |Well Pointing LF 445 39.20 | $ 17,444.00 | $ 81.00 | S 36,045.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 48,950.00 | $ 84.00 | S 37,380.00 0
1F13 |[16" Dia. 3/8" Steel Casing (Welded) LF 48 21840 | S 10,483.20 | $ 266.00 | S 12,768.00 | $ 350.00 | S 16,800.00 | $ 16693 | $ 8,012.64 0
1F14 30" Dia. 3/8" Steel Casing (Welded) EA 48 252.00 | S 12,096.00 | $ 344.00 | S 16,512.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 21,600.00 | $ 315.66 | S 15,151.68 0
1F15 |10" 45° Bend EA 2 784.00 | S 1,568.00 | $ 1,070.00 | $ 2,140.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 694.80 | S 1,389.60 0
1F16 [10" 90° Bend EA 4 868.00 | $ 3,472.00 | $ 1,360.00 | $ 5,440.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 7,200.00 | $ 940.80 | $ 3,763.20 0
1F17 |25000 EA 2 2,576.00 | S 5,152.00 | $ 2,520.00 | S 5,040.00 | $ 3,300.00 | S 6,600.00 | $ 2,019.60 | S 4,039.20 0
1F18 [18"90° Bend EA 4 2,576.00 | S 10,304.00 | $ 2,830.00 | S 11,320.00 | $ 3,700.00 | S 14,800.00 | $ 2,282.40 | S 9,129.60 0
1F19 |Air Release Valve EA 2 5,040.00 | S 10,080.00 | $ 9,980.00 | S 19,960.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 26,000.00 | $ 10,920.00 | $ 21,840.00 0
1F20 |4' Diameter Manhole VF 2 8,960.00 | S 17,920.00 | $ 20,400.00 | S 40,800.00 | $ 26,600.00 | S 53,200.00 | $ 12,913.20 | $ 25,826.40 0
1F21 |Manhole Extra Depth (> 6') EA 7 1,120.00 | $ 7,840.00 | $ 729.00 | S 5,103.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 6,650.00 | $ 588.00 | S 4,116.00 0
1F22 |Manhole Trench Safety EA 2 1,120.00 | $ 2,240.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 5,200.00 | $ 10,400.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 2,400.00 0
New Wastewater Service Lateral (with C/0)
1F23 |(Incl. Well Pointing and Trench Safety, as| EA 9
Needed) 3,584.00 | $ 32,256.00 | $ 6,980.00 | S 62,820.00 | $ 9,100.00 | S 81,900.00 | $ 6,850.80 | S 61,657.20 0
1624 Remove Sewage and Grout Fill Bottom of EA 1
Existing 4' Manhole to Flowline 1,680.00 | $ 1,680.00 | $ 3,440.00 | S 3,440.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 0
1F25 Rehabilitate Existing Manhole with F/G Liner EA 3
and New 24" Ring and Cover 6,720.00 | S 20,160.00 | $ 11,300.00 | $ 33,900.00 | $ 14,700.00 | $ 44,100.00 | $ 12,082.80 | $ 36,248.40 0
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LAGUNA SHORES RD - GRAHAM TO SPID

Mako Contracting

Haas-Anderson Constr

Bay Ltd

Clark Pipeline Services

Reytec Constr Resources

PROJ NO 18026A (SEGMENT 1) - BASE BID 1 3636 S Alameda #B153 1402 Holly Rd 401 Corn Products Rd 6229 Leopard St 1901 Hollister
RFB #3127 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT| QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
1626 Adjust 10" Force Main (Includes 60 LF DIP EA 4
Force Main and All Req'd Fittings) 13,440.00 | $ 53,760.00 | $ 8,860.00 | S 35,440.00 | $ 11,600.00 | $ 46,400.00 | $ 19,461.60 | $ 77,846.40 0
1F27 Adjust 18" Force Main (Includes 60 LF DIP EA 4
Force Main and All Req'd Fittings) 22,960.00 | S 91,840.00 | $ 8,860.00 | S 35,440.00 | $ 11,600.00 | $ 46,400.00 | $ 29,019.60 | S 116,078.40 0
1F28 |Adjust Existing Wastewater Manhole EA 13 1,064.00 | $ 13,832.00 | $ 4,230.00 | $ 54,990.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 71,500.00 | $ 2,070.00 | S 26,910.00 0
1F29 |Adjust Existing Valve Box EA 1 168.00 | $ 168.00 | $ 603.00 | S 603.00 | $ 790.00 | S 790.00 | $ 840.00 | $ 840.00 0
1F30 |Connect to Existing 10" CIP Force Main EA 2 728.00 | S 1,456.00 | $ 6,240.00 | S 12,480.00 | $ 8,100.00 | S 16,200.00 | $ 3,390.00 | S 6,780.00 0
1F31 |Connect to Existing 18" PVC Force Main EA 2 896.00 | $ 1,792.00 | $ 6,910.00 | S 13,820.00 | $ 9,000.00 | S 18,000.00 | $ 3,747.60 | S 7,495.20 0
1F32 |Connect to Existing Wastewater Manhole EA 4 1,680.00 | S 6,720.00 | $ 6,040.00 | $ 24,160.00 | $ 7,900.00 | $ 31,600.00 | $ 3,720.00 | S 14,880.00 0
1F33 Connect Existing Wastewater Line to Proposed EA 4
Manhole 1,680.00 | $ 6,720.00 | $ 6,040.00 | S 24,160.00 | $ 7,900.00 | S 31,600.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 16,800.00 0
1F34 Allowance for Unanticipated Wastewater AL 1
Improvements 25,000.00 | S 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | S 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | S 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | S 25,000.00 0
SUBTOTAL PART 1F - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS S 573,784.80 S 910,873.00 $ 1,177,975.00 S 924,561.39 NO BID
PART 1G - REDHEAD POND MITIGATION
1G1 Mobilization (Max. 5% Part of 1G) LS 1 S 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 7,000.00 | S 7,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | S 35,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | S 6,000.00 0
1G2 Silt Fence LF 1,000 |$ 425 (S 4,250.00 | $ 505|$ 5,050.00 | $ 820 (S 8,200.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 6,000.00 0
1G3 Rock Filter Dam EA 3 S 500.00 | S 1,500.00 | $ 748.00 | S 2,244.00 | $ 4,400.00 | $ 13,200.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 0
1G4 Revegetation (Hydromulch) Sy 877 |S 150 | $ 1,31550 | $ 155 ]S 1,359.35 | $ 5.00|$ 4,385.00 | $ 3.00 (S 2,631.00 0
1G5 Remove Existing 15" RCP LF 6 S 25.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 88.00 | S 528.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 42.00 | S 252.00 0
1G6 Remove Existing 18" RCP LF 706 S 30.00 | $ 21,180.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 9,884.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 38,830.00 | $ 42.00 | S 29,652.00 0
1G7 Remove Existing 30" RCP LF 27 S 35.00 | $ 945.00 | $ 39.00 | $ 1,053.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 42.00 | S 1,134.00 0
Remove Existing Grate Inlet & Concrete Flume | EA 1
1G8 S 2,000.00 | S 2,000.00 | $ 1,070.00 | $ 1,070.00 | $ 5,900.00 | $ 5,900.00 | $ 14,400.00 | $ 14,400.00 0
1G9 Remove Existing Bollard & Cable Fence LF 21 S 20.00 | $ 420.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 252.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 3,780.00 | $ 48.00 | S 1,008.00 0
Remove & Replace Existing Chainlink Fence LF 22
1G10 S 7935 | $ 1,745.70 | $ 79.00 | $ 1,738.00 | $ 170.00 | $ 3,740.00 | $ 130.80 | $ 2,877.60 0
1G11 Ditch Excavation cYy 650 S 1250 | $ 8,125.00 | $ 31.00 | $ 20,150.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 71,500.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 39,000.00 0
1G12 5" Concrete Riprap SY 516 S 86.00 | S 44,376.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 85,140.00 | $ 200.00 | S 103,200.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 61,920.00 0
1G13 Bollard & Cable Fence LF 8 S 126.50 | $ 1,012.00 | $ 127.00 | $ 1,016.00 | $ 530.00 | S 4,240.00 | $ 132.00 | $ 1,056.00 0
1G14 Metal Beam Guard Fence LF 56 82.80 | S 4,636.80 | $ 44.00 | S 2,464.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 112.80 | $ 6,316.80 0
1G15 Articulated Concrete Block Matting SY 83 130.00 | $ 10,790.00 | $ 145.00 | $ 12,035.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 13,280.00 | $ 6240 | $ 5,179.20 0
SUBTOTAL PART 1G - REDHEAD POND MITIGATION S 107,446.00 S 150,983.35 $ 312,365.00 S 189,426.60 NO BID
PART 1H - LAGUNA SHORES LIVING SHORELINE
1H1 Additional Mobilization LS 1 S 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 12,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 25000( $ 25,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | S 60,000.00
1H2 Construction Surveys LS 1 S 8,000.00 | S 8,000.00 5,920.00 | $ 5,920.00 115500( $ 115,500.00 | $ 120,000.00 | $ 120,000.00
1H3 Graded Riprap LF 495 S 200.00 | S 99,000.00 394.00 | S 195,030.00 | $ 720.00 | S 356,400.00 | $ 66.00 | $ 32,670.00 0

Page 7 of 8




LAGUNA SHORES RD - GRAHAM TO SPID

Mako Contracting

Haas-Anderson Constr

Bay Ltd

Clark Pipeline Services

Reytec Constr Resources

PROJ NO 18026A (SEGMENT 1) - BASE BID 1 3636 S Alameda #B153 1402 Holly Rd 401 Corn Products Rd 6229 Leopard St 1901 Hollister
RFB #3127 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT| QTY | UNITPR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT

1H4 Geotextile SY 800 S 10.00 | $ 8,000.00 9.70 | $§ 7,760.00 11.75 | $ 9,400.00 | $ 1440 | S 11,520.00 0
1H5 Marsh Fill cYy 165 S 35.00 | $ 5,775.00 37.00 | $ 6,105.00 120.00 | $ 19,800.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 49,500.00 0
1H6 Marsh Planting LS 1 $ 12,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 31,600.00 | $ 31,600.00 41,300.00 | S 41,300.00 [ $ 1,140,000.00 | $ 1,140,000.00 0

SUBTOTAL PART 1H - LAGUNA SHORES LIVING SHORELINE S 135,275.00 S 258,415.00 S 567,400.00 S 1,413,690.00 NO BID
TOTAL BASE BID 1 - (PARTS 1A THRU 1H) S 3,548,277.14 S 4,103,139.47 S 6,217,350.40 S 6,300,962.65 NO BID
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