
BID DATE: Wed., August 5, 2020

RFB #3129
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT

2A1 Mobilization (Max. 5% of Part 2A) LS 1 15,000.00$        15,000.00$               
2A2 Bonds & Insurance (Base Bid 2) AL 1 105,000.00$      105,000.00$             
2A3 Traffic Control Mobilization/Adjustments LS 1 12,000.00$        12,000.00$               

2A4
Traffic Control Items (Signs, Barricades,
Channelizing Devices, LPCB, etc.)

MO 13
13,000.00$        169,000.00$             

2A5 Ozone Advisory Day DAYS 3 500.00$             1,500.00$                 
2A6 Storm Water Pollution Prevention Plan LS 1 10,000.00$        10,000.00$               
2A7 Rock Filter Dam EA 3 750.00$             2,250.00$                 
2A8 Silt Fence LF 1,158 5.00$                  5,790.00$                 
2A9 Revegetation (Hydromulch) SY 14,652 2.00$                  29,304.00$               

2A10
Contingency Allowance for Unanticipated
Disposal of Contaminated Groundwater

AL 1
5,000.00$          5,000.00$                 

354,844.00$            NO BID NO BID NO BID

2B1 Mobilization (Max. 5% of Part 2B) LS 1 60,000.00$        60,000.00$               

2B2
Removal of Sign and Sign Support 
Assembly

EA 18
75.00$                1,350.00$                 

2B3 Remove Existing Metal Beam Guard Rail LF 38 6.00$                  228.00$                    

2B4
Pulverize & Recompact Existing Roadway
Pavement

SY 1,208
12.00$                14,496.00$               

2B5 Street Excavation (1' Beyond E.O.P.) SY 21,234 11.00$                233,574.00$             

2B6
10" Cement Stabilized Subgrade
Preparation (1' Beyond E.O.P.)

SY 22,442
26.00$                583,492.00$             

2B7
6" Reinforced Concrete Pavement (4,000 
psi)

SY 21,195
73.00$                1,547,235.00$         

2B8
Level Up Mill (0"-1") & 1 1/2" HMAC Type 
D Overlay

SY 11,350
18.00$                204,300.00$             

2B9 Full Depth Pavement Repair SY 1,035 115.00$             119,025.00$             

1402 Holly Rd
CC, TX  78411

TABULATION OF BIDS
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT DEPT.

LAGUNA SHORES RD - MEDITERRANEAN TO WYNDALE Reytec Constr Resources Bay Ltd Clark Pipeline ServicesHaas-Anderson Constr
PROJ NO 18025A (SEGMENT 3) - BASE BID 2 1901 Hollister 401 Corn Products Rd 6229 Leopard

Houston, TX  77080 CC, TX  78409 CC, TX  78409

PART 2A - GENERAL 

PART 2B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS 
SUBTOTAL PART 2A - GENERAL
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2B10
Concrete Driveway (Incl. Existing
Driveway Removal)

SF 12,821
10.00$                128,210.00$             

2B11
Pavement Markings (24" Wide, White, 
Type C Hear Applied, 125 mil, Preformed 
Thermoplastic "Stop Bar" Marking Lines)

LF 321
14.00$                4,494.00$                 

2B12
Pavement Marking, Reflectorized
Thermoplastic, Type I, 90 mil thickness –
Yellow 4” Solid 

LF 2,459
0.80$                  1,967.20$                 

2B13
Pavement Marking, Reflectorized
Thermoplastic, Type I, 90 mil thickness –
Yellow 4” Broken

LF 940
1.50$                  1,410.00$                 

2B14
Pavement Marking, Reflectorized
Thermoplastic, Type I, 90 mil thickness –
White 4” Solid 

LF 9,479
0.80$                  7,583.20$                 

2B15
TYII-A-A Raised Pavement Marker
(Reflectorized)

EA 80
6.00$                  480.00$                    

2B16
TYII-B-B Raised Pavement Market
(Reflectorized)

EA 15
15.00$                225.00$                    

2B17
Type 2 Object Marker with Flexible Post
(OM-2Z) (FLX)

EA 6
90.00$                540.00$                    

2B18
Combo Stop Sign (R1-1) (30"x30") / Street
Name Sign (Incl. Metal Pole and
Foundation)

EA 25
650.00$             16,250.00$               

2B19
Stop Sign (R1-1) (30"x30") (Incl. Metal
Pole and Foundation)

EA 4
535.00$             2,140.00$                 

2B20
All Way (R1-3P) (18"x6') (Incl. Metal Pole
and Foundation)

EA 3
340.00$             1,020.00$                 

2B21
Dead End (W14-1aR(L)) (36"x8') (Incl.
Metal Pole and Foundation)

EA 5
370.00$             1,850.00$                 

2B22
Stop Ahead (W3-1) (30"x30") (Incl. Metal
Pole and Foundation)

EA 4
445.00$             1,780.00$                 
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2B23
Speed Limit Sign (R2-1) (24"x30") (Incl.
Metal Pole and Foundation)

EA 4
420.00$             1,680.00$                 

2B24
Curve (W1-2R) (30"x30") (Incl. Metal Pole
and Foundation)

EA 1
445.00$             445.00$                    

2B25
Curve (W1-2L) (30"x30") (Incl. Metal Pole
and Foundation)

EA 1
445.00$             445.00$                    

2B26
Two Direction Large Arrow (W1-7T)
(96"x36") (Incl. Metal Pole and
Foundation)

EA 3
1,000.00$          3,000.00$                 

2B27
Road Ends (W14-1T) (30"x30") (Incl.
Metal Pole and Foundation)

EA 1
445.00$             445.00$                    

2B28 Dead End Barricade (Type 3) LF 20 50.00$                1,000.00$                 
2B29 Traffic Rail - Type 631LS LF 261 85.00$                22,185.00$               
2B30 Guardrail Terminal EA 3 6,000.00$          18,000.00$               
2B31 Erosion Control Matting (TRM) SY 15,214 22.00$                334,708.00$             
2B32 Select Fill Embankment CY 2,041 28.00$                57,148.00$               

2B33
Articulated Concrete Block Matting 
(Revetment)

SY 386
160.00$             61,760.00$               

2B34
Allowance for Unanticipated Street 
Improvements

AL 1
25,000.00$        25,000.00$               

3,457,465.40$         NO BID NO BID NO BID

2C1 Mobilization (Max. 5% of Part 2C) LS 1 1,500.00$          1,500.00$                 
2C2 Remove & Salvage Existing RTA Bench EA 1 80.00$                80.00$                       
2C3 Concrete Bus Pad SY 320 125.00$             40,000.00$               
2C4 Concrete Landing Pad SF 240 24.00$                5,760.00$                 

47,340.00$               NO BID NO BID NO BID

2D1 Mobilization (Max. 5% of Part 2D) LS 1 50,000.00          50,000.00$               
2D2 Remove 12" RCP LF 865 5.00                    4,325.00$                 
2D3 Remove 15" RCP LF 1,089 5.00                    5,445.00$                 
2D4 Remove 18" RCP LF 492 6.00                    2,952.00$                 

PART 2C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS

SUBTOTAL PART 2C - RTA IMPROVEMENTS

SUBTOTAL PART 2B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS

PART 2D - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS
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2D5 Remove 24" RCP LF 259 12.00                  3,108.00$                 
2D6 Remove Existing Concrete Junction Box EA 3 250.00                750.00$                    

2D7
Ditch Excavation and 
Regrading/Reshaping

LF 8,334
12.00                  100,008.00$             

2D8 18" Class III RCP LF 502 116.00                58,232.00$               
2D9 24" Class III RCP LF 79 153.00                12,087.00$               

2D10
13.5"x22" Class III Reinforced Concrete 
Arch Pipe

LF 1,113
233.00                259,329.00$             

2D11
18"x28.5" Class III Reinforced Concrete 
Arch Pipe

LF 94
261.00                24,534.00$               

2D12 18" Class IV RCP LF 533 121.00                64,493.00$               
2D13 24" Class IV RCP LF 103 175.00                18,025.00$               

2D14
13.5"x22" Class IV Reinforced Concrete 
Arch Pipe

LF 118
265.00                31,270.00$               

2D15
18"x28.5" Class IV Reinforced Concrete 
Arch Pipe

LF 1,292
295.00                381,140.00$             

2D16
22.5"x36.25" Class IV Reinforced Concrete 
Arch Pipe

LF 369
390.00                143,910.00$             

2D17
26.625"x43.75" Class IV Reinforced
Concrete Arch Pipe

LF 134
525.00                70,350.00$               

2D18 5'x2' Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert LF 69 540.00                37,260.00$               
2D19 5'x3' Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert LF 27 540.00                14,580.00$               
2D20 6'x2' Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert LF 496 600.00                297,600.00$             
2D21 10'x3' Reinforced Concrete Box Culvert LF 107 1,500.00            160,500.00$             
2D22 Pipe Trench Safety LF 5,036 0.50                    2,518.00$                 
2D23 Well Pointing LF 5,036 25.00                  125,900.00$             
2D24 3'-6"x4' Type B Manhole EA 1 4,200.00            4,200.00$                 
2D25 4'x4' Type B Manhole EA 2 4,200.00            8,400.00$                 

2D26
4'-6"x4' Junction Box with Grate/Frame 
Unit

EA 1
4,700.00            4,700.00$                 

2D27 4'x8'-2" Junction Box & Manhole EA 3 8,200.00            24,600.00$               
2D28 4'x8'-4" Junction Box & Manhole EA 1 7,900.00            7,900.00$                 
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2D29 4'x10' Junction Box & Manhole EA 1 8,700.00            8,700.00$                 
2D30 5'x8' Junction Box & Manhole EA 1 8,500.00            8,500.00$                 
2D31 5'-6"x8' Junction Box & Manhole EA 1 8,600.00            8,600.00$                 
2D32 7'x4' Junction Box & Manhole EA 1 6,500.00            6,500.00$                 
2D33 7'x7' Junction Box & Manhole EA 1 11,200.00          11,200.00$               
2D34 7'x8'-2" Junction Box & Manhole EA 1 12,800.00          12,800.00$               
2D35 7'x10' Junction Box & Manhole EA 1 14,400.00          14,400.00$               
2D36 10'x8' Junction Box & Manhole EA 1 16,600.00          16,600.00$               
2D37 City Standard Grate Inlet EA 2 3,400.00            6,800.00$                 

2D38
Manhole/Junction Box/Grate Inlet Trench 
Safety

EA 18
200.00                3,600.00$                 

2D39
Headwall/Wingwalls for Yorktown 
Channel

EA 2
51,000.00          102,000.00$             

2D40 Headwall for 24" RCP EA 2 4,400.00            8,800.00$                 
2D41 5" Concrete Rip Rap for Yorktown Ditch SF 938 11.00                  10,318.00$               

2D42 Safety End Treatment (Type II) (3:1) (18") EA 2
2,200.00            4,400.00$                 

2D43 Safety End Treatment (Type II) (6:1) (18") EA 29
3,000.00            87,000.00$               

2D44 Safety End Treatment (Type II) (3:1) (24") EA 5
3,100.00            15,500.00$               

2D45 Safety End Treatment (Type II) (6:1) (24") EA 1
3,800.00            3,800.00$                 

2D46
Safety End Treatment (Type II) (3:1) 
(13.5"x22")

EA 23
3,100.00            71,300.00$               

2D47
Safety End Treatment (Type II) (6:1) 
(13.5"x22")

EA 29
3,600.00            104,400.00$             

2D48
Safety End Treatment (Type II) (6:1) 
(18"x28.5")

EA 6
5,600.00            33,600.00$               

2D49
Safety End Treatment (Type II) (6:1)
(26.625"x43.75")

EA 6
10,500.00          63,000.00$               

2D50 4" Concrete Slope Protection SF 228 13.00                  2,964.00$                 
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2D51 Clean Out Existing 5'x3' Box Culvert LF 720 14.00                  10,080.00$               

2D52
Connect Existing 18" CPP to Proposed 
Manhole

EA 1
900.00                900.00$                    

2D53 Temporary Cofferdam EA 1 60,000.00          60,000.00$               

2D54
Allowance for Unanticipated Drainage
Improvements

AL 1
10,000.00          10,000.00$               

2,603,878.00$         NO BID NO BID NO BID

2E1 Mobilization (Max. 5% of Part 2E) LS 1 10,000.00          10,000.00$               

2E2 Remove and Salvage Existing Fire Hydrant EA 5
646.00                3,230.00$                 

2E3 Remove 4" CIP Waterline LF 80 17.00                  1,360.00$                 
2E4 Remove 6" CIP Waterline LF 93 17.00                  1,581.00$                 
2E5 Remove 12" PVC Waterline LF 29 19.00                  551.00$                    
2E6 Remove 12" DIP Waterline LF 71 20.00                  1,420.00$                 
2E7 4" C900 PVC Waterline LF 80 145.00                11,600.00$               
2E8 6" C900 PVC Waterline LF 93 147.00                13,671.00$               
2E9 12" C900 PVC Waterline LF 29 222.00                6,438.00$                 

2E10 12" DIP Waterline (Class 350) LF 71 282.00                20,022.00$               
2E11 Pipe Trench Safety LF 273 5.00                    1,365.00$                 
2E12 6"x4" Tee EA 1 434.00                434.00$                    
2E13 4" Gate Valve & Box EA 2 1,120.00            2,240.00$                 
2E14 6" Gate Valve & Box EA 1 1,250.00            1,250.00$                 

2E15
Adjust 6" Waterline (Includes 60 LF DIP
Waterline and All Req'd Fittings)

EA 4
8,500.00            34,000.00$               

2E16
Adjust 8" Waterline (Includes 60 LF DIP
Waterline and All Req'd Fittings)

EA 1
9,200.00            9,200.00$                 

2E17
Adjust 12" Waterline (Includes 60 LF DIP
Waterline and All Req'd Fittings)

EA 12
10,800.00          129,600.00$             

2E18
Connect to Existing 4" CIP WL (Incl. All
Required Fittings) with Omni Coupling
System

EA 2
3,600.00            7,200.00$                 

PART 2E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS
SUBTOTAL PART 2D - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS
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2E19
Connect to Existing 6" CIP WL (Incl. All
Required Fittings) with Omni Coupling
System

EA 2
2,650.00            5,300.00$                 

2E20
Connect to Existing 8" PVC WL (Incl. All
Required Fittings) with Omni Coupling
System

EA 1
3,800.00            3,800.00$                 

2E21
Connect to Existing 12" PVC WL (Incl. All
Required Fittings) with Omni Coupling
System

EA 4
3,800.00            15,200.00$               

2E22 Fire Hydrant Assembly EA 5 13,000.00          65,000.00$               

2E23
Allowance for Unanticipated Water 
Improvements

AL 1
10,000.00          10,000.00$               

354,462.00$            NO BID NO BID NO BID
-$                           

2F1 Mobilization (Max. 5% of Part 2F) LS 1 50,000.00          50,000.00$               

2F2
Rehab 8" Wastewater Line (Static Pipe
Bursting w/ IPS DR 17) (0'-10')

LF 2,069
120.00                248,280.00$             

2F3
Rehab 8" Wastewater Line (Static Pipe
Bursting w/ IPS DR 17) (10'-18')

LF 246
206.00                50,676.00$               

2F4
Rehab 10" Wastewater Line (Static Pipe
Bursting w/ IPS DR 17) (0'-10')

LF 644
150.00                96,600.00$               

2F5
Rehab 10" Wastewater Line (Static Pipe
Bursting w/ IPS DR 17) (10'-18')

LF 178
265.00                47,170.00$               

2F6
Rehab 15" Wastewater Line (Static Pipe
Bursting w/ IPS DR 17) (0'-10')

LF 93
165.00                15,345.00$               

2F7
Rehab 18" Wastewater Line (Static Pipe
Bursting w/ IPS DR 17) (10'-18')

LF 83
256.00                21,248.00$               

2F8 Remove Existing 8" VCP Wastewater LF 9 45.00                  405.00$                    
2F9 Remove Wastewater Service LF 250 14.00                  3,500.00$                 

2F10 8" C900 (DR-18) PVC (0-6') LF 36 171.00                6,156.00$                 
2F11 8" C900 (DR-18) PVC (6'-8') LF 40 200.00                8,000.00$                 
2F12 8" SDR 26 PVC (8'-10') LF 53 218.00                11,554.00$               

PART 2F - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS
SUBTOTAL PART 2E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS
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2F13 Pipe Trench Safety LF 129 20.00                  2,580.00$                 
2F14 Well Pointing LF 129 28.00                  3,612.00$                 
2F15 4' Diameter Manhole EA 22 10,600.00          233,200.00$             
2F16 Manhole Extra Depth (> 6') VF 40 154.00                6,160.00$                 
2F17 Manhole Trench Safety EA 22 200.00                4,400.00$                 

2F18
New Wastewater Service Lateral (with
C/O) (Incl. Well Pointing and Trench
Safety, as Needed)

EA 12
3,500.00            42,000.00$               

2F19
Rehabilitate Existing Manhole with F/G
Liner and New 24" Ring and Cover

EA 14
13,900.00          194,600.00$             

2F20
Adjust 8" Force Main (Includes 60 LF DIP
Force Main and All Req'd Fittings)

EA 3
14,000.00          42,000.00$               

2F21
Adjust 12" Force Main (Includes 60 LF DIP 
Force Main and All Req'd Fittings)

EA 3
16,500.00          49,500.00$               

2F22 Adjust Existing Wastewater Manhole EA 12 2,800.00            33,600.00$               

2F23 Connect to Existing Wastewater Manhole EA 6
1,800.00            10,800.00$               

2F24
Connect Existing Wastewater Line to
Proposed Manhole

EA 21
1,000.00            21,000.00$               

2F25 Reconnect Existing Wastewater Service EA 2 800.00                1,600.00$                 

2F26
Allowance for Unanticipated Wastewater
Improvements

AL 1
25,000.00          25,000.00$               

1,228,986.00$         NO BID NO BID NO BID

8,046,975.40$         NO BID NO BID NO BIDTOTAL BASE BID 2 - (PARTS 2A THRU 2F)

SUBTOTAL PART 2F - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS
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