
BID DATE: Wed., August 19, 2020

RFB #3183
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT

A - A1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART A) LS 1 2,000.00$       2,000.00$             6,547.19$       6,547.19$            8,000.00$        8,000.00$            
A - A2 BONDS AND INSURANCE AL 1 75,000.00$     75,000.00$           155,629.15$   155,629.15$        70,000.00$      70,000.00$          
A - A3

STORMWATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN 
(SWPPP) (PER STREET SEGMENT EXCLUDING 
SILT FENCE AND INLET PROTECTION) EA 13 1,500.00$       19,500.00$           3,000.00$       39,000.00$          1,500.00$        19,500.00$          

A - A4 SILT FENCE (FOR SWPPP) LF 500 3.30$               1,650.00$             10.00$             5,000.00$            6.00$                3,000.00$            
A - A5 INLET PROTECTION (FOR SWPPP) EA 43 200.00$          8,600.00$             150.00$           6,450.00$            200.00$            8,600.00$            
A - A6 OZONE ACTION DAYS DAY 13 12.00$             156.00$                 1.00$               13.00$                  100.00$            1,300.00$            
A - A7 TRAFFIC CONTROL (PLAN PREPARATION) EA 13 2,000.00$       26,000.00$           4,000.00$       52,000.00$          1,700.00$        22,100.00$          
A - A8 TRAFFIC CONTROL (MOBILIZATION, 

IMPLEMENTATION, AND ADJUSTMENTS) MO 35 2,000.00$       70,000.00$           1,000.00$       35,000.00$          1,800.00$        63,000.00$          
A - A9 DOOR HANGERS, PRINTED AND DELIVERED (2 

PER RESIDENCE) EA 604 1.30$               785.20$                 7.50$               4,530.00$            6.00$                3,624.00$            
A - A10 ALLOWANCES FOR UNANTICIPATED GENERAL 

ACTIVITIES AL 1 10,000.00$     10,000.00$           10,000.00$     10,000.00$          10,000.00$      10,000.00$          
213,691.20$        314,169.34$        209,124.00$       NO BID

A - B1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART B) LS 1 96,000.00$     96,000.00$           195,210.36$   195,210.36$        215,000.00$    215,000.00$       
A - B2

REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL OF EXISTING TOP 
LAYER OF PAVEMENT ASPHALT (0-2 INCH) SY 36413 2.60$               94,673.80$           4.00$               145,652.00$        3.00$                109,239.00$       

A - B3 REHABILITATION - REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL 
OF EXISTING TOP LAYER OF PAVEMENT 
ASPHALT OR BASE SY-IN 0 -$                 -$  4.00$               -$  -$                  -$  

A - B4 REHABILITATION - SURFACE PREPARATION SY 0 -$                 -$  8.00$               -$  -$                  -$  
A - B5 1.5 INCH HMAC (TYPE D) SY 0 -$                 -$  19.00$             -$  -$                  -$  
A - B6 2 INCH HMAC (TYPE D) SY 36413 15.50$             564,401.50$         20.00$             728,260.00$        16.75$              609,917.75$       

3636 S Alameda, #B153
CC, TX 78411

REBID "A" - PROJECT NO 18164A 102 Airport Rd 311 S Sunset Strip
A ORTIZ CONSTR & PAVING TIERRA LEASE SERVICE

TABULATION OF BIDS
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT DEPT.

MAKO CONTRACTING

PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS 

RESIEDENTIAL STREET REBUILD PROGRAM #JE CONSTRUCTION 
SERVICES 7505 UpRiver Rd

CC, TX  78409 CC, TX 78405 Kennedy, TX 78119

PART A - GENERAL 

SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL
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A - B7 3 INCH HMAC (TYPE D) SY 2667 22.00$             58,674.00$           25.00$             66,675.00$          25.00$              66,675.00$          
A - B8 PRIME COAT, MC-30 (0.20 GAL/SY) GAL 7283 4.00$               29,132.00$           5.00$               36,415.00$          6.75$                49,160.25$          
A - B9

   (    
2) SY-IN 243608 2.50$               609,020.00$         4.00$               974,432.00$        3.75$                913,530.00$       

A - B10 TENSAR GEOGRID (TX5) SY 6697 4.50$               30,136.50$           6.00$               40,182.00$          5.00$                33,485.00$          
A - B11 8 INCH LIME STABILIZED SUBGRADE SY 37846 10.50$             397,383.00$         18.00$             681,228.00$        17.25$              652,843.50$       
A - B12 12 INCH MOISTURE CONDITIONED 

COMPACTED SUBGRADE SY 36413 3.00$               109,239.00$         5.00$               182,065.00$        3.50$                127,445.50$       
A - B13 REHABILITATION - 8 INCH LIME TREATED BASE 

AND SUBGRADE SY 0 -$                 -$                       15.00$             -$                      -$                  -$                      
A - B14 REHABILITATION - CEMENT TREATED BASE 

AND SUBGRADE (MIN 4") SY-IN 0 -$                 -$                       18.00$             -$                      -$                  -$                      
A - B15 RECONSTRUCTION - STREET EXCAVATION (0-

12 INCH) SY 36413 5.50$               200,271.50$         10.00$             364,130.00$        14.00$              509,782.00$       
A - B16 RECONSTRUCTION - STREET EXCAVATION (12-

24 INCH) SY 6509 10.50$             68,344.50$           10.00$             65,090.00$          20.00$              130,180.00$       
A - B17 REHABILITATION - FULL DEPTH REPAIR SY 267 42.00$             11,214.00$           30.00$             8,010.00$            50.00$              13,350.00$          
A - B18 PAVEMENT REPAIR SF 596 14.00$             8,344.00$             6.00$               3,576.00$            25.00$              14,900.00$          
A - B19 RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS (TYPE II-B-B) 

(FIRE HYDRANT MARKING) EA 12 33.00$             396.00$                 10.00$             120.00$                28.00$              336.00$               
A - B20 CONCRETE DRIVEWAY DEMOLITION SF 37628 4.00$               150,512.00$         6.00$               225,768.00$        5.25$                197,547.00$       
A - B21 6-INCH CONCRETE DRIVEWAY SF 39925 8.00$               319,400.00$         9.00$               359,325.00$        13.50$              538,987.50$       
A - B22

ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING MANHOLE 
RING\COVER IN ROADWAY (SEWER, STORM) EA 18 900.00$          16,200.00$           1,500.00$       27,000.00$          2,800.00$        50,400.00$          

A - B23 ADJUSTMENT OF EXISTING VALVE BOX 
(WATER, GAS) EA 2 600.00$          1,200.00$             750.00$           1,500.00$            1,100.00$        2,200.00$            

A - B24 SPEED TABLE/SPEED HUMP EA 3 5,000.00$       15,000.00$           4,250.00$       12,750.00$          6,200.00$        18,600.00$          
A - B25 REMOVE EXISTING CHAIN LINK FENCE AND 

REPLACE WITH NEW LF 180 26.00$             4,680.00$             20.00$             3,600.00$            28.00$              5,040.00$            
A - B26 REMOVE EXISTING WOODEN FENCE AND 

REPLACE WITH NEW LF 100 26.00$             2,600.00$             20.00$             2,000.00$            23.00$              2,300.00$            
A - B27 NEW REGULATORY SIGNAGE EA 82 165.00$          13,530.00$           200.00$           16,400.00$          140.00$            11,480.00$          
A - B28 NEW STREET BLADE NAME SIGNS EA 86 200.00$          17,200.00$           250.00$           21,500.00$          165.00$            14,190.00$          
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A - B29 RELOCATION OF EXISTING SIGNAGE EA 10 330.00$          3,300.00$             300.00$           3,000.00$            275.00$            2,750.00$            
A - B30 REMOVAL OF EXISTING SIGNAGE EA 75 72.00$             5,400.00$             100.00$           7,500.00$            60.00$              4,500.00$            
A - B31 SIGN SUPPORT ASSEMBLY (WEDGE ANCHOR 

STEEL SYSTEM) EA 64 230.00$          14,720.00$           250.00$           16,000.00$          195.00$            12,480.00$          
A - B32 SIGN SUPPORT ASSEMBLY (TRIANGULAR 

SLIPBASE SYSTEM) EA 10 400.00$          4,000.00$             400.00$           4,000.00$            325.00$            3,250.00$            
A - B33

REMOVE AND REPLACE EXISTING MAILBOX EA 41 250.00$          10,250.00$           250.00$           10,250.00$          215.00$            8,815.00$            
A - B34 SODDING, CLEARING AND GRADING SY 6283 13.00$             81,679.00$           15.00$             94,245.00$          15.00$              94,245.00$          
A - B35 WATER SERVICE LINE ADJUSTMENTS LF 699 61.00$             42,639.00$           40.00$             27,960.00$          45.00$              31,455.00$          
A - B36 TYPE 'C' PREFABRICATED STOP BAR STRIPING 

(24-INCH) LF 98 23.00$             2,254.00$             20.00$             1,960.00$            20.00$              1,960.00$            
A - B37 TYPE 1 REFLECTIVE PAVEMENT MARKING 

(YELLOW) (SOLID) (4-INCH) LF 100 2.50$               250.00$                 2.00$               200.00$                2.25$                225.00$               
A - B38 RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS (TYPE II-A-A) EA 10 26.00$             260.00$                 15.00$             150.00$                22.25$              222.50$               
A - B39 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED STREET 

IMPROVEMENTS AL 1 25,000.00$     25,000.00$           25,000.00$     25,000.00$          25,000.00$      25,000.00$          
A - B40 SINGLE COURSE SURFACE TREATMENT SY 36413 4.00$               145,652.00$         5.00$               182,065.00$        5.00$                182,065.00$       

3,152,955.80$     4,533,218.36$    4,653,556.00$    NO BID

A - C1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART C) LS 1 4,000.00$             4,000.00$             40,171.73$     40,171.73$          35,000.00$      35,000.00$          
A - C2 4-INCH CONCRETE SIDEWALK SF 56190 7.03$                     395,015.70$         8.00$               449,520.00$        8.75$                491,662.50$       
A - C3 SIDEWALK DEMOLITION SF 51545 2.65$                     136,594.25$         5.00$               257,725.00$        4.50$                231,952.50$       
A - C4 CONCRETE CURB RAMP SF 5825 17.00$                   99,025.00$           25.00$             145,625.00$        17.00$              99,025.00$          
A - C5 CURB RAMP DEMOLITION SF 5675 3.50$                     19,862.50$           5.00$               28,375.00$          9.00$                51,075.00$          
A - C6 TYPE 'C' PREFABRICATED CROSSWALK 

STRIPING (12-INCH) LF 0 -$                       -$                       25.00$             -$                      -$                  -$                      
A - C7 TYPE 'C' PREFABRICATED CROSSWALK 

STRIPING (24-INCH) LF 573 23.00$                   13,179.00$           20.00$             11,460.00$          20.00$              11,460.00$          
667,676.45$        932,876.73$        920,175.00$       NO BID

A - D1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART D) LS 1  $       4,000.00 4,000.00$             62,038.35$     62,038.35$          60,000.00$      60,000.00$          
PART D - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS

SUBTOTAL PART C - ADA IMPROVEMENTS

SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS
PART C - ADA IMPROVEMENTS
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A - D2 DEMOLITION OF EXISTING INLET (0 - 5 FEET 
DEEP) EA 2  $       1,400.00 2,800.00$             1,500.00$       3,000.00$            1,500.00$        3,000.00$            

A - D3 EXISTING CURB INLET TOP ADJUSTMENT 
(REMOVE AND REPLACE, 5' THROAT TYP.) EA 35  $       1,500.00 52,500.00$           1,500.00$       52,500.00$          3,600.00$        126,000.00$       

A - D4 NEW CURB INLET (5' THROAT OPENING) (I.D. 
3.5' X 5')  0 - 5 FEET DEEP EA 9  $       5,000.00 45,000.00$           4,500.00$       40,500.00$          6,000.00$        54,000.00$          

A - D5 NEW CURB INLET (5' THROAT OPENING) (I.D. 
4.5' X 5')  5 - 10 FEET DEEP EA 4  $       5,500.00 22,000.00$           8,000.00$       32,000.00$          7,000.00$        28,000.00$          

A - D6 NEW CURB INLET EXTENSION (5' THROAT 
OPENING) (I.D. 2' X 5') EA 2  $       2,700.00 5,400.00$             2,000.00$       4,000.00$            5,000.00$        10,000.00$          

A - D7 NEW 4-INCH CURB AND GUTTER LF 500  $            28.00 14,000.00$           24.00$             12,000.00$          45.00$              22,500.00$          
A - D8 NEW 6-INCH CURB AND GUTTER LF 24389  $            23.00 560,947.00$         27.00$             658,503.00$        33.00$              804,837.00$       
A - D9 TYPE 'B' STORM MANHOLE (I.D. 4'X4')  0 - 5 

FEET DEEP EA 1  $       7,900.00 7,900.00$             6,200.00$       6,200.00$            9,000.00$        9,000.00$            
A - D10 TYPE 'C' STORM MANHOLE (I.D. 4'X4')  5 - 7 

FEET DEEP EA 1  $    11,000.00 11,000.00$           7,500.00$       7,500.00$            9,000.00$        9,000.00$            
A - D11 CURB & GUTTER DEMOLITION (4-INCH, 6-INCH 

AND DRIVEWAY) LF 24389  $              4.00 97,556.00$           7.00$               170,723.00$        8.00$                195,112.00$       
A - D12 VALLEY GUTTER SF 2190  $              9.00 19,710.00$           15.00$             32,850.00$          20.00$              43,800.00$          
A - D13 VALLEY GUTTER DEMOLITION SF 2190  $              6.00 13,140.00$           5.00$               10,950.00$          11.00$              24,090.00$          
A - D14 18-INCH ARCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE 

(CLASS IV) LF 581  $          217.00 126,077.00$         300.00$           174,300.00$        225.00$            130,725.00$       
A - D15 18-INCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS 

III) LF 458  $          107.00 49,006.00$           150.00$           68,700.00$          105.00$            48,090.00$          
A - D16 24-INCH ARCH REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE 

(CLASS III) LF 30  $          280.00 8,400.00$             350.00$           10,500.00$          220.00$            6,600.00$            
A - D17 CONCRETE COLLAR (18-24 INCH PIPE) EA 3  $          350.00 1,050.00$             1,500.00$       4,500.00$            1,400.00$        4,200.00$            
A - D18 CONCRETE COLLAR (36 INCH PIPE) EA 8  $          350.00 2,800.00$             2,000.00$       16,000.00$          1,550.00$        12,400.00$          
A - D19 REMOVAL OF REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (12 

- 15 INCH) LF 30  $            11.00 330.00$                 100.00$           3,000.00$            44.00$              1,320.00$            
A - D20 REMOVAL OF REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (18 

- 24 INCH) LF 30  $            23.00 690.00$                 100.00$           3,000.00$            44.00$              1,320.00$            
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A - D21 REMOVAL OF REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (36 
INCH) LF 24  $            40.00 960.00$                 100.00$           2,400.00$            44.00$              1,056.00$            

A - D22 TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER LINES (0 - 
5 FEET DEEP) LF 503  $              3.00 1,509.00$             28.00$             14,084.00$          11.00$              5,533.00$            

A - D23 TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER LINES (5 - 
10 FEET DEEP) LF 514  $              6.00 3,084.00$             30.00$             15,420.00$          17.00$              8,738.00$            

A - D24
TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER INLETS/ 
TYPE 'B' MANHOLE (0 - 5 FEET DEEP) EA 12  $          130.00 1,560.00$             1,500.00$       18,000.00$          125.00$            1,500.00$            

A - D25
TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORMWATER INLETS/ 
TYPE 'C' MANHOLE (5 - 10 FEET DEEP) EA 4  $          200.00 800.00$                 2,000.00$       8,000.00$            550.00$            2,200.00$            

A - D26 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED STORM 
WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1  $    10,000.00 10,000.00$           10,000.00$     10,000.00$          10,000.00$      10,000.00$          

1,062,219.00$     1,440,668.35$    1,623,021.00$    NO BID

A - E1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART E) LS 1  $       2,000.00 2,000.00$             3,836.25$       3,836.25$            1,500.00$        1,500.00$            
A - E2 6-INCH OR 8-INCH A.C.P. WATERLINE TO BE 

REMOVED AND DISPOSED LF 30  $            90.00 2,700.00$             200.00$           6,000.00$            110.00$            3,300.00$            
A - E3

6-INCH OR 8-INCH A.C.P. TO D.I. COUPLINGS EA 4  $          330.00 1,320.00$             750.00$           3,000.00$            1,100.00$        4,400.00$            
A - E4 6-INCH WATERLINE ADJUSTMENT EA 2  $       4,000.00 8,000.00$             6,000.00$       12,000.00$          6,100.00$        12,200.00$          
A - E5 8-INCH WATERLINE ADJUSTMENT EA 2  $       4,100.00 8,200.00$             6,750.00$       13,500.00$          6,700.00$        13,400.00$          
A - E6 FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY TYPE 1 (INCLUDES 

MAIN LINE FITTING) EA 4  $       5,000.00 20,000.00$           9,000.00$       36,000.00$          8,300.00$        33,200.00$          
A - E7 FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY TYPE 2 (INCLUDES 

MAIN LINE FITTING) EA 1  $       5,100.00 5,100.00$             9,750.00$       9,750.00$            8,300.00$        8,300.00$            
A - E8 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED WATER 

IMPROVEMENTS AL 1  $       5,000.00 5,000.00$              $       5,000.00 5,000.00$             $        5,000.00 5,000.00$            
52,320.00$           89,086.25$          81,300.00$         NO BID

A - F1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART F) LS 1  $            50.00 50.00$  90.00$             90.00$                  50.00$              50.00$                  

SUBTOTAL PART D - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS
PART E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS

SUBTOTAL PART E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS
PART F - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS
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A - F2 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED 
WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1  $       2,000.00 2,000.00$              $       2,000.00 2,000.00$             $        2,000.00 2,000.00$            

2,050.00$             2,090.00$            2,050.00$            NO BID

A - G1 MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% PART G) LS 1 50.00$             50.00$  194.40$           194.40$                150.00$            150.00$               
A - G2

EXCAVATION, BACKFILL AND COMPACTION OF 
TRENCH FOR GAS LINE (ADJUSTMENT TO BE 
COMPLETED BY THE CITY GAS DEPARTMENT) LF 48 50.00$             2,400.00$             90.00$             4,320.00$            90.00$              4,320.00$            

2,450.00$             4,514.40$            4,470.00$            

5,153,362.45$     7,316,623.43$    7,493,696.00$    NO BID

PART G - GAS SYSTEMS IMPROVEMENTS

SUBTOTAL PART G - GAS SYSTEM IMPROVEMENTS

TOTAL BASE BID - (PARTS A THRU G)

SUBTOTAL PART F - WASTEWTR IMPROVEMENTS
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