BID DATE: Wed., November 18, 2021

TABULATION OF BIDS

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT DEPT.

RFB 3303 Burnside Services Inc JE Constr Services Reytec Constr Resources Clark Pipeline Services Bay Ltd
LEOPARD STREET - NUECES BAY BLVD TO PALM DR 1110 Navasota Ridge Road 7505 UpRiver Rd 1901 Hollister 6229 Leopard St 401 Corn Products Rd
PROJ. NO. 18027A Navasota, TX 77868 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409
ITEM DESCRIPTION | UNIT| Qry UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID 2 - CONCRETE (RIGID)
PART A - GENERAL
2-A1 |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART A) LS 1 $12,843.00( $ 12,843.00 $20,000.00( $ 20,000.00 $25,000.00| $ 25,000.00
2-A2  |BONDS AND INSURANCE (AS REQUIRED) AL 1 $75,600.00( $ 75,600.00 $95,000.00( $ 95,000.00 $62,000.00| $ 62,000.00
2-A3  [CLEAR RIGHT-OF-WAY AC 0.81 $10,000.00( $ 8,100.00 $120,000.00| $ 97,200.00 $54,000.00( $ 43,740.00
2-A4  |LOW PROFILE CONCRETE BARRIERS EA 61.5 $1,300.00( $ 79,950.00 $1,650.00 $ 101,475.00 $1,300.00| $ 79,950.00
2-A5  |TCP PLAN AND PREP LS 1 $7,800.00| $ 7,800.00 $7,000.00| $ 7,000.00 $12,000.00( $ 12,000.00
2-A6 |TCP MOBILIZATION/ADJUSTMENTS LS 1 $34,430.00( $ 34,430.00 $20,000.00( $ 20,000.00 $7,600.00| $ 7,600.00
2-A7 |TCP ITEMS (BARRELS, CONES, ETC.) MO 14 $2,534.00| $ 35,476.00 $2,500.00| $ 35,000.00 $15,000.00( $ 210,000.00
2-A8  |TCP - ELECTRIC MESSAGE BOARDS DAY 20 $230.00| $ 4,600.00 $200.00| $ 4,000.00 $200.00| $ 4,000.00
2-A9  [TCP - CROSSING GUARDS DAY | 175 $70.00( $ 12,250.00 $250.00( $ 43,750.00 $188.00| $ 32,900.00
2-A10 TCP - PAVEMENT REPAIRS LS 1 $15,000.00( $ 15,000.00 $13,000.00( $ 13,000.00 $20,000.00( $ 20,000.00
2-A11 [TCP - ADJUSTING TRAFFIC SIGNAL HEADS AL 1 $10,000.00( $ 10,000.00 $10,000.00( $ 10,000.00 $10,000.00( $ 10,000.00
2-A12 [STORM WATER PULLUTION PREVENTION PLAN LS 1 $35,000.00( $ 35,000.00 $1,900.00| $ 1,900.00 $15,000.00| $ 15,000.00
2-A13  [SILT FENCE LF | 1,794 $1.10| $ 1,973.40 $3.50| $ 6,279.00 $2.00| $ 3,588.00
2-A14 |BLOCK SODDING Sy 153 $5.70( $ 872.10 $18.00( $ 2,754.00 $10.00( $ 1,530.00
SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL $ 333,894.50 $ 457,358.00 S 527,308.00 NO BID NO BID
PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS
2-B1 |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART B) LS 1 $71,506.00( $ 71,506.00 $80,000.00( $ 80,000.00 $100,000.00| $ 100,000.00
2-B2 |STREET EXCAVATION sy | 19,941 $9.00( $ 179,469.00 $10.00| $ 199,410.00 $10.00( $ 199,410.00
2-B3 |JOINTED PLAIN CONCRETE PAVEMENT (9 IN) Sy | 18,881 $82.00| $ 1,548,242.00 $72.00( $ 1,359,432.00 $91.00( $ 1,718,171.00
2-B4 |PRIME COAT (MC-30) GAL | 2,832 $5.50| $ 15,576.00 $5.00( $ 14,160.00 $6.00| $ 16,992.00
2-B5 |[6" CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE (TY A, GR. 1-2) sy | 19,941 $16.00| $ 319,056.00 $13.00( $ 259,233.00 $13.00( $ 259,233.00
2-B6 |12" COMPACTED SUBGRADE sy | 19,941 $2.75[ $ 54,837.75 $1.80 $ 35,893.80 $4.00| $ 79,764.00
TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED
THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT MARKING TYPE 1 (W)
2-87 |(WORD) EA 4 $250.00| $ 1,000.00 $300.00| $ 1,200.00 $252.00| $ 1,008.00
TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED
THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT MARKING TYPE 1 (W)
2-B8 |(ARROW) EA 15 $250.00| $ 3,750.00 $240.00| $ 3,600.00 $187.00| $ 2,805.00
REFL. PAVEMENT MARKING TYPE 1 (W) (4")
2-89 [(DOT)(090 MIL) LF 33 $1.50 $ 49.50 $1.00| $ 33.00 $0.75| $ 24.75
REFL. PAVEMENT MARKING TYPE 1 (W) (8")
2-B10 [(SLD)(090 MIL) LF 550 $2.75[ $ 1,512.50 $1.50| $ 825.00 $1.50| $ 825.00
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RFB 3303 Burnside Services Inc JE Constr Services Reytec Constr Resources Clark Pipeline Services Bay Ltd
LEOPARD STREET - NUECES BAY BLVD TO PALM DR 1110 Navasota Ridge Road 7505 UpRiver Rd 1901 Hollister 6229 Leopard St 401 Corn Products Rd
PROJ. NO. 18027A Navasota, TX 77868 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT| QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
REFL. PAVEMENT MARKING TYPE 1 (W) (12")
2-B11 |(SOLID)(090 MIL) LF 147 $4.10( $ 602.70 $7.00| $ 1,029.00 $6.00| $ 882.00
REFL. PAVEMENT MARKING TYPE 1 (W) (4")
2-B12 |(BRK)(090 MIL) LF 1,090 $1.50| $ 1,635.00 $1.00| $ 1,090.00 $0.75[ $ 817.50
TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED
2-B13 |THERMOPLASTIC REFL. PAVEMENT MARKING TYPE | |F
1(W) (24") (SLD) (090 MIL) 1,379 $18.00| $ 24,822.00 $12.00| $ 16,548.00 $10.00| $ 13,790.00
REFL. PAVEMENT MARKINGS TY I (Y) 4" (BRK)(090
2-B14 |MIL) LF 660 $1.50 $ 990.00 $1.00| $ 660.00 $0.75| $ 495.00
REFL. PAVEMENT MARKING TYPE [ (Y) (4")
2-B15 [(SLD)(090 MIL) LF 4,829 $4.10| $ 19,798.90 $1.00| $ 4,829.00 $0.75| $ 3,621.75
2-B16 |PAVEMENT SEALER 4" LF | 6,612 $1.00( $ 6,612.00 $0.30| $ 1,983.60 $0.25| $ 1,653.00
2-B17 |PAVEMENT SEALER 8" LF 550 $1.50( $ 825.00 $0.65( $ 357.50 $0.50| $ 275.00
2-B18 |PAVEMENT SEALER 12" LF 147 $3.00 $ 441.00 $1.00| $ 147.00 $0.75| $ 110.25
2-B19 |PAVEMENT SEALER 24" LF 1,379 $4.00( $ 5,516.00 $2.00( $ 2,758.00 $1.55] $ 2,137.45
TY I-C RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER
2-B20 |(REFLECTORIZED) EA 62 $12.00| $ 744.00 $6.00| $ 372.00 $5.05| $ 313.10
TY-I-A-A RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER
2-B21 |(REFLECTORIZED) EA 255 $12.00| $ 3,060.00 $6.00| $ 1,530.00 $5.05] $ 1,287.75
2-B22 |REMOVE EXISTING STREET SIGNS AND ASSEMBLIES | EA 29 $800.00( $ 23,200.00 $190.00| $ 5,510.00 $61.00( $ 1,769.00
2-823 |INSMRD SN SUP & AM TY 10BWG (1)SA(P) EA 25 $1,032.00{ $ 25,800.00 $1,000.00( $ 25,000.00 $833.00| $ 20,825.00
2-B24 |IN SM RD SN SUP & AM TY 10BWG (1)SA(P-BM) EA 9 $1,170.00| $ 10,530.00 $1,200.00 $ 10,800.00 $985.00| $ 8,865.00
2-B25 |CONCRETE MEDIAN CAP SF | 5,053 $6.50( $ 32,844.50 $6.00( $ 30,318.00 $5.00 $ 25,265.00
2-B26 |CONCRETE DRIVEWAY sy | 1,259 $61.00| $ 76,799.00 $95.00| $ 119,605.00 $93.00| $ 117,087.00
2-B27 |UNANTICIPATED CONCRETE DRIVEWAY REMOVAL SF 100 $8.00| $ 800.00 $21.00| $ 2,100.00 $5.00] $ 500.00
ATLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED STREET
2-828 |IMPROVEMENTS AL 1 $25,000.00( $ 25,000.00 $25,000.00( $ 25,000.00 $25,000.00( $ 25,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS $ 2,455,018.85 $ 2,203,423.90 $ 2,602,926.55 NO BID NO BID
PART C - TRAFFIC SIGNAL IMPROVEMENTS
2-C1  |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART C) LS 1 $16,500.00( $ 16,500.00 $17,000.00( $ 17,000.00 $18,000.00( $ 18,000.00
2-C2  |DRILL SHAFT (TRF SIG POLE) (24 IN) LF 24 $215.00( $ 5,160.00 $160.00| $ 3,840.00 $126.00| $ 3,024.00
2-C3  |DRILL SHAFT (TRF SIG POLE) (36 IN) LF 47 $279.00( $ 13,113.00 $400.00| $ 18,800.00 $313.00| $ 14,711.00
2-C4  |DRILL SHAFT (TRF SIG POLE) (48 IN) LF 23 $500.00( $ 11,500.00 $650.00| $ 14,950.00 $505.00| $ 11,615.00
2-C5 |CONDT (PVC) (SCHD 40) (2") LF 425 $10.00| $ 4,250.00 $20.00| $ 8,500.00 $28.00( $ 11,900.00
2-C6 |CONDT (PVC) (SCHD 40) (4") LF 441 $21.00( $ 9,261.00 $25.00( $ 11,025.00 $32.00 $ 14,112.00
2-C7 |CONDT (PVC) (SCHD 40) (2") (BORE) LF 263 $23.00| $ 6,049.00 $25.00| $ 6,575.00 $32.00( $ 8,416.00
2-C8 |CONDT (PVC) (SCHD 40) (4") (BORE) LF 525 $29.00| $ 15,225.00 $41.00| $ 21,525.00 $44.00| $ 23,100.00
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RFB 3303 Burnside Services Inc JE Constr Services Reytec Constr Resources Clark Pipeline Services Bay Ltd
LEOPARD STREET - NUECES BAY BLVD TO PALM DR 1110 Navasota Ridge Road 7505 UpRiver Rd 1901 Hollister 6229 Leopard St 401 Corn Products Rd
PROJ. NO. 18027A Navasota, TX 77868 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT| QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
2 CONDR (NO.12) WITH GROUND (LUMINAIRE
2-C9  |WIRE) LF 704 $1.00| $ 704.00 $2.00( $ 1,408.00 $1.80 $ 1,267.20
2-C10 |ELEC CONDR (NO. 6) BARE LF 37 $1.00| $ 37.00 $6.00| $ 222.00 $5.05| $ 186.85
2-C11 |ELEC CONDR (NO. 6) INSULATED LF 74 $1.50| $ 111.00 $6.00( $ 444,00 $5.05[ $ 373.70
2-C12 |ELEC CONDR (NO. 8) BARE LF | 1512 $1.50| $ 2,268.00 $2.00| $ 3,024.00 $1.75[ $ 2,646.00
2-C13 |TRAY CABLE (3 CONDR) (12 AWG) LF | 1,317 $2.15| $ 2,831.55 $2.00( $ 2,634.00 $1.85[ $ 2,436.45
2-C14 |TRAY CABLE (3 CONDR) (14 AWG) LF 875 $2.50( $ 2,187.50 $2.00( $ 1,750.00 $1.95[ $ 1,706.25
2-C15 |GROUND BOX TY D WITH APRON EA 10 $1,240.00 $ 12,400.00 $1,400.00 $ 14,000.00 $1,110.00 $ 11,100.00
2-C16 |INSTALL HWY TRF SIG (ISOLATED) EA 1 $8,760.00| $ 8,760.00 $4,000.00| $ 4,000.00 $3,230.00( $ 3,230.00
2-C17 |ELC SRV TY D 120/240 060 (NS)SS(E)PS(U) EA 1 $8,100.00 $ 8,100.00 $7,000.00{ $ 7,000.00 $5,850.00( $ 5,850.00
2-C18 |ILSN (LED) 8S (DURALIGHT) (FIXED MOUNT) EA 4 $3,100.00{ $ 12,400.00 $3,800.00 $ 15,200.00 $2,980.00( $ 11,920.00
2-C19 |REMOVING TRAFFIC SIGNALS EA 1 $3,600.00 $ 3,600.00 $4,600.00 $ 4,600.00 $2,525.00( $ 2,525.00
LOUVERED VACUUM FORMED ABS BACK PLATE
2-C20 [(12")(3 SEC) EA 8 $120.00( $ 960.00 $100.00( $ 800.00 $86.00| $ 688.00
LOUVERED VACUUM FORMED ABS BACK PLATE
2-C21 |(12")(4 SEC) EA 3 $147.00( $ 441.00 $140.00| $ 420.00 $111.00| $ 333.00
DURALIGHT COUNTDOWN PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL
2-C22 |MODULE (16 INCH) EA 8 $602.00 $ 4,816.00 $600.00| $ 4,800.00 $480.00| $ 3,840.00
2-C23 [TRFSIG CBL (TY A) (12 AWG) (4 CONDR) LF 294 $1.25| $ 367.50 $2.00( $ 588.00 $1.75[ $ 514.50
2-C24 |TRFSIG CBL (TY A) (14 AWG) (5 CONDR) LF 327 $1.65| $ 539.55 $2.00| $ 654.00 $1.95| S 637.65
2-C25 |[TRFSIG CBL (TY A) (14 AWG) (7 CONDR) LF 237 $1.65| $ 391.05 $2.50( $ 592.50 $2.00( $ 474.00
2-C26 |TRFSIG CBL (TY A) (14 AWG) (16 CONDR) LF 698 $3.00( $ 2,094.00 $5.00( $ 3,490.00 $4.25| $ 2,966.50
2-C27 |INS TRF SIG PL AM(S)1 ARM (24') LUM & ILSN EA 1 $9,000.00{ $ 9,000.00 $10,000.00( $ 10,000.00 $8,180.00( $ 8,180.00
2-C28 |INS TRF SIG PL AM(S)1 ARM (32') LUM & ILSN EA 1 $9,560.00| $ 9,560.00 $11,000.00| $ 11,000.00 $8,940.00( $ 8,940.00
2-C29 [INS TRF SIG PL AM(S)1 ARM (44') LUM & ILSN EA 1 $10,830.00( $ 10,830.00 $14,000.00( $ 14,000.00 $11,392.00| $ 11,392.00
2-C30 |[INS TRFSIG PL AM(S)1 ARM (60') LUM & ILSN EA 1 $23,410.00( $ 23,410.00 $25,000.00( $ 25,000.00 $19,876.00| $ 19,876.00
2-C31 |PED POLE ASSEMBLY EA 4 $1,345.00( $ 5,380.00 $1,200.00 $ 4,800.00 $984.00| $ 3,936.00
2-C32  |POLARA PUSH BUTTON (APS) W/R10-3E SIGN EA 8 $815.00 $ 6,520.00 $900.00| $ 7,200.00 $717.00| $ 5,736.00
2-C33 |PED DETECTOR CONTROLLER UNIT EA 1 $4,100.00 $ 4,100.00 $4,500.00( $ 4,500.00 $3,838.00( $ 3,838.00
LED TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULE - VEH SIG SEC (12")
2-C34 |LED (GRN) EA 8 $247.00( $ 1,976.00 $300.00( $ 2,400.00 $247.00| $ 1,976.00
LED TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULE - VEH SIG SEC (12")
2-C35 [LED (GRN ARW) EA 3 $247.00( $ 741.00 $300.00| $ 900.00 $247.00| $ 741.00
LED TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULE - VEH SIG SEC (12")
2-C36 |LED (YEL) EA 8 $247.00| $ 1,976.00 $300.00| $ 2,400.00 $247.00] S 1,976.00
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RFB 3303 Burnside Services Inc JE Constr Services Reytec Constr Resources Clark Pipeline Services Bay Ltd
LEOPARD STREET - NUECES BAY BLVD TO PALM DR 1110 Navasota Ridge Road 7505 UpRiver Rd 1901 Hollister 6229 Leopard St 401 Corn Products Rd
PROJ. NO. 18027A Navasota, TX 77868 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT| QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
LED TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULE - VEH SIG SEC (12")
2-C37 |LED (YEL ARW) EA 6 $247.00| $ 1,482.00 $300.00| $ 1,800.00 $247.00| $ 1,482.00
LED TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULE - VEH SIG SEC (127)
2-C38 [LED (RED) EA 8 $247.00| $ 1,976.00 $300.00| $ 2,400.00 $247.00| $ 1,976.00
LED TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULE - VEH SIG SEC (12")
2-C39 [LED (RED ARW) EA 3 $247.00| $ 741.00 $300.00| $ 900.00 $247.00| $ 741.00
ALPHA FXM 2000 UNINTERRUPTIBLE POWER
2-C40 |SUPPLY WITH CABINET EA $7,850.00| $ 7,850.00 $8,000.00( $ 8,000.00 $6,262.00| $ 6,262.00
2-C41 |RADAR PRESENCE DETECTOR (WAVETRONIX) EA 4 $5,365.00 $ 21,460.00 $7,900.00| $ 31,600.00 $6,161.00 $ 24,644.00
RADAR PRESENCE DETECTOR COMM & POWER
2-C42 |CABLE (SMARTSENSOR 6/C) LF 782 $4.00( $ 3,128.00 $3.80( $ 2,971.60 $3.05( $ 2,385.10
SCHOOL ZONE FLASHER ASSEMBLY (REMOVE AND
2-C43  [REPLACE) EA 2 $8,500.00( $ 17,000.00 $6,500.00| $ 13,000.00 $5,151.00| $ 10,302.00
CAMERA PTZ (PELCO SPECTRA ENHANCED SERIES)
2-C44  |WITH PELCO PA402 MOUNT EA 1 $4,500.00( $ 4,500.00 $4,600.00| $ 4,600.00 $3,626.00| $ 3,626.00
2-C45 |ETHERNET CABLE CATSE FOR PTZ LF 184 $3.30 $ 607.20 $6.00( $ 1,104.00 $5.05| $ 929.20
WAVETRONIX CLICK 656 CABINET INTERFACE
2-C46 |DEVICE EA 1 $4,900.00( $ 4,900.00 $5,000.00| $ 5,000.00 $3,939.00| $ 3,939.00
DATA AGGREGATOR DA-400, POWER/COMM
2-C47 |CABLE AND 5-BAND ANTENNA EA 1 $5,400.00( $ 5,400.00 $7,000.00| $ 7,000.00 $5,726.00| $ 5,726.00
2-C48 |MAST ARM DAMPING PLATE EA 1 $269.00( $ 269.00 $700.00| $ 700.00 $555.00| $ 555.00
2-C49 |CONTROLLER CABINET (TS-2) WITH EXTENSION EA 1 $13,800.00| $ 13,800.00 $13,000.00( $ 13,000.00 $10,625.00( $ 10,625.00
2-C50 |NEMA TYPE CONTROLLER FOUNDATION EA 1 $3,500.00 $ 3,500.00 $2,700.00 $ 2,700.00 $2,121.00 $ 2,121.00
2-C51 |CONTROLLER ECONOLITE COBALT EA 1 $3,900.00( $ 3,900.00 $4,600.00| $ 4,600.00 $3,560.00| $ 3,560.00
2-C52  |MMU2-16LEIP WITH ETHERNET PORT EA 1 $1,140.00| $ 1,140.00 $1,500.00| $ 1,500.00 $1,247.00| $ 1,247.00
CISCO ETHERNET 4000 SWITCH (IE-4000-8GT8GP4G-
2-C53  |E) AND POWER SUPPLY (PWR-IE170W-PC-AC=) EA 1 $8,500.00| $ 8,500.00 $10,000.00( $ 10,000.00 $8,383.00| $ 8,383.00
2-C54  [MIMOSA-B5 BACKHAUL RADIO EA 1 $7,000.00( $ 7,000.00 $4,000.00| $ 4,000.00 $3,131.00| $ 3,131.00
2-C55 [TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODIFICATION (2 INTERSECTIONS)| LS 1 $65,000.00| $ 65,000.00 $8,400.00( $ 8,400.00 $6,565.00| $ 6,565.00
ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED TRAFFIC SIGNAL
2-C56  [IMPROVEMENTS AL 1 $5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $5,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $5,000.00( $ 5,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART C - TRAFFIC SIGNALS IMPR $ 394,712.35 $ 378,317.10 $ 327,363.40 NO BID NO BID
PART D - RTA IMPROVEMENTS
2-D1 |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART D) LS 1 $213.00| $ 213.00 $2,000.00| $ 2,000.00 $500.00( $ 500.00
2-D2 |CONCRETE BUS SHELTER PAD SF 900 $6.75( $ 6,075.00 $17.00| $ 15,300.00 $16.00| $ 14,400.00
ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED RTA
2-D3 [IMPROVEMENTS AL 1 $1,000.00 $ 1,000.00 $1,000.00 $ 1,000.00 $1,000.00 $ 1,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART D - RTA IMPROVEMENTS S 7,288.00 18,300.00 $ 15,900.00 NO BID NO BID
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RFB 3303 Burnside Services Inc JE Constr Services Reytec Constr Resources Clark Pipeline Services Bay Ltd
LEOPARD STREET - NUECES BAY BLVD TO PALM DR 1110 Navasota Ridge Road 7505 UpRiver Rd 1901 Hollister 6229 Leopard St 401 Corn Products Rd
PROJ. NO. 18027A Navasota, TX 77868 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT| QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
PART E - ADA IMPROVEMENTS
2-E1  [MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART E) LS 1 $5,015.00| $ 5,015.00 $12,000.00( $ 12,000.00 $10,000.00| $ 10,000.00
2-E2  |CONCRETE SIDEWALK SF | 15,308 $6.25| $ 95,675.00 $8.00( $ 122,464.00 $8.60| $ 131,648.80
REMOVE AND REPLACE EXISTING 6" CONCRETE
2-E3  |CURB & GUTTER LF 263 $35.00( $ 9,205.00 $54.00| $ 14,202.00 $27.00| $ 7,101.00
2-E4 |CONCRETE CURB RAMPS SF | 4,167 $8.70| $ 36,252.90 $28.00| $ 116,676.00 $21.00| $ 87,507.00
2-E5 [SIDEWALK RETAINING CURB LF 50 $25.00( $ 1,250.00 $65.00( $ 3,250.00 $32.00( $ 1,600.00
2-E6  [SIDEWALK DRAIN LF 50 $100.00| $ 5,000.00 $200.00| $ 10,000.00 $390.00| $ 19,500.00
REFL. PAVEMENT MARKING TYPE 1 (W) (24")
2-E7  |(SOLID) - CROSSWALK LF 959 $18.00( $ 17,262.00 $12.00( $ 11,508.00 $10.00| $ 9,590.00
ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED ADA
2-E8  [IMPROVEMENTS AL 1 $2,500.00| $ 2,500.00 $2,500.00| $ 2,500.00 $2,500.00( $ 2,500.00
SUBTOTAL PART E - ADA IMPROVEMENTS $  172,159.90 $ 292,600.00 $  269,446.80 NO BID NO BID
PART F - STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS
2-F1 |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART F) LS 1 $21,326.00( $ 21,326.00 $40,000.00( $ 40,000.00 $30,000.00| $ 30,000.00
2-F2 |REMOVE EXISTING INLET OR MANHOLE EA 1 $800.00| $ 800.00 $2,000.00| $ 2,000.00 $500.00| $ 500.00
5" DIAMETER CONCRETE MANHOLE (TYPE-A) (CAST
2-F3 [IN PLACE) EA 4 $4,500.00| $ 18,000.00 $8,000.00| $ 32,000.00 $5,500.00| $ 22,000.00
6' DIAMETER CONCRETE MANHOLE (TYPE-A) (CAST
2-F4 |[IN PLACE) EA 3 $6,000.00| $ 18,000.00 $9,000.00| $ 27,000.00 $7,500.00| $ 22,500.00
REMOVE EXISTING REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE
2-F5 [(15"-36") LF 437 $25.00( $ 10,925.00 $39.00( $ 17,043.00 $8.00| $ 3,496.00
2-F6 |CONCRETE CURB LF | 5,073 $18.00| $ 91,314.00 $23.00| $ 116,679.00 $5.25| $ 26,633.25
2-F7 |6' CONCRETE CURB INLET (CAST IN PLACE) EA 9 $7,800.00| $ 70,200.00 $9,000.00| $ 81,000.00 $5,400.00| $ 48,600.00
2-F8 |5' CONCRETE CURB INLET THROAT EXTENSION EA 28 $4,500.00| $ 126,000.00 $2,000.00{ $ 56,000.00 $2,600.00( $ 72,800.00
REMOVE AND REPLACE EXISTING 5' CURB INLET
2-F9 |TOP (CAST IN PLACE) EA 9 $4,000.00| $ 36,000.00 $3,000.00| $ 27,000.00 $2,400.00| $ 21,600.00
18" DIAMETER REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS
2-F10 | LF 292 $79.00| $ 23,068.00 $160.00| $ 46,720.00 $148.00| $ 43,216.00
24" DIAMETER REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS
2-F11 |m) LF 70 $86.00( $ 6,020.00 $180.00| $ 12,600.00 $161.00| $ 11,270.00
36" DIAMETER REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS
2-F12 |m) LF | 1,186 $133.00| $ 157,738.00 $200.00| $ 237,200.00 $220.00| $ 260,920.00
42" DIAMETER REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (CLASS
2-F13 |) LF 801 $162.00| $ 129,762.00 $230.00| $ 184,230.00 $267.00| $ 213,867.00
TRENCH SAFETY (STORM WATER INLETS OR
2-F14 |MANHOLES) EA 13 $300.00( $ 3,900.00 $650.00( $ 8,450.00 $100.00| $ 1,300.00
2-F15 |TRENCH SAFETY (STORM WATER LINE) LF | 2,349 $1.75) $ 4,110.75 $6.00( $ 14,094.00 $2.00| ¢ 4,698.00
ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED STORM WATER
2-F16 |IMPROVEMENTS AL 1 $15,000.00( $ 15,000.00 $15,000.00( $ 15,000.00 $15,000.00( $ 15,000.00
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RFB 3303 Burnside Services Inc JE Constr Services Reytec Constr Resources Clark Pipeline Services Bay Ltd
LEOPARD STREET - NUECES BAY BLVD TO PALM DR 1110 Navasota Ridge Road 7505 UpRiver Rd 1901 Hollister 6229 Leopard St 401 Corn Products Rd
PROJ. NO. 18027A Navasota, TX 77868 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT| QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
SUBTOTAL PART F - STORM WATER IMPR $ 732,163.75 $ 917,016.00 S 798,400.25 NO BID NO BID
PART G - WATER IMPROVEMENTS
2-G1 |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART G) LS 1 $12,697.00( $ 12,697.00 $30,000.00( $ 30,000.00 $30,000.00| $ 30,000.00
2-G2 |8"PVC C900 WATERLINE LF | 2,578 $44.00( $ 113,432.00 $90.00( $ 232,020.00 $105.00| $ 270,690.00
2-G3 |8" DI WATERLINE LF 170 $89.00( $ 15,130.00 $270.00| $ 45,900.00 $152.00| $ 25,840.00
2-G4 [10" PVC C900 WATERLINE LF 64 $55.00( $ 3,520.00 $175.00| $ 11,200.00 $130.00| $ 8,320.00
2-G5 |6" GATE VALVE & VALVE BOX, RESTRAINED EA 1 $1,575.00| $ 1,575.00 $1,500.00| $ 1,500.00 $1,430.00| $ 1,430.00
2-G6 |[8" GATE VALVE & VALVE BOX, RESTRAINED EA 2 $1,920.00| $ 3,840.00 $1,900.00| $ 3,800.00 $1,773.00| $ 3,546.00
2-G7 |10" GATE VALVE & VALVE BOX, RESTRAINED EA 2 $2,500.00| $ 5,000.00 $3,200.00| $ 6,400.00 $2,525.00| $ 5,050.00
2-G8 |16" GATE VALVE & VALVE BOX, RESTRAINED EA 1 $5,500.00| $ 5,500.00 $10,000.00( $ 10,000.00 $8,200.00| $ 8,200.00
2-G9 [8"45° DIMJ BEND EA 55 $165.00| $ 9,075.00 $350.00| $ 19,250.00 $440.00| $ 24,200.00
2-G10 |10" 45° DIMJ BEND EA 2 $305.00| $ 610.00 $400.00| $ 800.00 $610.00| $ 1,220.00
2-G11 |8" WATER VALVE EA 18 $1,920.00| $ 34,560.00 $1,900.00| $ 34,200.00 $1,450.00| $ 26,100.00
2-G12 |10" WATER VALVE EA 1 $2,520.00| $ 2,520.00 $3,200.00| $ 3,200.00 $2,500.00| $ 2,500.00
2-G13 |8" DIMJ ELBOW EA 2 $165.00| $ 330.00 $600.00| $ 1,200.00 $660.00| $ 1,320.00
2-G14 |8"X 8" DIMJ CROSS RESTRAINED EA 2 $1,400.00| $ 2,800.00 $500.00| $ 1,000.00 $670.00| $ 1,340.00
2-G15 |8" X 6" DIMJ TEE EA 18 $210.00| $ 3,780.00 $250.00| $ 4,500.00 $300.00| $ 5,400.00
2-G16 |8" X 6" DIMJ REDUCER EA 3 $450.00| $ 1,350.00 $200.00| $ 600.00 $446.00| $ 1,338.00
2-G17 |8"X 8" DIMJ TEE EA 3 $264.00| $ 792.00 $500.00| $ 1,500.00 $600.00| $ 1,800.00
2-G18 |8"X 10" DIMJ TEE EA 1 $440.00| $ 440.00 $900.00| $ 900.00 $1,046.00| $ 1,046.00
6" PVC CONNECTION TO EXISTING LINE,
2-G19 |RESTRAINED EA 2 $1,200.00| $ 2,400.00 $2,000.00| $ 4,000.00 $2,328.00| $ 4,656.00
8" PVC CONNECTION TO EXISTING LINE,
2-G20 |RESTRAINED EA 6 $1,800.00| $ 10,800.00 $2,000.00| $ 12,000.00 $2,360.00| $ 14,160.00
10" PVC CONNECTION TO EXISTING LINE,
2-G21 |RESTRAINED EA 1 $2,200.00| $ 2,200.00 $2,000.00| $ 2,000.00 $3,243.00| $ 3,243.00
2-G22 |8" X 8" TAPPING SLEEVE AND VALVE EA 1 $3,542.00| $ 3,542.00 $16,000.00( $ 16,000.00 $9,734.00| $ 9,734.00
2-G23 |16" X 8" TAPPING SLEEVE AND VALVE EA 1 $4,800.00| $ 4,800.00 $17,000.00( $ 17,000.00 $11,000.00| $ 11,000.00
2-G24 |6" PLUG EA 3 $500.00| $ 1,500.00 $200.00| $ 600.00 $1,009.00| $ 3,027.00
2-G25 |8" PLUG EA 5 $650.00| $ 3,250.00 $200.00| $ 1,000.00 $1,217.00| $ 6,085.00
2-G26 [10"PLUG EA 1 $800.00| $ 800.00 $300.00| $ 300.00 $1,563.00| $ 1,563.00
2-G27 |NEW FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY (TYPE 1) EA 18 $5,100.00| $ 91,800.00 $6,000.00| $ 108,000.00 $11,000.00| $ 198,000.00
REPLACE EXISTING WATER SERVICE WITH NEW
2-G28 |WATER SERVICE LINE W/CONNECTION EA 9 $2,800.00| $ 25,200.00 $2,500.00| $ 22,500.00 $1,683.00| $ 15,147.00
1" WATER SERVICE CONNECTION (INCLUDING
2-G29 |METER ASSEMBLY AND METER BOX) EA 9 $2,800.00| $ 25,200.00 $1,200.00| $ 10,800.00 $617.00| $ 5,553.00
2-G30 |CONNECTION TO EXISTING WATER LINE EA 12 $2,800.00| $ 33,600.00 $1,000.00| $ 12,000.00 $400.00| $ 4,800.00
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RFB 3303 Burnside Services Inc JE Constr Services Reytec Constr Resources Clark Pipeline Services Bay Ltd
LEOPARD STREET - NUECES BAY BLVD TO PALM DR 1110 Navasota Ridge Road 7505 UpRiver Rd 1901 Hollister 6229 Leopard St 401 Corn Products Rd
PROJ. NO. 18027A Navasota, TX 77868 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT| QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
2-G31 [TRENCH SAFETY FOR WATER LINES LF 2,578 $1.50| $ 3,867.00 $3.00| $ 7,734.00 $2.00| $ 5,156.00
ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED WATER
2-G32 |[IMPROVEMENTS AL 1 $10,000.00( $ 10,000.00 $10,000.00( $ 10,000.00 $10,000.00( $ 10,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART G - WATER IMPROVEMENTS $ 435,910.00 $ 631,904.00 S 711,464.00 NO BID NO BID
PART H - WASTEWTR IMPROVEMENTS
2-H1 |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART H) LS 1 $13,038.00( $ 13,038.00 $30,000.00( $ 30,000.00 $20,000.00( $ 20,000.00
4 DIAMETER WASTEWATER MANHOLE (6' DEPTH
2-H2 |OR LESS) (FIBERGLASS) EA 9 $8,000.00| $ 72,000.00 $9,000.00| $ 81,000.00 $13,000.00( $ 117,000.00
EXTRA DEPTH FOR 4' DIAMETER WASTEWATER
2-H3 |MANHOLE (OVER 6' DEPTH) (FIBERGLASS) VF 35 $250.00( $ 8,750.00 $1,300.00| $ 45,500.00 $145.00| $ 5,075.00
EXTRA DEPTH FOR 5' DIAMETER WASTEWATER
2-H4 |MANHOLE (OVER 6' DEPTH) (FIBERGLASS) VF 5 $275.00( $ 1,375.00 $1,500.00| $ 7,500.00 $265.00| $ 1,325.00
5" DIAMETER WASTEWATER MANHOLE (6' DEPTH
2-H5 |OR LESS) (FIBERGLASS) EA 1 $12,500.00( $ 12,500.00 $10,000.00( $ 10,000.00 $14,000.00( $ 14,000.00
ADJUST EXISTING WASTEWATER MANHOLE RIM TO
2-H6 |GRADE EA 1 $800.00( $ 800.00 $2,500.00| $ 2,500.00 $2,500.00| $ 2,500.00
2-H7 |8"SDR 26 PVC WASTEWATER MAIN (0' - 6' DEPTH) LF 9 $44.00| $ 396.00 $145.00( $ 1,305.00 $200.00| $ 1,800.00
2-H8 |8" SDR 26 PVC WASTEWATER MAIN (6' - 8' DEPTH) LF 288 $46.00| $ 13,248.00 $155.00( $ 44,640.00 $132.00| $ 38,016.00
2-H9 |8" SDR 26 PVC WASTEWATER MAIN (8' - 10' DEPTH)| LF 324 $48.00( $ 15,552.00 $180.00( $ 58,320.00 $140.00| $ 45,360.00
8" SDR 26 PVC WASTEWATER MAIN (10 - 12'
2-H10 |[DEPTH) LF 75 $50.00| $ 3,750.00 $215.00( $ 16,125.00 $145.00| $ 10,875.00
10" SDR 26 PVC WASTEWATER MAIN (8' - 10'
2-H11 |DEPTH) LF 503 $65.00| $ 32,695.00 $195.00( $ 98,085.00 $150.00| $ 75,450.00
10" SDR 26 PVC WASTEWATER MAIN (10' - 12°
2-H12 |DEPTH) LF 655 $70.00| $ 45,850.00 $200.00( $ 131,000.00 $158.00| $ 103,490.00
2-H13 [GROUTFILL (8" - 10") VCP WASTEWATER LINE LF 1,468 $68.00| $ 99,824.00 $15.00| $ 22,020.00 $15.00| $ 22,020.00
SHORT WASTEWATER SERVICE LINE (INCLUDES
2-H14 [NEW SERVICE LINE, CLEANOUT, AND CONNECTION)| EA 6 $12,000.00( $ 72,000.00 $7,000.00| $ 42,000.00 $2,600.00| $ 15,600.00
LONG WASTEWATER SERVICE LINE (INCLUDES NEW
2-H15 [SERVICE LINE, CLEANOUT, AND CONNECTION) EA 3 $15,000.00( $ 45,000.00 $12,000.00( $ 36,000.00 $3,200.00| $ 9,600.00
2-H16 |DROP CONNECTION AT MANHOLE EA 1 $4,820.00| $ 4,820.00 $2,300.00| $ 2,300.00 $3,800.00| $ 3,800.00
2-H17 |TRENCH SAFETY (WASTEWATER MANHOLES) EA 9 $250.00| $ 2,250.00 $650.00| $ 5,850.00 $320.00( $ 2,880.00
2-H18 [TRENCH SAFETY FOR WASTEWATER MAIN LF 1,854 $1.50| $ 2,781.00 $7.00| $ 12,978.00 $3.00| $ 5,562.00
ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED WASTEWATER
2-H19 [IMPROVEMENTS AL 1 $10,000.00( $ 10,000.00 $10,000.00 $ 10,000.00 $10,000.00( $ 10,000.00
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LEOPARD STREET - NUECES BAY BLVD TO PALM DR

RFB 3303

Burnside Services Inc
1110 Navasota Ridge Road

JE Constr Services
7505 UpRiver Rd

Reytec Constr Resources
1901 Hollister

Clark Pipeline Services
6229 Leopard St

Bay Ltd

401 Corn Products Rd

PROJ. NO. 18027A Navasota, TX 77868 CC, TX 78409 Houston, TX 77080 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT| QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
SUBTOTAL PART H - WASTEWTR IMPR S 456,629.00 $ 657,123.00 S 504,353.00 NO BID NO BID
PART | - GAS IMPROVEMENTS

2-11  |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART I) LS 1 $2,741.00| $ 2,741.00 $1,000.00| $ 1,000.00 $5,000.00( $ 5,000.00

EXCAVATION, BACKFILL, AND COMPACTION OF GAS
2.2 |LINES LF 5,423 $15.00| $ 81,345.00 $5.00| $ 27,115.00 $30.00| $ 162,690.00

ADJUST EXISTING GAS VALVE BOX TO FINISHED
2-13 |GRADE EA 2 $4,500.00| $ 9,000.00 $700.00( $ 1,400.00 $700.00| $ 1,400.00

ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED GAS
2-14 [IMPROVEMENTS AL 1 $1,000.00( $ 1,000.00 $1,000.00( $ 1,000.00 $1,000.00( $ 1,000.00

SUBTOTAL PART | - GAS IMPROVEMENTS S 94,086.00 30,515.00 S 170,090.00 NO BID NO BID

PART J - L.T. IMPROVEMENTS

2-]11 |MOBILIZATION (MAX. 5% OF PART J) LS 1 $1,264.00( $ 1,264.00 $3,000.00| $ 3,000.00 $2,000.00( $ 2,000.00

2" PVC SCHEDULE 40 I.T. CONDUIT WITH PULL
2-2  [STRING AND MULE TAPE LF 2,486 $13.00| $ 32,318.00 $13.00| $ 32,318.00 $11.00| $ 27,346.00
2-13  [24"X36"X18" I.T. PULL BOX (INSTALLATION ONLY) EA 14 $650.00( $ 9,100.00 $2,500.00| $ 35,000.00 $1,950.00( $ 27,300.00

ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED I.T.
2-)4  [IMPROVEMENTS AL 1 $1,000.00( $ 1,000.00 $1,000.00( $ 1,000.00 $1,000.00( $ 1,000.00

SUBTOTAL PARTJ - I.T. IMPROVEMENTS S 43,682.00 S 71,318.00 57,646.00

TOTAL BASE BID 1 HMAC - (PARTS A THRU J) $ 5,125,544.35 $ 5,657,875.00 5,984,898.00 NO BID NO BID
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