City of Corpus Christi

Contracts and Procurement

Department

Buyer : Marco Lozano

Bid Tabulation

RFB # 3359

Mobile Tire Repair for Asset Management Fleet Maintenance Division

Southern Tire Mart, LLC -
Columbia, Mississippi

E.B. Creager Tire & Battery,
Inc. - Corpus
Christi, Texas

Vicente Cavazos Jr, dba
Cavazos Tire Service -
Corpus Christi, Texas

Goodyear Tire & Rubber Co.

Group 1 - Lig_;ht Passenger and Truck Tires
3yr
ITEM Description Unit Qty | Unit Price Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price
1 Service Call EA 300 | $ 48.00 | S 14,400.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 16,500.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 19,500.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 24,000.00
2 Service Call - After Hour EA 60 S 59.00 | $ 3,540.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 3,900.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 6,300.00
3 Service Call — Holiday EA 21 |S 59.00 | $ 1,239.00 | S 100.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 1,365.00 | S 105.00 | $ 2,205.00
4 Out of Town Mileage Per Mile 50 S 055($ 27.50 | $ 1.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 1.15|$ 57.50 [ $ 1.00 | $ 50.00
5 Mount and Dismount EA 330 | S 18.00 | $ 5,940.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 3,300.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 6,600.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 6,600.00
6 Tire Repair EA 50 S 2250 (S 1,125.00 | S 15.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 1,000.00 | S 25.00 [ $ 1,250.00
7 Misc, Valve Stems EA 30 S 250 (S 75.00 [ $ 295|$ 88.50 | S 5.00|$ 150.00 | $ 3.00 (S 90.00
S 26,346.50 S 28,788.50 S 32,572.50 S 40,495.00
Southern Tire Mart. LLC - E.B. Creager Tire & Battery, Vicente Cavazos Jr, dba
) R Inc. - Corpus Cavazos Tire Service - Goodyear Tire & Rubber Co.
Columbia, Mississippi L .
Christi, Texas Corpus Christi, Texas
Group 2 — Medium Tires to Class 8 Tires
3yr
ITEM Description Unit Qty | Unit Price Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price
8 Service Call EA 300 | $ 53.00 | $ 15,900.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 16,500.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 19,500.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 24,000.00
9 Service Call - After Hour EA 90 (S 70.00 | S 6,300.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 5,850.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 9,450.00
10 Service Call — Holiday EA 21 |S 70.00 | S 1,470.00 | S 100.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 65.00 | $ 1,365.00 | S 105.00 | $ 2,205.00
11 Out of Town Mileage Per Mile 300 | $ 055($ 165.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 1.15|$ 345.00 | $ 1.00 | 300.00
12 Mount and Dismount EA 4500 | $ 18.00 | $ 81,000.00 | $ 25.00 ([ $ 112,500.00 | $ 30.00 [ $ 135,000.00 | $ 30.00 [ $ 135,000.00
13 Tire Repair EA 50 S 3150 S 1,575.00 | 30.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 30.00 | S 1,500.00 | S 35.00 | $ 1,750.00
14 Misc, Valve Stems EA 30 S 350 (S 105.00 | $ 495 (S 14850 | S 7.00|$ 210.00 | $ 5.00 |$ 150.00
S 106,515.00 S 142,048.50 S 163,770.00 S 172,855.00
Vicente CaYazos Jr: dba E.B. Creager Tire & Battery, | Southern Tire Mart, LLC- |** Goodyear Tire & Rubber
Cavazos Tire Service - Inc. - Corpus . ..
. L. Columbia, Mississippi Co.
Corpus Christi, Texas Christi, Texas
Group 3 — OTR (Off the Road) Tires
3yr
ITEM Description Unit Qty | Unit Price Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price [ Unit Price | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price
15 Service Call EA Q0 (S 65.00 | $ 5,850.00 | $ 55.00 | $ 4,950.00 | $ 53.00 | $ 4,770.00 No Bid
16 Service Call - After Hour EA 30 |S 65.00 | $ 1,950.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 2,100.00 No Bid
17 Service Call — Holiday EA 21 |S 65.00 | $ 1,365.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 1,470.00 No Bid
18 Out of Town Mileage Per Mile | 150 | $ 115 $ 172.50 | $ 1.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 0.55|$ 82.50 No Bid
19 Mount and Dismount EA 9 |$S 45.00 | $ 4,050.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 3,600.00 | Non Resp. No Bid
20 Tire Repair EA 50 |$ 45.00 | $ 2,250.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 3,000.00 | Non Resp. No Bid
21 Misc, Valve Stems EA 30 |S 10.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 9.95|$ 298.50 | $ 17.50 [ $ 525.00 No Bid
S  15,937.50 $  17,098.50 $ 8,947.50 $ -

* Group 3 - Vendor Non Responsive

** Group 3 - Vendor No Bid




	Bid #

