TABULATION OF BIDS

CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT

BID DATE: Friday, April 2, 2021

BRAWNER PARKWAY - CARROLL LANE TO KOSTORYZ ROAD J CARROLL WEAVER MAX UNDERGROUND CONSTRUCTION BAY LTD. MAKO CONTRACTING CLARK PIPELINE SERVICES JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES REYTEC CONSTRUCTION RESOURCES, INC.
PROJECT NO. 18008A 211 WEST WELDER ST. 3729 CORINA LN. 401 CORN PRODUCTS RD. 3636 S Alameda, #8153 6229 LEOPARD ST. 7505 UP RIVER RD. 1901 HOLLISTER
RFB #3537 SINTON, TX 78387 CC, TEXAS 78427 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78409 CC, TEXAS 78409 HOUSTON, TX 77080
ITEM DESCRIPTION [unit[ ary UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID 1 - HMAC

PART A - GENERAL
1-A1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART A) AL 1S 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 17,000.00 | $ 17,000.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 38,000.00 | $ 38,000.00
1-A2 BONDS AND INSURANCE (MAX 2% BID) AL 1 $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 38,250.00 | $ 38,250.00 | $ 45,000.00 | $ 45,000.00 | $ 87,500.00 | $ 87,500.00 | $ 70,000.00 | $ 70,000.00 | $ 85,000.00 | $ 85,000.00
1-A3 CLEAR RIGHT OF WAY AC 50 S 6,500.00 | $ 32,500.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 75,000.00 | $ 23,708.00 | $ 118,540.00 | $ 39,500.00 | $ 197,500.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 175,000.00
1-A4 OZONE DAY DAY 4s 565.00 | $ 2,260.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 440.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 4.00[$ 5,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 2,000.00
1-A5 SURVEY MONUMENT EA 2| S 1,695.00 | $ 3,390.00 | $ 550.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 660.00 | $ 1,320.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00
1-A6 TRAFFIC CONTROL PLAN BY PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER EA 1s 16,950.00 | $ 16,950.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 14,385.00 | $ 14,385.00 | $ 13,500.00 | $ 13,500.00 | $ 16,120.00 | $ 16,120.00 | $ 15,200.00 | $ 15,200.00
1-A7 TRAFFIC CONTROL MOBILIZATION AND ADJUSTMENTS AL 1 s 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00
1-A8  |TRAFFIC CONTROL ITEMS (SIGNS, BARRICADES, CHANNELIZING

DEVICES, ETC.) MO 12| $ 22,992.40 | $ 275,908.80 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 43,200.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 1,560.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 72,000.00 | $ 6,909.40 | $ 82,912.80 | $ 6,700.00 | $ 80,400.00
1-A9  |TRAFFIC CONTROL ITEMS FOR TRAFFIC SIGNAL (MAST ARM SIGNS

AND COVERING: VEHICULAR AND PEDESTRIAN SIGNALI HEADS, AND

PUSH BUTTONS) MO 12| $ 565.00 | $ 6,780.00 | $ 975.00 | $ 11,700.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 42,000.00 | $ 15,400.00 | $ 184,800.00
1-A10  |MOBILE MESSAGE BOARD FOR TRAFFIC CONTROL EA 4 $ 20,340.00 | $ 81,360.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 84,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 96,000.00 | $ 21,600.00 | $ 86,400.00 | $ 27,279.00 | $ 109,116.00 | $ 24,700.00 | $ 98,800.00
1-A11  |BLOCK SODDING sY 1910 $ 9.04 | $ 17,266.40 | $ 12.00 | $ 22,920.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 30,560.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 19,100.00 | $ 9.70 [ $ 18,527.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 38,200.00
1-A12  |SILT FENCE FOR STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION LF 1520 $ 452 |$ 6,870.40 | S 2.50 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 12,160.00 | $ 425 | S 6,460.00 | S 6.90 | $ 10,488.00 | $ 420 | S 6,384.00
1-A13  |CURB INLET PROTECTION EA 27| $ 282.50 | $ 7,627.50 | $ 125.00 | $ 3,375.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 5,670.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 9,450.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 7,560.00
1-A14  |POST INLET PROTECTION EA 6| S 565.00 | $ 3,390.00 | $ 165.00 | $ 990.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 1,260.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 3,360.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 1,680.00
1-A15 |STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN AL s 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00

SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL] $ 569,303.10 S 395,335.00 $ 422,095.00 $ 657,764.00 S 520,073.80 $ 816,024.00 NO BID

PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS
1-B1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART B) AL 1S 62,000.00 | $ 62,000.00 | $ 85,000.00 | $ 85,000.00 | $ 16,913.60 | $ 16,913.60 | $ 70,000.00 | $ 70,000.00 [ $  112,000.00 | $ 112,000.00 | $ 84,000.00 | $ 84,000.00
1-82 STREET EXCAVATION Sy 18972 $ 1043 | $ 197,877.96 | $ 12.00 | $ 227,664.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 208,692.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 189,720.00 | $ 17.50 | $ 332,010.00 | $ 13.00 | $ 246,636.00
1-83 12" COMPACTED SUBGRADE SY 18972| $ 291 |S 55,208.52 | $ 350 | $ 66,402.00 | $ 240 $ 45,532.80 | $ 275($ 52,173.00 | $ 350 | $ 66,402.00 | $ 250 [ $ 47,430.00
1-84 8" CRUSHED LIMESTONE FLEX BASE (TY A, GR 1-2) SY 18972| $ 13.37 [ $ 253,655.64 | $ 19.00 | $ 360,468.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 379,440.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 379,440.00 | $ 2850 | S 540,702.00 | $ 19.00 | $ 360,468.00
1-B5 ONE-COURSE SURFACE TREATMENT SY 15631| $ 477 |$ 74,559.87 | $ 5.50 | $ 85,970.50 | $ 4.00 [ $ 62,524.00 | $ 561 |$ 87,689.91 | $ 5.60 | $ 87,533.60 | $ 450 [ $ 70,339.50
1-86 PRIME COAT (0.15 GAL/SY) GAL 2345 § 5.90 | $ 13,835.50 | $ 6.25|$ 14,656.25 | $ 460 | $ 10,787.00 | $ 392 |$ 9,192.40 | $ 560 |$ 13,132.00 | $ 5.50 | $ 12,897.50
1-87 1.5" HMACP (TYPE D) SURFACE COURSE sY 15631 $ 10.70 | $ 167,251.70 | $ 15.00 | $ 234,465.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 171,941.00 | $ 14.23 | $ 222,429.13 [ $ 1435 $ 224,304.85 | $ 18.00 | $ 281,358.00
1-88 2.5" HMACP (TYPE B) BASE COURSE Sy 15631 $ 16.72 | $ 261,350.32 | $ 22.00 [ $ 343,882.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 265,727.00 | $ 1991 | $ 311,213.21 | $ 33.60 [ $ 525,201.60 | $ 21.00 | $ 328,251.00
1-B9 GEOGRID (TENSAR TX-5) SY 18972| $ 3.94 | $ 74,749.68 | S 5.00 [ $ 94,860.00 | $ 330($ 62,607.60 | $ 425|$ 80,631.00 | $ 9.90 [ $ 187,822.80 | $ 370 [ $ 70,196.40
1-810  |6" CONCRETE DRIVEWAY (CLASS A) SF 11500| $ 9.79 | $ 112,585.00 | $ 8.00[$ 92,000.00 | $ 24.00 [ $ 276,000.00 | $ 850 | $ 97,750.00 | $ 13.90 | $ 159,850.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 126,500.00
1-B11  |6" CONCRETE DRIVEWAY (CLASS HES) SF 1078| $ 9.78 | $ 10,542.84 | $ 850 [ $ 9,163.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 30,184.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 10,780.00 | $ 15.70 | $ 16,924.60 | $ 12.00 | $ 12,936.00
1-812  |6" HEADER CURB (TYPE B) LF 50[ $ 50.85 [ $ 2,542.50 | $ 35.00 [ $ 1,750.00 | $ 86.00 | $ 4,300.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 72.10 [ $ 3,605.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 500.00
1-B13  |UNANTICIPATED CONCRETE DRIVEWAY REMOVAL SF 250( $ 10.63 [ S 2,657.50 | $ 5.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 12.00 [ $ 3,000.00 | $ 3.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 17.50 | $ 4,375.00 | $ 4.00 [ $ 1,000.00
1-B14  |ASPHALT PAVEMENT REPAIR (TYPE 1) SY 100[ $ 62.15 | $ 6,215.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 300.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 126.00 | $ 12,600.00 | $ 50.00 | $ 5,000.00
1-B15 |CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR SY 32($ 186.45 | $ 5,966.40 | S 140.00 | $ 4,480.00 | S 400.00 | $ 12,800.00 | $ 76.50 | $ 2,448.00 | S 245.00 | $ 7,840.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 2,240.00
1-B16  |ADJUST EXISTING MANHOLE TO FINISHED GRADE EA 6/ S 2,260.00 | $ 13,560.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 2,875.00 | $ 17,250.00 | $ 1,750.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 18,000.00
1-817  |REFL. PAV MRK TY 1 (Y) (4") (DBL) (SOLID)(090MIL) LF 920 $ 071 ($ 653.20 [ $ 0.65[$ 598.00 | $ 0.80 | $ 736.00 | $ 072 % 662.40 [ $ 088 [$ 809.60 | $ 1.00 | $ 920.00
1-B18  |REFL. PAV MRKTY 1 (Y) (4") (BRK)(090MIL) LF 1050| $ 071 $ 745.50 | $ 0.65 | $ 682.50 | $ 0.80 | $ 840.00 | $ 072 |$ 756.00 | $ 088 [$ 924.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 1,050.00
1-B19  |REFL PAV MRK TY | (W)4”(SLD)(090MIL) LF 4531| § 0.68 | $ 3,081.08 | $ 0.65 | $ 2,945.15 | $ 0.80 | $ 3,624.80 | $ 0.69 | $ 3,126.39 | $ 084 |$ 3,806.04 | S 1.00 | $ 4,531.00
1-B20  |REFL PAV MRK TY | (W) (8") (SOLID)(090MIL) LF 115 $ 5.65[$ 649.75 [ $ 5.50 [ $ 632.50 [ $ 6.60 | $ 759.00 | $ 5.75|$ 661.25 | $ 7.00 [ $ 805.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 805.00
1-B21  |REFL PAV MRK TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED

THERMOPLASTIC (W) 18” (YLD TRI) (125MIL) LF 12| $ 22.60 | $ 271.20 [ $ 22.00 | $ 264.00 | $ 27.00 | $ 324.00 | $ 23.00 | $ 276.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 336.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 336.00
1-822  |24-IN STOP BAR LF 25 $ 22.60 [ $ 565.00 | $ 22.00 [ $ 550.00 | $ 27.00 [ $ 675.00 | $ 23.00 [ $ 575.00 | $ 28.00 [ $ 700.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 700.00
1-B23  |REFL PAV MRKTY 1-C EA 2| S 1130 [ $ 22.60 | $ 11.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 13.30 [ $ 26.60 | $ 11.50 [ $ 23.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 28.00
1-824  |TYPE Il B-B PAVEMENT MARKINGS EA 10[ $ 11.30 [ $ 113.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 1330 | $ 133.00 | $ 11.50 | $ 115.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 140.00
1-B25  |TYPE Il A-A PAVEMENT MARKINGS EA 82| $ 11.30 [ $ 926.60 | $ 11.00 | $ 902.00 | $ 13.30 [ $ 1,090.60 | $ 11.50 [ $ 943.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 1,148.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 1,148.00
1-826  |REMOVE SM RD SN SUP & AM EA 13| $ 79.10 | $ 1,028.30 | $ 80.00 [ $ 1,040.00 | $ 460.00 | $ 5,980.00 | $ 82.60 | $ 1,073.80 | $ 98.00 [ $ 1,274.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 1,300.00
1-827  |FURNISH AND INSTALL ROADSIDE TRAFFIC SIGN AND SIGN SUPPORT

ASSEMBLY (TRIANGULAR SLIPBASE) EA 24[ S 649.75 | $ 15,594.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 19,200.00 | $ 770.00 | $ 18,480.00 | $ 678.50 | $ 16,284.00 | $ 805.00 | $ 19,320.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 19,200.00
1-828  |UNANTICIPATED STREET IMPROVEMENTS AL s 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00

SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS $ 1,436,708.66 $ 1,768,456.90 $ 1,726,618.00 $ 1,663,462.49 $ 2,432,594.09 $ 1,796,410.40 NO BID

PART C - ADA IMPROVEMENTS
1-C1 |MOB|L|ZAT|0N (MAX 5% PART C) AL 1S 8,650.00 | $ 8,650.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 3,200.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 11,200.00 | $ 11,200.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
1-C2_ |4-IN THICK CONCRETE SIDEWALK SF 19420 $ 729 | $ 141,571.80 | $ 6.00 | $ 116,520.00 | $ 13.00 | $ 252,460.00 | $ 7.85|$ 152,447.00 | $ 1120 $ 217,504.00 | $ 9.40 | $ 182,548.00

Page 1of 6




BID DATE: Friday, April 2, 2021
BRAWNER PARKWAY - CARROLL LANE TO KOSTORYZ ROAD J CARROLL WEAVER MAX UNDERGROUND CONSTRUCTION BAY LTD. MAKO CONTRACTING CLARK PIPELINE SERVICES JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES REYTEC CONSTRUCTION RESOURCES, INC.
PROJECT NO. 18008A 211 WEST WELDER ST. 3729 CORINA LN. 401 CORN PRODUCTS RD. 3636 S Alameda, #B153 6229 LEOPARD ST. 7505 UP RIVER RD. 1901 HOLLISTER
RFB #3537 SINTON, TX 78387 CC, TEXAS 78427 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78409 CC, TEXAS 78409 HOUSTON, TX 77080
ITEM DESCRIPTION [uniT] ary UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID 1 - HMAC
1-C3 CONCRETE CURB RAMP SF 280[ S 1271 | S 3,558.80 | S 18.00 | $ 5,040.00 | $ 17.50 [ $ 4,900.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 3040 | $ 8,512.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 8,400.00
1-C4 REFL PAV MRK TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED
THERMOPLASTIC (W) 24” (SLD) (125MIL) LF 52 $ 24.86 [ $ 1,292.72 | $ 11.00 | $ 572.00 | $ 27.00 [ $ 1,404.00 | $ 23.00 [ $ 1,196.00 | $ 28.00 [ $ 1,456.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 1,456.00
1-C5 SIDEWALK RETAINING CURB LF 160[ S 27.12 | S 4,339.20 | $ 30.00 | $ 4,800.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 17,600.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 4,800.00 | $ 57.00 | $ 9,120.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 11,200.00
1-C6 UNANTICIPATED CONCRETE SIDEWALK REMOVAL SF 250( $ 10.63 | $ 2,657.50 | $ 550 | $ 1,375.00 | $ 1130 [ $ 2,825.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 1,250.00 | $ 1120 | S 2,800.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 5,500.00
1-C7 UNANTICIPATED ADA IMPROVEMENTS AL 1S 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00
SUBTOTAL PART C - ADA IMPROVEMENTS| $ 173,570.02 $ 146,307.00 $ 293,889.00 $ 186,193.00 $ 262,092.00 $ 230,604.00 NO BID
PART D - SIGNALIZATION IMPROVEMENTS
1-D1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART D) AL 1 $ 1,977.50 | $ 1,977.50 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,450.00 | $ 2,450.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
1-D2 REMOVE PUSH BUTTONS EA 12| $ 56.50 | $ 678.00 | S 55.00 | $ 660.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 1,260.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 1,500.00
1-D3 POLARA iNAVIGATOR PED DETECT PUSH BUTTON (APS) w/ R10-3E
SIGN EA 12| $ 791.00 | $ 9,492.00 | $ 765.00 | $ 9,180.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 1,020.00 | $ 12,240.00 | $ 1,190.00 | $ 14,280.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 12,600.00
1-D4 POLARA PED DETECTOR CONTROLLER UNIT (ICCU-S) EA 1 s 4,859.00 | $ 4,859.00 | $ 4,750.00 | $ 4,750.00 | $ 6,400.00 | $ 6,400.00 | $ 5,040.00 | $ 5,040.00 | $ 5,880.00 | $ 5,880.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
1-D5 POLARA APS MOUNTING EXTENDER (iNS-EXT-06) EA 2[ S 621.50 | $ 1,243.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 830.00 | $ 1,660.00 | $ 228.00 | $ 456.00 | $ 266.00 | $ 532.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 1,600.00
1-D6 POLARA APS HEIGHT REDUCING EXTENDER (iN-EXTHTRED) EA 1 $ 734.50 | $ 734.50 [ $ 700.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 970.00 | $ 970.00 | $ 270.00 | $ 270.00 [ $ 315.00 [ $ 315.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00
1-D7  |ALPHA FXM 2000 UNINTERRUPTIBLE POWER SUPPLY (INCLUDE
REMOTE BATTERY MONITORING SYSTEM PLUS). REMOVE AND
REPLACE EXISTING UPS IN EXISTING CABINET. EA 1 s 9,266.00 | $ 9,266.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 12,300.00 | $ 12,300.00 | $ 8,640.00 | $ 8,640.00 | $ 10,080.00 | $ 10,080.00 | $ 9,250.00 | $ 9,250.00
1-D8 WaAVETRONIX CILICK 656 CABINET INTERFACE DEVICE EA 1S 6,384.50 | $ 6,384.50 | S 6,100.00 | $ 6,100.00 | $ 8,500.00 | $ 8,500.00 | $ 5,844.00 | $ 5,844.00 | 6,818.00 | $ 6,818.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 7,000.00
1-D9 DATA AGGREGATOR DA-400, POWER/COMM CABLE AND 5-BAND
ANTENNA (INCLUDES Y SDLC CABLE AND ANTENNA BRACKET SIDE
MOUNT WITH PROTECTION COVER) EA 1 $ 6,531.40 [ $ 6,531.40 | $ 6,250.00 | $ 6,250.00 | $ 8,700.00 | $ 8,700.00 | $ 6,840.00 | $ 6,840.00 | $ 7,980.00 | $ 7,980.00 | $ 8,300.00 | $ 8,300.00
1-D10  |UNANTICIPATED SIGNALIZATION IMPROVEMENTS AL s 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART D - SIGNALIZATION IMPROVEMENTS| $ 43,165.90 $ 41,740.00 $ 54,930.00 $ 44,410.00 $ 51,595.00 $ 50,850.00 NO BID
PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS
1-E1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART E) AL 1 $ 23,500.00 | $ 23,500.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 29,400.00 | $ 29,400.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00
1-E2 18-IN Dia. RCP (CLASS IIl) LF 435| S 73.54 | S 31,989.90 | $ 75.00 | $ 32,625.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 82,650.00 | $ 172.50 | $ 75,037.50 | $ 193.10 | $ 83,998.50 | $ 170.00 | $ 73,950.00
1-E3 24-IN Dia. RCP (CLASS Ill) LF 55 $ 82.49 | $ 4,536.95 | $ 88.00 [ $ 4,840.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 19,250.00 | $ 138.00 | $ 7,590.00 | $ 204.77 | $ 11,262.35 | $ 210.00 | $ 11,550.00
1-E4 30-IN Dia. RCP (CLASS I11) LF 26[ $ 219.82 | $ 571532 | $ 110.00 | $ 2,860.00 | $ 410.00 | $ 10,660.00 | $ 207.00 | $ 5,382.00 | $ 248.36 [ $ 6,457.36 | $ 240.00 | $ 6,240.00
1-E5 TIE-IN EXISTING 24" DIA RCP EA 1 $ 2,150.18 | $ 2,150.18 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 1,900.00 | $ 2,875.00 [ $ 2,875.00 | $ 1,586.67 | $ 1,586.67 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
1-E6 TIE-IN TO PROPOSED INLET EA 8l $ 2,150.25 | $ 17,202.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 20,800.00 | $ 4,025.00 | $ 32,200.00 | $ 2,450.00 | $ 19,600.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 20,000.00
1-E7 5' STANDARD CURB INLET EA 20[ $ 3,455.32 [ $ 69,106.40 | $ 4,250.00 | $ 85,000.00 | $ 5,400.00 | $ 108,000.00 | $ 10,360.00 | $ 207,200.00 | $ 5,110.00 | $ 102,200.00 | $ 6,300.00 | $ 126,000.00
1-E8 8' CURB INLET EA 2| S 5,300.05 | $ 10,600.10 | $ 5,750.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 9,400.00 | $ 18,800.00 | $ 11,760.00 | $ 23,520.00 | $ 7,021.00 | $ 14,042.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 15,000.00
1-E9 5' CURB INLET EXTENSION EA 13| $ 2,590.37 [ $ 33,674.81 [ $ 2,050.00 | $ 26,650.00 | $ 3,900.00 | $ 50,700.00 | $ 5,376.00 | $ 69,888.00 | $ 4,332.00 | $ 56,316.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 31,200.00
1-E10  |PLUG EXIST. 15-IN RCP FROM INSIDE OF MH EA 2| $ 2,150.25 | $ 4,300.50 | $ 1,750.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 791.00 | $ 1,582.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 1,000.00
1-E11  |5'SWMH EA 1 $ 12,678.98 | $ 12,678.98 | $ 6,250.00 | $ 6,250.00 | $ 13,800.00 | $ 13,800.00 | $ 16,800.00 | $ 16,800.00 | $ 11,900.00 | $ 11,900.00 | $ 9,800.00 | $ 9,800.00
1-E12  |6" CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER LF 10011 $ 2236 (S 223,845.96 | $ 17.50 | $ 175,192.50 | $ 27.00 | $ 270,297.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 220,242.00 | $ 27.20 | $ 272,299.20 | $ 25.00 | $ 250,275.00
1-E13  |5-IN CONCRETE RIP RAP SF 50[ $ 111.97 | $ 5,598.50 | $ 50.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 96.00 | $ 4,800.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 53.33[$ 2,666.50 | $ 10.00 | $ 500.00
1-E14  |TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORM WATER CONDUITS LF 512| $ 9.04 | $ 4,628.48 | S 4.00 | $ 2,048.00 | S 1.40 | S 716.80 | S 560 | $ 2,867.20 | S 2.80 | $ 1,433.60 | S 7.00 | $ 3,584.00
1-E15  |TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORM WATER MH, JUNCTION BOX, AND
INLETS EA 23[ S 339.00 | $ 7,797.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 8,050.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 16,100.00 | $ 1,120.00 | $ 25,760.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 16,100.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 16,100.00
1-E16  |UNANTICIPATED STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1S 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS $ 492,325.08 $ 425,515.50 $ 661,973.80 $ 760,961.70 $ 665,844.18 $ 632,699.00 NO BID
PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS
1-F1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART F) AL 1 $ 31,600.00 | $ 31,600.00 | $ 23,000.00 | $ 23,000.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 39,900.00 | $ 39,900.00 | $ 46,000.00 | $ 46,000.00
1-F2 6-IN GATE VALVE WITH BOX AND COVER EA 6| $ 2,433.30 | $ 14,599.80 | $ 1,175.00 | $ 7,050.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 1,848.00 | $ 11,088.00 | $ 1,211.00 | $ 7,266.00 | S 1,700.00 | $ 10,200.00
1-F3 6-IN DIA C900 PVC WATERLINE (DR 18) LF 4605| $ 54.50 [ $ 250,972.50 | $ 50.00 | $ 230,250.00 | $ 63.00 [ $ 290,115.00 | $ 72.80 [ $ 335,244.00 | $ 96.07 [ $ 442,402.35 | $ 95.00 | $ 437,475.00
1-F4 6-IN DIA D.I. WATERLINE LF 533 $ 68.65 | S 36,590.45 | $ 70.00 | $ 37,310.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 58,630.00 | $ 173.60 | $ 92,528.80 | $ 152,53 | $ 81,298.49 | $ 275.00 | $ 146,575.00
1-F5 6-IN DIA 45° D.I. BEND EA 16| $ 991.07 | $ 15,857.12 | $ 750.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 870.00 | $ 13,920.00 | $ 672.00 | $ 10,752.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 378.00 | $ 6,048.00
1-F6 6-IN DIA 22.5° D.I. BEND EA 2| S 957.16 | $ 1,914.32 [ S 575.00 [ $ 1,150.00 | $ 990.00 | $ 1,980.00 | $ 728.00 | $ 1,456.00 | $ 329.00 [ $ 658.00 [ $ 378.00 | $ 756.00
1-F7 6-IN PLUG EA 1 $ 1,130.00 | $ 1,130.00 | $ 285.00 | $ 285.00 | $ 590.00 | $ 590.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 315.00 | $ 315.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 350.00
1-F8 8-IN DIA C900 PVC WATERLINE (DR 18) LF 150| $ 125.13 | $ 18,769.50 | $ 60.00 | S 9,000.00 | $ 86.00 | $ 12,900.00 | $ 95.20 [ $ 14,280.00 | $ 102.83 | $ 15,424.50 | $ 100.00 | $ 15,000.00
1-F9 8-IN GATE VALVE WITH BOX AND COVER EA 1s 2,681.96 | $ 2,681.96 | S 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 1,890.00 | $ 1,890.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 2,200.00
1-F10  |8-IN TIE-IN CONNECTION EA 1S 2,825.00 | $ 2,825.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 4,300.00 | $ 4,300.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 1,722.00 | $ 1,722.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 2,200.00
1-F11  [8-IN DIA 45° D.Il. BEND EA 2l $ 841.95 | $ 1,683.90 | $ 775.00 | $ 1,550.00 | $ 940.00 | $ 1,880.00 | $ 952.00 | $ 1,904.00 | $ 403.20 | $ 806.40 | $ 385.00 | $ 770.00
1-F12  |8-IN X 6-IN DI TEE EA 1S 993.47 | $ 99347 | S 650.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 990.00 | $ 990.00 | $ 1,064.00 | $ 1,064.00 | $ 546.00 [ $ 546.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 560.00
1-F13  |8-IN x 6-IN TAPPING SLEEVE EA 2l $ 5,424.00 | $ 10,848.00 | $ 3,850.00 | $ 7,700.00 | $ 5,900.00 | $ 11,800.00 | $ 8,960.00 | $ 17,920.00 | $ 5,810.00 | $ 11,620.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 36,000.00
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BID DATE: Friday, April 2, 2021
BRAWNER PARKWAY - CARROLL LANE TO KOSTORYZ ROAD

PROJECT NO. 18008A

J CARROLL WEAVER
211 WEST WELDER ST.

MAX UNDERGROUND CONSTRUCTION
3729 CORINA LN.

BAY LTD.

401 CORN PRODUCTS RD.

MAKO CONTRACTING
3636 S Alameda, #B153

CLARK PIPELINE SERVICES
6229 LEOPARD ST.

JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES
7505 UP RIVER RD.

REYTEC CONSTRUCTION RESOURCES, INC.

1901 HOLLISTER

RFB # 3537 SINTON, TX 78387 CC, TEXAS 78427 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78411 CC, TX 78409 CC, TEXAS 78409 HOUSTON, TX 77080
ITEM DESCRIPTION |UNIT| QTY UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID 1 - HMAC
1-F14  |8-IN x 6-IN D.I. REDUCER EA 1 s 800.20 | $ 800.20 | $ 875.00 | $ 875.00 | $ 2,900.00 | $ 2,900.00 | $ 952.00 | $ 952.00 | $ 511.00 [ $ 511.00 [ $ 204.00 | $ 204.00
1-F15 FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY (TYPE 1) EA 10[ $ 7,169.64 | $ 71,696.40 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 45,000.00 | $ 6,700.00 | $ 67,000.00 | $ 7,616.00 | $ 76,160.00 | $ 4,771.20 | $ 47,712.00 | $ 6,800.00 | $ 68,000.00
1-F16  |REMOVE AND REPLACE EXISTING FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY EA 1 s 3,955.00 | $ 3,955.00 | $ 4,250.00 | $ 4,250.00 | $ 7,600.00 | $ 7,600.00 | $ 6,720.00 | $ 6,720.00 | S 5,496.40 | $ 5,496.40 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
1-F17  |ADJUST EXIST WATER VALVE BOX TO FINISH GRADE EA 6/ S 904.00 | $ 5,424.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 5,100.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 12,600.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 3,360.00 | $ 574.00 | $ 3,444.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 5,100.00
1-F18  |ABANDON EXIST 6-IN C.I. WATERLINE AND FILL W/GROUT LF 2521 $ 226 |$ 5,697.46 | S 16.00 | $ 40,336.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 40,336.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 70,588.00 | $ 1820 | S 45,882.20 | $ 16.50 | $ 41,596.50
1-F19  |TRENCH SAFETY FOR WATERLINES LF 5288| $ 339 (S 17,926.32 | $ 3.00 [ $ 15,864.00 | $ 140 (S 7,403.20 | $ 168 [ S 8,883.84 | $ 2.80 [ $ 14,806.40 | $ 5.00 | $ 26,440.00
1-F20  |WATER SERVICES (TIE TO EXISTING) EA 35 $ 2,570.73 | $ 89,975.55 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 52,500.00 | $ 2,900.00 | $ 101,500.00 | $ 2,184.00 | $ 76,440.00 | $ 3,131.80 | $ 109,613.00 | $ 2,660.00 | $ 93,100.00
1-F21  |UNANTICIPATED WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL s 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS $ 618,940.95 $ 530,570.00 $ 685,044.20 $ 801,300.64 $ 869,913.74 $ 974,074.50 NO BID
PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS
1-G1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART G) AL 1 s 18,995.00 | $ 18,995.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00
1-G2 8-IN DIA TIE-IN TO EXISTING MH EA 1s 1,130.00 | $ 1,130.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 1,150.00 | $ 1,150.00 | $ 2,87233 | S 2,87233 | S 2,520.00 | $ 2,520.00
1-G3 REHAB EXISTING 8-IN DIA VCP WASTEWATER GRAVITY LINE BY PIPE
BURSTING W/ 8-IN HDPE (DIOD) LF 2453 $ 84.75 | $ 207,891.75 | $ 98.00 | $ 240,394.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 245,300.00 | $ 98.56 | $ 241,767.68 | S 88.55 | $ 217,213.15 | $ 200.00 | $ 490,600.00
1-G4 REHABILITATE EXISTING BRICK MH EA 1s 8,475.00 | $ 8,475.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 8,700.00 | $ 8,700.00 | $ 8,625.00 | $ 8,625.00 | $ 11,200.00 | $ 11,200.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 13,000.00
1-G5 4' DIA FIBERGLASS MH EA 50 S 14,690.00 | $ 73,450.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 75,000.00 | $ 13,400.00 | $ 67,000.00 | $ 14,950.00 | $ 74,750.00 | $ 8,470.00 | $ 42,350.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 52,500.00
1-G6 EXTRA DEPTH FOR MH VF 3[ S 395.50 | $ 1,186.50 | $ 285.00 [ $ 855.00 | $ 990.00 | $ 2,970.00 | $ 287.50 | $ 862.50 | $ 919.80 | $ 2,759.40 | $ 1,420.00 | $ 4,260.00
1-G7 ABANDON EXISTING MH EA 2| S 2,486.00 | S 4,972.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 4,100.00 | $ 8,200.00 | $ 2,530.00 | $ 5,060.00 | $ 2,359.00 | $ 4,718.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00
1-G8 TRENCH SAFETY FOR WASTEWATER MH EA 50 S 339.00 | $ 1,695.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 1,750.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 345.00 | $ 1,725.00 | $ 1,120.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 2,500.00
1-G9 WASTEWATER SERVICE CONNECTIONS EA 35 $ 791.00 | $ 27,685.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 2,900.00 | $ 101,500.00 | $ 805.00 | $ 28,175.00 | $ 3,668.40 | $ 128,394.00 | $ 7,800.00 | $ 273,000.00
1-G10  |UNANTICIPATED WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1S 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00
SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS| $ 378,980.25 $ 419,999.00 $ 481,670.00 $ 413,615.18 $ 469,606.88 $ 907,880.00 NO BID
PART H - GAS LINE IMPROVEMENTS
1-H1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART H) AL 1S 775.00 | $ 775.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,610.00 | $ 1,610.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00
1-H2 2-IN DIA P.E. GAS LINE LF 230[ $ 1130 [ $ 2,599.00 | $ 74.00 | $ 17,020.00 | $ 56.00 | $ 12,880.00 | $ 34.50 | $ 7,935.00 | $ 96.30 | $ 22,149.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 3,450.00
1-H3 2-IN GAS VALVE EA 4 S 1,695.00 | $ 6,780.00 | S 1,750.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 4,700.00 | $ 18,800.00 | $ 1,150.00 | $ 4,600.00 | $ 2,401.00 | $ 9,604.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
1-H4 TRENCH SAFETY FOR GAS LINE LF 230) $ 339 (S 779.70 [ $ 18.00 | $ 4,140.00 | $ 66.00 | $ 15,180.00 | $ 230 $ 529.00 | $ 2.80 [ $ 644.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 1,150.00
1-H5 2-IN GAS LINE CONNECTIONS EA 2| S 1,695.00 | $ 3,390.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 660.00 | $ 1,320.00 | $ 3,910.00 | $ 7,820.00 | $ 1,890.00 | $ 3,780.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00
1-H6 UNANTICIPATED GAS IMPROVEMENTS AL s 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00
SUBTOTAL PART H - GAS LINE IMPROVEMENTS $ 15,423.70 $ 31,860.00 $ 50,780.00 $ 22,984.00 $ 38,887.00 $ 13,300.00 NO BID
TOTAL BASE BID 1 HMAC - (PARTS A THRU H) $ 3,728,417.66 $ 3,759,783.40 $ 4,377,000.00 $ 4,550,691.01 $ 5,310,606.69 $ 5,421,841.90 NO BID
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TABULATION OF BIDS
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT

BID DATE: Friday, April 2, 2021
BRAWNER PARKWAY - CARROLL LANE TO KOSTORYZ ROAD REYTEC CONSTRUCTION RESOURCES, INC. MAKO CONTRACTING JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES BAY LTD. CLARK PIPELINE SERVICES J CARROLL WEAVER MAX UNDERGROUND CONSTRUCTION
PROJECT NO. 18008A 1901 HOLLISTER 3636 S Alameda, #8153 7505 UP RIVER RD. 401 CORN PRODUCTS RD. 6229 LEOPARD ST. 211 WEST WELDER ST. 3729 CORINA LN.
RFB #3537 HOUSTON, TX 77080 CC, TX 78411 CC, TEXAS 78409 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 SINTON, TX 78387 CC, TEXAS 78427
ITEM DESCRIPTION Tunit] _ary UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID 2 - CONCRETE
PART A - GENERAL
2-A1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART A) AL 1 $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 32,000.00 | $ 32,000.00 | $ 38,000.00 | $ 38,000.00
2-A2 BONDS AND INSURANCE (MAX 2% BID) AL 1 $ 60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 94,500.00 | $ 94,500.00 | $ 90,000.00 | $ 90,000.00
2-A3 CLEAR RIGHT OF WAY AC 5% 11,000.00 | $ 55,000.00 | $ 39,500.00 | $ 197,500.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 175,000.00
2-Ad4 OZONE DAY DAY 2| S 500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1.00 [ $ 2.00|$ 500.00 | $ 1,000.00
2-A5 SURVEY MONUMENT EA 2| $ 1,700.00 | $ 3,400.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00
2-A6 TRAFFIC CONTROL PLAN BY PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER EA 1 $ 12,000.00 | $ 12,000.00 | $ 13,500.00 | $ 13,500.00 | $ 15,200.00 | $ 15,200.00
2-A7 TRAFFIC CONTROL MOBILIZATION AND ADJUSTMENTS AL 1 $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00 | $ 50,000.00
2-A8  |TRAFFIC CONTROL ITEMS (SIGNS, BARRICADES, CHANNELIZING
DEVICES, ETC.) MO 12| $ 10,500.00 | $ 126,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 72,000.00 | $ 6,700.00 | $ 80,400.00
2-A9  |TRAFFIC CONTROL ITEMS FOR TRAFFIC SIGNAL (MAST ARM SIGNS
AND COVERING: VEHICULAR AND PEDESTRIAN SIGNALI HEADS, AND
PUSH BUTTONS) MO 12| $ 2,300.00 | $ 27,600.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 15,400.00 | $ 184,800.00
2-A10  |MOBILE MESSAGE BOARD FOR TRAFFIC CONTROL EA 4] $ 19,000.00 | $ 76,000.00 | $ 20,700.00 | $ 82,800.00 | $ 24,700.00 | $ 98,800.00
2-A11  [BLOCK SODDING sy 1910| $ 5.50 | $ 10,505.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 19,100.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 38,200.00
2-A12  [SILT FENCE FOR STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION LF 1520] $ 450 | $ 6,840.00 | $ 425 | S 6,460.00 | S 420 (S 6,384.00
2-A13  |CURB INLET PROTECTION EA 27| $ 165.00 | $ 4,455.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 2,700.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 7,560.00
2-A14  |POST INLET PROTECTION EA 6| $ 165.00 | $ 990.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 1,680.00
2-A15 [STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN AL 1| s 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL $ 473,790.00 $ 663,162.00 $ 820,024.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS
2-B1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART B) AL 1 $ 45,000.00 | $ 45,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 | $ 115,000.00 | $ 115,000.00
2-B2 STREET EXCAVATION SY 18972 $ 9.00 | $ 170,748.00 | $ 12.00 [ S 227,664.00 | $ 13.00 [ S 246,636.00
2-83 12" COMPACTED SUBGRADE SY 18972| $ 4.00 [ $ 75,888.00 [ S 275(s 52,173.00 [ $ 250 (S 47,430.00
2-B4 7" CRUSHED LIMESTONE FLEX BASE (TY A, GR 1-2) Sy 18972| $ 18.00 | $ 341,496.00 | S 18.00 | $ 341,496.00 | S 18.50 | $ 350,982.00
2-85 ONE-COURSE SURFACE TREATMENT SY 17877| $ 550 | S 98,323.50 [ $ 7.08 (S 126,569.16 | $ 4.50 | $ 80,446.50
2-B6 6" REINFORCED CONCRETE PAVEMENT SY 17877 $ 67.00 | $ 1,197,759.00 | $ 81.00 | $ 1,448,037.00 | $ 75.00 | $ 1,340,775.00
2-B7 6" CONCRETE DRIVEWAY (CLASS A) SF 11500| $ 12.00 | $ 138,000.00 | $ 850 [ $ 97,750.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 126,500.00
2-B8 6" CONCRETE DRIVEWAY (CLASS HES) SF 1078( $ 13.00 | $ 14,014.00 | $ 9.00 [ $ 9,702.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 12,936.00
2-B9 6" HEADER CURB (TYPE B) LF 50| § 80.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 500.00
2-B10  |UNANTICIPATED CONCRETE DRIVEWAY REMOVAL SF 250[ $ 200($ 500.00 | $ 500 (S 1,250.00 | $ 4,00 | $ 1,000.00
2-B11  |ASPHALT PAVEMENT REPAIR (TYPE 1) SY 118 $ 170.00 | $ 20,060.00 | $ 110.84 | $ 13,079.12 | $ 50.00 | $ 5,900.00
2-B12  [CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR SY 32 $ 180.00 | $ 5,760.00 | $ 108.00 | $ 3,456.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 2,240.00
2-B13  |ADJUST EXISTING MANHOLE TO FINISHED GRADE EA 6l $ 1,800.00 | $ 10,800.00 | $ 2,875.00 | S 17,250.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 18,000.00
2-B14  [REFL. PAV MRKTY 1 (Y) (4") (DBL) (SOLID)(090MIL) LF 920| $ 0.80 | $ 736.00 | $ 0.81]$ 745.20 | $ 1.00 [ $ 920.00
2-B15  [REFL. PAV MRKTY 1 (Y) (4") (BRK)(090MIL) LF 1050| $ 0.80 | $ 840.00 | $ 0.81]$ 850.50 | $ 1.00 [ $ 1,050.00
2-B16  [REFL PAV MRK TY | (W)4”(SLD)(090MIL) LF 4531| $§ 0.70 | $ 3,171.70 [ $ 075 | $ 3,398.25 [ $ 1.00 [ $ 4,531.00
2-B17  [REFL PAV MRKTY | (W) (8") (SOLID)(090MIL) LF 115[ $ 450 | $ 517.50 [ $ 460 | S 529.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 805.00
2-818  [REFL PAV MRK TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED
THERMOPLASTIC (W) 18” (YLD TRI) (125MIL) LF 12| § 28.00 | $ 336.00 | $ 2875 | $ 345.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 336.00
2-B19  [24-IN STOP BAR EA 25| $ 28.00 [ $ 700.00 | $ 2875 | $ 718.75 | $ 28.00 | $ 700.00
2-B20  [REFL PAV MRK TY 1-C EA 2|$ 11.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 1150 | $ 23.00 [ $ 14.00 | $ 28.00
2-B21  [TYPE Il B-B PAVEMENT MARKINGS EA 10| $ 11.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 1150 | $ 115.00 | $ 14.00 | $ 140.00
2-B22  [TYPE Il A-A PAVEMENT MARKINGS EA 82( $ 9.00 | $ 738.00 | $ 9.20 | $ 754.40 | $ 14.00 | $ 1,148.00
2-B23  [REMOVE SM RD SN SUP & AM EA 13( $ 78.00 | $ 1,014.00 | $ 82.60 | $ 1,073.80 [ $ 100.00 | $ 1,300.00
2-824  [FURNISH AND INSTALL ROADSIDE TRAFFIC SIGN AND SIGN SUPPORT
ASSEMBLY (TRIANGULAR SLIPBASE) EA 24[ $ 640.00 | $ 15,360.00 | $ 678.50 | $ 16,284.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 19,200.00
2-B25 |UNANTICIPATED STREET IMPROVEMENTS AL s 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00 | $ 98,500.00
SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS| $ 2,244,393.70 $ 2,562,763.18 $ 2,477,003.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PART C - ADA IMPROVEMENTS
2-C1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART C) AL 1 $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
2-C2 4-IN THICK CONCRETE SIDEWALK SF 19420| $ 9.00 | $ 174,780.00 | $ 7.85|$ 152,447.00 | $ 9.40 | S 182,548.00
2-C3 CONCRETE CURB RAMP SF 280 $ 35.00 [ $ 9,800.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 8,400.00
2-Cc4 REFL PAV MRK TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED
THERMOPLASTIC (W) 24” (SLD) (125MIL) LF 52 $ 24.00 | $ 1,248.00 | $ 25.30 | $ 1,315.60 | $ 28.00 | $ 1,456.00
2-C5 SIDEWALK RETAINING CURB LF 160[ $ 34.00 | $ 5,440.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 11,200.00
2-C6 UNANTICIPATED CONCRETE SIDEWALK REMOVAL SF 250[ $ 200($ 500.00 | $ 500 (S 1,250.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 5,500.00
2-C7 UNANTICIPATED ADA IMPROVEMENTS AL s 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00 | $ 11,500.00
SUBTOTAL PART C - ADA IMPROVEMENTS $ 213,268.00 $ 188,112.60 $ 230,604.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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BID DATE: Friday, April 2, 2021

BRAWNER PARKWAY - CARROLL LANE TO KOSTORYZ ROAD REYTEC CONSTRUCTION RESOURCES, INC. MAKO CONTRACTING JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES BAY LTD. CLARK PIPELINE SERVICES J CARROLL WEAVER MAX UNDERGROUND CONSTRUCTION
PROJECT NO. 18008A 1901 HOLLISTER 3636 S Alameda, #8153 7505 UP RIVER RD. 401 CORN PRODUCTS RD. 6229 LEOPARD ST. 211 WEST WELDER ST. 3729 CORINA LN.
RFB #3537 HOUSTON, TX 77080 CC, TX 78411 CC, TEXAS 78409 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 SINTON, TX 78387 CC, TEXAS 78427
ITEM DESCRIPTION Tunit] _ary UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID 2 - CONCRETE
PART D - SIGNALIZATION IMPROVEMENTS
2-D1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART D) AL 1 $ 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
2-D2 REMOVE PUSH BUTTONS EA 12| $ 84.00 | $ 1,008.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 1,080.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 1,500.00
2-D3  [POLARA iNAVIGATOR PED DETECT PUSH BUTTON (APS) w/ R10-3E
SIGN EA 12( $ 950.00 | $ 11,400.00 | $ 1,020.00 | $ 12,240.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 12,600.00
2-D4 POLARA PED DETECTOR CONTROLLER UNIT (ICCU-S) EA 1 $ 4,700.00 | $ 4,700.00 | $ 5,040.00 | $ 5,040.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
2-D5 POLARA APS MOUNTING EXTENDER (iNS-EXT-06) EA 2| $ 212.00 [ $ 424.00 | $ 228.00 | $ 456.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 1,600.00
2-D6  |POLARA APS HEIGHT REDUCING EXTENDER (iN-EXTHTRED) EA 1] s 252.00 [ $ 252.00 [ $ 270.00 | $ 270.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00
2-D7  |ALPHA FXM 2000 UNINTERRUPTIBLE POWER SUPPLY (INCLUDE
REMOTE BATTERY MONITORING SYSTEM PLUS). REMOVE AND
REPLACE EXISTING UPS IN EXISTING CABINET. EA 1 s 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 8,640.00 | S 8,640.00 | S 9,250.00 | $ 9,250.00
2-D8 WaAVETRONIX CILICK 656 CABINET INTERFACE DEVICE EA 1 $ 5,400.00 | $ 5,400.00 | $ 5,844.00 | $ 5,844.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 7,000.00
2-D9 DATA AGGREGATOR DA-400, POWER/COMM CABLE AND 5-BAND
ANTENNA (INCLUDES Y SDLC CABLE AND ANTENNA BRACKET SIDE
MOUNT WITH PROTECTION COVER) EA 1 $ 6,300.00 | $ 6,300.00 | $ 6,840.00 | $ 6,840.00 | $ 8,300.00 | $ 8,300.00
2-D10  |UNANTICIPATED SIGNALIZATION IMPROVEMENTS AL 1S 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART D - SIGNALIZATION IMPROVEMENTS! $ 41,084.00 $ 44,410.00 $ 50,850.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS
2-E1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART E) AL 1| $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
2-E2 18-IN Dia. RCP (CLASS Ill) LF 435| $ 160.00 | $ 69,600.00 | $ 17250 | $ 75,037.50 | $ 170.00 | $ 73,950.00
2-£3 24-IN Dia. RCP (CLASS I1l) LF 55 $ 190.00 | $ 10,450.00 | $ 138.00 | $ 7,590.00 | $ 210.00 | $ 11,550.00
2-E4 30-IN Dia. RCP (CLASS I1l) LF 26| $ 250.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 207.00 | $ 5,382.00 | $ 240.00 | $ 6,240.00
2-E5 TIE-IN EXISTING 24" DIA RCP EA 1 $ 960.00 | $ 960.00 | $ 2,875.00 | $ 2,875.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
2-E6 TIE-IN TO PROPOSED INLET EA 8| $ 720.00 | $ 5,760.00 | $ 4,025.00 | $ 32,200.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 20,000.00
2-E7 5' STANDARD CURB INLET EA 20( $ 4,800.00 | $ 96,000.00 | $ 10,360.00 | $ 207,200.00 | $ 6,300.00 | $ 126,000.00
2-E8 8' CURB INLET EA 2|$ 7,500.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 11,760.00 [ $ 23,520.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 15,000.00
2-E9 5' CURB INLET EXTENSION EA 13| § 3,300.00 | $ 42,900.00 | $ 5,376.00 | $ 69,888.00 [ $ 2,400.00 | $ 31,200.00
2-E10  |PLUG EXIST. 15-IN RCP FROM INSIDE OF MH EA 2| $ 900.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 1,000.00
2-E11  [5'SWMH EA 1 s 9,000.00 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 16,800.00 | $ 16,800.00 | $ 9,800.00 | $ 9,800.00
2-E12  |6" CONCRETE CURB AND GUTTER LF 100 $ 25.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 22.00 S 2,200.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 4,000.00
2-E13  |6" CONCRETE CURB LF 10011 $ 5.00 | $ 50,055.00 [ $ 15.00 [ $ 150,165.00 | $ 8.00 (S 80,088.00
2-E14  |5-IN CONCRETE RIP RAP SF 50| $ 40.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 560 |$ 280.00 [ $ 10.00 [ $ 500.00
2-E15 | TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORM WATER CONDUITS LF 512( $ 4.00 (S 2,048.00 | $ 575|$ 2,944.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 3,584.00
2-E16  [TRENCH SAFETY FOR STORM WATER MH, JUNCTION BOX, AND
INLETS EA 23| $ 40.00 | $ 920.00 | $ 1,150.00 | $ 26,450.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 16,100.00
2-E17  |UNANTICIPATED STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1S 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00 | $ 35,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART E - DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS $ 365,493.00 $ 693,131.50 $ 456,512.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS
2-F1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART F) AL 1 $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 45,000.00 | $ 45,000.00
2-F2 6-IN GATE VALVE WITH BOX AND COVER EA 6| S 1,400.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 1,848.00 | $ 11,088.00 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 10,200.00
2-F3 6-IN DIA C900 PVC WATERLINE (DR 18) LF 4605 $ 75.00 | $ 345,375.00 [ $ 7280 | S 335,244.00 [ $ 95.00 | $ 437,475.00
2-F4 6-IN DIA D.I. WATERLINE LF 533[ $ 125.00 | $ 66,625.00 [ $ 173.60 | $ 92,528.80 | $ 275.00 | $ 146,575.00
2-F5 6-IN DIA 45° D.I. BEND EA 16| $ 360.00 | $ 5,760.00 | $ 672.00 | $ 10,752.00 [ $ 378.00 | $ 6,048.00
2-F6 6-IN DIA 22.5° D.I. BEND EA 2| $ 360.00 | $ 720.00 | $ 728.00 | $ 1,456.00 | $ 378.00 | $ 756.00
2-F7 6-IN PLUG EA 1 $ 780.00 | $ 780.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 350.00 [ $ 350.00
2-F8 8-IN DIA C900 PVC WATERLINE (DR 18) LF 150| $ 120.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 95.20 | $ 14,280.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 15,000.00
2-F9 8-IN GATE VALVE WITH BOX AND COVER EA 1| s 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 2,200.00
2-F10  [8-IN TIE-IN CONNECTION EA 1| $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 2,200.00
2-F11  [8-IN DIA 45° D.I. BEND EA 2[$ 480.00 | $ 960.00 | $ 952.00 | $ 1,904.00 | $ 385.00 | $ 770.00
2-F12  |8-IN DI TEE EA 1 $ 580.00 | $ 580.00 [ $ 1,064.00 | $ 1,064.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 560.00
2-F13  [8-IN x 6-IN TAPPING SLEEVE EA 2| ¢ 7,000.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 8,960.00 | $ 17,920.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 36,000.00
2-F14  |8-INx 6-IN D.I. REDUCER EA 1 $ 400.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 952.00 | $ 952.00 | $ 204.00 | $ 204.00
2-F15  [FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY (TYPE 1) EA 10| $ 6,500.00 | $ 65,000.00 | $ 7,616.00 | $ 76,160.00 | $ 6,800.00 | $ 68,000.00
2-F16  |REMOVE AND REPLACE EXISTING FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY EA 1 $ 7,500.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 6,720.00 | $ 6,720.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00
2-F17 | ADJUST EXIST WATER VALVE BOX TO FINISH GRADE EA 6| $ 500.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 560.00 | $ 3,360.00 | $ 850.00 | $ 5,100.00
2-F18  |ABANDON EXIST 6-IN C.I. WATERLINE AND FILL W/GROUT LF 2521] $ 8.00|$ 20,168.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 70,588.00 [ $ 16.50 | $ 41,596.50
2-F19 | TRENCH SAFETY FOR WATERLINES LF 5288) $ 0.80 | $ 4,230.40 | $ 168 [ S 8,883.84 | $ 5.00|$ 26,440.00
2-F20 | WATER SERVICES (TIE TO EXISTING) EA 350 $ 1,600.00 | $ 56,000.00 | $ 2,184.00 | $ 76,440.00 | $ 2,660.00 | $ 93,100.00
2-F21  |UNANTICIPATED WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1S 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00 | $ 33,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART F - WATER IMPROVEMENTS| $ 675,598.40 $ 801,300.64 $ 973,074.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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BID DATE: Friday, April 2, 2021

BRAWNER PARKWAY - CARROLL LANE TO KOSTORYZ ROAD REYTEC CONSTRUCTION RESOURCES, INC. MAKO CONTRACTING JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES BAY LTD. CLARK PIPELINE SERVICES J CARROLL WEAVER MAX UNDERGROUND CONSTRUCTION
PROJECT NO. 18008A 1901 HOLLISTER 3636 S Alameda, #8153 7505 UP RIVER RD. 401 CORN PRODUCTS RD. 6229 LEOPARD ST. 211 WEST WELDER ST. 3729 CORINA LN.
RFB #3537 HOUSTON, TX 77080 CC, TX 78411 CC, TEXAS 78409 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 SINTON, TX 78387 CC, TEXAS 78427
ITEM DESCRIPTION Tunit] _ary UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID 2 - CONCRETE
PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS
2-G1 MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART G) AL 1| $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 32,000.00 | $ 32,000.00
2-G2 8-IN DIA TIE-IN TO EXISTING MH EA 1| $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,120.00 | $ 1,120.00 | $ 2,520.00 | $ 2,520.00
2-G3  [REHAB EXISTING 8-IN DIA VCP WASTEWATER GRAVITY LINE BY PIPE
BURSTING W/ 8-IN HDPE (DIOD) LF 2453( $ 85.00 | $ 208,505.00 | $ 98.56 | $ 241,767.68 | $ 200.00 | $ 490,600.00
2-G4 REHABILITATE EXISTING BRICK MH EA 1| $ 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 13,000.00
2-G5 4' DIA FIBERGLASS MH EA 5 $ 11,000.00 | $ 55,000.00 | $ 14,560.00 | $ 72,800.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 52,500.00
2-G6 EXTRA DEPTH FOR MH VF 308 250.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 840.00 | $ 1,420.00 | $ 4,260.00
2-G7 ABANDON EXISTING MH EA 2| $ 2,200.00 | $ 4,400.00 | $ 2,464.00 | $ 4,928.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00
2-G8 TRENCH SAFETY FOR WASTEWATER MH EA 5 $ 320.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 336.00 | $ 1,680.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 2,500.00
2-G9 WASTEWATER SERVICE CONNECTIONS EA 35 $ 900.00 | $ 31,500.00 | $ 784.00 | $ 27,440.00 | $ 7,800.00 | $ 273,000.00
2-G10  |UNANTICIPATED WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1S 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00 | $ 33,500.00
SUBTOTAL PART G - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS $ 354,455.00 $ 410,475.68 $ 906,880.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PART H - GAS LINE IMPROVEMENTS
2-H1 _ |MOBILIZATION (MAX 5% PART H) AL 1% 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 600.00
2-H2 2-IN DIA P.E. GAS LINE LF 230[ $ 140.00 | $ 32,200.00 | $ 3450 | $ 7,935.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 3,450.00
2-H3 2-IN GAS VALVE EA 4'$ 550.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 1,120.00 | $ 4,480.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 4,000.00
2-H4 TRENCH SAFETY FOR GAS LINE LF 230[ $ 2.00($ 460.00 | $ 5.60|$ 1,288.00 | $ 5.00|$ 1,150.00
2-H5 2-IN GAS LINE CONNECTIONS EA 2| $ 1,200.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 3,808.00 | $ 7,616.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 3,000.00
2-H6 UNANTICIPATED GAS IMPROVEMENTS AL 1S 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,100.00
SUBTOTAL PART H - GAS LINE IMPROVEMENTS $ 39,860.00 $ 23,419.00 $ 13,300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TOTAL BASE BID 2 CONCRETE - (PARTS A THRU H) $ 4,407,942.10 $ 5,386,774.60 $ 5,928,248.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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