TABULATION OF BIDS
CITY OF CORPUS CHRISTI, TEXAS - CONTRACTS AND PROCUREMENT

BID DATE: Thursday, August 23, 2021
CALLICOATTE ROAD (UP RIVER ROAD TO IH-37) MAKO CONTRACTING CLORE EQUIPMENT, LLC GERKE EXCAVATING BAY LTD. CLARK PIPELINE SERVICES JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES REYTEC CONSTRUCTION RESOURCES, INC.
PROJECT NO. 18010A 3636 S Alameda, #B153 21220 FM 1420 15341 State Highway 131 401 CORN PRODUCTS RD. 6229 LEOPARD ST. 7505 UP RIVER RD. 1901 HOLLISTER
RFB #3723 CC, TX 78411 HARLINGEN, TX 78550 TOMAH, WI 54660 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 CC, TEXAS 78409 HOUSTON, TX 77080
ITEM DESCRIPTION [uniT] ary UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASE BID 1 - HMAC
PART A - GENERAL
A1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART A) LS s 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 9,449.53 | $ 9,449.53 | $ 8,366.45 | S 8,366.45 | $ 13,187.46 | $ 13,187.46 | $ 9,000.00 | $ 9,000.00
A2 BONDS AND INSURANCE AL s 40,000.00 | $ 40,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 11,654.76 | $ 11,654.76 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 36,000.00 | $ 36,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00
A3 STORM WATER POLLUTION PREVENTION PLAN LS s 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 11,235.00 [ $ 11,235.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 2,150.00 | $ 2,150.00
A4 REINFORCED FILTER FABRIC FENCE LF 235| $ 420 $ 987.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 2,350.00 | $ 9.37]$ 2,201.95 [ $ 12.75| S 2,996.25 [ $ 6.00 | $ 1,410.00 | $ 450 | S 1,057.50
AS INLET/GRATE PROTECTION BARRIER EA 22| $ 85.00 | $ 1,870.00 | $ 275.00 | $ 6,050.00 | $ 24533 | $ 5,397.26 [ $ 350.00 | $ 7,700.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 3,300.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 7,700.00
A6 REVEGETATION (HYDROMULCH) SF 3920| $ 1.00 [ $ 3,920.00 | $ 020 | S 784.00 | S 022 |$ 862.40 | S 325 (S 12,740.00 | $ 1.80 [ $ 7,056.00 [ $ 2.00 [ $ 7,840.00
A7 TRAFFIC CONTROL DESIGN PLAN BY A PROFESSIONAL ENGINEER LS 1 s 5,000.00 | 5,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 4,815.00 | $ 4,815.00 [ $ 5,100.00 | $ 5,100.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 5,700.00 | $ 5,700.00
A8 TRAFFIC CONTROL MOBILIZATION / ADJUSTMENTS Ls 18 4,887.50 | $ 4,887.50 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 5,831.50 [ $ 5,831.50 | $ 5,800.00 | $ 5,800.00 | $ 5,700.00 | $ 5,700.00 | $ 6,100.00 | $ 6,100.00
A9 TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES MTH 5 S 1,200.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 1,24451 | $ 6,222.55 | $ 7,306.00 | $ 36,530.00 | $ 2,526.00 | $ 12,630.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 7,500.00
A10 TEMPORARY PAVEMENT SY 2633| $ 26.00 | $ 68,458.00 | $ 70.68 | $ 186,100.44 | $ 18.38 [ S 48,394.54 | $ 27.00 [ $ 71,091.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 110,586.00 | $ 31.00 [ $ 81,623.00
A11 MESSAGE BOARDS FOR TRAFFIC CONTROL EA 3| S 10,200.00 | $ 30,600.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 1,950.00 | $ 9,617.60 | $ 28,852.80 | $ 5,800.00 | $ 17,400.00 | $ 16,562.40 | $ 49,687.20 | $ 12,200.00 | $ 36,600.00
A12 ARROW BOARDS FOR TRAFFIC CONTROL EA s 3,047.50 | $ 3,047.50 | $ 650.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 3,410.26 | $ 3,410.26 | $ 3,400.00 | $ 3,400.00 | $ 3,480.00 | $ 3,480.00 | $ 3,800.00 | $ 3,800.00
A13 OZONE ACTION DAY EA 50 $ 1.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 3,250.00 | $ 9,549.75 | $ 47,748.75 | $ 130.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 475.00 | $ 2,375.00
SUBTOTAL PART A - GENERAL $ 182,775.00 $ 270,634.44 $ 186,076.30 $ 188,073.70 $ 276,936.66 $ 196,445.50 NO BID
PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS
B1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART B) LS s 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 9,864.23 [ $ 9,864.23 | $ 3542828 | $ 3542828 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 40,880.00 | $ 40,880.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 24,000.00
B2 SITE CLEARING AND GRUBBING SF 3950 $ 050 | $ 1,975.00 | $ 1401 $ 5,530.00 | $ 24213 9,559.00 | $ 5.00]$ 19,750.00 | $ 12.00 [ $ 47,400.00 | $ 200]$ 7,900.00
B3 DEMO - EXIST ASPHALT PAVEMENT SF 23700| $ 1.00 [ $ 23,700.00 | $ 171 (S 40,527.00 | $ 123 (S 29,151.00 | $ 1.70 [ $ 40,290.00 | $ 5.00 [ $ 118,500.00 | $ 2.00 [ $ 47,400.00
B4 DEMO - EXIST ASPHALT DRIVEWAY SF 5215| $ 1.00 [ $ 5,215.00 | $ 519 [ $ 27,065.85 | $ 2.65(S 13,819.75 | $ 5.00 [ $ 26,075.00 | $ 7.50 | $ 39,112.50 | $ 2.00 [ $ 10,430.00
B5 DEMO - EXIST CONCRETE DRIVEWAY SF 800 S 320 | $ 2,560.00 | $ 11.00 [ $ 8,800.00 | $ 876 [$ 7,008.00 | $ 8.60 [ S 6,880.00 | $ 15.00 [ $ 12,000.00 | $ 200]$ 1,600.00
B6 DEMO - EXIST CONCRETE SF 30| S 320 | $ 96.00 [ $ 68.89 | $ 2,066.70 | $ 3297 (S 989.10 | $ 39.00 [ $ 1,170.00 | $ 60.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 4.00($ 120.00
B7 DEMO - EXIST OUTFALL EA s 1,500.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 5147.09 [ $ 5,147.09 | $ 3,495.06 | $ 3,495.06 | $ 2,300.00 | $ 2,300.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 71500 | $ 715.00
B8 REMOVE - GENERAL SIGN EA 2($ 100.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 91.17 | $ 182.34 [ $ 363.84 | $ 727.68 | $ 130.00 | $ 260.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 180.00 | $ 107.00 | $ 214.00
B9 REMOVE - SIGN - SPEED LIMIT 30 EA 1 $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 91.17 | $ 91.17 [ $ 415.62 | $ 41562 [ $ 130.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 107.00 | $ 107.00
B10 REMOVE - SM RD SN SUP & AM EA 1 $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 91.17 | $ 91.17 | $ 41562 | $ 41562 | $ 130.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 90.00|$ 107.00 | $ 107.00
B11 REMOVE / RELOCATE - EXISTING MAILBOX EA 13| § 177.00 | $ 2,301.00 | $ 18234 | S 2,370.42 | S 33755 | $ 4,388.15 [ $ 200.00 | $ 2,600.00 | S 180.00 | $ 2,340.00 | S 215.00 | $ 2,795.00
B12 REMOVE - CHAINLINK FENCE LF 255 $ 7.00 | S 1,785.00 | $ 520 |$ 1,326.00 | $ 6.54 | S 1,667.70 [ $ 2.60|$ 663.00 | $ 15.60 | $ 3,978.00 [ $ 5.00 | $ 1,275.00
B13 REMOVE - TREE EA 1S 420.00 | $ 4,620.00 | $ 1,107.47 | $ 12,182.17 | S 72175 | S 7,939.25 | S 650.00 | $ 7,150.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 16,500.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 3,850.00
B14 RELOCATE - EXIST PEDESTAL EA 6 S 500.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 165.83 | $ 994.98 | $ 1,069.49 | $ 6,416.94 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 350.00 | $ 2,100.00
B15 ASPHALT PAVEMENT (REMOVE AND REPLACE) SF 655 S 5.50 [ $ 3,602.50 | $ 20.52 | $ 13,440.60 | S 1131 | S 7,408.05 [ $ 23.00 | $ 15,065.00 | $ 15.05 | $ 9,857.75 [ $ 26.00 | $ 17,030.00
B16 FLEXIBLE PAVEMENT - TYPE D HMAC 1 1/2 INCHES Sy 3210| $ 17.25 | $ 55,372.50 | $ 21.06 | $ 67,602.60 | S 17.98 | $ 57,715.80 | $ 17.00 | $ 54,570.00 | $ 21.60 | $ 69,336.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 64,200.00
B17 FLEXIBLE PAVEMENT - TYPE B HMAC 3 1/2 INCHES SY 3210| $ 3335 ]S 107,053.50 | $ 40.04 | $ 128,528.40 | $ 4157 (S 133,439.70 | $ 32.00 | $ 102,720.00 | $ 42.00|$ 134,820.00 | $ 31.00 | $ 99,510.00
B18 FLEXIBLE PAVEMENT - CRUSHED LIMESTONE BASE 6 INCHES Sy 3675 $ 16.00 | $ 58,800.00 | $ 2153 | $ 79,122.75 | $ 27.99 | $ 102,863.25 [ $ 19.25 | $ 70,743.75 | $ 28.80 | $ 105,840.00 | $ 23.00 | $ 84,525.00
B19 FLEXIBLE PAVEMENT - LIME STABILIZED SUBGRADE 8 INCHES Sy 3675 $ 12.00 | $ 44,100.00 | $ 1142 | S 41,968.50 | $ 1159 | $ 42,593.25 | $ 18.50 | $ 67,987.50 | $ 7.14 | S 26,239.50 | $ 16.00 | $ 58,800.00
B20 PRIME COAT (0.20 GAL/SY) GAL 735 S 6.90 | $ 5,071.50 | $ 762 5,600.70 | $ 7.02($ 5,159.70 | $ 4.00($ 2,940.00 | $ 9.60 [ $ 7,056.00 | $ 7.00[$ 5,145.00
B21 LRA PAV TY-Il GR-CS SY 3210| $ 9.00 | $ 28,890.00 | $ 3063 [ $ 98,322.30 | $ 14.56 | $ 46,737.60 | $ 10.50 | $ 33,705.00 | $ 18.00 | $ 57,780.00 | $ 5.00]$ 16,050.00
B22 DRIVEWAY - CONCRETE SF 5310( $ 8.50 | $ 45,135.00 | $ 1594 | S 84,641.40 [ $ 2472 | S 131,263.20 | $ 17.25| S 91,597.50 | $ 16.20 | $ 86,022.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 79,650.00
B23 CONCRETE FLUME SF 216| S 15.00 | $ 3,240.00 | $ 36.87 [ $ 7,963.92 | $ 28.09 [ $ 6,067.44 | $ 16.00 | $ 3,456.00 | $ 21.60 [ $ 4,665.60 | $ 15.00 [ $ 3,240.00
B24 CHAINLINK FENCE LF 85 S 40.00 | $ 3,400.00 | $ 3429 (S 2,914.65 | $ 34.83 [ S 2,960.55 | $ 39.00 [ $ 3,315.00 | $ 61.80 [ $ 5,253.00 | $ 28.00 [ $ 2,380.00
B25 REFL PAV MRK TY C HEAT APPLIED PREFAB PREFORMED THERMOPLATIC
(W124"(SLD)(125MIL)(STOP BAR] LF 14| $ 29.50 | $ 413.00 | $ 3039 | $ 425.46 | $ 28.09 | $ 393.26 | $ 32.00 [ $ 448.00 | $ 16.80 | $ 23520 | $ 35.00 | $ 490.00
B26 REFL PAV MRK TY | (Y)4"(SLD)(090MIL) LF 640| $ 2.95 (S 1,888.00 | S 3.04 S 1,945.60 | S 281 (S 1,798.40 | S 3.20 (S 2,048.00 | S 3.00 [ $ 1,920.00 | $ 3.00 [ $ 1,920.00
B27 REFL PAV MRK TY | (Y)4"(BRK)(090MIL) LF 160[ $ 354 (S 566.40 | S 3.65 (S 584.00 | $ 337 (S 539.20 | $ 3.80 [ $ 608.00 | $ 3.60 [ $ 576.00 | $ 4.00 | $ 640.00
B28 REFL PAV MRKR TY Il-A-A EA 37| S 17.70 | $ 654.90 | $ 18.23 [ S 67451 | $ 16.85 [ $ 62345 | $ 19.00 [ $ 703.00 | $ 18.00 [ $ 666.00 | $ 22.00 [ $ 814.00
B29 REFL PAV MRKR TY II-B-B EA 5[ $ 23.60 | $ 118.00 | S 2431 | S 12155 | S 2247 | S 11235 | S 25.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 145.00
B30 SIGN ASSEMBLY - TYPE 3 OBJECT MARKERS EA 2($ 402.50 | $ 805.00 | $ 850.92 | $ 1,701.84 | $ 393.23 | $ 786.46 | $ 440.00 | $ 880.00 | $ 42000 | $ 840.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 1,000.00
B31 SIGN ASSEMBLY - TWO DIRECTION ARROW (48X24)(W1-7) EA s 862.50 | $ 862.50 | $ 1,215.60 | $ 1,215.60 | $ 84263 | $ 84263 | $ 950.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 972.00 | $ 972.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
B32 SIGN ASSEMBLY - CROSS ROAD (W2-1)(30X30) EA s 862.50 | $ 862.50 | $ 1,215.60 | $ 1,215.60 | $ 842,63 | $ 84263 | $ 950.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 972.00 | $ 972.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
B33 SIGN ASSEMBLY - T INTERSECTION (30X30)(W2-4) EA s 862.50 | $ 862.50 | $ 1,215.60 | $ 1,215.60 | $ 84263 | $ 84263 | $ 950.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 972.00 | $ 972.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
B34 SIGN ASSEMBLY - STOP (R1-1) WITH STREET ID PLAQUES EA 1 $ 1,092.50 | $ 1,092.50 | $ 1,458.71 | $ 1,458.71 | S 1,067.33 | $ 1,067.33 | S 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,140.00 | $ 1,140.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 1,400.00
B35 SIGN ASSEMBLY - SPEED 30 MPH (18X24)(R2-1) EA 2($ 833.75 | $ 1,667.50 [ $ 1,215.60 | $ 2,431.20 | $ 81454 | $ 1,629.08 | $ 920.00 | $ 1,840.00 | $ 870.00 | $ 1,740.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
B36 ALLOWANCE B1 - STREET LIGHTING AL s 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
B37 ALLOWANCE B2 - UNANTICIPATED STREET IMPROVEMENTS AL 1 s 27,000.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 27,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART B - STREET IMPROVEMENTS| $ 468,609.80 $ 696,334.61 $ 704,107.11 $ 637,199.75 $ 858,493.55 $ 581,552.00 NO BID
PART C - STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS
c1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART C) LS s 15,000.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 9,864.23 [ $ 9,864.23 | $ 16,800.73 [ $ 16,800.73 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 13,000.00 | $ 20,63033 | $ 20,630.33 | $ 17,000.00 | $ 17,000.00
C2 REMOVE EXIST GRATE INLET EA 2($ 1,680.00 | $ 3,360.00 | $ 2,076.18 | $ 4,152.36 | $ 580.70 | $ 1,161.40 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 3,600.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 2,400.00
c3 DEMO - EXISTING REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE LF 265[ $ 28.75| S 7,618.75 [ $ 27.04 | $ 7,165.60 [ $ 21.96 | $ 5,819.40 | $ 36.00 | $ 9,540.00 | $ 98.00 | $ 25,970.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 9,275.00
ca HIGH-PERFORMANCE POLYPROPYLENE (HP) - 18-inch LF 754 $ 4945 | $ 37,285.30 | $ 52.18 | $ 39,343.72 | $ 69.30 | S 52,252.20 | $ 95.00 | $ 71,630.00 | $ 134.02 | $ 101,051.08 [ $ 86.00 | $ 64,844.00
cs HIGH-PERFORMANCE POLYPROPYLENE (HP) - 24-inch LF 67| $ 81.65 | $ 5,470.55 | S 73.26 | S 4,908.42 [ $ 334.02 | $ 22,379.34 | $ 165.00 | $ 11,055.00 | $ 186.42 | S 12,490.14 | $ 130.00 | $ 8,710.00
C6 HIGH-PERFORMANCE POLYPROPYLENE (HP) - 30-inch LF 370| $ 128.80 | $ 47,656.00 | $ 92.60 | $ 34,262.00 | $ 158.84 | $ 58,770.80 | $ 165.00 | $ 61,050.00 | $ 217.00 | $ 80,290.00 | $ 164.00 | $ 60,680.00
c7 REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP) CLASS IIl - 18-inch LF 420 $ 11040 | $ 46,368.00 | $ 54.57 | $ 22,919.40 | $ 88.74 | $ 37,270.80 | $ 140.00 | $ 58,800.00 | $ 14337 | $ 60,215.40 | $ 188.00 | $ 78,960.00
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BID DATE: Thursday, August 23, 2021
CALLICOATTE ROAD (UP RIVER ROAD TO IH-37) MAKO CONTRACTING CLORE EQUIPMENT, LLC GERKE EXCAVATING BAY LTD. CLARK PIPELINE SERVICES JE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES REYTEC CONSTRUCTION RESOURCES, INC.
PROJECT NO. 18010A 3636 S Alameda, #B153 21220 FM 1420 15341 State Highway 131 401 CORN PRODUCTS RD. 6229 LEOPARD ST. 7505 UP RIVER RD. 1901 HOLLISTER
RFB #3723 CC, TX 78411 HARLINGEN, TX 78550 TOMAH, W1 54660 CC, TX 78409 CC, TX 78409 CC, TEXAS 78409 HOUSTON, TX 77080
ITEM DESCRIPTION [uniT] ary UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT UNIT PR AMOUNT
BASEBID 1 - HMAC
c8 REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE (RCP) CLASS IIl - 30-inch LF 43 $ 150.65 | $ 6,477.95 | $ 90.28 | $ 3,882.04 | $ 206.81 | $ 8,892.83 | $ 200.00 | $ 8,600.00 | $ 236.22 | S 10,157.46 | $ 215.00 | S 9,245.00
co GRATE INLET EA 27| $ 4,600.00 | $ 124,200.00 | $ 3,764.50 | $ 101,641.50 | $ 2,896.92 | $ 78,216.84 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 81,000.00 | $ 1,530.00 | $ 41,310.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 108,000.00
c10 SET WITH CROSS HARDWARE EA 3l s 4,025.00 | $ 12,075.00 | $ 3,577.40 | $ 10,732.20 | $ 1,879.54 | $ 5,638.62 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 1,400.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 2,700.00 | S 8,100.00
c11 30" PIPE OUTFALL EA 1 $ 4,025.00 | $ 4,025.00 | $ 27,080.70 | $ 27,080.70 | $ 5,844.31 | $ 5,844.31 | $ 7,900.00 | $ 7,900.00 | $ 12,300.00 | $ 12,300.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00
c12 EXIST 18" RCP TO TIE-INTO PROP OUTFALL EA 1 s 1,725.00 | $ 1,725.00 | $ 6,395.04 | $ 6,395.04 | $ 1,475.40 | $ 1,475.40 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 2,100.00 | S 2,100.00 | $ 700.00 | S 700.00
c13 CONCRETE RIPRAP SF 40[ $ 20.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 74.20 | $ 2,968.00 | $ 2092 | $ 836.80 | $ 25.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 44.00 | $ 1,760.00 | $ 46.00 | $ 1,840.00
c14 DITCH GRADING LF 1824 $ 7.00 [ $ 12,768.00 | $ 13.66 | $ 2491584 | $ 10.30 | $ 18,787.20 | $ 27.00 | $ 49,248.00 | $ 16.80 | $ 30,643.20 | $ 8.00|$ 14,592.00
c15 TRENCH SAFETY LF 1619] $ 575|$ 9,309.25 [ $ 150 | $ 2,428.50 | $ 413 [$ 6,686.47 | $ 5.20 | $ 8,418.80 | $ 12.00 | $ 19,428.00 | $ 7.00|$ 11,333.00
c16 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1s 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | S 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART C - STORM WATER IMPROVEMENTS $ 344,138.80 $ 312,659.55 $ 330,833.14 $ 401,441.80 $ 436,145.61 $ 423,679.00 NO BID
PART D - WATER IMPROVEMENTS
D1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART D) Ls s 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 9,864.23 | $ 9,864.23 [ $ 14,535.48 | $ 14,535.48 | $ 16,305.00 | $ 16,305.00 | $ 16,092.00 | $ 16,092.00 | $ 19,000.00 | $ 19,000.00
D2 ABANDONED IN PLACE EXIST 2" WATER LINE LF 545| $ 6.90 | $ 3,760.50 | $ 9.16 | $ 4,992.20 | $ 18.59 | $ 10,131.55 | $ 21.00 | $ 11,445.00 | $ 8.40| S 4,578.00 | $ 7.00 [ $ 3,815.00
D3 REMOVE EXIST WATERLINE LF 50[ $ 28.75 | $ 1,437.50 | $ 39.52 | $ 1,976.00 | $ 3592 | $ 1,796.00 | $ 47.00 | $ 2,350.00 | $ 16.80 | S 840.00 | $ 36.00 | S 1,800.00
D4 GROUT FILL EXIST 8" WATER LINE LF 570 $ 1150 | $ 6,555.00 | $ 1271 $ 7,244.70 | $ 52.70 | $ 30,039.00 | $ 35.00 | $ 19,950.00 | $ 13.20 | S 7,524.00 | $ 19.00 | S 10,830.00
D5 ADJUST 20" WATER LINE LF 435 $ 500.25 | $ 217,608.75 | $ 189.91 | $ 82,610.85 | $ 193.25 | $ 84,063.75 | $ 230.00 | $ 100,050.00 | $ 190.86 | $ 83,024.10 | $ 515.00 | $ 224,025.00
D6 RELOCATE EXIST WATER METER AND BOX EA 11| $ 575.00 | $ 6,325.00 | $ 1,269.37 | $ 13,963.07 | $ 2,093.31 | $ 23,026.41 | $ 430.00 | $ 4,730.00 | $ 900.00 | $ 9,900.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 19,800.00
D7 REMOVE EXIST FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY EA 2| S 3,220.00 | $ 6,440.00 | S 2,177.86 | $ 4,355.72 | $ 1,026.00 | $ 2,052.00 | $ 2,900.00 | $ 5,800.00 | $ 940.40 | $ 1,880.80 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 2,200.00
D8 2" WATERLINE LF 75 $ 23.00 [ $ 1,725.00 | $ 3843 (S 2,882.25 | $ 161.70 | $ 12,127.50 | $ 33.00 | $ 2,475.00 | $ 61.56 | $ 4,617.00 | $ 37.00 | $ 2,775.00
D9 6" WATERLINE LF 51] $ 51.75 [ $ 2,639.25 | $ 86.34 | $ 4,403.34 | $ 170.98 | $ 8,719.98 | $ 120.00 | $ 6,120.00 | $ 97.60 | $ 4,977.60 | $ 64.00 | $ 3,264.00
D10 8" WATERLINE LF 1085| $ 63.25 [ $ 68,626.25 | $ 50.79 | $ 55,107.15 | $ 37.60 | $ 40,796.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 119,350.00 | $ 14133 | $ 153,343.05 | $ 111.00 | $ 120,435.00
D11 8" 45 DEGREE DI BEND EA 1 $ 1,092.50 | $ 1,092.50 | $ 1,759.16 | $ 1,759.16 | $ 42245 | $ 42245 | S 650.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 510.00 | $ 510.00 | $ 379.00 | $ 379.00
D12 8" GATE VALVE WITH BOX AND COVER EA 2| $ 2,875.00 | $ 5,750.00 | $ 4,384.34 | $ 8,768.68 | $ 3,903.40 | $ 7,806.80 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 1,782.00 | $ 3,564.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00
D13 1" PE WATER SERVICE CONNECTION EA 8l $ 2,070.00 | $ 16,560.00 | $ 2,800.18 | $ 22,401.44 | $ 1,725.62 | $ 13,804.96 | $ 3,100.00 | $ 24,800.00 | $ 2,217.60 | $ 17,740.80 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 16,000.00
D14 TIE TO EXISTING WATER VAULT EA 1 $ 5,750.00 | $ 5,750.00 | $ 4,628.03 | $ 4,628.03 | $ 2,501.39 | $ 2,501.39 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 1,746.00 | $ 1,746.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00
D15 TIE TO EXISTING WATER LINE EA 1 s 9,775.00 | $ 9,775.00 | $ 5,995.57 | $ 5,995.57 | $ 3,314.24 | $ 3,314.24 | $ 11,700.00 | $ 11,700.00 | $ 4,638.00 | $ 4,638.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 4,500.00
D16 TIE TO EXISTING 2" WATER SERVICE CONNECTION EA 1 s 4,370.00 | $ 4,370.00 | $ 3,546.15 | $ 3,546.15 | $ 2,950.79 | $ 2,950.79 | $ 11,600.00 | $ 11,600.00 | $ 1,747.20 | S 1,747.20 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,000.00
D17 FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY EA 2| S 7,475.00 | $ 14,950.00 | $ 9,206.08 | $ 18,412.16 | $ 7,779.48 | $ 15,558.96 | $ 7,600.00 | $ 15,200.00 | $ 4,164.00 | S 8,328.00 | $ 6,500.00 | S 13,000.00
D18 TRENCH SAFETY LF 1211] $ 230 $ 2,785.30 | $ 2.01 (S 2,434.11 | $ 213 | $ 2,579.43 | $ 330 (S 3,996.30 | $ 240 (S 2,906.40 | $ 3.00 |$ 3,633.00
D19 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1s 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | S 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART D - WATER IMPROVEMENTS $ 406,150.05 $ 265,344.81 $ 286,226.69 $ 376,021.30 $ 337,956.95 $ 464,456.00 NO BID
PART E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS - LOOP OF SYSTEM
E1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART E) LS 1 s 8,000.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 9,864.23 | $ 9,864.23 | $ 9,706.38 | $ 9,706.38 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 13,200.00 | $ 13,200.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 18,000.00
E2 8" WATERLINE LF 1200 $ 63.25 [ $ 75,900.00 | $ 4582 | $ 54,984.00 | $ 61.51 | $ 73,812.00 | $ 7825 (S 93,900.00 | $ 13537 | $ 162,444.00 | $ 104.00 | $ 124,800.00
E3 8" GATE VALVE WITH BOX AND COVER EA 3l s 2,875.00 | $ 8,625.00 | $ 4,834.70 | $ 14,504.10 | $ 3,846.44 | $ 11,539.32 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 1,777.20 | $ 5,331.60 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 4,800.00
E4 8" 45 DEGREE DI BEND EA 2| S 1,092.50 | $ 2,185.00 | $ 1,996.45 | $ 3,992.90 | $ 2,369.83 | $ 4,739.66 | $ 650.00 | $ 1,300.00 | $ 510.00 | S 1,020.00 | $ 393.00 | S 786.00
ES 8" 90 DEGREE DI BEND EA 1 $ 1,092.50 | $ 1,092.50 | $ 2,029.32 | $ 2,029.32 | $ 46739 | $ 46739 | S 650.00 | $ 650.00 | $ 546.00 | $ 546.00 | $ 431.00 | $ 431.00
6 16" STEEL CASING LF 100[ $ 201.25 | $ 20,125.00 | $ 29555 | $ 29,555.00 | $ 393.23 | § 39,323.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 186.00 | $ 18,600.00 | $ 286.00 | $ 28,600.00
E7 BORE AND INSTALL STEEL CASING LF 100| $ 316.25 | $ 31,625.00 | $ 360.77 | $ 36,077.00 | $ 196.61 | $ 19,661.00 | $ 280.00 | $ 28,000.00 | $ 428.00 | $ 42,800.00 | $ 1,970.00 | $ 197,000.00
E8 TIE TO EXIST. WATER LINE EA 1 s 7,475.00 | $ 7,475.00 | $ 7,613.54 | $ 7,613.54 | $ 3,769.96 | $ 3,769.96 | $ 9,700.00 | $ 9,700.00 | $ 3,660.00 | S 3,660.00 | $ 6,600.00 | S 6,600.00
E9 FIRE HYDRANT ASSEMBLY (TYPE 1) EA 3l s 7,475.00 | $ 22,425.00 | $ 8,935.60 | $ 26,806.80 | $ 6,736.33 | $ 20,208.99 | $ 7,900.00 | $ 23,700.00 | $ 4,387.20 | S 13,161.60 | $ 6,300.00 | S 18,900.00
E10 TRENCH SAFETY LF 1200| $ 230 $ 2,760.00 | $ 2.03|$ 2,436.00 | $ 239 (S 2,868.00 | $ 330 (S 3,960.00 | $ 240 (S 2,880.00 | $ 3.00 [ $ 3,600.00
E11 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED WATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1s 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | S 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART E - WATER IMPROVEMENTS - LOOP OF SYSTEM $ 185,212.50 $ 192,862.89 $ 191,095.70 $ 201,710.00 $ 268,643.20 $ 408,517.00 NO BID
PART F - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS
F1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART F) LS 1 s 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 9,864.23 | $ 9,864.23 | $ 14,811.12 | $ 14,811.12 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 11,000.00 | $ 12,777.82 | $ 12,777.82 | $ 20,400.00 | S 20,400.00
F2 GROUT FILL EXIST WASTEWATER MANHOLE EA 2| S 1,725.00 | $ 3,450.00 | $ 2,357.74 | $ 4,715.48 | $ 1,828.12 | $ 3,656.24 | $ 2,800.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 2,280.00 | S 4,560.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
F3 GROUT FILL EXIST WASTEWATER LINE LF 625 S 1150 | $ 7,187.50 | $ 11.73 | $ 7,331.25 | $ 2859 | $ 17,868.75 | $ 38.00 | $ 23,750.00 | $ 13.20 | $ 8,250.00 | $ 16.00 | S 10,000.00
F4 WASTEWATER MANHOLE EA 4 $ 9,343.75 [ 37,375.00 | $ 10,068.58 | $ 40,274.32 | $ 7,058.57 | $ 28,234.28 | $ 10,100.00 | $ 40,400.00 | $ 8,491.20 | $ 33,964.80 | $ 37,000.00 | $ 148,000.00
F5 8" PVC WASTEWATER LINE LF 942| $ 108.10 | $ 101,830.20 | $ 3512 | $ 33,083.04 | $ 39.83 | $ 37,519.86 | $ 84.00 | $ 79,128.00 | $ 163.56 | $ 154,073.52 | $ 268.00 | $ 252,456.00
F6 WASTEWATER SERVICE CONNECTION EA 11| $ 2,875.00 | $ 31,625.00 | $ 2,447.02 | $ 26,917.22 | $ 3,808.29 | $ 41,891.19 | $ 4,400.00 | $ 48,400.00 | $ 1,746.00 | S 19,206.00 | $ 6,500.00 | $ 71,500.00
F7 PAVEMENT REPAIR SF 110 $ 80.00 [ $ 8,800.00 | $ 52.08 | $ 5,728.80 | $ 1,25531 ]S 138,084.10 | $ 110.00 | $ 12,100.00 | $ 27.00 | $ 2,970.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 5,940.00
F8 8" LINE TIE-INTO WASTEWATER MANHOLE EA 2| $ 2,875.00 | $ 5,750.00 | $ 4,08291 | $ 8,165.82 [ $ 1,23947 | $ 2,478.94 | $ 2,100.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 2,462.00 | $ 4,924.00 | $ 6,300.00 | $ 12,600.00
F9 TRENCH SAFETY LF 942[ $ 575|$ 5,416.50 | $ 258 | S 2,430.36 | $ 224 |$ 2,110.08 | $ 7.60 | $ 7,159.20 | $ 24.00 | $ 22,608.00 | $ 21.00|$ 19,782.00
F10 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS AL 1s 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | S 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 5,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART F - WASTEWATER IMPROVEMENTS $ 216,434.20 $ 143,510.52 $ 291,654.56 $ 236,737.20 $ 268,334.14 $ 555,678.00 NO BID
PART G - GAS IMPROVEMENTS
G1 MOBILIZATION (5% MAX OF PART G) LS 1 s 3,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 9,864.23 | $ 9,864.23 | $ 3,667.51 | $ 3,667.51 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 1,188.85 | $ 1,188.85 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 2,200.00
G2 RELOCATE GAS METER EA 4 s 115.00 | $ 460.00 | $ 4,355.70 | $ 17,422.80 | $ 1,081.97 | $ 4,327.88 | $ 690.00 | $ 2,760.00 | $ 888.00 | $ 3,552.00 | $ 3,800.00 | S 15,200.00
63 ADJUST - LINE (EXCAVATION, BEDDING, BACKFILL, TESTING, INCIDENTALS) LF 1125( $ 52.90 [ $ 59,512.50 | $ 79.94 | $ 89,932.50 [ $ 5219 | $ 58,713.75 | $ 16.50 | $ 18,562.50 | $ 13.80 | $ 15,525.00 | $ 41.00 | $ 46,125.00
Ga TRENCH SAFETY LF 1125| $ 230 $ 2,587.50 | $ 2.16 | $ 2,430.00 | $ 312 | $ 3,510.00 | $ 115($ 1,293.75 | $ 240 (S 2,700.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 5,625.00
G5 ALLOWANCE FOR UNANTICIPATED GAS IMPROVEMENTS AL 1s 2,000.00 | § 2,000.00 | S 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00 | S 2,000.00 | $ 2,000.00
SUBTOTAL PART G - GAS IMPROVEMENTS| $ 67,560.00 $ 121,649.53 $ 72,219.14 $ 25,816.25 $ 24,965.85 $ 71,150.00 NO BID
TOTAL BASE BID 1 HMAC - (PARTS A THRU G)) $ 1,870,880.35 $ 2,002,996.35 $ 2,062,212.64 $ 2,067,000.00 $ 2,471,475.96 $ 2,701,477.50 NO BID
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